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Court File No. CV-20-74570 

Commercial List Court No. _________________________ 

ONTARIO 

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 
[COMMERCIAL LIST] 

BUDUCHNIST CREDIT UNION LIMITED 

Applicant 

- and -

DUNDAS RETIREMENT PLACE INC., MAPLE RETIREMENT HOME INC. and 
1059244 ONTARIO INC. 

Respondents 

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 243(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND 
INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED, AND SECTION 101 OF 
THE COURTS OF JUSTICE ACT, R.S.O. 1990, c. C.43, AS AMENDED 

NOTICE OF MOTION 

MNP Ltd., in its capacity as Court-appointed receiver (the “Receiver”), without security, of all of 

the assets, undertakings and properties of Dundas Retirement Place Inc., Maple Retirement Homes 

Inc. and 1059244 Ontario Inc.  (collectively, the “Debtors”) acquired for, or used in relation to a 

business carried on by the Debtors will make a motion (the “Motion”) to a  Judge presiding over 

the Commercial List on March 23, 2021 at 12:30 pm, or as soon after that time as the Motion can 

be heard, which motion shall be heard virtually by “Zoom” videoconference and may be attended 

online by accessing the direct videoconference link at the following address 

https://zoom.us/j/96157077297?pwd=TFRUejRVS1hNdTVRUkJIbUhRc0VEQT09 and using the 

following credentials: Meeting ID: 961 5707 7297, Passcode: FRY1Fb. A direct link will be 

circulated by email to those members of the Service List with known email addresses. 

PROPOSED METHOD OF HEARING: The motion is to be heard orally. 
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THE MOTION IS FOR: 
 

1. an Order, substantially in the form attached hereto as Schedule “A” directing that: 

(a) these proceedings be transferred to and listed on, and heard by a Judge presiding 

over, the Commercial List; and 

(b) all further materials in these proceedings shall be filed with the Commercial List 

save and except for a requisition to affect the physical transference of the Court file 

to the Commercial List, which the Receiver shall file forthwith with the Hamilton 

Office of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice; 

2. an Order, substantially in the form attached hereto as Schedule “B”, inter alia: 

(a) approving a sale process for assets, undertakings and properties of the Debtors, 

including authority to enter into a proposed listing agreement with Seniors Housing 

Real Estate Group (“Seniors Housing”); 

(b) approving the first report of the Receiver dated March 12, 2021 (the “First 

Report”), including the interim statement of receipts and disbursements included 

therein;  

(c) sealing the confidential appendices to the First Report; and  

(d) approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its counsel through 

February 28, 2021; and 

3. such further and other relief as counsel may advise and this Court may permit.  

 

THE GROUNDS FOR THE MOTION ARE: 
 

BACKGROUND 
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1. the Debtors were operators of three retirement homes in the Hamilton area, known as 

“Dundas Retirement Place”, “Northview Seniors Residence” and “Montgomery Lodge” 

(collectively, the “Retirement Homes”);  

2. the Receiver was appointed as Receiver of the Retirement Homes on December 23, 2020 

by order of Justice Parayeski (the “Appointment Order”); 

3. these proceedings were commenced under and are proceeding under s. 243 of the 

Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act and there are considerable time pressures and other 

challenges facing the continuing operation of the business that, if not expeditiously 

addressed, will impact the Receiver’s mandate, potential recoveries to creditors and the 

well-being of the residents of the Retirement Homes; 

CHALLENGES & REVOCATION ORDERS 

4. at the time of the Receiver’s appointment, the Retirement Homes were facing various 

operational and funding issues; 

5. critically, among such issues were existing orders, pre-dating the Receiver’s appointment, 

issued by the Retirement Home Regulatory Authority (the “RHRA”), which provided, 

inter alia, that if the Retirement Homes could not be sold to an approved operator by June 

1, 2021, the operating licenses would be revoked (collectively, the “Revocation Orders”); 

RECEIVER’S GENERAL ACTIVITIES 

6. following its appointment, the Receiver assessed the business of the debtors, including an 

assessment of the Debtors’ existing administrators, employees and third-party staffing 

arrangements; 

7. the Receiver conducted “townhall” meetings with the residents of the Retirement Homes 

and their families and substitute decision makers to explain the impact of the Receivership, 

potential sale of the Debtors’ business and anticipated paths forward;   

8. the Receiver worked with the RHRA, the City of Hamilton and other stakeholders to 

address various issues, and continues to do so; 
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9. in addition to regularizing operations, addressing various incidents and fulfilling reporting 

obligations to the RHRA, the Receiver also identified Yvonne Dobronyi as a qualified 

manager of the Debtors’ operations and negotiated and entered into independent contractor 

agreement, naming Yvonne Dobronyi, as Vice President of Operations of the Debtors’ 

undertakings, commencing April 1, 2021; 

10. the Receiver continues to oversee the Debtors’ operations to ensure the health and safety 

of the residents and compliance with all RHRA requirements; 

PROPOSED SALES PROCESS 

11. in furtherance of its mandate to realize on the assets and to comply with the Revocation 

Orders that the Retirement Homes be sold, the Receiver commissioned a property condition 

report and requested proposals from qualified brokers for the marketing and sale of the 

Debtors’ assets, properties and undertakings; 

12. after a number of broker interviews, as well as consultations with the senior secured lender 

(Buduchnist Credit Union), the RHRA and various market players, the Receiver identified 

Seniors Housing as the broker with the best proposal and experience to market assets, 

undertakings and properties of the Debtors; 

13. in addition, Seniors Housing agreed to commence – and has commenced – preliminary 

work in advance of this motion for approval of its engagement, to ensure that the necessary 

due diligence materials are ready and the marketing and sale process can start immediately 

following Court approval (should it be granted); 

14. the Receiver negotiated the broker agreement with Seniors appended to the First Report 

(the “Broker Agreement”) and seeks approval of the same, together with the marketing 

and sale process for assets, undertakings and properties of the Debtors as detailed in the 

First Report (the “Sales Process”), which, in summary, provides for; 

(a) entering into the Broker Agreement and commencing the Sales Process 

immediately following Court approval thereof; 

(b) the identification and solicitation of interested parties; 

(c) marketing of the opportunity through the Senior Housing’s network and publicly; 
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(d) comprehensive marketing materials, including an offering memorandum, 

comprising relevant due diligence materials to be accessible by interested parties 

who sign confidentially and non-disclosure agreements; 

(e) a bid start date five weeks following Court approval (tentatively April 27, 2021) – 

being the first date on which offers will be considered; 

(f) a sale on an “as is, where is” basis, conditional on (i) the final Court approval and 

(ii) the approval of RHRA of the transfer of the Debtors’ licenses to the purchaser; 

and 

(g) a closing as soon as possible after the negotiation of a binding agreement, approval 

of the Court and approval of the license transfer by RHRA; 

15. the Sales Process is appropriate in the circumstances and will allow the Receiver to market 

the Retirement Homes in a manner consistent with prevailing commercial practice with a 

view to serving the interest of the economic stakeholders, RHRA and the residents; 

APPROVAL OF FIRST REPORT AND ACTIVITIES  

16. the Receiver has undertaken the activities, which are further detailed in the First Report, in 

accordance with the terms of the Appointment Order;  

17. the First Report fairly and accurately reflects the circumstances of the Receivership, the 

activities performed by the Receiver since appointment, as does the interim statement of 

receipts and disbursements included therein;  

APPROVAL OF FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS  

18. the Receiver’s fees, including the fees and fee accrual of its legal counsel, as set out in the 

First Report, are fair and reasonable;  

TRANSFER OF PROCEEDINGS 

19. counsel was previously advised by Justice Hainey that the transfer of these proceedings to 

the Commercial List is approved and the Receiver is of the view the same is appropriate 

as, not only because this matter proceeding by way of  receivership under Section 243 the 

BIA, but also because of the need to have access to the expertise of the Commercial List 



 

{L2051560.1} 6 
 

Judges and expediency of the Commercial List process to address the sales process, any 

operational challenges that may arise over the course of the sales process, the potential 

need to respond to any COVID-19 related issues that may impact the residents, and any 

concerns the RHRA may have; 

20. BCU and RHRA support the transfer, the respondents have consented and, to the best of 

the Receiver’s knowledge, no party opposes the transfer and no party would be prejudiced 

by the same; 

OTHER GROUNDS 

21. the other grounds set out in the First Report;  

22. the Consolidated Practice Direction Concerning the Commercial List and the inherent 

equitable jurisdiction of the Court;  

23. rules 1.04, 2.03, 3.02, 16.08 and 37 of the Rules of Civil Procedure, R.R.O. 1990, Reg. 

194;  

24. section 100 of the Courts of Justice Act, R.S.O. 1990, c. C-43;  

25. sections 243, 249 and 250 of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3;  

26. the Bankruptcy and Insolvency General Rules, C.R.C., c. 368;  

27. such further and other grounds as counsel may advise and this Honourable Court may 

permit. 

THE FOLLOWING DOCUMENTARY EVIDENCE will be used at the hearing of the Motion: 

1. the First Report and the appendices thereto; and  

2. such further and other documentary evidence as counsel may advise and this Court permits. 

 
 
DATE: March 12, 2021 
 
 LOOPSTRA NIXON LLP 
 135 Queens Plate Drive – Suite 600 
 Toronto, ON   M9W 6V7 
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 R. Graham Phoenix (LSUC #52650N) 
 t. 416-748-4776 
 f. 416-746-8319 
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Lawyers for the Court-Appointed 
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Court File No.: CV-20-74570  

Commercial List Court File No.:_______________________ 

 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(IN BANKRUPTCY & INSOLVENCY) 
[COMMERCIAL LIST] 

THE HONOURABLE   )  TUESDAY, THE 23rd  DAY 

      ) 

JUSTICE <*>     )  OF MARCH, 2021 

 

BUDUCHINIST CREDIT UNION LIMITED  
 

Applicant 
 

- and - 
 
 
 

DUNDAS RETIREMENT PLACE INC., MAPLE RETIREMENT HOMES INC. 
and 1059244 ONTARIO INC. 

 
Respondents  

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 243(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND 
INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED, AND SECTION 101 OF THE 

COURTS OF JUSTICE ACT, R.S.O. 1990, c. C.43, AS AMENDED 

ORDER  
 

THIS MOTION is made by MNP LTD., in its capacity as court-appointed receiver and 

manager (in either capacity, the “Receiver”) without security, of all of the assets, undertakings 

and properties of Dundas Retirement Place Inc., Maple Retirement Homes Inc. and 1059244 

Ontario Inc. (collectively, the “Respondents”) acquired for, or used in relation to a business 

carried on by the Debtors, for an Order transferring this proceeding (the “Receivership 

Proceeding”) from the Hamilton Ontario Superior Court of Justice to the Toronto Superior Court 



- 2 - 
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of Justice (Commercial List) was heard this day by “ZOOM” videoconference at 330 University 

Avenue, Toronto, Ontario. 

ON READING the First Report of the Receiver dated March 12, 2021 (the “First 

Report”) and on hearing counsel for the Receiver and counsel to such other parties as reflected in 

the counsel slip, no one else appearing although served as evidenced by the affidavit of <*> sworn 

March <*>, 2021: 

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the within proceedings be and are hereby directed to be 

listed on, and to be heard by a Judge presiding over, the Commercial List. 

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that all further materials in the Receivership Proceeding shall 

be filed with the Commercial List only save and except for a Requisition to affect the 

physical transference of the Court file to the Commercial List, which THIS COURT 

ORDERS AND DIRECTS the Receiver to file forthwith with the Hamilton Superior 

Court of Justice. 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that this Order is effective from today’s date and is not required 

to be entered. 

 

_______________________________ 
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TAB 1B 



Court File No.: CV-20-74570  

Commercial List Court File No.:_______________________ 

 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(IN BANKRUPTCY & INSOLVENCY) 
[COMMERCIAL LIST] 

THE HONOURABLE   )  TUESDAY, THE 23rd  DAY 

      ) 

JUSTICE <*>     )  OF MARCH, 2021 

 

BUDUCHNIST CREDIT UNION LIMITED 

Applicant  

- and - 

DUNDAS RETIREMENT PLACE INC., MAPLE RETIREMENT HOMES INC. and 
1059244 ONTARIO INC. 

Respondents 

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 243(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND 
INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED, AND SECTION 101 OF THE 
COURTS OF JUSTICE ACT, R.S.O. 1990, c. C.43, AS AMENDED 

 
ORDER 

(Approval of Sale Process & Administrative Order) 

 

THIS MOTION made by MNP Ltd., in its capacity as Court-appointed receiver (the 

“Receiver”), without security, of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of Dundas 

Retirement Place Inc., Maple Retirement homes Inc. and 1059244 Ontario Inc.  (collectively, the 

“Debtors”) acquired for, or used in relation to a business carried on by the Debtors for, inter alia,  
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approval of a proposed marketing and sale process for the assets, undertakings and properties of 

the Debtors;  approval of the first report of the Receiver, as well as the fees and disbursements of 

the Receiver and its counsel; and, sealing the confidential appendices to the Receiver’s first report 

was heard this day by “ZOOM” videoconference this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, 

Ontario. 

ON READING the First Report of the Receiver dated March 12, 2021 (the “First Report”) 

and on hearing counsel for the Receiver and counsel to such other parties as reflected in the counsel 

slip, no one else appearing although served as evidenced by the affidavit of <*> sworn March <*>, 

2021, filed: 

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that that the time for service and filing of the moving party’s 

motion record is hereby abridged and validated so that this motion is properly returnable today and 

hereby dispenses with further service thereof. 

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Sale Process (as defined in the First Report) is hereby 

approved and that the Receiver is hereby authorized and directed to enter into the Broker 

Agreement (as defined in the First Report) and to market the assets, properties and undertakings 

of the Debtors in accordance with the terms of the Sale Process and Broker Agreement, subject to 

the Court’s approval of the terms of any agreement of purchase and sale arising therefrom. 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the activities of the Receiver, as well as the Receiver’s 

interim statement of receipts and disbursements attached as Appendix “C” thereto, are hereby 

approved.   
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4. THIS COURT ORDERS that the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its counsel, 

Loopstra Nixon LLP, as set out in the fee affidavits attached to the First Report as Appendix “D” 

and Appendix “E”, respectively, are hereby approved. 

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that Confidential Appendices “1”, “2” and “3”, as set out in the 

First Report and filed separately with the Court be and are hereby sealed pending the conclusion 

of the Sale Process or further order of the Court. 

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that this Order is effective from today’s date and is not required 

to be entered. 
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Se lle r Re pre s e nta tio n  Ag re e m e nt
Autho rity  to  Offe r fo r Sa le

®
EXCLUSIVE

This  is  a  Multip le  Lis ting  Se rv ice ® Ag re e m e nt OR This  Lis ting  is  Ex clus ive

(Seller’s Initia ls)          (Seller’s Initia ls)
BETWEEN :
BROKERAGE: ............................................................................................................................................................................................................................................

............................................................................................................................................ (the “Listing Brokera ge”) Tel. No. ..................................................................

SELLER: .................................................................................................................................................................................................................................. (the “Seller”)

In considera tion of the Listing Brokera ge listing the rea l property fo r sa le  known a s ......................................................................................................................

.............................................................................................................................................................................................................................................. (the “Property”)
the Seller hereby gives the Listing Brokera ge the e x clus ive  a nd  irre vo ca b le  right to a ct a s the Seller’s a gent,

co m m e ncing  a t 12 :01  a .m. on the .................................. da y of ............................................................................................................................ , 20 ................... ,

until 11 :59  p.m. on the .................................  da y of ..........................................................................................................., 20 ...................... (the “Listing Period”),

{ Seller a cknowledges tha t the length of the Listing Period is negotia ble between the Seller a nd the Listing Brokera ge a nd, if a n
MLS® listing, ma y be subject to minimum requirements of the rea l esta te boa rd, however, in a ccorda nce with the Rea l Esta te
a nd Business Brokers Act, 2002 , (REBBA), if the  Lis ting  Pe rio d  e x ce e d s  s ix  m o nths ,  the  Lis ting  Bro k e ra g e  m us t (Seller’s Initia ls)
o b ta in  the  Se lle r’s  in itia ls .

to offer the Property fo r sa le  a t a  price of:

...................................................................................................................................................................................Dolla rs   ($CDN) $
a nd upon the terms pa rticula rly set out herein, or a t such other price a nd/ or terms a ccepta ble to the Seller. It is understood tha t the price a nd/ or terms 
set out herein a re a t the Seller’s persona l request, a fter full discussion with the Listing Brokera ge’s representa tive rega rding potentia l ma rket va lue of the
Property.

The  Se lle r he re by  re pre s e nts  a nd  w a rra nts  tha t the  Se lle r is  no t a  pa rty  to  a ny  o the r lis ting  a g re e m e nt fo r the  
Pro pe rty  o r a g re e m e nt to  pa y  co m m is s io n  to  a ny  o the r re a l e s ta te  bro k e ra g e  fo r the  sa le  o f the  pro pe rty.

1 . DEFIN ITION S AN D IN TERPRETATION S: For the purposes of this Agreement (“Authority” or “Agreement”):

(Seller’s Initia ls)

“Seller” includes vendor a nd a  “buyer” includes a  purcha ser or a  prospective purcha ser. A purcha se sha ll be deemed to include the entering into of 
a ny a greement to excha nge, or the obta ining of a n option to purcha se which is subsequently exercised, or the ca using of a  First Right of Refusa l to be 
exercised, or a n a greement to sell or tra nsfer sha res or a ssets. “Rea l property” includes rea l esta te a s de ned in the Rea l Esta te a nd Business Brokers 
Act (2002). The “Property” sha ll be deemed to include a ny pa rt thereof or interest therein. A “rea l esta te boa rd” includes a  rea l esta te a ssocia tion. 
Commission sha ll be deemed to include other remunera tion. This Agreement sha ll be rea d with a ll cha nges of gender or number required by the 
context. For purposes of this Agreement, a nyone introduced to or shown the Property sha ll be deemed to include a ny spouse, heirs, executors, 
a dministra tors, successors, a ssigns, rela ted corpora tions a nd a f lia ted corpora tions. Rela ted corpora tions or a f lia ted corpora tions sha ll include a ny 
corpora tion where one ha lf or a  ma jority of the sha reholders, directors or of cers of the rela ted or a f lia ted corpora tion a re the sa me person(s) a s the 
sha reholders, directors, or of cers of the corpora tion introduced to or shown the Property.

2 . COMMISSION : In considera tion of the Listing Brokera ge listing the Property for sa le, the Seller a grees to pa y the Listing Brokera ge a  commission

of ...................................  % of the sa le price of the Property or ...........................................................................................................................................................

................................................................................................................................................................................................................................................................
for a ny va lid offer to purcha se the Property from a ny source wha tsoever obta ined during the Listing Period a nd on the terms a nd conditions set out in 
this Agreement OR such other terms a nd conditions a s the Seller ma y a ccept.

IN ITIALS OF LISTIN G BROKERAGE: IN ITIALS OF SELLER(S):

The tra dema rks REALTO R®, REALTO RS®, MLS®, Multiple Listing Services® a nd a ssocia ted logos a re owned or controlled by 
The Ca na dia n Rea l Esta te Associa tion (CREA) a nd identify the rea l esta te professiona ls who a re members of CREA a nd the 
qua lity of services they provide. Used under license.

© 2021, O nta rio Rea l Esta te Associa tion (“O REA”). All rights reserved. This form wa s developed by O REA for the use a nd reproduction 
by its members a nd licensees only. Any other use or reproduction is prohibited except with prior written consent of O REA. Do not a lter 
when printing or reproducing the sta nda rd pre-set portion. O REA bea rs no lia bility for your use of this form. Fo rm  5 2 0      Revised 2021 Pa g e  1  o f 4
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The Seller a uthorizes the Listing Brokera ge to co-opera te with a ny other registered rea l esta te brokera ge (co-opera ting brokera ge), a nd to offer to pa y

the co-opera ting brokera ge a  commission of .....................  % of the sa le price of the Property or ...............................................................................................

...........................................................................................................................................................out of the commission the Seller pa ys the Listing Brokera ge.
The Seller further a grees to pa y such commission a s ca lcula ted a bove if a n a greement to purcha se is a greed to or a ccepted by the Seller or a nyone on

the Seller’s beha lf within .......................  da ys a fter the expira tion of the Listing Period (Ho ldo ve r Pe rio d ), so long a s such a greement is with a nyone
who wa s introduced to the Property from a ny source wha tsoever during the Listing Period or shown the Property during the Listing Period. If, however, 
the offer for the purcha se of the Property is pursua nt to a  new a greement in writing to pa y commission to a nother registered rea l esta te brokera ge, 
the Seller‘s lia bility for commission sha ll be reduced by the a mount pa id by the Seller under the new a greement.
The Seller further a grees to pa y such commission a s ca lcula ted a bove even if the tra nsa ction contempla ted by a n a greement to purcha se a greed to
or a ccepted by the Seller or a nyone on the Seller’s beha lf is not completed, if such non-completion is owing or a ttributa ble to the Seller’s defa ult or 
neglect, sa id commission to be pa ya ble on the da te set for completion of the purcha se of the Property.
Any deposit in respect of a ny a greement where the tra nsa ction ha s been completed sha ll  rst be a pplied to reduce the commission pa ya ble. Should
such a mounts pa id to the Listing Brokera ge from the deposit or by the Seller’s solicitor not be suf cient, the Seller sha ll be lia ble to pa y to the Listing 
Brokera ge on dema nd, a ny de ciency in commission a nd ta xes owing on such commission.
In the event the buyer fa ils to complete the purcha se a nd the deposit or a ny pa rt thereof becomes forfeited, a wa rded, directed or relea sed to the
Seller, the Seller then a uthorizes the Listing Brokera ge to reta in a s commission for services rendered,  fty (50%) per cent of the a mount of the sa id 
deposit forfeited, a wa rded, directed or relea sed to the Seller (but not to exceed the commission pa ya ble ha d a  sa le been consumma ted) a nd to pa y 
the ba la nce of the deposit to the Seller.
All a mounts set out a s commission a re to be pa id plus a pplica ble ta xes on such commission.

3 . REPRESEN TATION : The Seller a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge ha s provided the Seller with written informa tion expla ining a gency
rela tionships,including informa tion on Seller Representa tion. Sub-a gency, Buyer Representa tion, Multiple Representa tion a nd Customer Service. The 
Seller understa nds tha t unless the Seller is otherwise informed, the co-opera ting brokera ge is representing the interests of the buyer in the tra nsa ction. 
The Seller further a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge ma y be listing other properties tha t ma y be simila r to the Seller’s Property a nd the
Seller hereby consents to the Listing Brokera ge a cting a s a n a gent for more tha n one seller without a ny cla im by the Seller of con ict of interest.
Unless otherwise a greed in writing between Seller a nd Listing Brokera ge, a ny commission pa ya ble to a ny other brokera ge sha ll be pa id out of the 
commission the Seller pa ys the Listing Brokera ge.
The Seller hereby a ppoints the Listing Brokera ge a s the Seller’s a gent for the purpose of giving a nd receiving notices pursua nt to a ny offer or
a greement to purcha se the Property.

MULTIPLE REPRESEN TATION : The Seller hereby a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge ma y be entering into buyer representa tion a greements 
with buyers who ma y be interested in purcha sing the Seller’s Property. In the event tha t the Listing Brokera ge ha s entered into or enters into a  buyer 
representa tion a greement with a  prospective buyer for the Seller’s Property, the Listing Brokera ge will obta in the Seller’s written consent to represent 
both the Seller a nd the buyer for the tra nsa ction a t the ea rliest pra ctica l opportunity a nd in a ll ca ses prior to a ny offer to purcha se being submitted 
or presented.
The Seller understa nd a nd a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge must be impa rtia l when representing both the Seller a nd the buyer a nd equa lly
protect the interests of the Seller a nd buyer. The Seller understa nds a nd a cknowledges tha t when representing both the Seller a nd the buyer, the Listing 
Brokera ge sha ll ha ve a  duty of full disclosure to both the Seller a nd the buyer, including a  requirement to disclose a ll fa ctua l informa tion a bout the 
Property known to the Listing Brokera ge.
However, the Seller further understa nds a nd a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge sha ll not disclose:

• tha t the Seller ma y or will a ccept less tha n the listed price, unless otherwise instructed in writing by the Seller;
• tha t the buyer ma y or will pa y more tha n the offered price, unless otherwise instructed in writing by the buyer;
• the motiva tion of or persona l informa tion a bout the Seller or buyer, unless otherwise instructed in writing by the pa rty to which the informa tion

a pplies or unless fa ilure to disclose would constitute fra udulent, unla wful or unethica l pra ctice;
• the price the buyer should offer or the price the Seller should a ccept; a nd
• the Listing Brokera ge sha ll not disclose to the buyer the terms of a ny other offer.

However, it is understood tha t fa ctua l ma rket informa tion a bout compa ra ble properties a nd informa tion known to the Listing Brokera ge concerning 
potentia l uses for the Property will be disclosed to both Selle r a nd buyer to a ssist them to come to their own conclusions.

Whe re  a  Bro k e ra g e  re pre s e nts  bo th  the  Se lle r a nd  the  Buy e r (m ultip le  re pre s e nta tio n),  the  Bro k e ra g e  sha ll no t be  e ntitle d o r 
a utho rize d  to  b e  a g e nt fo r e ithe r the  Buy e r o r the  Se lle r fo r the  purpo s e  o f g iv ing  a nd  re ce iv ing  no tice s .

MULTIPLE REPRESEN TATION  AN D CUSTOMER SERVICE: The Seller understa nds a nd a grees tha t the Listing Brokera ge a lso provides 
representa tion a nd customer service to other sellers a nd buyers. If the Listing Brokera ge represents or provides customer service to more tha n one 
seller or buyer for the sa me tra de, the Listing Brokera ge sha ll, in writing, a t the ea rliest pra ctica ble opportunity a nd before a ny offer is ma de, inform 
a ll sellers a nd buyers of the na ture of the Listing Brokera ge’s rela tionship to ea ch seller a nd buyer.

IN ITIALS OF LISTIN G BROKERAGE: IN ITIALS OF SELLER(S):

The tra dema rks REALTO R®, REALTO RS®, MLS®, Multiple Listing Services® a nd a ssocia ted logos a re owned or controlled by 
The Ca na dia n Rea l Esta te Associa tion (CREA) a nd identify the rea l esta te professiona ls who a re members of CREA a nd the 
qua lity of services they provide. Used under license.

© 2021, O nta rio Rea l Esta te Associa tion (“O REA”). All rights reserved. This form wa s developed by O REA for the use a nd reproduction 
by its members a nd licensees only. Any other use or reproduction is prohibited except with prior written consent of O REA. Do not a lter 
when printing or reproducing the sta nda rd pre-set portion. O REA bea rs no lia bility for your use of this form. Fo rm  5 2 0      Revised 2021 Pa g e  2  o f 4
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The Seller further agrees to pay such commission as calculated above even if the transaction contemplated by an agreement to purchase agreed to

or accepted by the Seller or anyone on the Seller’s behalf is not completed, if such non-completion is owing or attributable to the Seller’s default or

neglect, said commission to be payable on the date set for completion of the purchase of the Property
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Such commissoin is payable only once the full selling price have been received by the Seller.
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fty (50%) per cent of the amount of the said

deposit forfeited, awarded, directed or released to the Seller (but not to exceed the commission payable had a sale been consummated) and to pay

the balance of the deposit to the Seller



4 . REFERRAL OF EN QUIRIES: The Seller a grees tha t during the Listing Period, the Seller sha ll a dvise the Listing Brokera ge immedia tely of a ll enquiries
from a ny source wha tsoever, a nd a ll offers to purcha se submitted to the Seller sha ll be immedia tely submitted to the Listing Brokera ge by the Seller 
before the Seller a ccepts or rejects the sa me. If a ny enquiry during the Listing Period results in the Seller’s a ccepting a  va lid offer to purcha se during 
the Listing Period or within the Holdover Period a fter the expira tion of the Listing Period described a bove, the Seller a grees to pa y the Listing Brokera ge 
the a mount of commission set out a bove, pa ya ble within  ve (5 ) da ys following the Listing Brokera ge’s written dema nd therefor.

5 . MARKETIN G: The Seller a grees to a llow the Listing Brokera ge to show a nd permit prospective buyers to fully inspect the Property during rea sona ble
hours a nd the Seller gives the Listing Brokera ge the sole a nd exclusive right to pla ce “For Sa le” a nd “Sold” sign(s) upon the Property. The Seller 
consents to the Listing Brokera ge including informa tion in a dvertising tha t ma y identify the Property. The Seller further a grees tha t the Listing Brokera ge 
sha ll ha ve sole a nd exclusive a uthority to ma ke a ll a dvertising decisions rela ting to the ma rketing of the Property during the Listing Period. The Seller 
a grees tha t the Listing Brokera ge will not be held lia ble in a ny ma nner wha tsoever for a ny a cts or omissions with respect to a dvertising by the Listing 
Brokera ge or a ny other pa rty, other tha n by the Listing Brokera ge’s gross negligence or wilful a ct.

6 . WARRAN TY: The Seller represents a nd wa rra nts tha t the Seller ha s the exclusive a uthority a nd power to execute this Authority to offer the Property for
sa le a nd tha t the Seller ha s informed the Listing Brokera ge of a ny third pa rty interests or cla ims on the Property such a s rights of  rst refusa l, options, 
ea sements, mortga ges, encumbra nces or otherwise concerning the Property, which ma y a ffect the sa le of the Property.

7 . IN DEMN IFICATION  AN D IN SURAN CE: The Seller will not hold the Listing Brokera ge a nd representa tives of the Brokera ge responsible for
a ny loss or da ma ge to the Property or contents occurring during the term of this Agreement ca used by the Listing Brokera ge or a nyone else by a ny 
mea ns, including theft,  re or va nda lism, other tha n by the Listing Brokera ge’s gross negligence or wilful a ct. The Seller a grees to indemnify a nd sa ve 
ha rmless the Listing Brokera ge a nd representa tives of the Brokera ge a nd a ny co-opera ting brokera ge from a ny lia bility, cla im, loss, cost, da ma ge or 
injury, including but not limited to loss of the commission pa ya ble under this Agreement, ca used or contributed to by the brea ch of a ny wa rra nty or 
representa tion ma de by the Seller in this Agreement a nd, if a tta ched, the a ccompa nying da ta  form.
The Seller wa rra nts the Property is insured, including persona l lia bility insura nce a ga inst a ny cla ims or la wsuits resulting from bodily injury or property
da ma ge to others ca used in a ny wa y on or a t the Property a nd the Seller indemni es the Brokera ge a nd a ll of its employees, representa tives, 
sa lespersons a nd brokers (Listing Brokera ge) a nd a ny co-opera ting brokera ge a nd a ll of its employees, representa tives, sa lespersons a nd brokers 
(co-opera ting  brokera ge) for a nd a ga inst a ny cla ims a ga inst the Listing Brokera ge or co-opera ting brokera ge ma de by a nyone who a ttends or visits 
the Property.

8 . EN VIRON MEN TAL IN DEMN IFICATION : The Seller a grees to indemnify a nd sa ve ha rmless the Listing Brokera ge a nd representa tives of the
Brokera ge a nd a ny co-opera ting brokera ge from a ny lia bility, cla im, loss, cost, da ma ge or injury a s a  result of the Property being a ffected by a ny 
conta mina nts or environmenta l problems.

9 . FAMILY LAW ACT: The Seller hereby wa rra nts tha t spousa l consent is not necessa ry under the provisions of the Fa mily La w Act, R.S.O . 1990 , unless
the spouse of the Seller ha s executed the consent hereina fter provided.

1 0 . FIN DERS FEES: The Seller a cknowledges tha t the Brokera ge ma y be receiving a   nder’s fee, rewa rd a nd/ or referra l incentive, a nd the Seller 
consents to a ny such bene t being received a nd reta ined by the Brokera ge in a ddition to the commission a s described a bove.

1 1 . VERIFICATION  OF IN FORMATION : The Seller a uthorizes the Listing Brokera ge to obta in a ny informa tion from a ny regula tory a uthorities, 
governments, mortga gees or others a ffecting the Property a nd the Seller a grees to execute a nd deliver such further a uthoriza tions in this rega rd a s 
ma y be rea sona bly required. The Seller hereby a ppoints the Listing Brokera ge or the Listing Brokera ge’s a uthorized representa tive a s the Seller’s
a ttorney to execute such documenta tion a s ma y be necessa ry to effect obta ining a ny informa tion a s a foresa id. The Seller hereby a uthorizes, instructs
a nd directs the a bove noted regula tory a uthorities, governments, mortga gees or others to relea se a ny a nd a ll informa tion to the Listing Brokera ge.

1 2 . USE AN D DISTRIBUTION  OF IN FORMATION : The Seller consents to the collection, use a nd disclosure of persona l informa tion by the Brokera ge 
for the purpose of listing a nd ma rketing the Property including, but not limited to: listing a nd a dvertising the Property using a ny medium including the
Internet; disclosing Property informa tion to prospective buyers, brokera ges, sa lespersons a nd others who ma y a ssist in the sa le of the Property; such
other use of the Seller’s persona l informa tion a s is consistent with listing a nd ma rketing of the Property. The Seller consents, if this is a n MLS® Listing, 
to pla cement of the listing informa tion a nd sa les informa tion by the Brokera ge into the da ta ba se(s) of the MLS® System of the a ppropria te Boa rd, a nd
to the posting of a ny documents a nd other informa tion (including, without limita tion, photogra phs, ima ges, gra phics, a udio a nd video recordings,
virtua l tours, dra wings,  oor pla ns, a rchitectura l designs, a rtistic renderings, surveys a nd listing descriptions) provided by or on beha lf of the Seller 
into the da ta ba se(s) of the MLS® System of the a ppropria te Boa rd. The Seller hereby indemni es a nd sa ves ha rmless the Brokera ge a nd/ or a ny of 
its employees, serva nts, brokers or sa les representa tives from a ny a nd a ll cla ims, lia bilities, suits, a ctions, losses, costs a nd lega l fees ca used by, or 
a rising out of, or resulting from the posting of a ny documents or other informa tion (including, without limita tion, photogra phs, ima ges, gra phics, a udio 
a nd video recordings, virtua l tours, dra wings,  oor pla ns, a rchitectura l designs, a rtistic renderings, surveys a nd listing descriptions) a s a foresa id. 
The Seller a cknowledges tha t the da ta ba se, within the boa rd’s MLS® System is the property of the rea l esta te boa rd(s) a nd ca n be licensed, resold, or 
otherwise dea lt with by the boa rd(s). The Seller further a cknowledges tha t the rea l esta te boa rd(s) ma y: during the term of the listing a nd therea fter, 
distribute the informa tion in the da ta ba se, within the boa rd’s MLS® System to a ny persons a uthorized to use such service which ma y include other 
brokera ges, government depa rtments, a ppra isers, municipa l orga niza tions a nd others; ma rket the Property, a t its option, in a ny medium, including 
electronic media ; during the term of the listing a nd therea fter, compile, reta in a nd publish a ny sta tistics including historica l da ta  within the boa rd’s 
MLS® System a nd reta in, reproduce a nd displa y photogra phs, ima ges, gra phics, a udio a nd video recordings, virtua l tours, dra wings,  oor pla ns, 
a rchitectura l designs, a rtistic renderings, surveys a nd listing descriptions which ma y be used by boa rd members to conduct compa ra tive a na lyses; a nd 
ma ke such other use of the informa tion a s the Brokera ge a nd/ or rea l esta te boa rd(s) deem a ppropria te, in connection with the listing, ma rketing a nd

IN ITIALS OF LISTIN G BROKERAGE: IN ITIALS OF SELLER(S):

The tra dema rks REALTO R®, REALTO RS®, MLS®, Multiple Listing Services® a nd a ssocia ted logos a re owned or controlled by 
The Ca na dia n Rea l Esta te Associa tion (CREA) a nd identify the rea l esta te professiona ls who a re members of CREA a nd the 
qua lity of services they provide. Used under license.

© 2021, O nta rio Rea l Esta te Associa tion (“O REA”). All rights reserved. This form wa s developed by O REA for the use a nd reproduction 
by its members a nd licensees only. Any other use or reproduction is prohibited except with prior written consent of O REA. Do not a lter 
when printing or reproducing the sta nda rd pre-set portion. O REA bea rs no lia bility for your use of this form. Fo rm  5 2 0      Revised 2021 Pa g e  3  o f 4

Trina.Burningham
Text Box
, subject to the successful completion of a sale transaction.


Trina.Burningham
Line

Trina.Burningham
Arrow

Trina.Burningham
Cross-out
.



Trina.Burningham
Text Box
subject to schedule "A" and as far as


Trina.Burningham
Line

Trina.Burningham
Arrow

Trina.Burningham
Text Box
is aware, it


Trina.Burningham
Line

Trina.Burningham
Arrow

Trina.Burningham
Text Box
property is being sold as is, where is, through an approval and vesting order
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The Seller warrants the Property is insured, including personal liability insurance against any claims or lawsuits resulting from bodily injury or property

damage to others caused in any way on or at the Property and the Seller indemni es the Brokerage and all of its employees, representatives,

salespersons and brokers (Listing Brokerage) and any co-operating brokerage and all of its employees, representatives, salespersons and brokers

(co-operating brokerage) for and against any claims against the Listing Brokerage or co-operating brokerage made by anyone who attends or visits

the Property.
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FAMILY LAW ACT: The Seller hereby warrants that spousal consent is not necessary under the provisions of the Family Law Act, R.S.O. 1990, unless

the spouse of the Seller has executed the consent hereinafter provided.
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FINDERS FEES: The Seller acknowledges that the Brokerage may be receiving a nder’s fee, reward and/or referral incentive, and the Seller

consents to any such bene t being received and retained by the Brokerage in addition to the commission as described above.
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he Seller has informed the Listing Brokerage of any third party interests or claims on the Property such as rights of rst refusal, options,

easements, mortgages, encumbrances or otherwise concerning the Property, which may affect the sale of the Property



    

    

    

selling of rea l esta te during the term of the listing a nd therea fter. The Seller a cknowledges tha t the informa tion, persona l or otherwise (“informa tion”), 
provided to the rea l esta te boa rd or a ssocia tion ma y be stored on da ta ba ses loca ted outside of Ca na da , in which ca se the informa tion would be 
subject to the la ws of the jurisdiction in which the informa tion is loca ted.

1 3 . SUCCESSORS AN D ASSIGN S: The heirs, executors, a dministra tors, successors a nd a ssigns of the undersigned a re bound by the terms of this Agreement.

1 4 . CON FLICT OR DISCREPAN CY: If there is a ny con ict or discrepa ncy between a ny provision a dded to this Agreement (including a ny Schedule 
a tta ched hereto) a nd a ny provision in the sta nda rd pre-set portion hereof, the a dded provision sha ll supersede the sta nda rd pre-set provision to the 
extent of such con ict or discrepa ncy. This Agreement, including a ny Schedule a tta ched hereto, sha ll constitute the entire Authority from the Seller to 
the Brokera ge. There is no representa tion, wa rra nty, colla tera l a greement or condition, which a ffects this Agreement other tha n a s expressed herein.

1 5 . ELECTRON IC COMMUN ICATION : This Agreement a nd a ny a greements, notices or other communica tions contempla ted thereby ma y be tra nsmitted 
by mea ns of electronic systems, in which ca se signa tures sha ll be deemed to be origina l. The tra nsmission of this Agreement by the Seller by electronic 
mea ns sha ll be deemed to con rm the Seller ha s reta ined a  true copy of the Agreement.

1 6 . ELECTRON IC SIGN ATURES: If this Agreement ha s been signed with a n electronic signa ture the pa rties hereto consent a nd a gree to the use of such 
electronic signa ture with respect to this Agreement pursua nt to the Electronic Commerce Act, 2000, S.O . 2000 , c17  a s a mended from time to time.

1 7 . SCHEDULE(S) ................................................................................................................  a nd da ta  form a tta ched hereto form(s) pa rt of this Agreement.

THE LISTIN G BROKERAGE AGREES TO MARKET THE PROPERTY ON  BEHALF OF THE SELLER AN D REPRESEN T THE SELLER IN  AN
EN DEAVOUR TO OBTAIN  A VALID OFFER TO PURCHASE THE PROPERTY ON  THE TERMS SET OUT IN  THIS AGREEMEN T OR ON  SUCH 
OTHER TERMS SATISFACTORY TO THE SELLER.

..................................................................................................................      ................................................ .........................................................................................
(Authorized to bind the Listing Brokera ge)                                                      (Da te) (Na me of Person Signing)

THIS AGREEMEN T HAS BEEN  READ AN D FULLY UN DERSTOOD BY ME, I ACCEPT THE TERMS OF THIS AGREEMEN T AN D I ACKN OWLEDGE 
ON  THIS DATE I HAVE SIGN ED UN DER SEAL. Any representa tions conta ined herein or a s shown on the a ccompa nying da ta  form respecting the 
Property a re true to the best of my knowledge, informa tion a nd belief.

SIGNED, SEALED AND DELIVERED I ha ve hereunto set my ha nd a nd sea l:

..................................................................................................................
(Na me of Seller)

..................................................................................................................       ........................................................     ........................................................................
(Signa ture of Seller/ Authorized Signing O f cer)                                          (Sea l)     (Da te)                            (Tel. No.)

..................................................................................................................       ........................................................     ........................................................................
(Signa ture of Seller/ Authorized Signing O f cer)                                          (Sea l)     (Da te)                            (Tel. No.)

SPOUSAL CON SEN T: The undersigned spouse of the Seller hereby consents to the listing of the Property herein pursua nt to the provisions of the Fa mily 
La w Act, R.S.O . 1990  a nd hereby a grees to execute a ll necessa ry or incidenta l documents to further a ny tra nsa ction provided for herein.

..................................................................................................................       ........................................................     ........................................................................
(Spouse)                                                                                               (Sea l)     (Da te)                                 (Tel. No.)

ACKN OWLEDGEMEN T
The  Se lle r(s ) he re by  a ck no w le dg e  tha t the  Se lle r(s ) fully  unde rs ta nd  the  te rm s  o f this  Ag re e m e nt a nd  ha ve  re ce ive d  a  co py  o f

this  Ag re e m e nt o n  the  …….................... da y  o f …………...................................................……...………..................... …………, 2 0  ….........................……

.............................................................................................................................................................................................    .......................................................................
(Signa ture of Seller)                                                                   (Da te)

.............................................................................................................................................................................................    .......................................................................
(Signa ture of Seller)                                                                   (Da te)
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In the event tha t this Agreement expires or is ca ncelled or otherwise
termina ted a nd the Property is not sold, the Seller, by initia lling:

(Do e s ) (Do e s  N o t)consent to a llow other rea l esta te boa rd members to conta ct the Seller a fter expira tion or
other termina tion of this Agreement to discuss listing or otherwise ma rketing the Property.

A

JOE LEVY

DECLARATION  OF IN SURAN CE

The Sa lesperson/ Broker/ Broker of Record ........................................................................................................................................................................................
(Na me of Sa lesperson/ Broker/ Broker of Record)

hereby decla res tha t he/ she is insured a s required by REBBA.

..........................................................................................................................................................................................................
(Signa ture(s) of Sa lesperson/ Broker/ Broker of Record)

JOE LEVY
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Fo rm  5 2 0
for use in the Province of O nta rio

Lis ting  Ag re e m e nt – Co m m e rcia l
Se lle r Re pre s e nta tio n  Ag re e m e nt
Autho rity  to  Offe r fo r Sa le

®
EXCLUSIVE

This  is  a  Multip le  Lis ting  Se rv ice ® Ag re e m e nt OR This  Lis ting  is  Ex clus ive

(Seller’s Initia ls)          (Seller’s Initia ls)
BETWEEN :
BROKERAGE: ............................................................................................................................................................................................................................................

............................................................................................................................................ (the “Listing Brokera ge”) Tel. No. ..................................................................

SELLER: .................................................................................................................................................................................................................................. (the “Seller”)

In considera tion of the Listing Brokera ge listing the rea l property fo r sa le  known a s ......................................................................................................................

.............................................................................................................................................................................................................................................. (the “Property”)
the Seller hereby gives the Listing Brokera ge the e x clus ive  a nd  irre vo ca b le  right to a ct a s the Seller’s a gent,

co m m e ncing  a t 12 :01  a .m. on the .................................. da y of ............................................................................................................................ , 20 ................... ,

until 11 :59  p.m. on the .................................  da y of ..........................................................................................................., 20 ...................... (the “Listing Period”),

{ Seller a cknowledges tha t the length of the Listing Period is negotia ble between the Seller a nd the Listing Brokera ge a nd, if a n
MLS® listing, ma y be subject to minimum requirements of the rea l esta te boa rd, however, in a ccorda nce with the Rea l Esta te
a nd Business Brokers Act, 2002 , (REBBA), if the  Lis ting  Pe rio d  e x ce e d s  s ix  m o nths ,  the  Lis ting  Bro k e ra g e  m us t (Seller’s Initia ls)
o b ta in  the  Se lle r’s  in itia ls .

to offer the Property fo r sa le  a t a  price of:

...................................................................................................................................................................................Dolla rs   ($CDN) $
a nd upon the terms pa rticula rly set out herein, or a t such other price a nd/ or terms a ccepta ble to the Seller. It is understood tha t the price a nd/ or terms 
set out herein a re a t the Seller’s persona l request, a fter full discussion with the Listing Brokera ge’s representa tive rega rding potentia l ma rket va lue of the
Property.

The  Se lle r he re by  re pre s e nts  a nd  w a rra nts  tha t the  Se lle r is  no t a  pa rty  to  a ny  o the r lis ting  a g re e m e nt fo r the  
Pro pe rty  o r a g re e m e nt to  pa y  co m m is s io n  to  a ny  o the r re a l e s ta te  bro k e ra g e  fo r the  sa le  o f the  pro pe rty.

1 . DEFIN ITION S AN D IN TERPRETATION S: For the purposes of this Agreement (“Authority” or “Agreement”):

(Seller’s Initia ls)

“Seller” includes vendor a nd a  “buyer” includes a  purcha ser or a  prospective purcha ser. A purcha se sha ll be deemed to include the entering into of 
a ny a greement to excha nge, or the obta ining of a n option to purcha se which is subsequently exercised, or the ca using of a  First Right of Refusa l to be 
exercised, or a n a greement to sell or tra nsfer sha res or a ssets. “Rea l property” includes rea l esta te a s de ned in the Rea l Esta te a nd Business Brokers 
Act (2002). The “Property” sha ll be deemed to include a ny pa rt thereof or interest therein. A “rea l esta te boa rd” includes a  rea l esta te a ssocia tion. 
Commission sha ll be deemed to include other remunera tion. This Agreement sha ll be rea d with a ll cha nges of gender or number required by the 
context. For purposes of this Agreement, a nyone introduced to or shown the Property sha ll be deemed to include a ny spouse, heirs, executors, 
a dministra tors, successors, a ssigns, rela ted corpora tions a nd a f lia ted corpora tions. Rela ted corpora tions or a f lia ted corpora tions sha ll include a ny 
corpora tion where one ha lf or a  ma jority of the sha reholders, directors or of cers of the rela ted or a f lia ted corpora tion a re the sa me person(s) a s the 
sha reholders, directors, or of cers of the corpora tion introduced to or shown the Property.

2 . COMMISSION : In considera tion of the Listing Brokera ge listing the Property for sa le, the Seller a grees to pa y the Listing Brokera ge a  commission

of ...................................  % of the sa le price of the Property or ...........................................................................................................................................................

................................................................................................................................................................................................................................................................
for a ny va lid offer to purcha se the Property from a ny source wha tsoever obta ined during the Listing Period a nd on the terms a nd conditions set out in 
this Agreement OR such other terms a nd conditions a s the Seller ma y a ccept.

IN ITIALS OF LISTIN G BROKERAGE: IN ITIALS OF SELLER(S):

The tra dema rks REALTO R®, REALTO RS®, MLS®, Multiple Listing Services® a nd a ssocia ted logos a re owned or controlled by 
The Ca na dia n Rea l Esta te Associa tion (CREA) a nd identify the rea l esta te professiona ls who a re members of CREA a nd the 
qua lity of services they provide. Used under license.

© 2021, O nta rio Rea l Esta te Associa tion (“O REA”). All rights reserved. This form wa s developed by O REA for the use a nd reproduction 
by its members a nd licensees only. Any other use or reproduction is prohibited except with prior written consent of O REA. Do not a lter 
when printing or reproducing the sta nda rd pre-set portion. O REA bea rs no lia bility for your use of this form. Fo rm  5 2 0      Revised 2021 Pa g e  1  o f 4

Royal LePage Real Estate Services Ltd, Brokerage

4025 Yonge Street Toronto,ON   suite 103 416-487-4311

33 Main Street, Dundas, ON

21

21

1One 

4 plus HST

Joe
Typewritten Text
Dundas - MNP Ltd., in its capacity as Court-appointed Receiver of Dundas Retirement Place Inc.




The Seller a uthorizes the Listing Brokera ge to co-opera te with a ny other registered rea l esta te brokera ge (co-opera ting brokera ge), a nd to offer to pa y

the co-opera ting brokera ge a  commission of .....................  % of the sa le price of the Property or ...............................................................................................

...........................................................................................................................................................out of the commission the Seller pa ys the Listing Brokera ge.
The Seller further a grees to pa y such commission a s ca lcula ted a bove if a n a greement to purcha se is a greed to or a ccepted by the Seller or a nyone on

the Seller’s beha lf within .......................  da ys a fter the expira tion of the Listing Period (Ho ldo ve r Pe rio d ), so long a s such a greement is with a nyone
who wa s introduced to the Property from a ny source wha tsoever during the Listing Period or shown the Property during the Listing Period. If, however, 
the offer for the purcha se of the Property is pursua nt to a  new a greement in writing to pa y commission to a nother registered rea l esta te brokera ge, 
the Seller‘s lia bility for commission sha ll be reduced by the a mount pa id by the Seller under the new a greement.
The Seller further a grees to pa y such commission a s ca lcula ted a bove even if the tra nsa ction contempla ted by a n a greement to purcha se a greed to
or a ccepted by the Seller or a nyone on the Seller’s beha lf is not completed, if such non-completion is owing or a ttributa ble to the Seller’s defa ult or 
neglect, sa id commission to be pa ya ble on the da te set for completion of the purcha se of the Property.
Any deposit in respect of a ny a greement where the tra nsa ction ha s been completed sha ll  rst be a pplied to reduce the commission pa ya ble. Should
such a mounts pa id to the Listing Brokera ge from the deposit or by the Seller’s solicitor not be suf cient, the Seller sha ll be lia ble to pa y to the Listing 
Brokera ge on dema nd, a ny de ciency in commission a nd ta xes owing on such commission.
In the event the buyer fa ils to complete the purcha se a nd the deposit or a ny pa rt thereof becomes forfeited, a wa rded, directed or relea sed to the
Seller, the Seller then a uthorizes the Listing Brokera ge to reta in a s commission for services rendered,  fty (50%) per cent of the a mount of the sa id 
deposit forfeited, a wa rded, directed or relea sed to the Seller (but not to exceed the commission pa ya ble ha d a  sa le been consumma ted) a nd to pa y 
the ba la nce of the deposit to the Seller.
All a mounts set out a s commission a re to be pa id plus a pplica ble ta xes on such commission.

3 . REPRESEN TATION : The Seller a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge ha s provided the Seller with written informa tion expla ining a gency
rela tionships,including informa tion on Seller Representa tion. Sub-a gency, Buyer Representa tion, Multiple Representa tion a nd Customer Service. The 
Seller understa nds tha t unless the Seller is otherwise informed, the co-opera ting brokera ge is representing the interests of the buyer in the tra nsa ction. 
The Seller further a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge ma y be listing other properties tha t ma y be simila r to the Seller’s Property a nd the
Seller hereby consents to the Listing Brokera ge a cting a s a n a gent for more tha n one seller without a ny cla im by the Seller of con ict of interest.
Unless otherwise a greed in writing between Seller a nd Listing Brokera ge, a ny commission pa ya ble to a ny other brokera ge sha ll be pa id out of the 
commission the Seller pa ys the Listing Brokera ge.
The Seller hereby a ppoints the Listing Brokera ge a s the Seller’s a gent for the purpose of giving a nd receiving notices pursua nt to a ny offer or
a greement to purcha se the Property.

MULTIPLE REPRESEN TATION : The Seller hereby a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge ma y be entering into buyer representa tion a greements 
with buyers who ma y be interested in purcha sing the Seller’s Property. In the event tha t the Listing Brokera ge ha s entered into or enters into a  buyer 
representa tion a greement with a  prospective buyer for the Seller’s Property, the Listing Brokera ge will obta in the Seller’s written consent to represent 
both the Seller a nd the buyer for the tra nsa ction a t the ea rliest pra ctica l opportunity a nd in a ll ca ses prior to a ny offer to purcha se being submitted 
or presented.
The Seller understa nd a nd a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge must be impa rtia l when representing both the Seller a nd the buyer a nd equa lly
protect the interests of the Seller a nd buyer. The Seller understa nds a nd a cknowledges tha t when representing both the Seller a nd the buyer, the Listing 
Brokera ge sha ll ha ve a  duty of full disclosure to both the Seller a nd the buyer, including a  requirement to disclose a ll fa ctua l informa tion a bout the 
Property known to the Listing Brokera ge.
However, the Seller further understa nds a nd a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge sha ll not disclose:

• tha t the Seller ma y or will a ccept less tha n the listed price, unless otherwise instructed in writing by the Seller;
• tha t the buyer ma y or will pa y more tha n the offered price, unless otherwise instructed in writing by the buyer;
• the motiva tion of or persona l informa tion a bout the Seller or buyer, unless otherwise instructed in writing by the pa rty to which the informa tion

a pplies or unless fa ilure to disclose would constitute fra udulent, unla wful or unethica l pra ctice;
• the price the buyer should offer or the price the Seller should a ccept; a nd
• the Listing Brokera ge sha ll not disclose to the buyer the terms of a ny other offer.

However, it is understood tha t fa ctua l ma rket informa tion a bout compa ra ble properties a nd informa tion known to the Listing Brokera ge concerning 
potentia l uses for the Property will be disclosed to both Selle r a nd buyer to a ssist them to come to their own conclusions.

Whe re  a  Bro k e ra g e  re pre s e nts  bo th  the  Se lle r a nd  the  Buy e r (m ultip le  re pre s e nta tio n),  the  Bro k e ra g e  sha ll no t be  e ntitle d o r 
a utho rize d  to  b e  a g e nt fo r e ithe r the  Buy e r o r the  Se lle r fo r the  purpo s e  o f g iv ing  a nd  re ce iv ing  no tice s .

MULTIPLE REPRESEN TATION  AN D CUSTOMER SERVICE: The Seller understa nds a nd a grees tha t the Listing Brokera ge a lso provides 
representa tion a nd customer service to other sellers a nd buyers. If the Listing Brokera ge represents or provides customer service to more tha n one 
seller or buyer for the sa me tra de, the Listing Brokera ge sha ll, in writing, a t the ea rliest pra ctica ble opportunity a nd before a ny offer is ma de, inform 
a ll sellers a nd buyers of the na ture of the Listing Brokera ge’s rela tionship to ea ch seller a nd buyer.

IN ITIALS OF LISTIN G BROKERAGE: IN ITIALS OF SELLER(S):
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deposit forfeited, awarded, directed or released to the Seller (but not to exceed the commission payable had a sale been consummated) and to pay

the balance of the deposit to the Seller



4 . REFERRAL OF EN QUIRIES: The Seller a grees tha t during the Listing Period, the Seller sha ll a dvise the Listing Brokera ge immedia tely of a ll enquiries
from a ny source wha tsoever, a nd a ll offers to purcha se submitted to the Seller sha ll be immedia tely submitted to the Listing Brokera ge by the Seller 
before the Seller a ccepts or rejects the sa me. If a ny enquiry during the Listing Period results in the Seller’s a ccepting a  va lid offer to purcha se during 
the Listing Period or within the Holdover Period a fter the expira tion of the Listing Period described a bove, the Seller a grees to pa y the Listing Brokera ge 
the a mount of commission set out a bove, pa ya ble within  ve (5 ) da ys following the Listing Brokera ge’s written dema nd therefor.

5 . MARKETIN G: The Seller a grees to a llow the Listing Brokera ge to show a nd permit prospective buyers to fully inspect the Property during rea sona ble
hours a nd the Seller gives the Listing Brokera ge the sole a nd exclusive right to pla ce “For Sa le” a nd “Sold” sign(s) upon the Property. The Seller 
consents to the Listing Brokera ge including informa tion in a dvertising tha t ma y identify the Property. The Seller further a grees tha t the Listing Brokera ge 
sha ll ha ve sole a nd exclusive a uthority to ma ke a ll a dvertising decisions rela ting to the ma rketing of the Property during the Listing Period. The Seller 
a grees tha t the Listing Brokera ge will not be held lia ble in a ny ma nner wha tsoever for a ny a cts or omissions with respect to a dvertising by the Listing 
Brokera ge or a ny other pa rty, other tha n by the Listing Brokera ge’s gross negligence or wilful a ct.

6 . WARRAN TY: The Seller represents a nd wa rra nts tha t the Seller ha s the exclusive a uthority a nd power to execute this Authority to offer the Property for
sa le a nd tha t the Seller ha s informed the Listing Brokera ge of a ny third pa rty interests or cla ims on the Property such a s rights of  rst refusa l, options, 
ea sements, mortga ges, encumbra nces or otherwise concerning the Property, which ma y a ffect the sa le of the Property.

7 . IN DEMN IFICATION  AN D IN SURAN CE: The Seller will not hold the Listing Brokera ge a nd representa tives of the Brokera ge responsible for
a ny loss or da ma ge to the Property or contents occurring during the term of this Agreement ca used by the Listing Brokera ge or a nyone else by a ny 
mea ns, including theft,  re or va nda lism, other tha n by the Listing Brokera ge’s gross negligence or wilful a ct. The Seller a grees to indemnify a nd sa ve 
ha rmless the Listing Brokera ge a nd representa tives of the Brokera ge a nd a ny co-opera ting brokera ge from a ny lia bility, cla im, loss, cost, da ma ge or 
injury, including but not limited to loss of the commission pa ya ble under this Agreement, ca used or contributed to by the brea ch of a ny wa rra nty or 
representa tion ma de by the Seller in this Agreement a nd, if a tta ched, the a ccompa nying da ta  form.
The Seller wa rra nts the Property is insured, including persona l lia bility insura nce a ga inst a ny cla ims or la wsuits resulting from bodily injury or property
da ma ge to others ca used in a ny wa y on or a t the Property a nd the Seller indemni es the Brokera ge a nd a ll of its employees, representa tives, 
sa lespersons a nd brokers (Listing Brokera ge) a nd a ny co-opera ting brokera ge a nd a ll of its employees, representa tives, sa lespersons a nd brokers 
(co-opera ting  brokera ge) for a nd a ga inst a ny cla ims a ga inst the Listing Brokera ge or co-opera ting brokera ge ma de by a nyone who a ttends or visits 
the Property.

8 . EN VIRON MEN TAL IN DEMN IFICATION : The Seller a grees to indemnify a nd sa ve ha rmless the Listing Brokera ge a nd representa tives of the
Brokera ge a nd a ny co-opera ting brokera ge from a ny lia bility, cla im, loss, cost, da ma ge or injury a s a  result of the Property being a ffected by a ny 
conta mina nts or environmenta l problems.

9 . FAMILY LAW ACT: The Seller hereby wa rra nts tha t spousa l consent is not necessa ry under the provisions of the Fa mily La w Act, R.S.O . 1990 , unless
the spouse of the Seller ha s executed the consent hereina fter provided.

1 0 . FIN DERS FEES: The Seller a cknowledges tha t the Brokera ge ma y be receiving a   nder’s fee, rewa rd a nd/ or referra l incentive, a nd the Seller 
consents to a ny such bene t being received a nd reta ined by the Brokera ge in a ddition to the commission a s described a bove.

1 1 . VERIFICATION  OF IN FORMATION : The Seller a uthorizes the Listing Brokera ge to obta in a ny informa tion from a ny regula tory a uthorities, 
governments, mortga gees or others a ffecting the Property a nd the Seller a grees to execute a nd deliver such further a uthoriza tions in this rega rd a s 
ma y be rea sona bly required. The Seller hereby a ppoints the Listing Brokera ge or the Listing Brokera ge’s a uthorized representa tive a s the Seller’s
a ttorney to execute such documenta tion a s ma y be necessa ry to effect obta ining a ny informa tion a s a foresa id. The Seller hereby a uthorizes, instructs
a nd directs the a bove noted regula tory a uthorities, governments, mortga gees or others to relea se a ny a nd a ll informa tion to the Listing Brokera ge.

1 2 . USE AN D DISTRIBUTION  OF IN FORMATION : The Seller consents to the collection, use a nd disclosure of persona l informa tion by the Brokera ge 
for the purpose of listing a nd ma rketing the Property including, but not limited to: listing a nd a dvertising the Property using a ny medium including the
Internet; disclosing Property informa tion to prospective buyers, brokera ges, sa lespersons a nd others who ma y a ssist in the sa le of the Property; such
other use of the Seller’s persona l informa tion a s is consistent with listing a nd ma rketing of the Property. The Seller consents, if this is a n MLS® Listing, 
to pla cement of the listing informa tion a nd sa les informa tion by the Brokera ge into the da ta ba se(s) of the MLS® System of the a ppropria te Boa rd, a nd
to the posting of a ny documents a nd other informa tion (including, without limita tion, photogra phs, ima ges, gra phics, a udio a nd video recordings,
virtua l tours, dra wings,  oor pla ns, a rchitectura l designs, a rtistic renderings, surveys a nd listing descriptions) provided by or on beha lf of the Seller 
into the da ta ba se(s) of the MLS® System of the a ppropria te Boa rd. The Seller hereby indemni es a nd sa ves ha rmless the Brokera ge a nd/ or a ny of 
its employees, serva nts, brokers or sa les representa tives from a ny a nd a ll cla ims, lia bilities, suits, a ctions, losses, costs a nd lega l fees ca used by, or 
a rising out of, or resulting from the posting of a ny documents or other informa tion (including, without limita tion, photogra phs, ima ges, gra phics, a udio 
a nd video recordings, virtua l tours, dra wings,  oor pla ns, a rchitectura l designs, a rtistic renderings, surveys a nd listing descriptions) a s a foresa id. 
The Seller a cknowledges tha t the da ta ba se, within the boa rd’s MLS® System is the property of the rea l esta te boa rd(s) a nd ca n be licensed, resold, or 
otherwise dea lt with by the boa rd(s). The Seller further a cknowledges tha t the rea l esta te boa rd(s) ma y: during the term of the listing a nd therea fter, 
distribute the informa tion in the da ta ba se, within the boa rd’s MLS® System to a ny persons a uthorized to use such service which ma y include other 
brokera ges, government depa rtments, a ppra isers, municipa l orga niza tions a nd others; ma rket the Property, a t its option, in a ny medium, including 
electronic media ; during the term of the listing a nd therea fter, compile, reta in a nd publish a ny sta tistics including historica l da ta  within the boa rd’s 
MLS® System a nd reta in, reproduce a nd displa y photogra phs, ima ges, gra phics, a udio a nd video recordings, virtua l tours, dra wings,  oor pla ns, 
a rchitectura l designs, a rtistic renderings, surveys a nd listing descriptions which ma y be used by boa rd members to conduct compa ra tive a na lyses; a nd 
ma ke such other use of the informa tion a s the Brokera ge a nd/ or rea l esta te boa rd(s) deem a ppropria te, in connection with the listing, ma rketing a nd

IN ITIALS OF LISTIN G BROKERAGE: IN ITIALS OF SELLER(S):
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The Seller warrants the Property is insured, including personal liability insurance against any claims or lawsuits resulting from bodily injury or property

damage to others caused in any way on or at the Property and the Seller indemni es the Brokerage and all of its employees, representatives,

salespersons and brokers (Listing Brokerage) and any co-operating brokerage and all of its employees, representatives, salespersons and brokers

(co-operating brokerage) for and against any claims against the Listing Brokerage or co-operating brokerage made by anyone who attends or visits

the Property.
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FAMILY LAW ACT: The Seller hereby warrants that spousal consent is not necessary under the provisions of the Family Law Act, R.S.O. 1990, unless

the spouse of the Seller has executed the consent hereinafter provided.
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FINDERS FEES: The Seller acknowledges that the Brokerage may be receiving a nder’s fee, reward and/or referral incentive, and the Seller

consents to any such bene t being received and retained by the Brokerage in addition to the commission as described above.
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easements, mortgages, encumbrances or otherwise concerning the Property, which may affect the sale of the Property



    

    

    

selling of rea l esta te during the term of the listing a nd therea fter. The Seller a cknowledges tha t the informa tion, persona l or otherwise (“informa tion”), 
provided to the rea l esta te boa rd or a ssocia tion ma y be stored on da ta ba ses loca ted outside of Ca na da , in which ca se the informa tion would be 
subject to the la ws of the jurisdiction in which the informa tion is loca ted.

1 3 . SUCCESSORS AN D ASSIGN S: The heirs, executors, a dministra tors, successors a nd a ssigns of the undersigned a re bound by the terms of this Agreement.

1 4 . CON FLICT OR DISCREPAN CY: If there is a ny con ict or discrepa ncy between a ny provision a dded to this Agreement (including a ny Schedule 
a tta ched hereto) a nd a ny provision in the sta nda rd pre-set portion hereof, the a dded provision sha ll supersede the sta nda rd pre-set provision to the 
extent of such con ict or discrepa ncy. This Agreement, including a ny Schedule a tta ched hereto, sha ll constitute the entire Authority from the Seller to 
the Brokera ge. There is no representa tion, wa rra nty, colla tera l a greement or condition, which a ffects this Agreement other tha n a s expressed herein.

1 5 . ELECTRON IC COMMUN ICATION : This Agreement a nd a ny a greements, notices or other communica tions contempla ted thereby ma y be tra nsmitted 
by mea ns of electronic systems, in which ca se signa tures sha ll be deemed to be origina l. The tra nsmission of this Agreement by the Seller by electronic 
mea ns sha ll be deemed to con rm the Seller ha s reta ined a  true copy of the Agreement.

1 6 . ELECTRON IC SIGN ATURES: If this Agreement ha s been signed with a n electronic signa ture the pa rties hereto consent a nd a gree to the use of such 
electronic signa ture with respect to this Agreement pursua nt to the Electronic Commerce Act, 2000, S.O . 2000 , c17  a s a mended from time to time.

1 7 . SCHEDULE(S) ................................................................................................................  a nd da ta  form a tta ched hereto form(s) pa rt of this Agreement.

THE LISTIN G BROKERAGE AGREES TO MARKET THE PROPERTY ON  BEHALF OF THE SELLER AN D REPRESEN T THE SELLER IN  AN
EN DEAVOUR TO OBTAIN  A VALID OFFER TO PURCHASE THE PROPERTY ON  THE TERMS SET OUT IN  THIS AGREEMEN T OR ON  SUCH 
OTHER TERMS SATISFACTORY TO THE SELLER.

..................................................................................................................      ................................................ .........................................................................................
(Authorized to bind the Listing Brokera ge)                                                      (Da te) (Na me of Person Signing)

THIS AGREEMEN T HAS BEEN  READ AN D FULLY UN DERSTOOD BY ME, I ACCEPT THE TERMS OF THIS AGREEMEN T AN D I ACKN OWLEDGE 
ON  THIS DATE I HAVE SIGN ED UN DER SEAL. Any representa tions conta ined herein or a s shown on the a ccompa nying da ta  form respecting the 
Property a re true to the best of my knowledge, informa tion a nd belief.

SIGNED, SEALED AND DELIVERED I ha ve hereunto set my ha nd a nd sea l:

..................................................................................................................
(Na me of Seller)

..................................................................................................................       ........................................................     ........................................................................
(Signa ture of Seller/ Authorized Signing O f cer)                                          (Sea l)     (Da te)                            (Tel. No.)

..................................................................................................................       ........................................................     ........................................................................
(Signa ture of Seller/ Authorized Signing O f cer)                                          (Sea l)     (Da te)                            (Tel. No.)

SPOUSAL CON SEN T: The undersigned spouse of the Seller hereby consents to the listing of the Property herein pursua nt to the provisions of the Fa mily 
La w Act, R.S.O . 1990  a nd hereby a grees to execute a ll necessa ry or incidenta l documents to further a ny tra nsa ction provided for herein.

..................................................................................................................       ........................................................     ........................................................................
(Spouse)                                                                                               (Sea l)     (Da te)                                 (Tel. No.)

ACKN OWLEDGEMEN T
The  Se lle r(s ) he re by  a ck no w le dg e  tha t the  Se lle r(s ) fully  unde rs ta nd  the  te rm s  o f this  Ag re e m e nt a nd  ha ve  re ce ive d  a  co py  o f

this  Ag re e m e nt o n  the  …….................... da y  o f …………...................................................……...………..................... …………, 2 0  ….........................……

.............................................................................................................................................................................................    .......................................................................
(Signa ture of Seller)                                                                   (Da te)

.............................................................................................................................................................................................    .......................................................................
(Signa ture of Seller)                                                                   (Da te)
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In the event tha t this Agreement expires or is ca ncelled or otherwise
termina ted a nd the Property is not sold, the Seller, by initia lling:

(Do e s ) (Do e s  N o t)consent to a llow other rea l esta te boa rd members to conta ct the Seller a fter expira tion or
other termina tion of this Agreement to discuss listing or otherwise ma rketing the Property.

A

JOE LEVY

DECLARATION  OF IN SURAN CE

The Sa lesperson/ Broker/ Broker of Record ........................................................................................................................................................................................
(Na me of Sa lesperson/ Broker/ Broker of Record)

hereby decla res tha t he/ she is insured a s required by REBBA.

..........................................................................................................................................................................................................
(Signa ture(s) of Sa lesperson/ Broker/ Broker of Record)

JOE LEVY
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for use in the Province of O nta rio

Lis ting  Ag re e m e nt – Co m m e rcia l
Se lle r Re pre s e nta tio n  Ag re e m e nt
Autho rity  to  Offe r fo r Sa le

®
EXCLUSIVE

This  is  a  Multip le  Lis ting  Se rv ice ® Ag re e m e nt OR This  Lis ting  is  Ex clus ive

(Seller’s Initia ls)          (Seller’s Initia ls)
BETWEEN :
BROKERAGE: ............................................................................................................................................................................................................................................

............................................................................................................................................ (the “Listing Brokera ge”) Tel. No. ..................................................................

SELLER: .................................................................................................................................................................................................................................. (the “Seller”)

In considera tion of the Listing Brokera ge listing the rea l property fo r sa le  known a s ......................................................................................................................

.............................................................................................................................................................................................................................................. (the “Property”)
the Seller hereby gives the Listing Brokera ge the e x clus ive  a nd  irre vo ca b le  right to a ct a s the Seller’s a gent,

co m m e ncing  a t 12 :01  a .m. on the .................................. da y of ............................................................................................................................ , 20 ................... ,

until 11 :59  p.m. on the .................................  da y of ..........................................................................................................., 20 ...................... (the “Listing Period”),

{ Seller a cknowledges tha t the length of the Listing Period is negotia ble between the Seller a nd the Listing Brokera ge a nd, if a n
MLS® listing, ma y be subject to minimum requirements of the rea l esta te boa rd, however, in a ccorda nce with the Rea l Esta te
a nd Business Brokers Act, 2002 , (REBBA), if the  Lis ting  Pe rio d  e x ce e d s  s ix  m o nths ,  the  Lis ting  Bro k e ra g e  m us t (Seller’s Initia ls)
o b ta in  the  Se lle r’s  in itia ls .

to offer the Property fo r sa le  a t a  price of:

...................................................................................................................................................................................Dolla rs   ($CDN) $
a nd upon the terms pa rticula rly set out herein, or a t such other price a nd/ or terms a ccepta ble to the Seller. It is understood tha t the price a nd/ or terms 
set out herein a re a t the Seller’s persona l request, a fter full discussion with the Listing Brokera ge’s representa tive rega rding potentia l ma rket va lue of the
Property.

The  Se lle r he re by  re pre s e nts  a nd  w a rra nts  tha t the  Se lle r is  no t a  pa rty  to  a ny  o the r lis ting  a g re e m e nt fo r the  
Pro pe rty  o r a g re e m e nt to  pa y  co m m is s io n  to  a ny  o the r re a l e s ta te  bro k e ra g e  fo r the  sa le  o f the  pro pe rty.

1 . DEFIN ITION S AN D IN TERPRETATION S: For the purposes of this Agreement (“Authority” or “Agreement”):

(Seller’s Initia ls)

“Seller” includes vendor a nd a  “buyer” includes a  purcha ser or a  prospective purcha ser. A purcha se sha ll be deemed to include the entering into of 
a ny a greement to excha nge, or the obta ining of a n option to purcha se which is subsequently exercised, or the ca using of a  First Right of Refusa l to be 
exercised, or a n a greement to sell or tra nsfer sha res or a ssets. “Rea l property” includes rea l esta te a s de ned in the Rea l Esta te a nd Business Brokers 
Act (2002). The “Property” sha ll be deemed to include a ny pa rt thereof or interest therein. A “rea l esta te boa rd” includes a  rea l esta te a ssocia tion. 
Commission sha ll be deemed to include other remunera tion. This Agreement sha ll be rea d with a ll cha nges of gender or number required by the 
context. For purposes of this Agreement, a nyone introduced to or shown the Property sha ll be deemed to include a ny spouse, heirs, executors, 
a dministra tors, successors, a ssigns, rela ted corpora tions a nd a f lia ted corpora tions. Rela ted corpora tions or a f lia ted corpora tions sha ll include a ny 
corpora tion where one ha lf or a  ma jority of the sha reholders, directors or of cers of the rela ted or a f lia ted corpora tion a re the sa me person(s) a s the 
sha reholders, directors, or of cers of the corpora tion introduced to or shown the Property.

2 . COMMISSION : In considera tion of the Listing Brokera ge listing the Property for sa le, the Seller a grees to pa y the Listing Brokera ge a  commission

of ...................................  % of the sa le price of the Property or ...........................................................................................................................................................

................................................................................................................................................................................................................................................................
for a ny va lid offer to purcha se the Property from a ny source wha tsoever obta ined during the Listing Period a nd on the terms a nd conditions set out in 
this Agreement OR such other terms a nd conditions a s the Seller ma y a ccept.

IN ITIALS OF LISTIN G BROKERAGE: IN ITIALS OF SELLER(S):
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Royal LePage Real Estate Services Ltd, Brokerage

4025 Yonge Street Toronto,ON   suite 103 416-487-4311

1605 Main Street East, Hamilton ON
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The Seller a uthorizes the Listing Brokera ge to co-opera te with a ny other registered rea l esta te brokera ge (co-opera ting brokera ge), a nd to offer to pa y

the co-opera ting brokera ge a  commission of .....................  % of the sa le price of the Property or ...............................................................................................

...........................................................................................................................................................out of the commission the Seller pa ys the Listing Brokera ge.
The Seller further a grees to pa y such commission a s ca lcula ted a bove if a n a greement to purcha se is a greed to or a ccepted by the Seller or a nyone on

the Seller’s beha lf within .......................  da ys a fter the expira tion of the Listing Period (Ho ldo ve r Pe rio d ), so long a s such a greement is with a nyone
who wa s introduced to the Property from a ny source wha tsoever during the Listing Period or shown the Property during the Listing Period. If, however, 
the offer for the purcha se of the Property is pursua nt to a  new a greement in writing to pa y commission to a nother registered rea l esta te brokera ge, 
the Seller‘s lia bility for commission sha ll be reduced by the a mount pa id by the Seller under the new a greement.
The Seller further a grees to pa y such commission a s ca lcula ted a bove even if the tra nsa ction contempla ted by a n a greement to purcha se a greed to
or a ccepted by the Seller or a nyone on the Seller’s beha lf is not completed, if such non-completion is owing or a ttributa ble to the Seller’s defa ult or 
neglect, sa id commission to be pa ya ble on the da te set for completion of the purcha se of the Property.
Any deposit in respect of a ny a greement where the tra nsa ction ha s been completed sha ll  rst be a pplied to reduce the commission pa ya ble. Should
such a mounts pa id to the Listing Brokera ge from the deposit or by the Seller’s solicitor not be suf cient, the Seller sha ll be lia ble to pa y to the Listing 
Brokera ge on dema nd, a ny de ciency in commission a nd ta xes owing on such commission.
In the event the buyer fa ils to complete the purcha se a nd the deposit or a ny pa rt thereof becomes forfeited, a wa rded, directed or relea sed to the
Seller, the Seller then a uthorizes the Listing Brokera ge to reta in a s commission for services rendered,  fty (50%) per cent of the a mount of the sa id 
deposit forfeited, a wa rded, directed or relea sed to the Seller (but not to exceed the commission pa ya ble ha d a  sa le been consumma ted) a nd to pa y 
the ba la nce of the deposit to the Seller.
All a mounts set out a s commission a re to be pa id plus a pplica ble ta xes on such commission.

3 . REPRESEN TATION : The Seller a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge ha s provided the Seller with written informa tion expla ining a gency
rela tionships,including informa tion on Seller Representa tion. Sub-a gency, Buyer Representa tion, Multiple Representa tion a nd Customer Service. The 
Seller understa nds tha t unless the Seller is otherwise informed, the co-opera ting brokera ge is representing the interests of the buyer in the tra nsa ction. 
The Seller further a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge ma y be listing other properties tha t ma y be simila r to the Seller’s Property a nd the
Seller hereby consents to the Listing Brokera ge a cting a s a n a gent for more tha n one seller without a ny cla im by the Seller of con ict of interest.
Unless otherwise a greed in writing between Seller a nd Listing Brokera ge, a ny commission pa ya ble to a ny other brokera ge sha ll be pa id out of the 
commission the Seller pa ys the Listing Brokera ge.
The Seller hereby a ppoints the Listing Brokera ge a s the Seller’s a gent for the purpose of giving a nd receiving notices pursua nt to a ny offer or
a greement to purcha se the Property.

MULTIPLE REPRESEN TATION : The Seller hereby a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge ma y be entering into buyer representa tion a greements 
with buyers who ma y be interested in purcha sing the Seller’s Property. In the event tha t the Listing Brokera ge ha s entered into or enters into a  buyer 
representa tion a greement with a  prospective buyer for the Seller’s Property, the Listing Brokera ge will obta in the Seller’s written consent to represent 
both the Seller a nd the buyer for the tra nsa ction a t the ea rliest pra ctica l opportunity a nd in a ll ca ses prior to a ny offer to purcha se being submitted 
or presented.
The Seller understa nd a nd a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge must be impa rtia l when representing both the Seller a nd the buyer a nd equa lly
protect the interests of the Seller a nd buyer. The Seller understa nds a nd a cknowledges tha t when representing both the Seller a nd the buyer, the Listing 
Brokera ge sha ll ha ve a  duty of full disclosure to both the Seller a nd the buyer, including a  requirement to disclose a ll fa ctua l informa tion a bout the 
Property known to the Listing Brokera ge.
However, the Seller further understa nds a nd a cknowledges tha t the Listing Brokera ge sha ll not disclose:

• tha t the Seller ma y or will a ccept less tha n the listed price, unless otherwise instructed in writing by the Seller;
• tha t the buyer ma y or will pa y more tha n the offered price, unless otherwise instructed in writing by the buyer;
• the motiva tion of or persona l informa tion a bout the Seller or buyer, unless otherwise instructed in writing by the pa rty to which the informa tion

a pplies or unless fa ilure to disclose would constitute fra udulent, unla wful or unethica l pra ctice;
• the price the buyer should offer or the price the Seller should a ccept; a nd
• the Listing Brokera ge sha ll not disclose to the buyer the terms of a ny other offer.

However, it is understood tha t fa ctua l ma rket informa tion a bout compa ra ble properties a nd informa tion known to the Listing Brokera ge concerning 
potentia l uses for the Property will be disclosed to both Selle r a nd buyer to a ssist them to come to their own conclusions.

Whe re  a  Bro k e ra g e  re pre s e nts  bo th  the  Se lle r a nd  the  Buy e r (m ultip le  re pre s e nta tio n),  the  Bro k e ra g e  sha ll no t be  e ntitle d o r 
a utho rize d  to  b e  a g e nt fo r e ithe r the  Buy e r o r the  Se lle r fo r the  purpo s e  o f g iv ing  a nd  re ce iv ing  no tice s .

MULTIPLE REPRESEN TATION  AN D CUSTOMER SERVICE: The Seller understa nds a nd a grees tha t the Listing Brokera ge a lso provides 
representa tion a nd customer service to other sellers a nd buyers. If the Listing Brokera ge represents or provides customer service to more tha n one 
seller or buyer for the sa me tra de, the Listing Brokera ge sha ll, in writing, a t the ea rliest pra ctica ble opportunity a nd before a ny offer is ma de, inform 
a ll sellers a nd buyers of the na ture of the Listing Brokera ge’s rela tionship to ea ch seller a nd buyer.

IN ITIALS OF LISTIN G BROKERAGE: IN ITIALS OF SELLER(S):
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The Seller further agrees to pay such commission as calculated above even if the transaction contemplated by an agreement to purchase agreed to

or accepted by the Seller or anyone on the Seller’s behalf is not completed, if such non-completion is owing or attributable to the Seller’s default or

neglect, said commission to be payable on the date set for completion of the purchase of the Property
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Such commissoin is payable only once the full selling price have been received by the Seller.
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after payment of any direct expenses of the transaction.
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fty (50%) per cent of the amount of the said

deposit forfeited, awarded, directed or released to the Seller (but not to exceed the commission payable had a sale been consummated) and to pay

the balance of the deposit to the Seller



4 . REFERRAL OF EN QUIRIES: The Seller a grees tha t during the Listing Period, the Seller sha ll a dvise the Listing Brokera ge immedia tely of a ll enquiries
from a ny source wha tsoever, a nd a ll offers to purcha se submitted to the Seller sha ll be immedia tely submitted to the Listing Brokera ge by the Seller 
before the Seller a ccepts or rejects the sa me. If a ny enquiry during the Listing Period results in the Seller’s a ccepting a  va lid offer to purcha se during 
the Listing Period or within the Holdover Period a fter the expira tion of the Listing Period described a bove, the Seller a grees to pa y the Listing Brokera ge 
the a mount of commission set out a bove, pa ya ble within  ve (5 ) da ys following the Listing Brokera ge’s written dema nd therefor.

5 . MARKETIN G: The Seller a grees to a llow the Listing Brokera ge to show a nd permit prospective buyers to fully inspect the Property during rea sona ble
hours a nd the Seller gives the Listing Brokera ge the sole a nd exclusive right to pla ce “For Sa le” a nd “Sold” sign(s) upon the Property. The Seller 
consents to the Listing Brokera ge including informa tion in a dvertising tha t ma y identify the Property. The Seller further a grees tha t the Listing Brokera ge 
sha ll ha ve sole a nd exclusive a uthority to ma ke a ll a dvertising decisions rela ting to the ma rketing of the Property during the Listing Period. The Seller 
a grees tha t the Listing Brokera ge will not be held lia ble in a ny ma nner wha tsoever for a ny a cts or omissions with respect to a dvertising by the Listing 
Brokera ge or a ny other pa rty, other tha n by the Listing Brokera ge’s gross negligence or wilful a ct.

6 . WARRAN TY: The Seller represents a nd wa rra nts tha t the Seller ha s the exclusive a uthority a nd power to execute this Authority to offer the Property for
sa le a nd tha t the Seller ha s informed the Listing Brokera ge of a ny third pa rty interests or cla ims on the Property such a s rights of  rst refusa l, options, 
ea sements, mortga ges, encumbra nces or otherwise concerning the Property, which ma y a ffect the sa le of the Property.

7 . IN DEMN IFICATION  AN D IN SURAN CE: The Seller will not hold the Listing Brokera ge a nd representa tives of the Brokera ge responsible for
a ny loss or da ma ge to the Property or contents occurring during the term of this Agreement ca used by the Listing Brokera ge or a nyone else by a ny 
mea ns, including theft,  re or va nda lism, other tha n by the Listing Brokera ge’s gross negligence or wilful a ct. The Seller a grees to indemnify a nd sa ve 
ha rmless the Listing Brokera ge a nd representa tives of the Brokera ge a nd a ny co-opera ting brokera ge from a ny lia bility, cla im, loss, cost, da ma ge or 
injury, including but not limited to loss of the commission pa ya ble under this Agreement, ca used or contributed to by the brea ch of a ny wa rra nty or 
representa tion ma de by the Seller in this Agreement a nd, if a tta ched, the a ccompa nying da ta  form.
The Seller wa rra nts the Property is insured, including persona l lia bility insura nce a ga inst a ny cla ims or la wsuits resulting from bodily injury or property
da ma ge to others ca used in a ny wa y on or a t the Property a nd the Seller indemni es the Brokera ge a nd a ll of its employees, representa tives, 
sa lespersons a nd brokers (Listing Brokera ge) a nd a ny co-opera ting brokera ge a nd a ll of its employees, representa tives, sa lespersons a nd brokers 
(co-opera ting  brokera ge) for a nd a ga inst a ny cla ims a ga inst the Listing Brokera ge or co-opera ting brokera ge ma de by a nyone who a ttends or visits 
the Property.

8 . EN VIRON MEN TAL IN DEMN IFICATION : The Seller a grees to indemnify a nd sa ve ha rmless the Listing Brokera ge a nd representa tives of the
Brokera ge a nd a ny co-opera ting brokera ge from a ny lia bility, cla im, loss, cost, da ma ge or injury a s a  result of the Property being a ffected by a ny 
conta mina nts or environmenta l problems.

9 . FAMILY LAW ACT: The Seller hereby wa rra nts tha t spousa l consent is not necessa ry under the provisions of the Fa mily La w Act, R.S.O . 1990 , unless
the spouse of the Seller ha s executed the consent hereina fter provided.

1 0 . FIN DERS FEES: The Seller a cknowledges tha t the Brokera ge ma y be receiving a   nder’s fee, rewa rd a nd/ or referra l incentive, a nd the Seller 
consents to a ny such bene t being received a nd reta ined by the Brokera ge in a ddition to the commission a s described a bove.

1 1 . VERIFICATION  OF IN FORMATION : The Seller a uthorizes the Listing Brokera ge to obta in a ny informa tion from a ny regula tory a uthorities, 
governments, mortga gees or others a ffecting the Property a nd the Seller a grees to execute a nd deliver such further a uthoriza tions in this rega rd a s 
ma y be rea sona bly required. The Seller hereby a ppoints the Listing Brokera ge or the Listing Brokera ge’s a uthorized representa tive a s the Seller’s
a ttorney to execute such documenta tion a s ma y be necessa ry to effect obta ining a ny informa tion a s a foresa id. The Seller hereby a uthorizes, instructs
a nd directs the a bove noted regula tory a uthorities, governments, mortga gees or others to relea se a ny a nd a ll informa tion to the Listing Brokera ge.

1 2 . USE AN D DISTRIBUTION  OF IN FORMATION : The Seller consents to the collection, use a nd disclosure of persona l informa tion by the Brokera ge 
for the purpose of listing a nd ma rketing the Property including, but not limited to: listing a nd a dvertising the Property using a ny medium including the
Internet; disclosing Property informa tion to prospective buyers, brokera ges, sa lespersons a nd others who ma y a ssist in the sa le of the Property; such
other use of the Seller’s persona l informa tion a s is consistent with listing a nd ma rketing of the Property. The Seller consents, if this is a n MLS® Listing, 
to pla cement of the listing informa tion a nd sa les informa tion by the Brokera ge into the da ta ba se(s) of the MLS® System of the a ppropria te Boa rd, a nd
to the posting of a ny documents a nd other informa tion (including, without limita tion, photogra phs, ima ges, gra phics, a udio a nd video recordings,
virtua l tours, dra wings,  oor pla ns, a rchitectura l designs, a rtistic renderings, surveys a nd listing descriptions) provided by or on beha lf of the Seller 
into the da ta ba se(s) of the MLS® System of the a ppropria te Boa rd. The Seller hereby indemni es a nd sa ves ha rmless the Brokera ge a nd/ or a ny of 
its employees, serva nts, brokers or sa les representa tives from a ny a nd a ll cla ims, lia bilities, suits, a ctions, losses, costs a nd lega l fees ca used by, or 
a rising out of, or resulting from the posting of a ny documents or other informa tion (including, without limita tion, photogra phs, ima ges, gra phics, a udio 
a nd video recordings, virtua l tours, dra wings,  oor pla ns, a rchitectura l designs, a rtistic renderings, surveys a nd listing descriptions) a s a foresa id. 
The Seller a cknowledges tha t the da ta ba se, within the boa rd’s MLS® System is the property of the rea l esta te boa rd(s) a nd ca n be licensed, resold, or 
otherwise dea lt with by the boa rd(s). The Seller further a cknowledges tha t the rea l esta te boa rd(s) ma y: during the term of the listing a nd therea fter, 
distribute the informa tion in the da ta ba se, within the boa rd’s MLS® System to a ny persons a uthorized to use such service which ma y include other 
brokera ges, government depa rtments, a ppra isers, municipa l orga niza tions a nd others; ma rket the Property, a t its option, in a ny medium, including 
electronic media ; during the term of the listing a nd therea fter, compile, reta in a nd publish a ny sta tistics including historica l da ta  within the boa rd’s 
MLS® System a nd reta in, reproduce a nd displa y photogra phs, ima ges, gra phics, a udio a nd video recordings, virtua l tours, dra wings,  oor pla ns, 
a rchitectura l designs, a rtistic renderings, surveys a nd listing descriptions which ma y be used by boa rd members to conduct compa ra tive a na lyses; a nd 
ma ke such other use of the informa tion a s the Brokera ge a nd/ or rea l esta te boa rd(s) deem a ppropria te, in connection with the listing, ma rketing a nd

IN ITIALS OF LISTIN G BROKERAGE: IN ITIALS OF SELLER(S):

The tra dema rks REALTO R®, REALTO RS®, MLS®, Multiple Listing Services® a nd a ssocia ted logos a re owned or controlled by 
The Ca na dia n Rea l Esta te Associa tion (CREA) a nd identify the rea l esta te professiona ls who a re members of CREA a nd the 
qua lity of services they provide. Used under license.
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property is being sold as is, where is, through an approval and vesting order
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The Seller warrants the Property is insured, including personal liability insurance against any claims or lawsuits resulting from bodily injury or property

damage to others caused in any way on or at the Property and the Seller indemni es the Brokerage and all of its employees, representatives,

salespersons and brokers (Listing Brokerage) and any co-operating brokerage and all of its employees, representatives, salespersons and brokers

(co-operating brokerage) for and against any claims against the Listing Brokerage or co-operating brokerage made by anyone who attends or visits

the Property.
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FAMILY LAW ACT: The Seller hereby warrants that spousal consent is not necessary under the provisions of the Family Law Act, R.S.O. 1990, unless

the spouse of the Seller has executed the consent hereinafter provided.



Trina.Burningham
Cross-out
FINDERS FEES: The Seller acknowledges that the Brokerage may be receiving a nder’s fee, reward and/or referral incentive, and the Seller

consents to any such bene t being received and retained by the Brokerage in addition to the commission as described above.
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easements, mortgages, encumbrances or otherwise concerning the Property, which may affect the sale of the Property



    

    

    

selling of rea l esta te during the term of the listing a nd therea fter. The Seller a cknowledges tha t the informa tion, persona l or otherwise (“informa tion”), 
provided to the rea l esta te boa rd or a ssocia tion ma y be stored on da ta ba ses loca ted outside of Ca na da , in which ca se the informa tion would be 
subject to the la ws of the jurisdiction in which the informa tion is loca ted.

1 3 . SUCCESSORS AN D ASSIGN S: The heirs, executors, a dministra tors, successors a nd a ssigns of the undersigned a re bound by the terms of this Agreement.

1 4 . CON FLICT OR DISCREPAN CY: If there is a ny con ict or discrepa ncy between a ny provision a dded to this Agreement (including a ny Schedule 
a tta ched hereto) a nd a ny provision in the sta nda rd pre-set portion hereof, the a dded provision sha ll supersede the sta nda rd pre-set provision to the 
extent of such con ict or discrepa ncy. This Agreement, including a ny Schedule a tta ched hereto, sha ll constitute the entire Authority from the Seller to 
the Brokera ge. There is no representa tion, wa rra nty, colla tera l a greement or condition, which a ffects this Agreement other tha n a s expressed herein.

1 5 . ELECTRON IC COMMUN ICATION : This Agreement a nd a ny a greements, notices or other communica tions contempla ted thereby ma y be tra nsmitted 
by mea ns of electronic systems, in which ca se signa tures sha ll be deemed to be origina l. The tra nsmission of this Agreement by the Seller by electronic 
mea ns sha ll be deemed to con rm the Seller ha s reta ined a  true copy of the Agreement.

1 6 . ELECTRON IC SIGN ATURES: If this Agreement ha s been signed with a n electronic signa ture the pa rties hereto consent a nd a gree to the use of such 
electronic signa ture with respect to this Agreement pursua nt to the Electronic Commerce Act, 2000, S.O . 2000 , c17  a s a mended from time to time.

1 7 . SCHEDULE(S) ................................................................................................................  a nd da ta  form a tta ched hereto form(s) pa rt of this Agreement.

THE LISTIN G BROKERAGE AGREES TO MARKET THE PROPERTY ON  BEHALF OF THE SELLER AN D REPRESEN T THE SELLER IN  AN
EN DEAVOUR TO OBTAIN  A VALID OFFER TO PURCHASE THE PROPERTY ON  THE TERMS SET OUT IN  THIS AGREEMEN T OR ON  SUCH 
OTHER TERMS SATISFACTORY TO THE SELLER.

..................................................................................................................      ................................................ .........................................................................................
(Authorized to bind the Listing Brokera ge)                                                      (Da te) (Na me of Person Signing)

THIS AGREEMEN T HAS BEEN  READ AN D FULLY UN DERSTOOD BY ME, I ACCEPT THE TERMS OF THIS AGREEMEN T AN D I ACKN OWLEDGE 
ON  THIS DATE I HAVE SIGN ED UN DER SEAL. Any representa tions conta ined herein or a s shown on the a ccompa nying da ta  form respecting the 
Property a re true to the best of my knowledge, informa tion a nd belief.

SIGNED, SEALED AND DELIVERED I ha ve hereunto set my ha nd a nd sea l:

..................................................................................................................
(Na me of Seller)

..................................................................................................................       ........................................................     ........................................................................
(Signa ture of Seller/ Authorized Signing O f cer)                                          (Sea l)     (Da te)                            (Tel. No.)

..................................................................................................................       ........................................................     ........................................................................
(Signa ture of Seller/ Authorized Signing O f cer)                                          (Sea l)     (Da te)                            (Tel. No.)

SPOUSAL CON SEN T: The undersigned spouse of the Seller hereby consents to the listing of the Property herein pursua nt to the provisions of the Fa mily 
La w Act, R.S.O . 1990  a nd hereby a grees to execute a ll necessa ry or incidenta l documents to further a ny tra nsa ction provided for herein.

..................................................................................................................       ........................................................     ........................................................................
(Spouse)                                                                                               (Sea l)     (Da te)                                 (Tel. No.)

ACKN OWLEDGEMEN T
The  Se lle r(s ) he re by  a ck no w le dg e  tha t the  Se lle r(s ) fully  unde rs ta nd  the  te rm s  o f this  Ag re e m e nt a nd  ha ve  re ce ive d  a  co py  o f

this  Ag re e m e nt o n  the  …….................... da y  o f …………...................................................……...………..................... …………, 2 0  ….........................……

.............................................................................................................................................................................................    .......................................................................
(Signa ture of Seller)                                                                   (Da te)

.............................................................................................................................................................................................    .......................................................................
(Signa ture of Seller)                                                                   (Da te)

The tra dema rks REALTO R®, REALTO RS®, MLS®, Multiple Listing Services® a nd a ssocia ted logos a re owned or controlled by 
The Ca na dia n Rea l Esta te Associa tion (CREA) a nd identify the rea l esta te professiona ls who a re members of CREA a nd the 
qua lity of services they provide. Used under license.

© 2021, O nta rio Rea l Esta te Associa tion (“O REA”). All rights reserved. This form wa s developed by O REA for the use a nd reproduction 
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In the event tha t this Agreement expires or is ca ncelled or otherwise
termina ted a nd the Property is not sold, the Seller, by initia lling:

(Do e s ) (Do e s  N o t)consent to a llow other rea l esta te boa rd members to conta ct the Seller a fter expira tion or
other termina tion of this Agreement to discuss listing or otherwise ma rketing the Property.

A

JOE LEVY

DECLARATION  OF IN SURAN CE

The Sa lesperson/ Broker/ Broker of Record ........................................................................................................................................................................................
(Na me of Sa lesperson/ Broker/ Broker of Record)

hereby decla res tha t he/ she is insured a s required by REBBA.

..........................................................................................................................................................................................................
(Signa ture(s) of Sa lesperson/ Broker/ Broker of Record)

JOE LEVY

21
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Maple - Montgomery Lodge - MNP Ltd., in its capacity as Court-appointed Receiver of Maple Retirement Homes Inc.
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In the Matter of the Receivership of 

Dundas Retirement Place Inc., Maple Retirement Homes Inc. and 1059422 Ontario Inc.

Statement of Receipts and Disbursements 

As at March 3, 2021

Total Dundas Maple Northview

Receipts ($) ($) ($) ($)

Transfer from Trust 4,862 2,319 200 2,343

CEBA Loan 60,000 20,000 20,000 20,000

Expense reimbursement- City of Hamilton 33,400 11,000 22,400

Subsidy 45,107 6,556 38,551

Deposits from Tenants 456,638 216,264 102,097 138,277

Funds held on Deposit on Date of Appointment 53,500 20,196 11,342 21,962

0

Total Receipts 653,508 258,779 151,195 243,534

Disbursements

Payroll 217,457 82,783 58,103 76,571

Internal Trsf 0 -13,000 0 13,000

Food 29,688 13,172 4,945 11,572

PIN Money Withdrawals 12,483 0 1,250 11,233

Subcontractors 72,952 55,939 6,670 10,344

Furnace replacement 9,763 0 0 9,763

HST (non refundable) 15,303 9,472 1,437 4,394

Repairs 13,914 2,164 8,867 2,883

Utilities 15,611 12,027 708 2,876

Snow removal 4,800 2,400 0 2,400

PPE 6,648 2,202 2,202 2,245

License fees 3,450 1,429 871 1,150

Employee Expenses (Administrator) 2,490 1,458 0 1,032

Insurance 12,374 2,612 7,822 1,941

Office 702 49 28 625

Lease payment 3,829 2,489 783 557

Bank Charges 1,273 417 367 489

Washer 350 0 0 350

Communications 5,704 4,621 897 185

Credit card fees 213 106 106

Filing fees 215 72 72 72

Total Disbursements 429,217 180,304 95,126 153,788

Excess of Receipts over disbursements 224,291 78,475 56,070 89,746
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Invoice Number: 9673556 Client Number:  837410 

2 

DETAILED TIME CHARGES 

DATE PROFESSIONAL HOURS DETAILED TIME DESCRIPTIONS 

03-Sep-2020 Sheldon Title 1.10 prep for and attendance at conference call with Tom 

Wilson, Walter Burych, Wojtek, to discuss strategy 

and approach 

08-Sep-2020 Sheldon Title .40 email to Tom Wilson re: revised request listing and 

email to Wilson, Wojtek and Walter on reasons for 

not delaying request for info; call with Wojtek 

22-Sep-2020 Sheldon Title .10 follow up email to Wilson on status of info delivery

25-Sep-2020 Sheldon Title .30 call with Wojtek 

27-Sep-2020 Sheldon Title 1.10 internal call on planning (Lem, Henechowicz), review 

of draft order/consent, call with Phoenix, request to 

Wojtek for a call on 9/29, review of COVID protocols 

28-Sep-2020 Sheldon Title .80 emails, conference call, 

29-Sep-2020 Sheldon Title .80 mark up of draft court order; email to Phoenix

30-Sep-2020 Sheldon Title .10 call with Phoenix on terms of order

30-Sep-2020 Sheldon Title .30 review of revised order and forward comments to 

Phoenix, email exchanges with Wilson on BCU 

approval of MNP and on boxes of records 

02-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title .30 call with Graham Phoenix and Wojtek Jaskiewicz re: 

terms of court order 

05-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title 2.50 email to All Seniors Responsive and Origin; call with 

Origin (Nick Prashad); receipt of and review of box of 

records, incl bank statements, intercompany 

transfers, etc. review of affidavit and NOM and 

provide comments on same layered onto Graham's 

06-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title .30 call with Mark Lugowki of Sienna Living re: potential 

consulting engagement  

07-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title .30 emails to Chris Joakim/Stephen Chandler re: 

consultant, email with Prashad of Origin, email from 

Wojtek on pre-filing report;  

08-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title .50 call with Crowley/Trollope, call with Phoenix, call 

with Neil Prashad 

09-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title 1.1 call with Y Thommy and S Chandler on our needs for 

a consultant on the receivership and the role MNP 

can play in carrying out that function 

09-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title .60 call with Tom Wilson on results of our review of info, 

status of offer on retirement homes, next steps; call 

with Graham Phoenix afterwards 

12-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title .30 email to Wojtek on additional comments on affidavit

13-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title .30 call with Phoenix, Wojtek, follow up email to Wojtek; 

email to Tom Wilson on books/records 

14-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title .20 email to Wojtek/Graham on request for call with Tom 

on next steps 



Invoice Number: 9673556 Client Number:  837410 

3 

DATE PROFESSIONAL HOURS DETAILED TIME DESCRIPTIONS 

15-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title .50 call with Wilson, Wojtek, Burych, Phoenix on next 

steps; call with Phoenix after receipt of revised 

affidavit on incorporating my additional comments 

15-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title .20 review of revised affidavit; email to Wojtek with 

comments/questions on same 

23-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title .40 forward engagement letter to Wilson and emails with 

team on planning for October 29th date 

28-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title 1.30 scanning of documents, create Microsoft Teams 

page, etc. email to team to advise of creation of page, 

28-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title 1.60 team planning call, email exchanges with Tom Wilson 

re: contact info for administrators, email receipt from 

Tom Wilson with memo/package of documents from 

Mitche Wolfe, broker, detailing concerns about 

receivership in view of events at Emerald, review of 

documents/investigate Emerald developments, call 

with Wilson, emails throughout day with 

Wojtek/Graham, review of Retirement Home 

regulatory body website, identify recent inspection 

reports and circulate to counsel/Wilson/team, 

planning email to Litwack on RBC accounts;  

29-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title .60 call with Chandler, emails with Wojtek on RHRA 

reports and on whether matter is consent; call with 

Wojtek 

30-Oct-2020 Sheldon Title .20 Call with Wojtek on Court’s rejection Northview et al 

on the commercial list; email with team 

08-Nov-2020 Sheldon Title .20 email from Phoenix on revised order; review of same 

and respond to Phoenix  with comments on draft 

order 

09-Nov-2020 Sheldon Title .40 review of draft order with Wojtek/Graham, review of 

revisions prepared by Phoenix 

13-Nov-2020 Sheldon Title .20 email exchanges with Graham and Wojtek on 

Duncan's revisions to order 

16-Nov-2020 Sheldon Title .60 plan for and attend on call with G. Phoenix and W. 

Jaskiewicz to review RHRA's changes to order and 

next steps 

17-Nov-2020 Sheldon Title .70 call with Wojtek, Tim Duncan and Graham Phoenix on 

terms of draft order and RHRA's requirements to 

review of revisions and brief call with Phoenix on 

same 

25-Nov-2020 Sheldon Title .30 review of Tim Duncan's comments/changes on order; 

email to Phoenix re: my proposed changes 

26-Nov-2020 Sheldon Title .70 Call with Phoenix *2, advice of pivot to full 

receivership and review of order; review of status 

emerald situation; email to Wojtek  on comments on 

order, river view pharmacy issue; emails with Wojtek  
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27-Nov-2020 Sheldon Title .40 call with Phoenix on terms of order/ROFR on 

pharmacy; email to team to update them on status, 

email from Crowley to advise RHRA has reached out 

to vet MNP 

30-Nov-2020 Sheldon Title .60 review of bios/quals for vetting

01-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .20 review of draft order and response to Wojtek and 

Graham on its terms 

02-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .20 email exchange with Wojtek, review of Tim Duncan's 

comments 

04-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .40 calls with Wojtek *2 on terms of order/email and call 

with Phoenix on transferring file to Commercial List, 

email to Phoenix after call with Wojtek 

07-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .20 call with Wojtek/Graham, Graham, arrange team 

meeting for Dec 8 

08-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .40 call with Wilson, Burych, Wojtek, Phoenix; emails 

with Crowley on PPE 

10-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .40 draft consent language for consideration by debtors 

on pre-appointment 

11-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title 1.00 call with Wilson, internal meeting to plan 

review/review list of preliminary information; email 

to Wojtek on his sending consent to Bob Brown and 

next steps; respond to Walter's emails 

15-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .10 email from Burych on engagement letter; email to 

Grant/Scott on same 

16-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .20 email exchange with Michael Springstead on access, 

follow up email to Wilson 

17-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .10 Discussion with S. Title re commencing work on the 

file and role of other teams and glancing through the 

folder 

17-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .50 Call with Springstead and Wilson 

18-Dec-2020 Misc. 

Disbursements 

14/12/2020 / Sheila Ayer / PPE for Staff - Client 

837410 Sheila Ayer (610.19): PPE for MNP Staff - 

Work n 'Wear 

18-Dec-2020 Misc. 

Disbursements 

16/12/2020 / Sheila Ayer / PPE for Staff - Client 

837410 Sheila Ayer (610.19): PPE for MNP Staff - 

Work n 'Wear 

18-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .30 email to team on status of our request, email to Mike 

Springstead on timing of his response 

20-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .10 Reviewing emails and discussion with S. Title re 

commencing work on this file 

20-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .40 review of information received and email to Mike 

Springstead concerning same 

22-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor 2.00 1) Review of draft motion material, issue of NITES by 

the lender to all the locations, corporate structure of 

the group incl. the 3 retirement homes, initial request 
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list and noting the data items received.2) Review of 

employee listing, noting down the name of 

administrators and other staff3) Glancing through 

financial statements of the 3 homes4) Review of floor 

plans5) Review of rent rolls available6) Going through 

other documents for understanding 

22-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Discussion with S. Title re plan for tomorrow's visit 

to the 3 homes and preparing CF projections 

especially determining the need for cash at each of 

the locations for the 13 weeks and more so for the 

initial 10 days up to Jan 3 20212) Glancing through 

available information, especially financial statements 

and preparing information request list for the 

purpose of preparing CF projections and shared with 

M. Lem for discussion 

22-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Discussion with M. Lem re preparation of IRL and 

plan to share it with Company at the earliest2) Call 

with S. Title re email communications and call with 

Company, realtors, BCU, discussion on preparing Task 

and Term Letter for employees and resident 

communication letter 

22-Dec-2020 Matthew Lem .30 Discussion with S. Title re cash flow projections; 

discussion with A. Kapoor re same and preparation of 

information request. 

22-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title 2.70 conference call with Shannon, Ryan, Rose, Mike, 

MNP team on  planning for December 23rd 

appointment, calls with Steve Hiscox of CBRE and 

John Jensen, each to discuss marketing of retirement 

homes generally given COVID limitations, prepare 

notice to residents in draft, discussions with Akhil and 

Matt on cash flow projections, call and emails with 

Phoenix, email to Duncan on RHRA November 30th 

inspections, email from and to Burych and Wilson on 

work commenced on review 

23-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor 2.40 1) Preparing for the meeting at the 3 retirement 

homes, discussion with S. Title re action items, notice 

to be sent to residents, discussion with 

Administrators of the 3 homes among others2) Email 

communication re Court order, finalization and 

proceeding to the 3 R. Homes basis discussions with 

the legal counsel.3) Discussion with the 3 

Administrators re plan to come.4) Discussion re 

conducting virtual or physical meeting at the homes 

basis availability of employees5) Discussion with M. 

Litwack (MNP) re first meeting to commence 

receivership and action items 6) Discussion re 
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planning a town hall for employees and residents 7) 

Discussion with M. Lem re required changes in the 

information request list for Cash flow projections 

23-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 Conducting meetings at the 3 retirement homes and 

separate calls/meeting with the 3 administrators and 

discussing their queries 

23-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .60 1) Multiple calls with S. Title re status of meetings at 

the 3 retirement homes, issues at the homes among 

other points2) Email communication with S. Title re 

next steps and action items 

23-Dec-2020 Matthew Lem .20 Review of preliminary information request lists; 

discussion with A. Kapoor re same. 

23-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title 2.90 call with M. Springstead on gathering further info on 

management of homes/uncleared cheques/status of 

bank accounts, etc. (13 minutes) attendance at Court 

(15 mins); call with S. Rivet (5 mins); calls with 

Phoenix; call with Springstead (16 mins); further call 

with Phoenix (9 mins); calls with Kapoor; calls to 

Amber/Neil at RBC; email to RBC; employee meeting 

at Northview (13 mins); call to Kapoor on mtg prep; 

calls from T. Duncan/Mike at RHRA;  (25 mins); call 

with Neil Patel of RBC (3 mins); call with Jensen  (15 

mins); email to the MNP team and retirement home 

team of  the order and our intent to proceed with 

meetings with staff/residents; tracking receipt of 

order; series of emails with the administrators 

coordinating taking possession related issues; finalize 

notice to residents; email to Keyser Mason Ball to 

obtain docs to be loaded on webpage; arrange for 

Trina to post; email on cash flow info; email to 

Trollope on his review of the compliance/health 

aspects;  

23-Dec-2020 Trina Burningham .50 MNPDebt webpage created; Documents provided by 

S. Title added to the webpage; Vanity URL created. 

24-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .80 Preparation of tasks and terms letter and sharing 

with S. Title for his review 

24-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .20 Glancing through information (bank statements) 

shared by HO Accounts head (Mike) 

24-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .60 1) Call with Mike re inputs required for cash flow 

projections- revenue, expenses, payroll, CRA 

payments, mortgage payments, major repairs 

required among others2) Updating the checklist as 

per availability of data from their accounting system 

24-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor 1.60 1) Review of information available, present status 

and preparing an update for S. Title including cash 

flow projections, trust account information, payroll, 
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head office expenses, CEWS, required repairs among 

others2) Discussion re pharmacist arrangement and 

heads up to prepare the mailing to be sent to the 

creditors 

24-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title 2.60 update call with Tom Wilson (32 mins); call with Rob 

Stelzer re: his experience in his dealings with Emerald 

Lodge;  calls and texts with M. Springstead (20 mins); 

text and call Tyler of Landform Landscaping to 

resurrect the snow plow arrangements (15 mins); 

email with Shannon Rivet re: Barbers on stove 

repairs; review of quote on stove and call to Barbers 

(closed); email to residents the info on the town hall; 

emails to administrators on various, incl coordinating 

health/safety review; call with resident family 

members of the Montgomery home (25 mins); emails 

to/from Trollope on same; multiple emails to/from 

Neil Patel at RBC on banking activity; review of term 

and task agreement; address questions of S. Rivet on 

rent/office expenses and periodic calls with the 

administrators; email Chagnon 

24-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .40 Emails to insurer and emails to prospective agents 

29-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor 2.00 1) Discussion with Trina and Jessie re sending 245, 

246 notice by Dec 31 and explaining them the 

background2) Preparation of required docs (file info) 

and detailed creditor list with addresses and 

outstanding amounts and sharing with Trina for the 

purpose of uploading in Ascend and subsequent 

generation of required reports and labels 

29-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor 2.00 1) Review of application record and preparation of 

draft 245, 246 notice, pending NBV of assets2) 

Discussion with Mike re creditor list, assets 

information among others. Mike to revert and 

confirm the creditor outstanding balances3) Review 

of financials of the 3 retirement homes provided by 

Mike4) Review of statement of claim by Gill et all 

against multiple retirement homes and emailing S. 

Title to discuss how to quantify the claim for the 2 

retirement homes under our domain- Northview and 

Dundas 

29-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Email communication re food orders for the 

retirement homes, other emails re setting up calls 

with Administrators and MNP Teams dealing with 

compliance and safety.2) Emails with S. Title re 

certain action points on the file3) Glancing through 

cash flow projections provided by Mike and sharing 

with M. Lem and S. Title 
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29-Dec-2020 Jessie Hue 1.50 Assist Akhil and Trina on the preparation of the 

Ascend file and creditor upload schedule. 

29-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title 1.80 call to Arun Mehta to consider elevator inspection, 

calls with Sharon Ellis of Flanagan's (11 mins); sending 

authorization to bill credit card for food orders for 

Montgomery and Northview, emails from Mike on 

Flanagan's order and request for payment of pre-

filing Flanagan invoices; email to Neil Patel of RBC 

and message left from Sharon of RBC on status of 

reversing payments; email to/from Cliff Trollope and 

to his advising me of heating issue at Montgomery, 

request to Mike on info on elevating devices; calls 

and emails to/from Barbers on stove repairs, emails 

to Ryan, Anthony and Shannon to set up regular 

update calls, email to/from Michael Cretzman on 

homes, email to Ryan on Flanagan order; email from 

Wojtek on PP and email to PP to set up call,  

29-Dec-2020 Trina Burningham .25 Touch base with Akhil re: mailout of notice.

29-Dec-2020 Trina Burningham .50 Touch base with Jessie re: Ascend and mailout of 

notice. 

30-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .20 Finalization of draft pending NBV of assets and 

sharing with Mike to seek his inputs on final creditor 

list and NBV of other assets- AR, advance to related 

parties among others 

30-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .70 Emails and calls with T. Burningham re incorporating 

all the creditor info (secured and unsecured) in 

Ascend incl. changes in certain creditor balances and 

preparation of labels 

30-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor 1.80 1) Discussion with Mike re changes in creditor 

balances and preparation of Appendix A (secured 

creditor) and Appendix B (unsecured creditor) for the 

notice2) Preparation and finalization of 245, 246 

notice and discussion with S. Title3) Review of 

financials, discussion with Mike and computing NBV 

of assets for the purpose of report4) Discussion with 

Branch office to facilitate sending notice to creditors 

on Dec 31 5) Discussion with Milke re accounts 

receivables from City of Hamilton and related party 

balances 

30-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor 1.80 1) Review of existing projections re rent roll, payroll 

and other expenses and discussion with S. Title2) Call 

with Mike re basis of projections, requesting him to 

provide certain information, rent roll, payroll, 

consideration of maintenance expenses for elevator 

and HVAC, agency contracts for addl. staff among 

others.3) Discussion with S. Title re Gill SOA4) 
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Attending a call with Residents and their relates 

(hosted by S. Title) and further discussion with S. Title 

re action items incl. discussion with Bank re stop 

payment on certain cheques 

30-Dec-2020 Jessie Hue 1.50 Preparation and arranging for the notice of receiver, 

create the Ascend file and coordinate with Trina and 

Akhil mailing. Direction with Trina on the faxing the 

notice with the OSB and appointment order once 

notice is completed. Provide the list of creditors to 

include in the mailing. 

30-Dec-2020 Matthew Lem .20 Review of preliminary review of cash flow 

projections; review correspondence re same; update 

discussion with S. Title;  

30-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title 2.40 townhall with residents, review of preliminary cash 

flow and call with Akhil on same, call to Michael at 

RHRA after receiving Murphy's question on sale to 

non-retirement home buyer, call with Phoenix, call to 

PP on Dundas property, emails from/to Ryan on food 

order and email to Ellis at Flanagan's on same; emails 

to potential property managers/business condition 

report suppliers; email with Trollope; review of 

s.245/246, creditor list, call to Sharon Ellis 

30-Dec-2020 Trina Burningham .75 Uploaded Dundas creditor list to Ascend and created 

mailing labels; Uploaded Northview creditor list to 

Ascend and created mailing labels; Uploaded 

Montgomery creditor list to Ascend and created 

mailing labels. 

30-Dec-2020 Trina Burningham .25 Printed Mailing list for secured and unsecured 

creditors from Ascend and emailed to A. Kapoor;  

31-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .20 Discussion with Branch office re certain queries while 

processing the request for mailing the notice to 

creditors 

31-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Reviewing the revised projections shared by Mike 

and comparing them with 2019, 2018 numbers for 

payroll and rent. 2) Call with Mike re certain queries 

and running through the CF projections for a brief 

understanding of the numbers3) Glancing through 

daily banking report 

31-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Noting down points discussed with Mike and 

evaluating them in the context of the projections2) 

Updating S. Title and M. Lem about the status3) 

Emails with S. Title re certain updates re payroll and 

rent rolls, repairs required, other requirements at the 

Homes among others4) Call with M. Lem re status of 

projections and next steps 
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31-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .20 Glancing through inputs and back ups received from 

Mike (to be reviewed and analysed) 

31-Dec-2020 Akhil Kapoor .10 Discussion with J. Hue and T. Burningham re filing the 

docs with OSB and affidavit of mailing 

31-Dec-2020 Jessie Hue .20 Direction with Trina to fax notice and appointment 

order with the OSB, request to post to the website. 

31-Dec-2020 Matthew Lem .20 Update discussion with A. Kapoor re projections,

31-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .90 review of payroll, email to Akhil on payroll, email 

to/from Shannon on garbage removal; emails 

to/from Springstead on N95 masks, carpet inspection 

by City of Hamilton; email to A. Martino on carpet 

cleaning; email to/from C. Trollope on his site visits; 

email to/from Trollope/Phoenix on City of Hamilton 

inspection notice;  

31-Dec-2020 Sheldon Title .40 Call with Ryan on staffing, elevating devices and to 

answer questions re: expense reimbursements and 

sale of global homes;  

31-Dec-2020 Trina Burningham .25 Faxed the notice of creditors to the OSB.

04-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Discussion with Trina re filing of 245, 246 notice 

and appointment letter with OSB2) Voice mail from 

OSB and discussion with them re retirement home 

file 3) Updating S. Title about the fact that OSB will 

generate 3 estate numbers. 4) Receipt of 

Receivership Certificates from OSB office and 

forwarding the same to the team 

04-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 2.80 1) Review of payroll registers for Northview, 

Montgomery and Dundas, preparing by month by 

employee  summary for 2020.  2) analysing the 

summary and noting down key issues3) Reviewing 

employee listing and noting down the employees per 

the listing and incorporating it in the payroll analysis 

tab.4) Receipt of revised rent roll for Dundas and 

updating the same in our projections 

04-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Email communication with S. Title and 

Administrators re current activities, status update, 

cash flow requirements at the 3 Homes, Health and 

Safety issues, payment of salaries at Montgomery 

among others2) Updating S. Title re status of 

computer records rec’d, cash flows, utilities, tasks 

and term letter, WEPP, CEWS among others 

04-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .70 1) Preparing detailed list of queries in payroll and 

rent roll and sharing with Mike and requesting for a 

call. also, discussing the same with S. Title. 

04-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 3.20 call with D. Kendellen, call with Carmela Vidic (32 

mins); call with Phoenix, call with Ronnie Mandowsky 
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on prop management; call with Trollope on 

safety/health review; email to Rivet on garbage 

pickup; email from Springstead on payment of 

Montgomery payroll historically involving a cash 

portion to deal with overtime and to my advising that 

practice stops with the receivership; email to Bleiweis 

of Sterling;  email *2  to Synergy Partners on building 

condition; email to Pinchin; email to Coluccio of FCA 

on insurance review; email from Hamilton 

Spec/notify parties of the  possibility of an article;  

email to/from Jensen; email to Trollope on 

carpet/staffing issue;  email to A. Martino on carpet 

issue;  

04-Jan-2021 Trina Burningham .25 Faxed the appointment order to the OSB as per J. 

Hue.  

05-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Call with S. Title, Compliance team re current issues 

at the Homes and briefly about payroll cost 

05-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 Call with administrators (along with S. Title and 

compliance team) of Dundas and Montgomery 

Homes re current issues faced by them, streamlining 

the process and explaining them the next steps 

05-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 Call with Mike (R. Homes) re queries in payroll, rent 

roll and other issues incl. projections and scheduling 

another call with him and S. Title to decide on the 

next steps and process (incl. approval of payments) 

going forward 

05-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 Multiple emails and calls with S. Title re payroll cost, 

payroll cheques to be issued, checklist from property 

management firm, payment approvals, Flanagan 

(food orders), receipt of CEBA (20k) for 2 of the 3 

retirement homes, opening of trust accounts for the 

3 homes at TD/RBC among others 

05-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Multiple emails with Mike re receipt of gross wage 

statements, net pay etc. and planning to incorporate 

it in my payroll analysis sheet 

05-Jan-2021 Jessie Hue .60 Banking admin on RBC and email S. Title.

05-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 3.00 call with Wilson (.5), call with Marshall Bleiweis and 

Jack Beaton (.3) of Sterling; call with Kamala of CRA 

on trust exam status (.2); call with P. Hauser (.2); call 

with Anthony (.5) and Ryan (.5) on status of 

operations/staffing; review of staffing analysis; 

review of Spectator article; emails with Rivet on 

rescheduling call/operational issues; receipt of RHRA 

(McClurg) letter and forward to Trollope for 

consideration and emails related thereto in regards 
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to shaping a response, email to Doug at DDK 

Mechanical on boiler repairs; emails to 

Kapoor/Springstead on 1/5 payroll run; arrange for 

account openings;  emails to Hiscox (CBRE) and 

from/to Jensen on information requirements; Email 

to Colliers;  follow up email to Allma; email exchange 

with Vidic on non-compliance related issues at 1605 

Main; email from Martino on quote for carpet; email 

with Phoenix on $20K receipt of CBEA for two of the 

homes post-receivership; email with CBRE prop 

maintenance team; email forwarded from Lem on PP 

and email to PP 

06-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.10 1) Discussion with Mike and S. Title re developing the 

process and steps going forward, vendor concerns 

and disputes, reference to court order for 

continuation of services, fire fighter issue at one of 

the R.Homes, other issues faced by Head office and 

the 3 retirement homes2) Receiving information on 

revised rent roll, vendor emails, agency invoices, 

hourly rate report, list of employees at Dundas not 

included in payroll register  among others 

06-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.40 1) Discussion with Trina re the letters to be prepared 

and to sent to the utilities informing them about 

receivership , continuation of services and 

segregating bills for the period Dec 23 onwards.2) 

Reviewing the invoices and confirming certain 

information with Mike3) Reviewing and revising the 

letters and sharing them with Trina for changes4) 

Sharing draft letters with Letters for review5) 

Informing Trina about S. Title's review points and 

advising about necessary changes to be made6) 

Requesting Mike to provide pending information to 

enable us to send the letters on Jan 7 7) Receiving 

voice mail and email from a creditor (to be 

responded on Jan 7) 

06-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.00 1) Emails and calls with S. Title and S. Ayer re payroll, 

outsourcing payroll service provider, vendors, vendor 

issues, utility letters, Trust accounts (emails with 

Jessie and Sheila at MNP), vaccination schedule 

among others2) Reviewing the daily banking report 

06-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Commencing work on payroll analysis to incorporate 

Jan payroll information in Dec payroll register (to be 

continued) 

06-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Discussion with S. Title re checklist of information 

required for facility management quotes, prepping 
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for marketing, payroll, actual cash flows among 

others 

06-Jan-2021 Jessie Hue 1.20 Banking set up of the three RBC trust accounts and 

email the appointment order. Email S. Title the 

banking information for the trust and wire 

information. 

06-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 3.00 call with Rose/Mike/Akhil on various operational 

issues, call with Greg Whittaker of Caring Hearts and 

follow up email, call with Shannon/Cliff/Sarah, call 

with Daniel Holmes of Colliers, call with Visha and 

Yoni of CBRE on request for listing proposals, and 

subsequent emails to each of CBRE and Colliers; call 

with Pinchin on building condition assessment and 

subsequent email; email to Phoenix on RHRA 

letter/June 1st deadline; dealings with Rivet on dryer 

replacement; investigate ADP utilization to process 

payroll; emails with Ryan on elevator problems 

06-Jan-2021 Trina Burningham 3.50 Spoke to Akhil re: four Utility Notices to be mailed 

out; Drafted the Notice to Utilities and emailed copy 

to A. Kapoor for review; Edited notices per A. Kapoor 

and sent back for second review; Edited notices per 

A. Kapoor and sent back for third review. 

07-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .70 1) Calls and emails with S. Title, Trina and S. Ayer re 

notices to be sent to the utilities and issue regarding 

Bell internet services at Northview2) Emails 

exchanged with S. Title and C. Trollope re 

maintenance and other critical issues at the Homes 

07-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Discussion with S. Title, S. Ayer and Trina re Daily 

banking activity and record keeping to be prepared 

on daily basis 

07-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 Emails and calls with Mike and explaining him our 

requirement of daily banking report and related docs 

required. Also, discussed the requirement of a 

checklist of docs required for marketing purpose. 

Lastly, discussed about the revised projections (to be 

updated by Mike) 

07-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 1.50 calls with Ryan at CBRE on listing proposal, internal 

call on banking, call with CBRE prop management 

team; preparation of RHRA reporting letter; email 

from Shannon on internet disconnection; emails with 

Phoenix on June 1st date; email with Phoenix on 

Riverview matter; email exchange with Angela 

Traube on insurance issue; ; receipt of order on 

carpet from City of Hamilton; email on fire inspection 

related issues 
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07-Jan-2021 Trina Burningham .25 Virtual meeting with S. Title, A. Kapoor and S. Ayer to 

review accounting information. 

07-Jan-2021 Trina Burningham 2.00 Emailed A. Kapoor re: Utility Notice information 

needed; Made edits to the 4 Utility Notices per A. 

Kapoor; Finalized letter to Bell and emailed to A. 

Kapoor for final review; Emailed Bell the Notice of 

Receiver as per S. Title; Called Bell to follow up on 

Notice; Emailed S. Title, A. Kapoor and S. Ayer with 

update. 

07-Jan-2021 Trina Burningham .25 Called Enbridge to obtain contact insolvency 

department email address; Called Alectra Utilities to 

obtain contact insolvency department. 

07-Jan-2021 Trina Burningham 1.25 Printed, mailed and emailed the Notice of Receiver to 

the utility companies. 

08-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.00 Review of data requirement list shared by a property 

management firm to prepare for marketing of 

homes, modifying the list and sharing with Mike and 

requesting to schedule a call to discuss.  

08-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Email comm. with S. Title re daily banking reports and 

how to commence mapping deposits and payments 

08-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.00 Review of bank info and preparation of format to 

track bank activity and sharing with Cherry Yip and S. 

Ayer 

08-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Emails with S. Ayer and C. Yip re tasks to be 

performed 

08-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Calls with C. Yip re detailed call on daily banking 

activity, period to be covered, preference of excel 

over an accounting software to manage the banking 

records among other related issues 

08-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.00 1) Preparation of statement of bank balance which 

can be transferred to Trust Account of receiver by 

analysing existing balance, payroll cheques cleared, 

payroll cheques outstanding (incl. pandemic cheques 

pending) and sharing the sheet with S. Title2) 

Discussion with Mike re pending payroll cheques for 

all periods, CEBA loan of $20k for each of the 

retirement homes, need for transfer of money from 

the accounts among other issues3) Sharing revised 

with S. Title basis discussion with Mike 4) Discussion 

with S. Title re the balance which can be transferred 

08-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .70 Calls with the 3 administrators re status of financial 

and non financials faced by them and timing of 

payroll records to be shared with Head office 
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08-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 Discussion with S. Ayer and S. Title re daily banking 

activity, emails re fund transfer, request from 

another property management firm among others 

08-Jan-2021 Cherry Yip .50 Initial meeting with Akhil Kapoor - bookkeeping for 3 

retirement homes 

08-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 2.50 call with Northview admin (.2); call with Ryan (.4); call 

with Anthony (.4); call with Colliers team (.4) call with 

Levy (.4); call with Vidic; call/email with Yvonne of 

Total Health (.2); calls/emails with RBC on banking, 

calls and emails with Springstead; call with Wilson on 

update on status/funding; consider/sign the Peel In 

Home agreement for Dundas' obtaining an RPN 

09-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Email communication with S. Title re certain issues at 

Montgomery 

09-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title .30 emails with Mike Springstead on $20K CEBA funds, 

review of additional info received in respect thereto, 

email to Ryan the invoice from Total Health,  

10-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .60 1) Review of revised projections shared by Mike and 

noting down steps and procedures to be performed 

for preparing the projections incl. the backup2) Email 

communication with S. Title re projections and 

information request list of property management 

firm 

11-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Reviewing changes made by S. Title in the 

projections2) Discussion with S. Title re projections, 

repairs required at the homes, update on Vestacon 

(construction managers), data requirement from 

property management firm among others.3) 

Discussion re Northview's payroll 

11-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.60 1) Review of sample bank activity tracker prepared by 

Cherry, making necessary changes and sending her 

the revised doc. Call with her to discuss and 

requesting her to replicate it for all the homes.2) 

Discussion with S. Title re creditor issues at 

Northview and checking with the administrator for 

background before calling the creditor.3) Call with a 

creditor explaining them about receivership, 

discussing their outstanding balance among other 

details. Also, emailing the receivership notice sent 

earlier at their mailing address4) Emails and call re 

preparation of bank tracker by Cherry and finalization 

of format for reporting5) Discussion with Cherry re 

evaluating if accounting software can be used for 

reporting6) Setting up the process of reporting and 

related discussion with S. Ayer and Cherry 
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11-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Emailing communication with administrator of 

Montgomery home re seeking quotations from an 

additional supplier for carpet repair. Updating S. Title 

about the status 

11-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .50 1) Discussion with S. Title re pending data points from 

Mike, projections, checklist of items required by 

property managers, issues re carpet repairs, other 

repairs, No of homes and residents, requirement of 

previous environmental reports among others2) 

Email comm. with Mike re time sheets of the Homes, 

data requirements, EHT liability among others 

11-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.40 Review of by resident rent roll for the 3 homes and 

noting down queries on the variances between rent 

roll for the previous period and projections. Also, 

reviewed subsidy received from City of Hamilton for 

Northview and Montgomery and noting queries on 

the policy and amounts received. 

11-Jan-2021 Cherry Yip 1.30 set up bank write-up x retirement homes and write-

up bank transactions up to Dec 24, 20 

11-Jan-2021 Cherry Yip 2.50 updated record up to Jan 6, 2021

11-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title .50 call with Jamie Oldfield of Vestacon; call with Joe 

Levine of Senior's Residence; call with Yvonne at 

Total Life on her invoice 

12-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.40 Review of payroll statements, hourly rate, job 

descriptions of the employees at the 3 homes and 

incorporating the information in the 3 payroll sheets 

prepared for the 3 homes. 

12-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 Calls and emails with Northview administrator re the 

employees, their rates, average salaries pre and post 

covid, spike in salaries due to pandemic period from 

Oct to Dec 2020, spike in Jan 5 salary due to 

Stat/Holiday pay, agency staff requirements, invoices 

received from a supplier and certain utility/tax 

payments, discussion re by room by resident data 

requirements among others 

12-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.00 Emails and calls with S. Title and other MNP team 

members re pharmacy agreements, data 

requirements for marketing, data room set up 

feasibility, issues related to clearing of BCU payments 

from the bank account, emails with Yohaan 

(Consulting Partner) re their visits to the Homes, 

Vestacon appointment to manage homes,  impact of 

new restrictions announced by Government on the 3 

retirement homes among others 
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12-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 Emails and calls with Mike re data requirements for 

marketing- building condition, environment reports, 

license/certificate related info, historical period detail 

and data requirements, city of Hamilton/RHRA 

related info, payroll, rent info and changes in 

projections required among others and noting his 

comments in the information request list. Also 

marked items to be discussed with the respective 

administrators 

12-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 1) Discussion with Cherry re updating daily activity 

report for 2 days in the daily banking activity 

tracker2) Seeking info from Mike re daily banking 

activity and time sheets for Northview 

12-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.30 1) Analysis of payroll for the 3 retirement homes, 

preparing the revised sheet, sorting the employees 

between existing and left employees, adding analysis 

and notes in each payroll. Also, preparing the sheet 

for sharing with realtors 

12-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .70 1) Reviewing rent roll, comparing with projections, 

subsidy available from City of Hamilton and 

finalization of the same for the purpose of sharing 

with realtors.2) Adding financials, floor plans, payroll, 

rent info in marketing information folder and sharing 

the information with S. Title 

12-Jan-2021 Cherry Yip .50 update record up to Jan 11

12-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 1.20 meeting Ryan + meeting Anthony

13-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Call with Shannon (Northview admin) re issues at 

the centre, requirement of grease cleaning at the 

centre, call with previous grease cleaning service 

provider, quotes obtained from other grease cleaning 

service providers among others2) Finalizing and 

sharing Northview payroll and rent roll with the 

admin for her comments and requesting for details of 

room numbers of the residents 

13-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 Finalization of Dundas and Montgomery payroll and 

rent roll and sharing with the respective admins to 

seek their comments and requesting for rent rooms 

among others 

13-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .50 Call with Mike re queries in projections, data request 

for marketing info, certain suppliers among other 

issues and requesting him to provide revised 

projections 

13-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 Emails with S. Title, Mike among others re certain 

issues at the homes, reporting requirements, 
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planning initiation of sale process through the 

realtors among others 

13-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Glancing through banking report and sharing with 

Cherry for updating the template2) Discussion with 

Cherry re preparation and updating of the activity 

tracker3) Email communication with Bonnie about 

scheduling a call tomorrow to discuss use of 

accounting software to record bank activity 

13-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Email communication with Rose and Mike and receipt 

of certain marketing information (incl. certain pics), 

revised rent roll from them.  

13-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Email communication with S. Title and providing 

detailed status of daily banking activity tracker, cash 

flow projections, information flow for the purpose of 

marketing  

13-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .60 Reviewing and saving marketing information received 

from Mike re pictures of homes, utilities, time sheets, 

food orders, financials, floor plans, property tax 

notices among others 

13-Jan-2021 Cherry Yip .30 updated Jan 12

13-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 2.70 call with Shannon of Northview on status; call with 

Phoenix; call with Jamie Oldfield on furnace related 

issues; call with McCluskie; call with Joe Levy; email 

from Ryan on resident fall (Mary) and emails'/call 

with Yvonne related to same 

14-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 Email communication and discussion with S. Title re 

information required by Colliers- size and structure of 

resident units, other info about building, furnace, 

portable heater requirements, agreement for grease 

trap cleaning, Cogeco issues, furnace quotes among 

others 

14-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 Emails and calls with the administrators re 

information required on room number of residents, 

size and structure of rooms, issues relating to 

heaters, grease trap cleaning, covid related expenses 

among others 

14-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 Emails and calls with Mike and Rose re info on 

resident units, subsidy agreements, licences, floor 

plans, appraisal reports (Dundas and Montgomery) , 

daily banking report, discussion on projections 

among others 

14-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 Commencing work on projections (Northview rent 

roll finalization), preparing them from Jan 13 to June 

1 - to be continued on Jan 15 

14-Jan-2021 Cherry Yip .40 updated to Jan 13
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14-Jan-2021 Jim Guo .30 chq & mailing

14-Jan-2021 Patricia Ball .10 process cheque requisition

14-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 3.40 emails from Peter Mayer of Intact on notice of 

termination on insurance policy, call with Phoenix on 

same; respond to Mayer; call to Edward John of City 

of Hamilton (left msg), email to Mr. John, email from 

Wojtek on impact of City's position on value and 

response thereto; email to Ryan at Dundas to discuss 

condition of two residents/reporting considerations 

on same, call with Phoenix on same; call with PP; 

advice on furnace at Northview being red tagged and 

emails with Shannon and calls with Oldfield on same; 

call with Jensen on  his decision to pass on 

opportunity and reasons therefor; emails and call 

with McCluskie at Colliers; left msg for Wilson; 

further call with Phoenix given Colliers/Jensen 

positions; emails to/from Oldfield on furnace/other 

repairs 

15-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Revising projections based on inputs received from 

Mike on certain expenses, snow removal revised 

contract among others2) Call and email with Cogeco 

re explaining receivership proceedings and 

reactivation of services at Northview retirement 

home3) Email comm. with S. Title re tenancy 

agreements with residents, appraisal reports4) Email 

comm. with Shannon re Cogeco and Ryan re Dundas 

payroll - time sheet for period ended Jan 4 20215) 

Sharing revised projections with Mike and requesting 

for certain info. Also mentioning pending items for 

projections- RPN costs, major repairs, EHT, CRA and 

prop taxes6) Email comm with Rose and Mike re 

certain information,  

15-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 2.50 Continued from Jan 14, 1) Preparing  projections for 

Northview, Dundas, Montgomery for the period Jan 

13 through June 12) Review of back up for opening 

bank balance as at Jan 13 and incorporating in 

projections3) Review of back up for food expenses, 

snow removal contract, other expenses and 

incorporating in the projections4) CRA dues and 

Property taxes for the Projection Period considered 

for payment in week ended June 14) Review of 

payroll and agency cost for each home and 

considering payroll and agency expenses in the 

projection period.5) Preparing consolidated cash flow 

for the 3 homes and determining cash shortfall over 
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the projection period6) Sharing draft financial 

projections with S. Title for review 

15-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Calls with Dundas and Montgomery admins re 

existing issues, payments to be processed, expense 

reports, urgent repairs among others2) Receipt of 

time sheet from Montgomery through fax3) 

Discussion with Mike and Cherry re receipt and 

completion of daily banking tracker for Jan 144) 

Receipt of info on RPN duties and time sheet from 

Dundas5) Receipt of computation of Dundas payroll 

and source deduction info for pay period due on Jan 

20 from Mike (to be reviewed) 

15-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .50 1) Emails and call with Yohaan re providing him 

information on the 3 homes, contact details of 

administrators and explaining background info, work 

done so far as Yohaan's team prepare for their review 

and analysis from Monday2) Emails and calls re 

setting up grease trap cleaning service for Dundas R. 

Home and informing Ryan and S. Title about it 

15-Jan-2021 Cherry Yip .20 updated Jan 14

15-Jan-2021 Jim Guo .30 chq & mailing

15-Jan-2021 Patricia Ball .10 process cheque requisition

15-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 2.30 team call with Rivet; call with Jamie Oldfield of 

Vestacon; team call with Ryan Anderson; call with 

A.Martino and MNP team; finalize and submit 

Landscape invoice for payment; email from Anthony 

on reporting info (PPE and no cases) to RHRA; email 

exchange with V. Sawlanie on CBRE`s ability to 

proceed with BCA in view of lockdown, email to 

Phoenix on whether lockdown impairs ability to have 

BCA; email from Akhil on grease trap; call with Wilson 

on (i) City of Hamilton position, resident issues at 

home, other; call with A. Coluccio on alternative 

insurance in view of Intact`s  threat of non-renewal; 

call with McClurg and Phoenix on McClurg's email 

and the reportable items at home 

16-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title .40 emails with Ryan/Graham/Cliff on incident dealing 

with Peel in Home PSW/resident; email to Akhil on 

following up with Orkin and The Cleaning House for 

ongoing supply 

17-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Email communication with S.Title re payroll for the 

pay period Jan 20, 2020 and Northview related 

operational issues.2) Sorting information on payroll 

and rent roll deposit relevant for Performance 

improvement team and sharing with Y. Thommy 
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17-Jan-2021 Grant Bazian .50 9 e.m.s from + 2 e.m.s to Sheldon Title & e.m from 

Matt Lem & e.m. from Jerry Henechowicz RE: course 

of action on sale (and when/with whom) vs secured 

lender credit bid, etc. 

17-Jan-2021 Matthew Lem .20 Attend to correspondence from S. Title re strategies 

and next steps. 

17-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title .70 review of listing proposals submitted by 

Colliers/Seniors, summarize; email to Akhil on 

funding for payroll 

18-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.30 1) Discussion with S. Rivet re itemized order for items 

to be procured from cleaning house 2) Calls and 

emails with Cleaning House rep re items, time of 

delivery, change of billing address (did not work) 

among others3) Discussion with Mike re order value 

and with Shannon re extra items 4) Evaluating 

purchases from cleaning house over the period Jan to 

Oct 2020 to understand the value of items procured 

in the historical period5) Discussion with Pest Control 

Company and explaining them the requirements 

(revert pending)6) Discussion with Shannon and Ryan 

re grease trap cleaning services schedule among 

others 

18-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .90 1) Emails and calls with Performance Improvement 

Team of MNP re the 3 retirement homes2) Preparing 

and sharing data as required by them on payroll, rent 

roll among others3) Facilitating discussions with 

administrators across R. Homes 

18-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .50 1) Discussion with Sheila and setting up expense 

report format for the administrators to spend and 

take reimbursement in order to expedite and remove 

bottlenecks2) Reviewing expense sheet of Shannon 

and sharing with S. Title for approval3) Explaining S. 

Ayer and requesting to make payments to Shannon 

18-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Discussion with S. Ayer and Matt from Ease team to 

discuss the costs involved and possibility of transfer 

of accounting and payroll function to our Ease team. 

We determined that it will be costly to transfer right 

now but may be considered after sale of the Homes 

18-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.60 1) Preparation of rent roll by room, incorporating 

room dimensions info Northview pending), age of 

property and sharing with S. Title2) Preparation of 

bank analysis as at Jan 15 and analysing payroll 

cheques outstanding, funds available in bank 

accounts, payroll payment requirement on Jan 20 

among others3) Review of Montgomery and Dundas 

payroll received from Mike 
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18-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .90 1) Emails and calls with S. Title re issues at Homes, 

agenda for discussion with BCU, funding 

requirement, creating a structure of all payments 

except payroll from Trust accounts, Cleaning house 

invoice, other requirements at the Homes among 

others2) Discussion re making revisions in projections 

(to be done)3) Discussion re retention bonus for 

administrators with S. Title and Y. Thommy 

18-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Discussion with Trina and Sheila re creating a tracker 

of all email addresses of utility companies to expedite 

discussion with them re outstanding payment and 

service activations 

18-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Receiving Cogeco invoice for the periods without 

bifurcating between Pre and Post receivership period 

and sending an email to them again to provide break 

up bill 

18-Jan-2021 Cherry Yip .30 bookkeeping updated

18-Jan-2021 Matthew Lem .70 Call with S. Title and J. Henechowicz re review 

strategies and next steps. 

18-Jan-2021 Patricia Ball .40 process cheque requisitions

18-Jan-2021 Sheila Ayer .30 Call w/ A. Kapoor, M. Bennett (MNP) - investigate 

options for payroll 

19-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .50 Calls with administrators of Dundas and Montgomery 

to discuss current issues and other requirements 

19-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 Discussion with vendors and supplier including:1) 

Cogeco- Discussed and emailed Cogeco team to share 

split invoices for the period prior and after Dec 23 

2020, the previous invoice rec’d was for the entire 

period.2) Password: Email communication re a brief 

about the situation and scheduling a call for Jan 20. 

Invoice received from Mike as well 

19-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Discussion and finalization of expense sheet 

process2) Coordinating for Shannon's expense sheet 

and sending it to her through mail with admin help3) 

Discussion with S. Ayer re certain cheque requisitions 

19-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Receipt of bank report, sharing with Cherry and 

discussion with Cherry re certain entries 

19-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Discussion with S. Rivet re clean house order, items 

received and pending to take control of inventory. 

Also, received their 2 invoices through Mike and 

going through the items 

19-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Discussion with Mike re payroll outstanding 

cheques to compute the bank balance required at 

RBC account held with Mike2) Discussion re 
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exemption from WSIB for the retirement homes3) 

Discussion re food orders 

19-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .60 Discussion re Fire control services, seeking docs from 

the 3 homes, reviewing the docs and understanding 

that Northview and Dundas do not require inspection 

at this time. Speaking with Regal Fire and sharing a 

test email. Updating S. Title about it 

19-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .90 1) Email communication with S. Title re PPE inventory 

order quantity for the 3 homes and determining a 

way to have control on the existing and the 

subsequent orders with key attention to PPE items 

required during an outbreak. email communication 

with S. Title and C. Trollope as well re existing and 

future orders and PPE order quantities as required by 

RHRA2) Discussion with S. Title re selected agenda 

items for the call with BCU on Jan 203) Discussion re 

finalization of payroll cheques for payroll due on Jan 

20 with S. Title and Mike 

19-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Review of historical rent for 2020 received from Mike 

for Dundas and Montgomery 

19-Jan-2021 Cherry Yip .30 bookkeeping update

19-Jan-2021 Jessie Hue .50 Banking, assist S. Ayer with the stop payment admin.

19-Jan-2021 Sheila Ayer .50 Compile expenses report, receipts, approvals for S. 

Rivet, prep cheque requisition, submit req  for 

approval/processing 

19-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 1.80 call with McCluskie to pose questions on proposal, 

call from Mark @ RHRA on follow up to incident 

report; call with Thommy on his findings and his text 

on outbreak at homes, email exchange with PP, email 

to RBC to transfer funds to cover payroll, discussion 

with Kapoor on WSIB issue raised by Thommy, email 

exchange with Wilson; call to Peel in Home; call with 

Ryan Anderson; call with Thommy on R Anderson's 

comments on looking for a position; call with Ryan on 

his request for personal day, job search, PPE 

requirements; email from Ryan Anderson after hours 

to deal with bed bugs/non-show nurse from agency; 

emails to Wilson after hours on furnace issue after 

exchange of emails with Shannon on issues with 

breakers arising from temporary heaters 

20-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Call with S. Rivet re current issues at the home, 

inventory levels, call with S. Title, C. Trollope re issues 

to be discussed with BCU, Health and Safety report, 

administrators compensation among others 
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20-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 Email communication with Regal Fire and another 

vendor in Hamilton for quotes and discussion on the 

list of repairs required as per Court order 

20-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.40 Multiple emails and calls with the administrators and 

Rose re existing inventory levels, quantities required 

and quotes received, preparing inventory sheet, 

minimum quantities required for Northview and 

Montgomery and requesting for missing info from 

administrators. Also, requesting Dundas admin to 

provide details (to be received on Jan 21) 

20-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .50 Multiple emails and calls with vendors- Password, 

Cogeco and Alectra re their queries in the accounts, 

receivership, next steps, their outstanding amounts 

among others 

20-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Multiple emails and calls with Pest control team, S. 

Rivet re scheduling the visit for 5 rooms and multiple 

mattress cover change and finalizing the order, 

service scheduled on Jan 21. Also, connecting Ryan 

(admin) from Dundas with Pest Control team to 

inform them about requirements at Dundas2) Emails 

and calls with S. Rivet re discrepancy in Clean House 

order and confirming that the remaining items will be 

delivered momentarily. 

20-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 Revising the 13 weeks projections basis discussion 

with S. Title and other changes due to change in 

timing of expense payments and  sharing them with 

S. Title, also listing down items not considered in the 

projections 

20-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Discussion re updating cash flow tracking through 

bank report and delegating the task to another staff 

member of Accounts team 

20-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Discussion with S. Rivet re certain inventory items 

and requirement of eye wash stations 

20-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Email communication with S. Title and C. Trollope 

re call with BCU, next steps, report from compliance 

team, projections among others2) email 

communication with Yohaan Thommy re sharing 

required docs with him for his review 

20-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .50 Reviewing and preparing updates for S. Title- re pest 

control, Fire inspection and PPE inventory required 

(and related matters and issues) 

20-Jan-2021 Cherry Yip .20 discussed with MG for ongoing bookkeeping 

20-Jan-2021 Jessie Hue .40 Banking.

20-Jan-2021 Jim Guo .30 chq req

20-Jan-2021 Jim Guo .30 chq req - Dundas Retirement
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20-Jan-2021 Jim Guo .30 chq req - Maple Retirement

20-Jan-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .30 Jan 19th Bookkeeping, discuss with Cherry

20-Jan-2021 Patricia Ball .50 cheque requisitions

20-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 1.80 conference call with Wilson/Burych (1.25 hours)(; call 

with Phoenix; call with Shannon Rivet on Northview 

(.3); call with team (.2) afterwards on various safety 

issues; mail from/to Vincent at Vestacon on furnace; 

call with PP; email with RBC (North York) on 

confirmation of loan balances, stop payments, etc.; 

emails with MNP accounting on cheque processing; 

21-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .70 1) Discussion with S. Title re inventory sheet shared 

earlier, quotes to be revised and email 

communication with him re Northview order. Also, 

discussed fire inspection safety work order for 

Montgomery2)  Discussion with Ryan re pest control 

at Dundas and evaluating couple of vendors with him 

who provide this service3) Updating self with City of 

Hamilton meeting with S. Title and action items 

21-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Discussion with Shannon and Ryan (admins) re 

explaining them the rationale to obtain their 

inventory levels, monthly quantities required and 

quantities required in case of an outbreak.  2) 

Identifying mistakes in Shannon's computation and 

asking her to revise. 3) Ryan's details were incorrect 

and not appropriate so requested him to refer to 

Shannon and Anthony' s sheet and provide correct 

numbers 

21-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Discussion with Anthony re repairs required as per 

Fire Inspection Order and connected him with the 

vendor 

21-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Reviewing inventory levels required in case of Coved 

outbreak as shared by Shannon. Also reviewing 

Ryan's numbers provided in email but they did not 

make sense so asked him to revise. 

21-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Review of bank activity tracker shared by Mike and 

sharing with Mubeen (Accounts team) for recording 

in our bank activity tracker. Email comm. with 

Mubeen re certain entries for which explanation is 

required 

21-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .70 1) Emails and calls with vendors who are not paid 

since September 2020 and having concerns about 

repayment of past dues. Explained them the Court 

order and that we will be paying for their services 

from Dec 23, 2020, sharing Court order, recording 

their past dues and coordinating with Mike. Also, 
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advising the creditor to refer our website for regular 

updates. 2) Finalization of inventory list for 

Northview and sharing with Ryan to provide his 

details in similar format. Also updating S. Title about 

it 

21-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Email communication with Rose and Mike re work in 

progress PPE inventory sheet and finalizing N95 mask 

order for Northview 

21-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Email comm. with S. Title and Shannon re eye wash 

station and obtaining its quote, reviewing the quote 

and the quantities required and sharing the quote 

with S. Title for approval. Also, an email conversation 

with Cleaning House who provided the quote 

21-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Reviewing inventory list shared by Ryan and 

incorporating it in our workbook 

21-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .60 1) Analysing inventory levels of the 3 homes, 

preparing consolidated sheet, sharing final numbers 

with the administrators for confirmation, discussion 

with Shannon re finalization and basis of numbers. 

Sharing revised sheet with S. Title for his review2) 

Discussion with Shannon re N95 mask orders and 

delivery3) Email comm. with S. Title re change of 

billing address for suppliers and inventory levels 

21-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Email comm with S. Title re bed bugs issue at Dundas 

and updating him about the steps taken so far and 

vendors contacted 

21-Jan-2021 Jim Guo .40 courier chq

21-Jan-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .20 Jan 20 Bookkeeping

21-Jan-2021 Patricia Ball .30 cheque requisitions

21-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 2.00 call with Edward John and Rob Mastroianni of City of 

Hamilton Subsidies office; email to Phoenix/Trollope 

summarizing call; email to Wilson also summarizing 

meeting; review/comment on draft RHRA report and 

forward comments to Cliff; call with Joe Levy of 

Seniors on asset values; numerous emails to Tom 

Wilson and Walter Burych on sales process and 

repairs/maintenance related issues; processing 

payments; review of banking position email with DDK 

on boiler; email with Donna Ballentyne of Pinchin on 

BCA 

22-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .70 1) Email comm with Shannon and updating inventory 

sheet2) Call with Shannon re new issues at home, 

trespass issue, N95 inventory, pest control issues 

among others 
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22-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 Multiple emails with Performance Improvement 

team re staffing requirement at home, resident roll 

for previous periods, Time sheet for historical period 

among others and sharing relevant info with them 

22-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 Multiple emails and calls with Shannon. Rose and AZ 

Med and placing N95 mask order with them and 

scheduling the delivery on Monday. Also, discussion 

with AZ Med re their interest in buying the homes 

22-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Reviewing the bank activity and sharing with team to 

update the tracker for Jan 21 

22-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Calls and emails with Anthony re fire inspection 

report repairs, quote for carpet repair, connecting 

with another person for minor construction repairs, 

understanding Montgomery marketing strategies to 

ensure the Home is always full among others2) 

Multiple emails and calls with password protection, 

Sheldon and Shannon re issues at homes which 

require urgent attention3) Multiple emails with S. 

Title re ongoing issues, updates, among others 

22-Jan-2021 Jessie Hue 1.70 Banking, review micro coding and t/c with S. Title on 

potential cheque issue. Dealing with branch at RBC 

Milton and follow up with S. Title on status. Further 

inquiry with RBC account manager on reissued 

cheques on the micro coding for precaution.  

22-Jan-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .20 Jan 21 Bookkeeping

22-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 1.70 emails from Shannon Rivet on break and enter and 

request whether we wish to press charges; call with 

Phoenix; call with Shannon, call with Pre Lock on 

front door issue; call with Blue Knight Security in case 

there is a need for security at front door; call with 

Carmela Vidic of City of Hamilton on carpet 

replacement; update call with Anthony Martino of 

Montgomery; emails with Ron Hazell to finalize Blue 

Knight's involvement; email from/to Angela Taube of 

insurance brokerage on insurance renewal; respond 

to Ryan on staffing concerns; call with Yohaan on 

Ryan's staffing issues 

23-Jan-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .20 Jan 22 Bookkeeping

23-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title .50 respond to Shannon Rivet's message re: lack of 

outdoor lighting at Northview and arrange for 

Vestacon to repair; emails/calls with Shannon and 

Jamie Oldfield concerning same; coordinate through 

Akhil the quoting on the carpet after receiving Tom 

Wilson's message; call from Oldfield to advise of 

resolution of lighting problem; to being advised by 
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Shannon that furnace is not working and coordinating 

with Vestacon the repairs by Opus to the units 

25-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Emails and calls with S. Rivet and Ryan re N95 

masks for Northview, Pest Control, Grease Trap 

cleaning at Dundas. Also, briefly discussed 

requirement of PPE at R. Home2) Discussion with 

Ryan re expense report and sharing a format. Also 

requesting him to seek quotes for Pest Control 

Inspection from Apollo3) Discussion re banking 

activity for Jan 22 and email comm with Accounts 

team re entries for which explanation is required 

25-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Emails and calls with S. Title re open issues at 

homes and planning ordering of PPE Inventory2) 

Discussion with S. Title daily banking activity3) 

Informing S. Title re interest of a party in buying 

retirement home and email comm with the party4) 

Requesting Mike to provide info about Brantel, 

creditor of Northview whose name was not there in 

the creditor list5) Further discussion with S. Rivet re 

action items, coordinating for deliveries etc. 

25-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Emailing Anthony to request him to provide an 

update about fire repairs2) Follow up with Ryan 

regarding Grease Trap service3) Email comm with 

Cleaning House re eye wash station, ordering 2 of 

them for Northview and informing them of 

receivership and revised billing information4) Making 

arrangements to pay for the N95 masks for 

Northview (incl. coordinating with admin team) 

25-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.30 1) Reviewing Reinvestment Funding document of City 

of Hamilton which deals with funding available for 

recreational activities of the residents and providing 

comments to S. Title re action to be taken before Feb 

1 to ensure the documentation is provided or return 

the money. Also, discussed the possibility of 

continuing to hold the funds in trust and list of 

eligible activities during Covid. 2) Discussion re issues 

raised by a family member of a resident of 

Montgomery Home3) Reviewing the daily banking 

activity, rectifying few errors, highlighting the items 

for which explanation from Mike is required. also 

sharing with S. Title and discussion re preparation of 

a summary for SRD and other purposes4) Email 

comm with S. Title re supplier invoices, Sale process, 

quotes for carpet repair to be obtained among others 

25-Jan-2021 Jessie Hue .40 Banking, request for the statements for three 

accounts to confirm cleared cheques. Email 
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confirmation with S. Title on no online access for 

trust accounts.  

25-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 1.90 email to Carmela Vidic on carpet replacement; email 

from Shannon on arranging additional night of 

security and to sending her supplier invoice to check; 

check in with Ryan Anderson (.4); emails to Barbers 

and Caring Hearts to lend support to Ryan's efforts at 

kitchen repairs/staffing needs; emails to/from MA 

Lenio on non-responsiveness from Montgomery on 

phone/emails; receipt of Walter Burych's 

email/develop response/call with McCluskie of 

Colliers to confirm certain aspects of its proposal with 

it. 

26-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.00 1) Discussion re action items- carpet quotes, 

accounting for entries in bank statement, 

Reinvestment Funding (City of Hamilton), supplier 

invoices, understanding payroll from Mike and 

initiating transition to ADP among others2) Call with 

S. Rivet, Northview re open issues, status of PPE 

among others3) Call with Cleaning House re change 

in billing address and other instructions4) Emails with 

Anthony re repairs at home- Fire related - completion 

of other work by a supplier for $400, quotes for Fire 

door installation, drywall deficiency, updating S. Title 

about the status5) Discussion with Accounts team re 

entries for which explanation is req’d and sharing 

cheque relates information with them. Also, 

discussion with him to prepare a summary of receipts 

and disbursements under various heads. 

26-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Email and call with a Brit Vis, a vendor who 

provides carpet replacement/repair service to explain 

the requirements and connecting them with the 

administrators of the Homes2) Discussion with S. 

Rivet re Cleaning House invoices for the last 30 days 

to understand if the products have been received.3) 

Call with Anthony re discussion on open issues (incl. 

fire related) and way forward4) Emails with S. Rivet 

re additional work required from Walker 

Environmental5) Discussion with Trina re 235 notice 

post on website, preparation of vendor list and 

payments to be made to them among other issues6) 

Discussion with mask vendor for Northview for 

additional invoicing for mask testing among other 

stuff 

26-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 Email comm with S. Title re follow up with utilities, 

preparation of a tracking sheet for payables, update 
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on Bert vis (carpet repair vendor) scheduled visit at 

the 2 homes and discussion re update on a PP and 

saving that information in the Sale process folder 

26-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.00 1) Emails and calls with S. Title and Mike re cheque 

book order, issues related to outstanding invoices, 

email from a vendor about payment as his name was 

not in creditor list (Mike explained it was missed)2) 

Discussion with Mike re Brantel invoices which were 

not recorded, how to deal with them, other queries 

related to that.3) Discussion with Ryan (Dundas) re 

Grease Trap services and scheduling a conference call 

with them (required by Grease Trap)4) Discussion 

with Ryan re status of conversation with Apollo for 

pest control service5) Email comm with Shannon re 

N95 masks, fitting issues and scheduling a visit by the 

supplier, coordinating with the supplier for the 

payment6) Further emails on the carpet issue, 

payment for furnace etc.7) Emails with Brit Vis re 

work to be done (carpet repair), approval process, 

timeline, Court order, billing information 

26-Jan-2021 Jessie Hue .80 Banking prepare cheque reqs.

26-Jan-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .20 Update bank activity tracker

26-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title .90 finalization of memo; call with Phoenix; email memo 

to Burych/Wilson, check in call with A. Martino;  

emails on locksmith/mag lock and arrange security; 

process payments; finalization/issuance to RHRA of 

safety/health letter; send copy of RHRA letter to 

Wilson/Burych 

26-Jan-2021 Trina Burningham 1.00 Cheque Requisitions filled out and emailed to 

Sheldon for Approval; Saved cheque reqs to 

directory; Emailed Akhil re: 3rd cheq req and invoice. 

26-Jan-2021 Trina Burningham .25 MNPdebt webpage updated to include document 

provided by A. Kapoor.  

27-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Discussion with S. Title re expense summary, 

vendor summary, call with BCU, transition for payroll, 

Sale process discussion, RHRA notice for June 1 

deadline among others2) Email comm re flooring 

options for Northview as carpet is not viable. Also 

need to inform Bert Vis to provide cost effective 

options for flooring other than carpet3) Email comm 

re commencing work on preparing vendor invoice 

summary with Trina's help 

27-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Discussion with Mubeen re preparation of expense 

summary 
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27-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .70 1) Updating the entries to appropriately group 

expenses incurred from Dec 23 2020 till date in the 

daily banking activity tracker, updating Pivots to 

ensure the information is captured correctly and 

sharing with Mubeen to update Jan 25 and Jan 26 in 

the report2) Sharing the sheet with Mike and 

requesting for his time to discuss a few entries 

27-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .70 1) Discussion with Mike re certain in the banking 

activity tracker, payroll processing next week and 

related steps, Sale process documents, subsidies 

from City of Hamilton among others2) Calls and 

emails with S. Title and AZ Med Pharma (PPE 

supplier) re inventory requirements for Dundas and 

Montgomery and placing the order for masks and 

gloves.3) Discussion with S. Rivet re delivery of N95 

masks at N.view and scheduling N95 mask fitment on 

Jan 28. Also discussed about scheduled delivery of 

eye wash stations at N. View on Jan 284) Discussion 

re pin money withdrawal and distribution among the 

residents 

27-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .50 1) Discussion with Mubeen (Accounts team) re 

update of bank activity for last 2 days- Jan 25 and Jan 

262) preparation of statement of R and D for the 

period Dec 23 2020 to Jan 25 2021 for the 3 Homes 

and sharing with S. Title for review3) Explaining how 

to prepare the pivot and SRD to Mubeen to ensure he 

prepares it going forward 

27-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Discussion re payment of an invoice from a vendor 

who fixed the elevator at Dundas a few weeks ago 

and also discussing with S. Ayer to commence 

preparation of vendor invoice summary with Trina's 

help2) Discussion with Shannon re requirement of 

addl. service from Walker for addl. repairs 

27-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .90 1) Reviewing all the vendor invoices, saving such 

emails rec’d from all vendors through Mike, Admins, 

S. Title, preparing a format to record vendor invoices 

and its summary and email comm with Trina re 

commencing work on the same2) Email comm with 

Trina re directing her to follow up with utilities for 

the break up of invoices for the period Dec 23 2020 

onwards 

27-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Email comm with May re finalization of PPE order 

for Dundas and Montgomery2) Informing Ryan and 

Anthony about the order to ensure they coordinate 

for delivery and also discuss fitment issues with AZ 
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Med3) Requesting Sheila to proceed for payment 

after Sheldon approves them 

27-Jan-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .30 Bookkeeping/pivots

27-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 1.20 Conference call with Burych/Wilson, call with Phoenix 

afterwards; call from Levy (Seniors)  

27-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title .50 email to MA Lenio (follow up on complaint re: A. 

Martino); emails on PPE; email from Shannon/to Ron 

on security issue; email to/from Ryan Anderson on 

personal days/PPE; exchange of Shannon on reasons 

carpet ought not to be used 

27-Jan-2021 Trina Burningham .50 Started the Affidavit of Mailing draft

27-Jan-2021 Trina Burningham .25 Cheque requisition drafted and emailed for approval; 

Emailed approved requisition to J. Hue for 

submission. 

28-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .50 1) Discussion with Sheldon re payroll transition, RHRA 

letter, steps to be taken for Sale Process, call update 

with BCU, scheduled call with the admins among 

others2) Bell email and advising Trina to follow up3) 

Sending email to Brantel to inform about Northview 

receivership and next steps4) Advising Accounts team 

to update bank report for Jan 275) Email comm with 

Brantel team and saving their 2 invoices6) Email 

comm with Trina advising her to add Branttel in 

Ascend for N. View 

28-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Call with Trina to explain how to make vendor invoice 

summary, follow up with utilities etc. 

28-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .70 1) Email comm with Mike re asking for payroll 

information for payments scheduled on Feb 5 and 

giving him a heads up about scheduling a visit at his 

office next week2) Review of letter received from 

RHRA3) Email comm with S. Rivet re time sheet for 

period ended Jan 15 20214) Email comm with Mike re 

PIN Money and to revert to him on that later5) Email 

comm with S. Title re status update on RP002 for 

MNP on behalf of R. Homes 

28-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Emails with Shannon and S. Title re fire related 

problem at N. View for which Hamilton Fire Service is 

required to be called2) Email comm with HFC 

explaining them about receivership, the requirement 

at N. View and assuring them that MNP will pay for 

the services.3) Email comm with Nick from Regal Fire 

and S. River re aspects of the work order, certain 

clarifications (HFC did not consent to provide the 

service)4) Email comm with S. Ayer re vendor invoice 

summary (draft) prepared by her and next steps and 
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fixing a call with her to understand ADP's 

involvement for payroll processing 5) Multiple emails 

with Regal Fire and Shannon re explanation the 

problem behind the beep noise from the instrument 

28-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .60 1) Review of PIN Money document along with the 

back ups available for resident PIN Money and 

approving the request to withdraw PIN money and 

hand over to the residents through administrators. 

Also, informing Shannon to collect PIN money from 

Mike2) Email and call with S. Title re PIN Money 

request3) Email comm with Mike re PIN Money for 

Dundas as they do not receive it from the City. He 

confirmed that resident families provide the money 

for residents. 

28-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Follow up with Bell re follow up to provide break 

up of invoice summary for the period Dec 23 onwards 

and directing Trina to follow up with the other 

utilities except Cogeco.2) Discussion with S. Title re 

one time funding received by Montgomery from city 

of Hamilton 

28-Jan-2021 Jessie Hue .30 Follow up with the bank and request of the 

statement of accounts to date, save to the directory. 

28-Jan-2021 Sheila Ayer 1.25 Compile Vendor Invoice tracker, reconcile payments, 

provide summary of findings to A. Kapoor 

28-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title .90 call from Flanagans on cheque; forward same to Hue 

to investigate RBC error on Flanagan cheque 

processing;; call with Angela Taube on Intact 

insurance policy renewals; call with Hamilton 

brokerage referred by BCU; request transfer of funds 

from Northview pre-existing a/c to our trust account 

29-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Email comm with Shannon and Regal Fire re 

resolution of "Beep" issue from an instrument from 

N. View basement and updating S. Title about it 

29-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Email comm with Trina re email address to be 

created for R. Homes2) Email with Trina re follow up 

Enbridge, Cogeco and setting up billing for 

enbridge.3) Following up with Cogeco for break up of 

invoices4) Bank activity tracker- sending bank 

statement to Mubeen for update and making 

changes in the tracker for entries as discussed with 

Mike 

29-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Call with Shannon re update on issues at home and 

updating S. Title re vaccination timeline, maintenance 

repairs, grease trap item repairs, PPE inventory to be 

discussed next week among others 2) Call with C. 

Trollope re open issues at Dundas and discussion on 
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Northview issues. 3) Call with Anthony re issues at 

Montgomery home re PPE Inventory, carpet issue, 

vaccination update, replacing furnace among others. 

Fire installation among others 

29-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Discussion with Sheila re payroll transition- steps 

to be taken to ensure transition for next payroll 

scheduled on Feb 20, documents to be submitted to 

ADP, time sheet available from homes among 

others2) Discussion with S. Rivet re security guard 

requirements, issues with door repair, connecting 

with Blue night services to verify availability of 

security guard among others and ensuring the guard 

is available and possibly for the weekend (multiple 

emails and calls)3) Email comm with Anthony re 

advance payment requirement for door repair and 

updating S. Title about it4) Email comm with S. Title 

re Thyssen Krupp email on the outstanding 

invoices.5) Update on communication with RHRA re 

Dundas and issues of resident fall in specific areas at 

the homes 

29-Jan-2021 Jessie Hue 1.20 Banking, prepare cheque reqs, issue cheque and 

prepare courier.  

29-Jan-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .20 Bookkeeping Jan 28

29-Jan-2021 Sheila Ayer .50 Call w C. Marshall (ADP), email status update; Call 

with A. Kapoor re ADP Payroll coordination, Vendor 

Tracker 

29-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title 1.60 two calls with Phoenix on various, incl. RHRA notice 

requirement after receiving McClurg email; (.4) call 

with McClurg/Phoenix (50 mins), emails with Wilson 

following call on BCU notice; call from Bob Brown and 

his msg re: RHRA notices; call with Wilson (.5);  

30-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Emails re Door repair at Northview, which is 

complete and do not require security, RHRA and BCU 

call update from S. Title and action items for today 

30-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Email comm re bank activity for Jan 29, comm with 

Mubeen for update , explaining S. Title about PIN 

money withdrawals, also advising Mubeen about the 

same 

30-Jan-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Providing update of the call with Anthony to S. 

Title re furnace, door, carpet among others and also 

email comm about matters impacting all the homes2) 

Email comm with S. River re carpet quotes from Bert 

Vis 

31-Jan-2021 Sheldon Title .20 email to David Blanchard of Blair Blanchard Stapleton 

on opportunity to list property 
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01-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Email comm with S. Rivet re maintenance works 

required, who will do it, its budget, timelines  and 

finally its visit 

01-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Email comm with Anthony re drywall deficiency, 

fire door installation, furnace among others2) Email 

and call with S. Rivet re maintenance repairs required 

at home, maintenance man expenses, his expense 

sheet and related matters incl. items required and 

their quotes3) Email comm with Shannon re carpet 

repair and related options available4) Email comm 

with Mike re requirement of payroll computation for 

Northview and Dundas and receipt of payroll for 

Montgomery and Bank activity report5) Email comm 

and calls with Jessie Hue re EHT letter received from 

Minister of Finance6) Emails and calls re privacy 

concern shared by Registrar of Hamilton Court as her 

name was appearing in the application record. 

Resolved by S. Title by asking to upload PDF scanned 

document so that the name is not searchable 

01-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.00 1) Email comm with Bert Vis re quote received from 

them for Montgomery2) Email comm with Sheila re 

new invoices received on Feb 1 and recording them 

in vendor invoice tracker. Also, discussed other 

alternatives of tracking invoices.  3) Call with CRA rep 

(Kamila) re RP002 account opening to proceed with 

source deduction payment and discussion re other 

files. Updating S. Title about the discussion4) Email 

comm with vendors re their invoices and payments to 

be made5) Email comm with Christina (For Fitment 

testing of employees) re central billing for the 3 

Homes and sharing Court Order 6) Email comm re 

Third party vendor invoices and email comm with S. 

Title and admins of homes 

01-Feb-2021 Jessie Hue .20 Banking

01-Feb-2021 Matthew Lem .30 Discussion with S. Title re file matters and strategies.

01-Feb-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .20 update bookkeeping

01-Feb-2021 Sheila Ayer .50 Update invoice tracker, coord. cheq requisitions for 

payments 

01-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title .70 conference call with Burych, Phoenix and Wilson

01-Feb-2021 Trina Burningham .60 Bank Cheque Requisition drafted and emailed for 

approval; Approved copy saved to directory and 

emailed to P. Ball for deposit; Bank Cheque 

Requisition drafted and emailed for approval; 

Approved copy saved to directory and emailed to P. 

Ball for deposit. 
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02-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Reading through emails between S. Title, legal 

counsel and BCU and email comm with S. Title re 

prep of SRD from Dec 23, 2020 to Jan 31 2021 

02-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Email comm with Shannon re garbage pick up 

through Waste Co, sink cleaning and other misc. 

items2) Email with Anthony re status update on 

drywall and furnace update3) Connecting Anthony 

with Vestacon for door repair 

02-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .60 1) Review of Banking tracker and making necessary 

changes in the tracker for the purpose of sending the 

SRD to S. Title for RBC Accounts held by Mike2) Email 

comm with Mubeen re Bank report for Feb 1 and 

explaining changes made in report3) Email comm 

with S. Title and S. Ayer re payments made by S. Title 

for food for the Homes 

02-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Email comm with Waste Connections explaining 

them about receivership and next steps upon receipt 

of their bill2) Email comm with Branley re services 

performed at Montgomery - Fire repairs3) Email 

comm with Sheila re payroll records available, form 

to be filled for ADP, requirement for payroll 

processing by Feb 20, ADP charges among others. 

Also, discussed vendor invoice summary for certain 

entries on which explanation was sought4) Call with 

S. Title and S. Ayer re discussion on payroll records 

for transition to ADP and vendor invoice summary5) 

Email comm with Bert Vis re the 2 quotes received 

from them for Montgomery (to review them)6) Email 

comm with Ryan (Dundas) re grease trap cleaning 

and Pest control service70 Email comm with 

Vestacon re certain repairs required at Montgomery 

02-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Call with Mike and S. Title re compensation for 

services by NA, payroll records and rent roll for 

January 2021 among other details 

02-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Discussion with the registrar of Court re uploading 

non searchable document on the web so that the 

name is not searchable. Receipt of a new doc from 

her2) Email comm with S. Title about it as the 

Registrar sent an email again3) Discussion with S. 

Title re final agreement on the issue re posting the 

searchable doc again on website 

02-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .70 1) Noting down key agenda points and having a call 

with Ryan to discuss issues re pest control, grease 

trap, time sheet, direct deposit form and some floor 

repairs. Also, discussed an issue re short collection of 

rent from a few residents, information to RHRA 
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among others2) Providing an update to S. Title about 

the call 

02-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.50 1) Call with Anthony re issues at Montgomery home -

door installation, furnace, quote for carpet, direct 

deposit forms, rent roll among others. Also sharing 

the 2 quotes with him2) Calls and emails with Mike, 

Ryan (admin of Dundas), S. Title, Trina and Sheila and 

Cogeco team re issues with Cogeco service at home 

and informing Ryan that it is a technical issue and 

there is no issue with service.3) Communication with 

Waste Co re change of service and change of billing 

info4) Closure of privacy concern issue and email 

comm re MNP Privacy officer5) Follow up with 

Vestacon and update of meeting between Anthony 

and Vestacon re fire door issue6) Email comm with 

Todd from Branley re payment to be made to them70 

Receipt of payroll for 3 homes and NA invoice to MNP

02-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Review of quotes received from Bert Vis (Glue 

down vs click installation)2) Email comm with Todd 

from Branley re payment to be made to him.3) Email 

comm with Cogeco team and sharing email address 

and other info with Ryan (Dundas) to schedule a visit 

or call with Cogeco 

02-Feb-2021 Jessie Hue .80 Updating minister of finance information in Ascend. 

Dealing with incoming mail and saving to the 

directory. Banking , prepare cheq reqs. 

02-Feb-2021 Matthew Lem .10 Review and approve cheque requisition

02-Feb-2021 Patricia Ball .10 cheque requisition

02-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title .60 call with Mike Springstead and Akhil Kapoor on 

payroll, financials, etc.; addressing matters related to 

privacy issue raised by court clerk  

02-Feb-2021 Trina Burningham 1.75 Printed and scanned appointment order to create 

privacy compliant version; Uploaded document to 

MNPdebt webpage; Deleted previous version from 

webpage; Per S.Title, removed Privacy Compliant 

version from webpage and replaced with original 

"searchable" version. 

03-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Emails received re Northview IPAC, Pinchin work 

heads up among others and sending an email to 

Shannon re action items for today- cleaning carts, 

inventory, flooring options among others 

03-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.50 1) Email comm with S. Rivet re cleaning cart order 

with Cleaning house, emails with Cleaning House 

team.2) Detailed discussion and review of quotes 

with Bert Vis team for Northview and Montgomery.3) 
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Email comm re bank activity and discussion with 

Mubeen4) Email comm with Mike re certain deposits 

and about Telus invoice 

03-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 Follow up with Bell, Cogeco, Alectra and Enbridge for 

their updated invoices to give effect to receivership 

03-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.40 1) Email comm with S. Rivet re quotes received for 

washer. Also sharing quotes received from Appliance 

Girl - Washer2) Receipt of employee information 

from Mike for the purpose of providing to ADP and 

reviewing the same3) Receipt of invoices from 

Cleaning House re sink solutions and Cart.4) Call with 

the Registrar re her name removal and directing her 

to MNP Legal team5) Email rec’d from H. Spector and 

forwarding it to S. Title. 6) Email comm with Trina re 

Enbridge account opening in MNP name and asking 

to seek login details6) Discussion re Reliance invoice 

for Northview and providing a status update to S. 

Title re all utilities- Bell, Cogeco, Alectra, Enbridge 

and a new one - Telus7) Email comm with Thyssen 

Krupp and another creditor re providing their 

information about the receivership and billing 

information 

03-Feb-2021 Jim Guo .30 chq run

03-Feb-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .25 Bookkeeping Feb 2nd

03-Feb-2021 Patricia Ball .20 cheque requisition

03-Feb-2021 Patricia Ball .20 cheque requisition

03-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title .60 review of cheq requisitions, email to/from 

Ryan/Desrene on Peel in Home payment/invoicing; 

updating SRD to reflect additional activity; email 

to/from Pinchin, email to/from Rob Mastroianni on 

timing for call with City of Hamilton,  call to Berg on 

potentially representing us on retirement home 

management and review of notes for other service 

providers 

03-Feb-2021 Trina Burningham .50 Bank Rec approved and emailed to P. Ball. 

04-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Discussion re Bell issues at NView, Pest control 

issue at Dundas among others with S. Title2) Email 

comm with Anthony re quote for door installation 

shared by Vestacon 

04-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Discussion re dry wall issue at Montgomery, 

multiple issues at Dundas (RHRA), telephone issue at 

Northview, Water tank at Northview, receipt of 

inventory list from N. View and discussion re order 

confirmation of AZ Med of additional PPE items 

which were not available earlier and scheduling 
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delivery at N. View.2) Discussion re rent roll with 

Mike and banking activity for Feb 3 incl. call with 

Mubeen for update on tracker3) Email comm with 

Waste connections re certain required information 

for their billing purpose4) Email comm with Trina re 

activation of Enbridge online account for invoice 

viewing and other purpose 

04-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Email comm with Doug from DDK about 

Montgomery's furnace issue and requesting for a 

call2) Email comm with Sheila re information for ADP 

and timelines to provide that information3) Email 

comm with Shannon re washer and Bell issue and 

delivery of certain cleaning items4) Call with Doug 

from DDK re estimated cost for parts replacement 

and timing of receipt of the revised quote (to be 

received on Feb 5) 

04-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Email comm with Ryan re maintenance of cable by

Cogeco and connecting with the representative2) 

Email comm with Brantel team re service request for 

phone line at Northview3) Email comm with Anthony 

re fire installation door and related quotes 

04-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .90 1) Email with Anthony re fire door installation and 

considering his offer of going ahead with a service 

provider other than Vestacon as they are cheaper2) 

Email comm with Cogeco re Dundas home service 

complaint for cable3) Email comm with Sheila re 

payroll process set up with ADP and related details4) 

Email and call with S. Title re issues at Dundas, payroll 

computation5) Updating S. Title about issues at 

Northview- Phone lines, washer among others6) 

Glancing through rent roll to understand collections 

till date and also reviewing the payroll to be paid 

tomorrow to verify if it matches with the 

projections.7) Understanding payroll payments 

scheduled on Feb 5, comparing them with projections 

and providing approval to Mike for payment 

04-Feb-2021 Jim Guo .30 chq run

04-Feb-2021 Matthew Lem .20 Affidavit of mailing - virtual commissioning

04-Feb-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .20 Feb 3 bookkeeping

04-Feb-2021 Patricia Ball .20 cheque requisition

04-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title 2.80 call with R. Anderson on staffing/RHRA/agencies, call 

with Phoenix; call/email to Hauser;  call with Levy in 

advance of call with Tom/Walter; lengthy conference 

call with Tom, Walter and Joe Levy on marketing of 
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homes; email exchange with Tom Wilson on books 

and records and arranging conference call 

04-Feb-2021 Trina Burningham .50 Call with Enbridge re: paper billing and online 

account access 

05-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Email comm with S. Title re issues at the homes for 

the purpose of discussion with the administrators in 

the calls2) Email comm with S. Title re issues with the 

phone lines at N. View and service request raised . 

Also discussed about furnace breakage 

05-Feb-2021 Jessie Hue .20 Banking, provide team with response on etransfer 

request. 

05-Feb-2021 Patricia Ball .20 prepare cheque

05-Feb-2021 Sheila Ayer 2.25 Contact supplier (Flanagan's) re: outstanding 

invoices, receipt of invoices, summarize and prep for 

pymt. approval, update supplier invoice tracker, file; 

BranTel: phone issues: coord. w/ BrantTel for service 

call, cheque requisition About Zed Pharmacy 

05-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title 2.20 call with Shannon Rivet; call with Anthony Martin; 

call with Cliff/Yohaan on Dundas staffing; call from 

Wojtek re: his receiving a call from Hamilton Court 

registrar's spouse/email to in-house counsel on same; 

call with Levy on follow up to conference call on next 

steps; call with Phoenix on RHRA notice; 

communications with Shannon/BrantTel on broken 

telephone line/furnace; review of RHRA proposed 

language to be posted on facilities and emails with 

Phoenix on same 

06-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .60 1) Email comm re Drywall quote received from a 

vendor and sending that quote to Anthony to 

discuss2) Discussion re Cogeco new account for 

Dundas and checking with Ryan if that is also part of 

Receivership accounts or a personal account of a 

resident3) Email comm re Flanagan invoices and 

repairs of telephone lines at Northview4) Email 

comm with Ryan and Cogeco re repairs at Dundas5) 

Email comm with S.Ayer and S. Title re updating 

vendor tracker for ensuring payments on time6) 

Other emails with S. Title and C. Trollope re issues at 

Dundas7) Email comm with S. Title and Anthony re 

the 2 pending issues at Montgomery about fire 

repairs and to discuss about communicated to the 

fire department about the update on all repairs (to 

be continued)8) Sending Cogeco invoice to Ryan to 

verify their invoice as it is extremely high9) Email 

comm with Ryan re existing inventory required in 
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excel and also connecting Ryan and AZ Med for mask 

replacement due to size issues 

06-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Email comm re updated rent roll for feb and 

reviewing it 

06-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Email comm with Mike and Mubeen re banking 

activity for last 2 days and explaining Mubeen about 

creating a combined summary of inflow and outflow 

in banking activity of RBC accounts held by Co and 

MNP for the period Dec 31 2020 to Jan 31 20212) 

Discussion with Mubeen re explaining the  3 

summaries and receipt of consolidated table for 

review 

06-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Email comm with Anthony re quote for dry wall 

deficiency 

06-Feb-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .30 Bookkeeping

07-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Discussion with S. Title re dry wall repairs and fire 

door installation at Montgomery and credibility of 

the suppliers and related email comm with Anthony 

2) Sharing a list of queries with Anthony re dry wall 

repairs and fire door installation 

08-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Review of consolidated SRD prepared by Mubeen 

and making necessary changes. Sending it to S. Title 

for review2) Conducting bank balance analysis, 

reviewing payroll commitments (Feb 5), reserve 

required to be maintained and arriving at the balance 

which can be transferred to Receiver RBC Accounts. 

Sharing the analysis with S. Title for comments 

08-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.00 1) Multiple calls and emails with Anthony re status of 

Bell account for TV, Cable and landline, Telus 

account.2) Discussion re certain services in the name 

of the previous owner instead of the retirement 

home and related complications 

08-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 2.30 1) Multiple calls with Bell team re account suspension 

at Montgomery and making efforts to resolve it.2) 

Multiple calls and emails with Mike re certain 

invoices from Bell received recently3) Emails and calls 

with Alectra team re revised invoices for the 

Receivership Period, timeline to receive them among 

others4) Discussion with Trina re comm with 

Enbridge5) Emails with S. Title and C. Trollope re 

status updates, RHRA communications and continued 

risks6) Glancing through invoices received from  

08-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Multiple emails and discussions with S. Title re Bell 

issue, efforts made to resolve them among other 
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related matters2) Updating S. Title about discussions 

with Cogeco, Enbridge and Alectra 

08-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Email comm with the vendor who provided quotes 

for floor repairs and status update 

08-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Preparing and sharing an email with Bell re 

requesting for sharing invoices for NV and Dundas 

which has clear bifurcation between Pre and Post 

Receivership Period. Also requiring them to 

reactivate services at Montgomery on immediate 

basis. Discussed payment options through cheque to 

expedite processing. 

08-Feb-2021 Jessie Hue .60 Prepare the cheque reqs for filing fee and efiled the 

remittance with the OSB. Mailing of the cheques. 

08-Feb-2021 Jessie Hue .80 Prepare three cheque req for the filing fees and 

mailing. Efiled the remittances with the OSB and 

email same. 

08-Feb-2021 Jim Guo .30 chq req

08-Feb-2021 Patricia Ball .20 cheque requisitions

08-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title .20 ongoing issues relating to privacy issue, including 

emails with Lorraine Laquerre and Grant Bazian 

08-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title 1.60 call with Russell and Rob at Staff Relief concerning its 

ability to service the Receiver as a third party agency; 

call with Tom Wilson on Seniors' involvement; call 

with G. Phoenix on RHRA letter; call with J. Levy on 

revision to proposal arising from discussion with 

Wilson; approval of various disbursements, approve 

transfer of funds between bank accounts, dealings 

with Bell Canada on suspension of services at 

Montgomery; markup of listing agreement and 

forward same to Phoenix 

08-Feb-2021 Trina Burningham .50 Document comparison for Privacy Compliance matter 

as per S. Title.  

08-Feb-2021 Trina Burningham .20 Reached out to collections agency as per S. Title and 

left message re: Receivership info 

09-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Email comm with S. Title re Snow removal Feb bill 

and its payment and update on Montgomery furnace 

repairs 

09-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .70 Emails and discussion with S. Ayer re how to 

effectively manage vendor invoices and subsequent 

payments through Excel/Ascend 

09-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.50 1) Emails and calls with S. Title re Bell issue at 

Mongomery2) Calls and emails with Bell Business and 

Residential Team re reactivation of account at 

Montgomery on urgent basis3) Calls and emails with 

Business Accounts team for Northview and Dundas 
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account and continuation of services4) Calls and

emails with Residential account services to reactivate 

the service at Montgomery and discussion re 

payment to be made of $9325) Discussion with S. 

Ayer to facilitate cheque payment to Bell for 

Montgomery6) Multiple emails and calls with S. Title 

re Bell invoices for 3 homes and payments 

09-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Call with S. Rivet re status update on issues at the 

Home and email comm re existing inventory levels (to 

determine the PPE quantities to be reordered) and 

fish tank problem and quote to be obtained to 

remove the water and clean the tank. 

09-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.50 1) Call with Ryan, Dundas re open issues - PPE 

inventory, Cogeco invoices, pest control rates 

obtained by Ryan, certain repairs required, ramp 

repairs, payroll DDF, Fire department related issues 

among other matters2) Call with Anthony re drywall 

repairs and related warranty terms, front door 

installation and related warranty terms, PPE 

inventory, floor repairs among others3) Discussion 

with S. Title and S. Ayer re invoice payments for Snow 

removal, food invoices, Cogeco among others4) 

Multiple emails with S. Ayer re vendor invoice and 

payment management to ensure completeness5) 

Email comm with S. Title and J. Hue re transfer of 

funds from Co accounts to Trust Accounts 

09-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Email comm with Wolter from Bert Vis re confirming 

them about the quote for Northview and 

Montgomery for floor repairs and requesting them to 

schedule their work at the earliest 

09-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Email comm with S. Title re updating him about Fire 

door installation done yesterday and Dry wall repair 

planned this week for Montgomery home 

09-Feb-2021 Jessie Hue .30 Prepare the wire transfer receipts for the three trust 

accounts. 

09-Feb-2021 Jim Guo 1.00 chq req

09-Feb-2021 Patricia Ball .20 process cheque requisition

09-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title 1.40 dealings with Bell Canada on suspension of 

Montgomery's services, incl, emails to Estalla 

Kanyambo and email to Stacey Ogilvy; email to 

Wilson on SRDs and carpet repairs; emails to 

Thommy on Dundas staffing, review Phoenix revised 

schedule A to listing agreement and revise; further 

communication with Pinchin on Montgomery's COVID 

protocols; call with Wilson on SRD/carpet; call with 
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Phoenix; call from Desrene of Peel in Home on 

payment; letter to RHRA on confirmation of 

services/telephone issue; email to/from Burych on 

Seniors proposal; reviewing/signing requisitions and 

request team go back to Cogeco on one-time charge 

to have it reversed;  

09-Feb-2021 Trina Burningham .25 Call with Paul from Dexon collections re: bankruptcy 

filing information 

10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Receipt of Bert Vis revised quote on Montgomery, 

quote finalization and requirement of 40% deposit2) 

Email comm with S. Title re requirement of 40% 

deposit through credit card3) Confirming Bert Vis for 

the deposit and requesting for tentative start and 

end date for the work to be executed at both the 

Homes 

10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Email comm with Ryan, Dundas re monthly 

inspection on sprinklers etc. and connecting him with 

Nick from Regal Fire Control to discuss and provide us 

a quote 

10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.00 1) Email comm with S. Ayer re payroll information to 

be provided to ADP and related matters2) Email 

comm with Ryan (Dundas) re items to be ordered for 

the medical kit at the Home3) Discussion with S. Rivet 

re fish tank and PPE Inventory4) Discussion with May 

re payment to be made to him for the outstanding 

invoices relating to the PPE Inventory delivered at the 

Homes5) Forwarding certain invoices for PPE 

Inventory to Sheila for payment 

10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.00 1) Analysing balance at the Bank for the 3 Homes 

available at Company and Receiver Accounts in RBC, 

understanding the amount of outstanding cheques, 

Payroll for Feb 20, pending rent to be collected.2) 

Email comm with Mike re outstanding cheques and 

rent roll status. 3) Understanding the total balance, 

cash flows for the month of February, commitments 

to pay Source deduction and Montgomery floor 

repairs among others to determine the need for addl. 

funding.4) Sharing the analysis with S. Title 

10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .50 1) Email comm re finalization of quote for Floor 

repairs from Bert Vis, communication with S. Title, 

Anthony, Shannon and Bert Vis2) Discussion with 

Sheila and Jessie re bank balance available in Ascend 

for the 3 homes 

10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Email comm with S. Title re news article in Hamilton 

Spector, resident queries among others 
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10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Email comm with Mubeen re bank statements for Feb 

8 and 9, updates in bank tracker and certain items of 

SRD. 

10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Email comm with Cogeco re requesting them to 

revisit the Dundas invoices shared as they included 

outstanding balances prior to the receiver ship date. 

Also requesting them to provide the invoices for 

Northview as well. 

10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Email comm with S. Rivet re Floor repairs quote 

and noting down a few changes and communicated 

them to Bert Vis re floor information.2) Email comm 

with Anthony re floor repairs quote, warranty terms 

from Fire door installation vendor and confirmation 

of Dry wall repairs scheduled on Feb 12.3) Reading 

through Draft letter prepared by S.Title  from MNP to 

RHRA highlighting issues at the Homes and related 

discussions 

10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Call with CRA rep re discussion on books and records 

of the Retirement Homes, ability to appoint one rep 

for the 3 homes, timing of CRA Trust Examination 

among other details 

10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Discussion re DDK invoice for certain repairs at 

Montgomery, verifying the services with Anthony and 

confirming S. Title about it2) Discussion with S. Title 

re finalization of floor repairs for the 2 homes and 

update on communication with the administrators 

10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Email comm with Mike and arranging information 

required by ADP for payroll processing2) Discussion 

with S. Ayer re the document list and to be shared 

with ADP team (to be continued) 

10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Sharing Direct Deposit forms with the 3 

administrators and related discussions 

10-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Discussion with S. Title re payment for the invoices 

for PPE Inventory at Dundas and Montgomery, 

approved PO, reconciliation between PO and invoice, 

confirmation from administrators re receipt of 

inventory, other details about existing inventory 

levels and to analyse and discuss tomorrow basis the 

inventory levels2) Discussion re DDK quote for 

Montgomery, confirmation and forwarding the 

invoice for payment3) Email request to Vestacon to 

provide another quote for boiler repair at 

Montgomery 4) Email comm re notices to be posted 

at the Homes about RHRA revocation/revised 

revocation timelines. 5) Discussion with S. Title and 
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Vestacon and confirmation re boiler repair review 

date 

10-Feb-2021 Jessie Hue .30 Provide RBC contact information to Akhil and Sheila.

10-Feb-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .25 Bookkeeping Feb 9th

10-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title 1.20 call with Ryan Anderson/Yohaan Thommy; finalize 

letter to RHRA; email exchange with Desrene of Peel 

in Home; email to/from Lori Murphy re: sale of 

homes in view of Hamilton Spectator article; call with 

Wolter Vis on flooring installation/payment 

10-Feb-2021 Trina Burningham 1.00 Bank requisitions drafted and finalized; Emailed to S. 

Title for approval; Approval email received. 

Forwarded requisitions to P. Ball for processing.  

11-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Preparation of information required by ADP in 

their PDF applications, finalization of excel 

information incl. employee names, hourly rates, bi- 

monthly salary (in case of admins) for 3 hours, CRA 

Business Account, sample timesheets among others2) 

Sharing the information with S. Ayer for comments 

and requesting her to forward to ADP with 

timelines3) Email comm with ADP team re 

commencing work on the agreement and data input 

11-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.80 1) Discussion re Enbridge letter received by 

Northview re service connection, verifying 

communications with them, multiple emails with S. 

Rivet, S. Ayer and Trina about the account numbers, 

receipt of revised invoice among others2) Review of 

S. Rivet's expense report and forwarding to S. Ayer 

for payment3) Advising the admins to post a notice at 

the Homes relating to RHRA orders, related 

discussion with the admins4) Email comm with 2 

employees at Dundas re Direct Deposit Forms (DDF) 

and receiving from them. Also, discussion with S. 

Rivet re timelines and other details for DDF.5) 

Discussion with Waste Connections and S. Rivet re 

certain pick up issues at N. View6) Email comm re 

issues at Montgomery and related email comm with 

S. Title7) Discussion with S. Title re CRA rep 

requirement of data and postponing the same to 1st 

week of March 

11-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .90 1) Review and discussion with Cogeco team for 

Dundas invoice of $5.2k and ensuring it does not 

cover any period prior to Dec 23, 2020. Discussion re 

new wi-fi connection and requesting for Northview 

invoice. Also, reviewed historical period invoices of 

Cogeco to make sure the bills received now are in line 
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with the historical monthly averages2) Discussion 

about Northview billing to ensure only services 

provided from Dec 23 2020 onwards are billed3) 

Finalization and sharing with S. Title for payment 

approval4) Email comm with S. Title re providing 

basis for the bills received now for Dundas and 

Northview 

11-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Discussion with Vestacon re fire door quote 

provided by them and requesting for a quote for 

Montgomery Boiler repair2) Discussion with Anthony 

re Dry wall repairs scheduled for Feb 12, Fire door 

installation - Warranty items and boiler repair info to 

be provided to Vestacon 

11-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Discussion with Mike re source deduction 

payments to be made on Feb 15, requesting for 

payroll sheets for both months2) Analysing them and 

verifying with the existing payroll numbers3) 

Preparing a summary sheet (to be continued) 

11-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Discussion re building assessment report, 

rescheduling the calls with admins, email comm re 

Montgomery issues raised by RHRA among others 

11-Feb-2021 Patricia Ball .50 cheque requisitions

11-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title .40 call with City of Hamilton (Rob Mastroianni)

11-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title 1.80 call with Evan at BBS on its marketing proposal, call 

with Phoenix on it and RHRA exchanges; call and 

email with Donna at Pinchin to arrange 2/24 BCA; call 

with Anthony Martino to investigate food shortage 

allegation raised by RHRA (McClurg email); email to 

Martino on food issue, emails to McClurg on 

response to concerns; review of BBS proposal and 

email exchange with Wilson on his email advising to 

pause moving forward with BBS to give consideration 

to BBS' proposal; email exchange with Shannon on 

RHRA inspection being favourable; bank requisition 

approvals; call to A. Smuk to respond to her email, 

email to Smuk to arrange a call; email to/from Taube 

on updating insurance policy to reflect MNP address 

12-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Discussion about boiler repair at Dundas, 

communicating with DDK and asking them to visit the 

premises to repair the boiler today2) Discussion re 

services provided by Reliance at Northview and their 

invoice among others with Mike and Shannon3) Email 

comm re food and other issues raised for 

Montgomery and update of related discussions with 

RHRA 4) Planning and rescheduling calls with the 
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admins of the Homes5) Discussion re bank reports for 

Feb 10 and 11 and payroll for Northview due on Feb 

206) Discussions, receipt of Enbridge bills for the 3 

homes and verifying the same 

12-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Discussion with Ryan re requirement to remove 

certain heavy waste material from the Home and 

quotes obtained from a trucking company.2) 

Approving the quotes and asking them to be billed to 

MNP 

12-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Finalization of Source deductions worksheet and 

sharing a summary with Mike for comments. Also 

understanding SD liability due on Feb 15 from cash 

flow perspective. 

12-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Discussion with Mike and Shannon re services 

obtained from Reliance basis the contract2) Glancing 

through the time sheet received for Dundas3) 

Discussion with S. Rivet and Vestacon re misc. repair 

of the furnace unit at one of the rooms in N. View4) 

Service request raised with Opus by Vestacon and 

updating S. Title and S. Rivet 5) Comparing the 

reliance invoice with the contract, understanding the 

contract and sharing the invoice with S. Title for 

payment 

12-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Discussion with Mike and Ryan re 2 connections -

Enbridge and if we have to continue with the 2 

connections2) Confirmation of posting of notices at 

the 3 homes and replacement of old notices3) 

Discussion re RHRA observations for Montgomery 

and relates calls and emails4) Discussion re staffing 

initiative at Dundas 

12-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Finalization of Source Deductions with Mike and 

sharing final sheet with S. Title for approval 

12-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .60 1) Emails and calls with S. Ayer re Cogeco invoices, 

with S. Title re source deduction payments to be 

made.2) Email comm with Password Protection re 

status update of their invoices, timing of payment 

and updating them about Pre Receivership Period3) 

Email comm with S. Title re RHRA queries on 

Montgomery, Reliance services for Northview, 

update on calls with Yohaan among others 

12-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Discussion with S. Title re status update on 

Montgomery repair, Northview Boiler repair and 

Dundas boiler repair and other related matters2) 

Emails re certain payments made with S. Ayer and S. 

Title3) Vaccination update from Northview 
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12-Feb-2021 Jessie Hue .30 Prepare cheque req and mailing to vendor.

12-Feb-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .20 Bookkeeping Feb 10,11

12-Feb-2021 Patricia Ball .20 prepare cheques

12-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title 2.00 call/text with Raftik, pharmacist on ROFR (.2); email 

from Rivet on need for snow removal and reach out 

to Landform Landscape for same, call with Mark  

Tonkin on February 3rd compliant from resident 

family member and email to Martino to address same 

(.9); call with Burych/Wilson/Phoenix (.5); call with 

Angela Smuk, Hamilton realtor and emails with Levy 

afterwards on her question posed (.2); email/call to 

Levy on changes to proposal and request to revise 

commission rate (.3); cheque requisitions/review of 

bank position; review of Reliance rental contract (.1) 

12-Feb-2021 Trina Burningham .25 Touchbase with S. Ayer re: bank requisition/invoice 

for Bert Flooring. 

12-Feb-2021 Trina Burningham .25 Bank Requisition drafted and emailed for approval; 

Approval saved to the directory and forwarded to P. 

Ball for processing.  

12-Feb-2021 Trina Burningham .25 Bank Requisition drafted and emailed for approval; 

Approval saved to the directory and forwarded to P. 

Ball for processing.  

12-Feb-2021 Trina Burningham .25 Bank Requisition drafted and emailed for approval; 

Approval saved to the directory and forwarded to P. 

Ball for processing.  

12-Feb-2021 Trina Burningham .25 Downloaded Enbridge invoices and emailed to A. 

Kapoor. 

13-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title .20 emails to Desrene Peel in Home; forward Peel in 

Home invoice to Ryan for approval; emails with Rivet 

on snow removal and emails with Akhil on following 

up on completion of maintenance issues 

15-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title .30 emails with Sheila on cheque requisitions; text with 

Levy on amended proposal 

15-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title .50 start work on first report to Court

16-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.60 1) Discussion with Ryan (Dundas) re elevator issue, 

boiler issue and salt order. Coordinating with DDK 

and Vestacon for boiler and elevator repairs and 

follow up discussion with all of them (also discussed 

with S. Title re incumbent elevator supplier - Hal 

Brant and considering calling them for repairs)2) 

RHRA letter for Northview3) Follow up for Direct 

Deposit forms with the admins and receipt of form 

from one of them4) Discussion with Vestacon for 

boiler/furnace issue at Northview (Opus visit) )and 

follow up calls to seek a quote for repair/new 
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furnace. Also discussed with S. Rivet about it.5) 

Discussion with S. Rivet re cable issues and 

coordinating with Cogeco team to restore the service 

as their invoices have already been paid6) Email 

comm with ADP team re set up formalities and 

provided the required information. To provide time 

sheets on Feb 177) Follow up and receipt of time 

sheet for Montgomery8) Discussion with S. Rivet re 

visiting the hospital to see a resident, Reliance Home 

comfort, vaccination on Friday among others 

16-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Investigating certain invoices from Hal Brant, 

Cogeco, Alectra, Enbridge,  Reliance Home Comfort 

(to be continued), 2) Discussion with S. Ayer re 

payment of invoices from Password Protection3) 

Discussion with S. Rivet about calling Aquaflow for 

specific services4) Receipt of fire certificates and 

related docs from Ryan (Dundas) and glancing 

through them 

16-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.40 1) Follow up with Cogeco re receipt of multiple 

invoices and informing them that we have made 

payment for Jan and Feb invoices2) Discussion with 

Ryan regarding requirement of new plank flooring 

and kitchen faucet and scheduling it for discussion on 

Wed3) Discussion with Anthony re status update on 

dry wall repair, Fire door warranty terms among 

others. Also discussed if he can provide user name 

and PW for access to Montgomery's Bell Account4) 

Following up with S. Ayer to make payment to 

Password Protection5) going through all the emails of 

last 3-4 weeks and reviewing the invoices received 

from Walker, Cleaning House, Branley, Appliance Girl, 

Argus, Flanagan (pending invoices), Glenbriar, Orkin, 

Telus, Waste Connections among others and saving 

them in a folder for S. Ayer's review and preparation 

of bank requisition 

16-Feb-2021 Jim Guo .80 chq req

16-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title 2.40 prepare for (.2)  (calls with Levy/review of draft 

Seniors' Housing proposal) and attend at (.8) call with 

RHRA (McClurg/Duncan); discussion after call with 

Phoenix on names of potential manager candidates 

(.2), review of Staff Relief contract (.3) and forward to 

Phoenix, emails on various issues (elevator at 

Dundas, furnace at Northview, Cogeco at Northview 

(.1); email from RHRA on inspection report at 

Northview (Feb 11) and to advise we have no 

concerns; call with Neil Persad on seeking potential 
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manager/arrange for third party staffing agency; 

prepare email to Donna Ballentrye to provide further 

guidance on its upcoming site visit to identify pre-

existing issues; email with PP; cheque requisitions, 

email to Persad names/addresses of homes; email 

to/from McClurg the Seniors Housing proposal; email 

from Duncan on transfer of file to commercial list 

17-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Requesting S.Ayer to make bank reqs for certain 

invoices received from misc. suppliers and verifying 

from Ascend.2) Revising Source deduction 

computation and sharing with S. Title to let him know 

about the source deduction liability. Also informing 

him about the bank reqs for new invoices 

17-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Discussion with S. Title re commencing work on 

the checklist for listing the properties on sale with 

Seniors, TLC invoices for 3rd party resources for the 

homes and to discuss them in the call today, heads 

up on bank balance verification and the upcoming 

payroll, to check Pre receivership arrears with CRA 

17-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Discussion with S. Rivet re her time off, issues 

related to Heat Exchange replacement at home, 

confirmation on TLC invoice among others2) 

Discussion with S. Ayer re queries in certain invoices- 

Cleaning House among others3) Follow up with 

Vincent for Northview's heat exchange 

replacement/repair4) Email comm with Hal Brant re 

their invoices for repair and routine inspection5) 

Discussion with AZ Med re their unpaid invoices and 

follow up with S. Ayer to understand the delays and 

when the cheques were mailed.6) discussion with S. 

Ayer re updating vendor invoice tracking as new 

invoices are being paid. Discussion re if Ascend/other 

report can help in updating cash flow projections 

17-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Discussion with Ryan re confirmation of TLC Order, 

items to be discussed in today's call2) Discussion with 

ADP re changes in the form, reviewing them briefly 

and forwarding them to S. Title for approval. 

Discussed with S. Ayer re approval process of such 

agreements3) Follow up with Mike re information on 

out. cheques, bank report and payroll computation 

among others. Also discussed with him certain 

invoices received and delivery of certain items 4) 

Preparation of points to be discussed in the call with 

Anthony 

17-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.40 1) Discussion with S. Title re open items, cash flow 

projections to be updated among others2) Discussion 
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with M. Lem re projections to be prepared and 

sharing certain info with him3) Call with Ryan and S. 

Title and discussing issues - items to be purchased, 

front/back door construction, PPE, Pest control, 

grease trap cleaning, staffing solutions update, 

requirement of laptop for virtual meeting with 

doctor, elevator, boiler issue and certain other 

repairs4) Call with Anthony and discussing issues- 

washing machine requirement and seeking quotes, 

dry wall repair, DDF, furnace repair and related 

quotes, regular testing of staff among others5) Follow 

up with Mike about certain docs required by Pinchin- 

TSSA, HVAC among others 5) Follow up with Walker 

for grease trap service at Dundas 

17-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title .40 call with Trollope on status

17-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title 1.60 call with Ryan Anderson,  email to Donna @ Pinchin 

re: TSSA/elevator/fire inspection; email to J. 

McCluskey at Barbers to authorize inspection of 

grease pans, fryer, faucet, email to MNP IT re: laptop 

re: virtual medical appts; email to Trollope re: ramp; 

call with Phoenix on commercial list transfer; 

complete insurance forms for broker; email to FCA 

the existing policies for review; call with Handelman 

Staff Relief (.5); call with CEO @ Shalom on reference 

on Staff Relief 

18-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Review of payroll and time sheets for the 3 Homes 

due on Feb 202) Preparing and updating the bank 

tracker for the 3 homes to understand the 

requirement to meet payroll dues on Feb 203) 

Sharing the tracker with S. Title to update and to 

initiate transfer of balance from Receiver Account to 

Co account at Dundas4) Review of rent rolls and trust 

account and approving Mike to refund/withdraw to 

pay the residents for overpayment/trust money5) 

Updating M. Lem about the bank tracker 

18-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Follow up with Vincent for Heat Exchange repair at 

Northview and communicating with S. Rivet2) 

Discussion with S. Rivet re Washer invoice to be paid 

and coordinating with S. Ayer for payment3) Multiple 

emails and calls with Vincent from Vestacon for 

Furnace repair/replacement at Northview and 

drainage of pipes. Receipt of quote and further 

discussion with Vincent and S. Title4) Discussion re 

obtaining second opinion about furnace quote 

received from Opus5) Discussion with Anthony re 

staff testing every 2 weeks and setting up for that for 
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Monday (Feb 22). Informing S. Title about it6) 

Discussion with Matt re extracting Bank reports from 

Ascend from Receiver held accounts7) Updating S. 

Rivet about the furnace repair/replacement8) Sharing 

final ADP forms with S. Title for signatures after 

correction made in them9) Discussion with S. Title re 

payment of insurance from existing accounts until 

the change to Receiver accounts is accepted 

18-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.50 1) Discussion with Kamila (CRA) re CRA dues for the 

Homes2) Discussion with Mubeen re preparation of 

SRD for Co held Accounts3) preparation of SRD for 

Receiver held accounts for the 3 Homes and sharing 

with Mubeen for consolidation. Also discussed with S. 

Ayer re certain payments made through Receiver 

accounts and sought explanation to understand the 

nature of payment.4) Review of consolidated SRD 

received from Mubeen and making changes in them 

to correct a few entries and balances.5) Sharing draft 

SRD as at Feb 17 with S. Title and M. Lem for review. 

Revision in SRD to incl. outstanding cheques in SRD 

and sharing final SRD with them6) Discussion re Hal 

Brant invoice for service call and routine inspection 

with S. Title and Ryan and follow up with Hal Brant to 

advise about the day when the service was 

delivered.7) discussion with Mike re nature of 

expense and service provided by Reliance for Dundas 

as the contract could not be found.8) Discussion with 

Anthony re completion of dry wall repair work9) 

Discussion with Vincent if he can provide a second 

opinion from another service provider for Northview 

furnace10) Follow up with Mike for revenue of the 3 

homes for 202011) Following up with S. Rivet re 

signatures on expense sheet12) Discussion with Trina 

re invoices received from Alectra 

18-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Discussion with Matt re inputs required for 

preparing another set of projections- rent roll, payroll 

and contractor cost and list of other commitments2) 

Discussion with S. Ayer re vendor invoice 

management and payment processing and related 

timelines3) Discussion re invoice payments for 

subcontractors4) Discussion with Anthony re Apollo 

visit for bed bug issue5) Multiple other emails re 

invoice payments and others6) Email comm with S. 

River re snaking of drains of the Home and the quote 

received for the same. 
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18-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Email comm with S. Title re CRA dues and forwarding 

him the response sent by Kamila (CRA) on CRA dues 

for the 3 Homes 

18-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Review of actual revenue for 2020- resident 

deposits and subsidy from the city2) Review of Feb. 

rent roll as on date and requesting for final Jan rent 

roll3) Requesting Mike to update about the T4 for the 

Homes for 20204) Email comm with Trina re receipt 

of 2 invoices from Alectra and asking her to provide 

the other 2 invoices 

18-Feb-2021 Matthew Lem .20 Review of R&D and bank balance analysis; discussion 

with A. Kapoor re same and projections data 

18-Feb-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .70 Update Bookkeeping, summarize data till Feb. 17

18-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title 1.40 call with L. Cormack (PP) on interest/manager 

position; email from Wilson on update on Seniors and 

response thereto; email from McClurg on need for 

call to answer further questions/timing of registrar's 

review of Seniors proposal; call with FCA on 

insurance related issues;; emails to Taube (pre-

authorized insurance forms, Perna at RBC to request 

transfer of funds, with Barbers on repairs to kitchen); 

call with Staff Relief, emails with Ryan on staffing at 

Dundas; review sign requisitions; review websites for 

B& K and In Initiative re: RHRA request for us to 

investigate a manager; email with Neil on potential 

manager 

19-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 1) Discussion with S. Rivet re drainage pipe clearing, 

furnace replacement and her signed expense form2) 

Sharing the signed form with S. Ayer for records 

19-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.20 1) Discussion with S. Rivet and Doug (DDK) to 

schedule a service call to verify the furnace to seek 

second opinion2) Discussion with S. Rivet, Ryan and 

Anthony  re PPE inventory items required and 

emailing AZ Med to provide the quotes3) Discussion 

re T4 and their preparation with Mike and the 3 

administrators and related conversation with Mike re 

preparation of pending T4 and T4 summary4) 

Discussion with S. Ayer and J. Kim (tax manager) re 

checklist of docs required by tax team to prepare T4 

and T4 summary5) Discussion with Ryan re 

vaccination drive (postponed to Sunday), phone audit 

with public health among others6) Update from S. 

Rivet re vaccination drive and residents/staff 

covered7) Discussion with Mike re payment for N/A 

invoice and explaining him that it is scheduled for 

next week 
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19-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Discussion with Trina re Alectra invoices and 

receiving the four invoices for review2) Discussion re 

direct deposit forms for Northview, Montgomery and 

Dundas3) Discussion with May (PPE inventory 

supplier)  re new order quote and comm re cheque 

for the previous invoice scheduled to be received by 

May by early next week4) Discussion with S. Title re 

his call with RHRA about Sale process approval, 

discussion on doing analysis for selecting a manager 

who can manage the firm, T4 and T4 summary, 

Furnace - Northview update among others5) 

confirming from Mike about completion of T4 of all 

the employees while T4 summary is pending6) Follow 

up and receipt of 2 DDF (1 PDF, 1 picture format)  

from Dundas (total 5 received so far)7) Call with Bert 

Vis re setting up the flooring work for Montgomery 

scheduled for Feb 228) Follow up with S. Rivet to 

confirm DDF completion, vaccination status9) Follow 

up with Mike for final rent roll for Jan 2021 

19-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.50 1) Review of rent rolls for Jan and Feb 2021 to 

determine the collections vs the projections. Also 

reviewed whether subsidy has been received.2) 

Review of payroll for 2020, Jan and Feb 2021 and 

comparing with projections3) Review of contractor 

invoices to see the amount paid to them at 

Northview and Dundas4) Collating this information to 

prepare revised cash flow projections and saving in a 

separate folder for M. Lem5) Email comm with Mike 

re T4 summary prep, rent roll for Jan, subsidy, bank 

statements among others6) Discussion with Anthony 

re payment to be made to Dry wall repair vendor 

through cheque/other means7) Call with Mike to 

discuss T4 summary preparation next week and to 

discuss resident pin money and rent received in Feb 

for better understanding8) Emailing M. Lem about 

the docs available and saved in the folder to prepare 

revised projections and further comm on other 

aspects on projections9) Call with M. Lem to discuss 

the rent roll for Jan and Feb 2021, projections and 

certain other queries (to be continued)10) Finding 

bank statements for the month of Feb and uploading 

in the folder for revised projections.11) Discussion 

with S. Title re Ryan expense report and related 

comm with S. Ayer for payments and with Ryan to 

share signed form 

19-Feb-2021 Jim Guo .50 chq req
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19-Feb-2021 Matthew Lem .90 discussion with A. Kapoor re projections data; 

commence assembly of revised operating 

projections/budget; discussion with S Title re same. 

19-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title 2.20 share SRDs, call with Wilson/Burych on same/status; 

email from McClurg on registrar position on 

Seniors/Manager; call with Phoenix and email to 

McClurg to offer assistance in gathering info/arrange 

call with Seniors; call with Anderson/Robert 

Handleman (Staff Relief) on transitioning staff/call 

with Ryan on staffing generally and status of Dundas; 

cheque requisitions; email to Pinchin and 

administrators to coordinate visit on Feb 24; call with 

Robert Handleman to see if he can assist with 

manager position; email to Taube (insurer) info on 

rates 

20-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Discussion with Mubeen re bank statements,  and 

missing transactions, reviewing the statements and 

enquiring with Mike for the missing statement2) 

Receipt of statement from 17-19 Feb, discussion with 

Mubeen and guiding him to complete the tracker as 

at Feb 19 

20-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 Discussion with AZ Med for discount on PPE 

inventory and receiving his quotes (quote to be 

reviewed) 

20-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .60 1) Review of outstanding balance to Apollo Pest 

management for Dundas, preparation of letter to be 

sent along with cheque to inform that their past dues 

are a claim in receivership and also about the billing 

and payment mechanism.2) Sharing the letter with S. 

Title for his review and signatures. 

21-Feb-2021 Matthew Lem 2.00 Attend to updated cashflow projections

21-Feb-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .20 Updated bookkeeping to Feb. 19th

22-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .40 1) Follow up with Mike and receipt of Revenue 

breakup for 2020 for the 3 homes (incl. pandemic pay 

from City of Hamilton)2) Review of the workings3) 

Sharing the breakup with S. Title for his review and 

for the purpose of the report4) Emails and calls with 

Mike re T4 and T4 filing and updating S. Title that 

Mike will be filing T4 summary this week 

22-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Review of RHRA points re Montgomery Home and 

updating S. Title and ERS team about the current 

status 

22-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Follow up with Northview and Dundas for fire 

inspection certificates2) Review of certificates and 

enquiring with Dundas to provide the certificate from 
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city of hamilton3) Follow up with Anthony for the 

certifcate4) Follow up with Mike for TSSA, HVAC for 

the Homes.5) Follow up with Mike and Ryan to 

provide the contract for Reliance Home Comfort for 

Dundas, the nature of services and whether they are 

active and required at this time 

22-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 1) Follow up with DDK for quote re repair of furnace 

at Northview2) Email comm with him re replacement 

required and he'll provide the quote during the day 

22-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Reviewing and updating the information in 

marketing information folder for the purpose of 

commencing the sales process2) Updating S. Title 

about the folder, its contents, Jensen's checklist and 

seeking his advice if we can forward the existing info 

to Seniors to commence the preparation of data 

room3) Updating S. Title about the furnace at 

Northview (DDK to provide quote) 

22-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .50 1) Review of PPE inventory quotes and sharing with 

the 3 Homes for confirmation2) Addition of items by 

Shannon at Northview and informing AZ Med about 

it3) Confirmation of numbers at Montgomery and 

Northview (after revisions)4) Follow up with Ryan to 

provide required corrections in the quote for a 

couple of items5) Updating S. Title about the 

proposed PPE order at Northview and Montgomery 

and other details 

22-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .70 1) Following up with Hal Brent re invoices for Dec and 

Jan 2021 and enquiring about the date of service for 

the month of Jan 2021. Also informed them about 

MNP's appointment and requirement of invoicing us 

directly.2) Discussion with S. Ayer re letter to be 

attached with Apollo cheque3) Discussion with S. 

Title re priorities for today- revised projections, PPE 

inventory, Sale Process material4) Email comm with 

Hal Brant re service call and regular maintenance 

done on Dec 31 and Jan 26 and confirming the same. 

Also discussed about billing going forward4) Call with 

Vincent from Vestacon re furnace enquiry at 

Northview and Montgomery, PPE inventory suppliers 

among others5) Email comm with Troy from Walker 

Environmental re grease trap services and 

requirement of a replacement of a part. Discussing 

with Ryan (Dundas) re whether the replacement 

costing 3500-7000 CAD is required. Further email 

comm to connect both as Ryan believes their team 

never visited the Home and no service has been 
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provided.6) Discussion with Anthony (Montgomery) 

re commencement of work by Bert Vis from Feb 23 

and duration of 6 days 

22-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.00 1) Review and recording of new DDF received from 

Dundas and Northview2) Reviewing and saving Fire 

inspection report of City of Hamilton for Dundas3) 

Reviewing and saving T4 and T4 summary of the 

Homes (follow up for Montgomery T4 among 

others)4) Receiving Ryan's signed expense sheet and 

forwarding to S. Ayer for payment5) Receipt of Forte 

(Produce) invoices6) Email comm with S. Rivet re a 

survey required to be filled for the Retirement Homes 

7) Review of cleaning house invoices, paid and 

unpaid, checking with S. Rivet to ensure that all the 

items were delivered and saving it in the folder for 

further review and processing. 8) Discussion with 

Ryan re his PPE and other cleaning items requirement 

9) Email comm with Anthony re availability/non-

availability of fire inspection/3rd party inspection 

reports 

22-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .90 1) Calls with Anthony re fire repairs, fire inspection 

report availability and related delays as HFC will not 

issue it on account on non-payment. Also, discussed 

update on vaccination and staff testing (postponed)2) 

Discussion with S. Title re repairs at Northview - 

furnace, quote provided by DDK for replacement and 

enquiring with DDK about the reason for choosing 

Magic Pak model of furnace compared to Lennox or 

York3) Discussion with M. Lem re certain inputs 

required for cash flow projections4) Updating S. Title 

about T4 and T4 summary for the Homes5) 

Discussion with S. Ayer re sending letter to Apollo to 

explain them about their pre receivership claim6) 

Confirmation from S. Title and sharing final order 

requirement with AZ Med for Northview and 

Montgomery7) Email comm with Ryan, Dundas, re his 

PPE order quantities, addition and removal of couple 

of items 

22-Feb-2021 Jim Guo .30 chq req

22-Feb-2021 Matthew Lem 3.00 Attend to cash flow projections

22-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title .30 email to Akhil on PPE, carpet (fish tank); call with 

Rafik, pharmacist 

23-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.60 1) Discussion with DDK re choosing Magic Pak variety 

of furnace over York or Lennox2) Email comm with S. 

Rivet and S. Title re tile damage and repairs required 
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in Northview hall on urgent basis3) Glancing through 

both quotes and providing Vestacon and DDK quotes 

for furnace replacement and snaking of drains to S. 

Title and requesting on guidance for next steps/call 

with the 2 suppliers4) Emails re Flanagan food orders, 

pre receivership invoices and related issues 5) 

Discussion with S. Title re call with Ryan about certain 

issues listed by RHRA6) Discussion with AZ Med re 

replacing certain items in the quote and adding a few 

items7) Discussion with S. Rivet, Vincent (Vestacon) 

and DDK and S. Title re need for snaking of drains and 

its impact on functioning of new furnace8) Email 

comm with Thyssenkrup informing them that 

outstanding invoices for services performed prior to 

Dec 23 2020 will be dealt with later through a claim 

process. Only services performed after Dec 23, 2020 

will be considered for payment at this time. Also 

discussed their future invoice with S. Title for 

Northview. 9) Finalization of Dundas quote for PPE 

and sharing with AZ Med and connecting Ryan with 

them for delivery10) Review of bank report an 

forwarding to S. Title and also to Mubeen to update 

the tracker.11) Email comm with Anthony re Apollo 

visit and asking to receive a quote for full pest 

prevention inspection12) Discussion with S. Rivet re 

DDK vs Opus for furnace replacement 

23-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 Call with Matt to discuss the revised cash flow 

projections- rent roll, payroll, contractor cost, 

operating expenses, capital expenses, source 

deductions among others. Period to be considered: 

13 weeks ending May 8 2021 

23-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .30 1) Call with S. Title re RH Sale Process, possible 

appointment of a GM to manage the Homes and 

their role2) Discussion with S. Title re Thyssenkrupp 

involvement and their service quality and their 

invoice received today3) Discussion with Ryan and 

May re PPE inventory at Dundas, addition of items, 

masks types among others4) Email comm re issues at 

Montgomery highlighted by RHRA and related 

concerns 

23-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.70 1) Calls with M. Lem and preparation of source 

deduction and contractor cost summary for the 

purpose of projections for Feb 20 to May 20, 2021. 

SD for Jan and Feb to be paid in the week of Feb 27 

and Mar 15 respectively and contractor cost to be 

paid over the course of 4 weeks for Dundas and NV.2) 
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Discussion with S. Title and Mubeen re bank 

statement for Feb 21 and updating in tracker 

23-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.60 Emails and calls with M. Lem and preparation of food 

cost summary, PPE summary and other expenses- 

Insurance, utility, Equipment lease, rental payment, 

office supplies among others for the purpose of 

projections Feb 20 to May 20, 2020 (pending 

commitments) 

23-Feb-2021 Jim Guo .20 chq req

23-Feb-2021 Matthew Lem 2.50 Discussion with A. Kapoor re cash flow projections 

and information required; update discussion with S. 

Title; update projections. 

23-Feb-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .20 bookkeeping for Feb. 19

23-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title .70 call with Ryan Anderson on receipt of RHRA's request 

for info; develop answers to questions and forward 

back to Anderson for completion; call with Phoenix ; 

call with potential GM;  

24-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .10 1) Email comm re tile repair at NV with Bert Vis and S. 

Title2) Receipt of quote for Montgomery's boiler 

repair from Vincent (Vestacon) and glancing through 

it 

24-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.60 1) Discussion with S. Rivet re TKrupp invoice for Jan 

to Feb 2021 and Mar 1 to May 31 (to be further 

investigated as charges appear high). Checking with 

Mike for agreement with Tkrupp. agreement2) 

Receipt of quote for MG boiler repair from Vestacon 

which is 30% higher than DDK3)  Discussion with S. 

Title re Alectra invoices for Dundas which appear to 

be very high4) Discussion re masks, goggles and other 

items to be added in Dundas PPE inventory order and 

related comm with AZ MEd and Ryan5) Discussion 

with S. Title re cleaning house invoices which have 

pre and post receivership and seeking his guidance6) 

Email comm with Cathy (Cogeco) re explaining the 

treatment of Pre receivership invoices4) RHRA4) 

Invoices 

24-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.60 1) Calls with Ryan (Dundas) re requirement of 

vacuum and advising him to obtain quote from 

appliance girl, requirement of cleaning items, grease 

trap cleaning and others.2) Call with Anthony re 

RHRA issues- Bed bug, dryer, resident masks in 

common areas, staff testing, tile work status, fire 

door installation- warranty terms pending among 

others3) Call with S. Title re his calls with RHRA, 

letters received from City and action items among 
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others4) Calls and emails with Matt re S. Title's 

comments and changes in resident rent, equipment, 

lease rent and other expenses. Sharing revised 

version with M. Lem5) Emailing cleaning house 

invoices to S. Rivet to discuss pre and post 

receivership invoices- to be discussed tomorrow 

24-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.60 1) Reviewing and sharing Hal Brant invoices to S. Ayer 

for payment2) Sharing DDK and Vestacon quote with 

S. Title for Montgomery boiler repair and highlighting 

the difference in quotes3)  Receipt of checklist for 

Property tax review and communication with Mike 

and receipt of some of the required docs4) Discussion 

with S. Rivet re expense report, approval and 

payment5) Discussion with DDK re follow up for M. 

Boiler repair quote and checking if any discount is 

possible6) Discussion with S. Ayer re mechanism for 

saving bank requisitions, how to locate them, Ascend 

entries among others 7) Calls and emails with N. 

Dewan re his background, his interests in purchasing 

the Homes and updating S. Title about after saving 

his information in the folder7) Saving property taxes 

docs received from Mike (to be reviewed)  

24-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .80 1) Reviewing Alectra invoice for Dundas and emailing 

them to verify as it is higher than historical average2) 

Reviewing Enbridge invoices and recording them3) 

Commencing work on Commitments tab to record 

Jan and Feb unpaid invoices4) Preparing Utilities 

sheet and recording Alectra, Enbridge invoices as well 

as historical average/winter average to project the 

future expenses and sharing with M. Lem to record in 

the projections worksheet 

24-Feb-2021 Matthew Lem .60 Adjust cash flow projections; discussion with A. 

Kapoor re same. 

24-Feb-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .20 Daily bookkeeping for Feb 23rd

24-Feb-2021 Patricia Ball .20 Jan bank recs

24-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title 1.20 call with Sharon Ellis on Flanagans; call and email re 

Handleman; email from Ryan Anderson on GM 

position and call related thereto; review of cash flow 

projections; email from City of Hamilton on 

inspection re: water temperature; emails with 

administrators on various (late food order, PPE, RHRA 

inspection to Montgomery, cheque requisition); 

25-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 2.00 1) Discussion with Bert Vis re concerns and issues in 

completing tile repair work at the Montgomery RH 

and related conversations with S. Title and Anthony2) 
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Communication with AZ Med and Ryan re finalization 

of PPE items and delivery of PPE at Dundas incl. 

replacement of certain items from the previous 

order3) Email from Irene from Active business 

services re retirement homes and requesting her to 

provide info on their invoices and services to the 

Home 4) Brief discussion with Matt re updating cash 

flow projections5) Call with Shannon re invoices from 

Cleaning House and date of delivery and finalizing the 

Pre and Post receivership invoices 6) Discussion with 

Anthony re setting up a meeting with Apollo (on 

Monday) as the rates appear to be higher than their 

previous quote provided7) Comm with S. Title and 

Ryan re barbers quote and pending confirmation 

from Ryan8) Discussion with DDK re 2 options on 

Boiler repair quote and which option should be 

selected and if any discount is possible9) Discussion 

with S. Title re fish tank removal from NV and if any 

supplier is available (to discuss with Bert Vis) and call 

update with S. Rivet- RHRA repair requirements and 

related stuff 

25-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.04 1) Receipt of Bank activity report and related 

discussions2) Discussion with Mike on rent received 

from a couple of residents (pending since Jan/Feb). 

Also discussed sending T4 summary to CRA3) 

Discussion with S. Title re Bert Vis, Ministry of 

Finance letter (response to be prepared), 4) Receipt 

of emails on RHRA for Dundas and related things to 

be done5) Discussion with Mike re maintenance 

issues at NV and sending M. Guy there6) Highlighting 

issues in Alectra, email comm with Alectra, to be 

further investigated7) Finalization of PPE order and 

confirming AZ Med for Dundas pending a couple of 

clarifications 

25-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.60 1) Discussion with Anthony re dryer order with 

Appliance girl, related costs of dryer plus installation 

and updating S.Title about it2) Update on staff 

testing, vaccination 3) City's letter on MG Home, 

Dundas and action points (to work on them later)4)  

Discussion re cleaning house items for Dundas, 

introduction and request for quote for certain 

items5) Discussion with Sheila re certain invoice 

payments6) Call update by S. Title from his call with 

the inspector for the 3 Homes (action items to be 

dealt with next week)7)) Email comm with Walker re 

service performed at Dundas but Ryan is unaware 
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about it so coordinating with both of them8) bank 

tracker received and advising Mubeen to update and 

to inform him about a few transactions9) Receipt of 

Peel In Home invoice and following up with Ryan to 

confirm10) Introduction with Joe from Seniors Home 

and receiving his prel. checklist 

25-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.80 1) Review of invoices- Hal Brant, Cleaning House, 

Orkin, Waste connections, Glenbriar, Argus, Telus 

among others for the 3 Homes2) Sending 6-7 emails 

to S. Ayer for payments. Also discussed Ascend 

entries in the name of Enbridge and Union Gas (to be 

consolidated). Noted down certain invoices which are 

approved but not paid and advising payment on 

those invoices3) Updating the model with these 

invoices in "Commitments" tab as they need to be 

paid by week ended Mar 6.4) Sharing revised model 

with Matt for comments5) Call with Anthony and 

sharing expense format with him. Discussed Dry wall 

invoice and asked Anthony to pay and claim 

reimbursement 

25-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title 1.80 emails with Phoenix and email with Yvonne re: 

managerial role/attempt call to Wolter Vis of Bert Vis 

on Northview; call with Joe Levy; email to Joe 

Levy/Akhil on delivering info to Seniors Housing in 

preparation for listing; call with Phoenix; call with 

Yohaan on his call with R. Anderson; call with Staff 

Relief on its frustrations with R. Anderson on staffing; 

call with Yvonne; call with Mark Tonkin of RHRA on 

Montgomery; email to Anthony on same 

26-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 2.00 1) Review of pending invoices and previous year 

account statements- Argus, Cogeco, Bell, Enbridge, 

Thyssenkrup, Aquaflow among others and updating 

the cash flow projections for Dundas, Northview and 

Montgomery. Sharing the same with Matt for his 

review2) Discussion with AZ Med re order 

finalization, delivery and receipt of invoice3) Receipt 

of revised rent roll for Feb for Dundas and reviewing 

it. Also received rent roll for NV and MG for Mar 

20214) Discussion with S. Rivet re invoice from 

Walker for grease trap part repair, revised invoice for 

Aquaflow and new disinfectant requirement (tbc)5) 

Reviewing and sharing Aquaflow invoice for 

processing to S. Ayer 

26-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.60 1) Preparation of folders/arranging information re 

financials statements, appraisal reports, license docs, 

revenue for 2020, rent rolls and sharing with Seniors 
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Real Estate team for their review2) Discussion with S. 

Title and Mike re HST return requirements for the 

Homes. Also discussed with Mike re their 

remuneration, updated rent roll, payroll status of 

Mar 5, source ded of Feb and receipt of payroll for 

NV for Mar 5 and source deduction work sheet for 

Feb 20213) Email comm re Yohaan's email on staff 

analysis (to be reviewed)4) Discussion with S. Rivet re 

disinfectant req’d as per revised public health 

guidelines5) Discussion with cleaning house re items 

to be ordered and coordinating with cleaning house 

and Ryan for list of items and to expedite6) 

Discussion with S. Title re SD to be paid, updated 

bank statements from Mike, update on March rent 

deposits among others7) Receipt of bank activity 

report and directing Mubeen to update it, clean the 

workbook for review8) Multiple emails and 

discussion re cheque payments to be made today 

26-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.60 1) Discussion with S. Ayer re payment of certain 

vendor invoices incl. Argus, updating Ascend and 

tracker, update on vendor invoice management 

among other details2) Decision making on quotes for 

furnace replacement (NV) and Boiler repair 

(Montgomery) and further review and discussion (to 

be continued)3) Discussion re rent receipts to be sent 

to residents, notice requirements- posted or mailing 

to residents4) Discussion with Anthony re pending 

DDF and Fire inspection reports5) Calls with DDK 

about his quotes, how the work will be done and 

timelines6) Discussion on pending grease trap 

cleaning at Dundas (to be continued) 

26-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor 1.70 1) Discussion incl. multiple emails and calls with S. 

Title re requirement of vacuums at Dundas, other 

issues at Dundas re flushing of drains, quote for 

cleaning items incl. vacuum, Mike's remuneration, 

status of projections, Apollo invoice for Dundas, Bert 

Vis work at Montgomery and related adjustments 

required to ensure residents cooperate. 2) Discussion 

with S. Rivet and S. Title re finalization of supplier for 

furnace replacement (quote compare- DDK and 

Vestacon) and advising DDK to commence the work 

at Northview.3) Discussion with Anthony and S. Title 

re finalization of supplier for boiler repair (quote 

compare- DDK and Vestacon) and advising DDK to 

procure the repair parts and wait for directions to 

commence the work at Montgomery (to wait for tile 
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work completion)4) Multiple emails and calls with 

Ryan (Dundas) re vacuum quotes, flushing of drains 

quote, requirement of disinfectant as per Public 

Health revised guidelines among others5) Calls with 

Daniel from Walker to confirm flushing of drains at 

Dundas (incl. email confirmation)6) Calls and emails 

re confirmed the order for cleaning house items after 

review 

26-Feb-2021 Jim Guo .40 chq req

26-Feb-2021 Mubeen Ghouri .25 Cleaned file and updated for Feb 25th

26-Feb-2021 Patricia Ball .20 post cheque requisition

26-Feb-2021 Patricia Ball .20 process cheque requisition

26-Feb-2021 Sheila Ayer 2.00 AP processing (prep cheque requisitions, submit for 

approval, processing) 

26-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title .50 emails with administrators, call with Shannon Rivet, 

call with Robert Handleman; call with Walter Vis 

27-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 Review of docs received from Mike for property tax 

review - Final notice for 2020 and 2015 financials and 

requesting him to provide 1.2016 CVA Assessment 

Notice and rent rolls for 2014 till date that define the 

room type and service 

28-Feb-2021 Akhil Kapoor .20 1) Email communication re notice to be posted at the 

Homes for an extension provided by RHRA2) Emails 

on GM's visit at the Homes and discussion on transfer 

of funds from Co Accounts to Trust Accounts3) Emails 

with Joe (Seniors) for data requests and S. Rivet re 

disinfectant (whether it falls under Public Health 

Guidelines) 

28-Feb-2021 Sheldon Title .20 email to/from Phoenix, to/from Ayer/Kapoor on need 

to revise notices to post in premises; to team on GM 

appt 
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SUMMARY OF TIME CHARGES 

PROFESSIONAL AVERAGE 

HOURLY RATE 

HOURS AMOUNT

Sheldon Title – Partner (Corporate 

Insolvency) 

590.00 107.60 63,484.00

Akhil Kapoor – Manager (Corporate 

Insolvency) 

375.00 188.34 70,627.50

Cherry Yip – Senior Accountant (Assurance –

Audit) 

228.00 6.50 1482.00

Grant Bazian – Partner (Corporate 

Insolvency) 

390.00 0.50 195.00

Jessie Hue – Estate Administrator (Corporate 

Insolvency) 

222.00 13.80 3,063.60

Jim Guo – Accounting Administrator 

(Corporate Insolvency) 

148.00 6.00 878.00

Matthew Lem - Partner (Corporate 

Insolvency) 

500.00 11.60 5,800.00

Mubeen Ghouri - Accountant (Assurance –

Audit) 

195.00 4.55 887.25

Patricia Ball– Estate Administrator

(Corporate Insolvency) 

166.00 4.0 664.00

Sheila Ayer – Administrative Assistant 

(Corporate Insolvency) 

169.00 7.30 1,233.70

Trina Burningham – Administrative Assistant 

(Corporate Insolvency) 

143.00 18.55 2,652.65

Misc. Disbursements (PPE) 539.99

TOTAL 369.24 $                   151,507.69
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BUDUCHNIST CREDIT UNION LIMITED 
Applicant  

v. DUNDAS RETIREMENT PLACE INC., et al 
Respondents  

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 243(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND 
INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED, AND SECTION 101 OF 
THE COURTS OF JUSTICE ACT, R.S.O. 1990, c. C.43, AS AMENDED 

      Court File No. 31-2663507 
Commercial List Court File No.: ________________ 

ONTARIO  
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

[COMMERCIAL LIST] 

Proceeding commenced at HAMILTON 

MOTION RECORD  
(returnable March 23, 2021 at 12:30pm via “ZOOM” 

videoconference)      

LOOPSRA NIXON LLP 
135 Queen’s Plate Drive – Suite 600 
Toronto, ON M9W 6V7 

R. Graham Phoenix
LSO No.: 52650N

(t) 416 748 4776
(f) 416 746 8319
(e) gphoenix@loonix.com

Lawyers for Court Appointed Receiver, MNP Ltd. 

mailto:gphoenix@loonix.com
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