




























Appendix "A"

Centre City Real Estate Inc. - In Receivership
Details of Adverse Claims in Commission Trust Account

Adverse Claims
Date Reference Seller(s) Name & Phone # Seller(s) Address Buyer(s) Name & Phone # Buyer(s) Address Amount Date Received Notes

Offer Date 02/08/2008 TR 802054

1775 Foothills Blvd

Fair Value Homes Ltd

250-961-3920

1755 Foothills Blvd

Prince George BC

Randy Hamp

250-692-6699

230 Pioneer Way

Burns Lake BC

$5,000.00 12/02/2008

Offer Date 06/24/2009 TR 906022

13875 Ferndale Road

Sheila Okeley

250-963-7092

13875 Ferndale Road

Prince George BC

Shane Brittons

250-552-8394

2988 Nixon 

Crescent

Prince George BC

V2K2B3

$1,000.00 03/06/2009

Offer Date 03/25/2011 TR 103069
1686 & 1706 Ogilvie 

Street

Stan Kristan
No Phone # On File

1686-1706 Ogilvie St
Prince George BC

0829328 BC Ltd
250-961-3325

1699 Ogilvie Street
Prince George BC

V2N1W7

$5,000.00 25/03/2011

Offer Date 11/22/2012 TR 211069

18700 Chief Lake Road

Thai Hung Phan

No Phone # On File

18700 Chief Lake Road

Prince George BC

Ed Wickware &

Dawn Curtis

250-255-0686

3265 Hayman 

Crescent

Quesnel BC 

V2J6K7

$2,000.00 24/11/2012

Offer Date 06/09/2013 TR 306033

9374 Ingelwood Road

Olga Stephens

No Phone # On File

1208 Brisbane Avenue

Coquitlam BC

V2J5L1

Marc Wurzhuber

519-240-6672

1826 Seaton Road

Cambridge, Ontario

N1R5S2

$500.00 10/06/2013

Offer Date 03/06/2016 TR 603063

16280 Allen Road

Catherone Solmonson

No Phone # On File

32650 Chief Lake Road

Prince George BC
V2K5L3

Clifford Wilson

No Phone # On File

3589 Balsum Road

Prince George BC
V2K1Z5

$50.00 15/03/2016

Offer Date 09/20/2016 TR 609143

825 2nd Avenue

Barry Belanger

No Phone # On File

825 2nd Avneue

Prince George BC

V2L3A6

Gaynor & 

Elvis Fjellner

No Phone # On File

No Address On File $500.00 27/09/2016

Offer Date 07/10/2020 TR 2007111

1604-16 20th Avenue

Francis Milat

No Phone # On File

4500 Kelly Drive

Delta BC
V4K1G6

Preeti Sachdeva

No Phone # On File

1662 Cedar Street

Prince George BC
V2L1B7

$10,000.00 13/07/2020

Offer Date 06/02/2003 (as per system) TR 990550

Old File May 31-99

No Name On File

No Phone # On File

No Adddress on File Cher Mazo

No Phone # On File

No Address On File $500.00 02/06/2003 No information available. Previous Bookkeeper 

created this files with the held funds, but left no 

information

Offer Date 06/02/2003 (as per system) TR 990364
Old File Apr 23-99

No Name On File
No Phone # On File

No Adddress on File Katy Walker
No Phone # On File

No Address On File $1,180.04 02/06/2003 No information available. Previous Bookkeeper 
created this files with the held funds, but left no 

information

Offer Date 06/02/2003 (as per system) TR 980490

Old File May 14-98

No Name On File

No Phone # On File

No Adddress on File Bruce Kamstra

No Phone # On File

No Address On File $0.52 02/06/2003 No information available. Previous Bookkeeper 

created this files with the held funds, but left no 

information

Offer Date 06/02/2003 (as per system) TR 980915

Old File Oct 21-98

No Name On File

No Phone # On File

No Adddress on File Roger McClure

No Phone # On File

No Address On File $854.53 02/06/2003 No information available. Previous Bookkeeper 

created this files with the held funds, but left no 

information

Offer Date 06/02/2003 (as per system) TR 970840

Old File Sep 8-97

No Name On File

No Phone # On File

No Adddress on File Daniel Chapman

No Phone # On File

No Address On File $500.00 02/06/2003 No information available. Previous Bookkeeper 

created this files with the held funds, but left no 

information

Offer Date 06/02/2003 (as per system) TR 970567

Old File Aug 15-97

No Name On File

No Phone # On File

No Adddress on File Adl Group Holdings Inc

No Phone # On File

No Address On File $500.00 02/06/2003 No information available. Previous Bookkeeper 

created this files with the held funds, but left no 

information

Offer Date 06/09/2003 (as per system) TR 030106

Old File Apr 16-01

No Name On File

No Phone # On File

No Adddress on File Holly Crosby

No Phone # On File

No Address On File $1,000.00 09/06/2003 No information available. Previous Bookkeeper 

created this files with the held funds, but left no 
information

Offer Date 06/02/2003 (as per system) TR 950273

Old File Mar 29-95

No Name On File

No Phone # On File

No Adddress on File Benjamin Buchi

NO Phone # On File

No Address On File $100.00 02/06/2003 No information available. Previous Bookkeeper 

created this files with the held funds, but left no 

information

Offer Date 06/02/2003 (as per system) TR 950444
Old File May 19-97

No Name On File
No Phone # On File

No Adddress on File Darrell Hebert
No Phone # On File

No Address On File $50.00 02/06/2003 No information available. Previous Bookkeeper 
created this files with the held funds, but left no 

information

Offer Date 06/02/2003 (as per system) TR 951128

Old File Nov 15-95

No Name On File

No Phone # On File

No Adddress on File Albert Jacobus

No Phone # On File

No Address On File $100.00 02/06/2003 No information available. Previous Bookkeeper 

created this files with the held funds, but left no 

information

$28,835.09Total Adverse Claims



Appendix "A"

Centre City Real Estate Inc. - In Receivership

Details of  Unclaimed Amounts in Commission Trust Account

Unclaimed Amounts

Description Reference Seller(s) Name & Phone # Seller(s) Address Buyer(s) Name & Phone # Date Amount

TR 308094  -  207-3644 Arnett Avenue CHQ 40645 Irene Lo & Mina Tran
No Phone # On File

Edmonton Alberta Drage & Silvana 
Todorovksi

250-552-8639

13/09/2013 $815.06

54316 Chq cleared wrong Colin Breadner    Rochester -                                        -                        -                                         31/01/2018 $1.00

59236 Chq cleared wrong Mark Dial Oak -                                        -                        -                                         31/07/2019 ($0.01)

Outstanding Cheque - payee unknown PREVIOUS -                                        -                        -                                         31/08/2008 $5.00

Outstanding Cheque - payee unknown PREVIOUS -                                        -                        -                                         31/08/2008 $1.06

Outstanding Cheque - payee unknown PREVIOUS -                                        -                        -                                         31/08/2008 $128.77

Outstanding Cheque - payee unknown PREVIOUS -                                        -                        -                                         31/08/2008 $5.00

Outstanding Cheque - payee unknown PREVIOUS -                                        -                        -                                         31/08/2008 $1,000.00

Outstanding Cheque - payee unknown PREVIOUS -                                        -                        -                                         31/08/2008 $100.00

Outstanding Cheque - payee unknown PREVIOUS -                                        -                        -                                         31/08/2008 $1,000.00

Outstanding Cheque payable to ANGELA 

LESNIEWICZ

25211 -                                        -                        -                                         31/08/2008 $150.48

Outstanding Cheque payable to 

BRAD/BRETT MALOT

10686 -                                        -                        -                                         31/08/2008 $86.02

Outstanding Cheque payable to  GERRY 

SCHEDWILL

10687 -                                        -                        -                                         31/08/2008 $1.00

Oustanding Cheque payable to GREG 

CRAWFORD

106888 -                                        -                        -                                         31/08/2008 $1,000.00

$4,293.38

No Address On File. Referral sent to Realty 
Executives for agent Ping Tom - This chq has never 

been deposited by the brokerage and upon contact 

they do not show any agent by that name

Realtor's bank cleared chq at wrong amount /  Was 
not corrected at realtors bank
Realtor's bank cleared chq at wrong amount /  Was 

not corrected at realtors bank

Total Unclaimed Amounts

Notes

No information available. Previous bookkeeper 

created misc entry to account for this amount.

No information available. Previous bookkeeper 

created misc entry to account for this amount.

No information available. Previous bookkeeper 

created misc entry to account for this amount.

No information available. Previous bookkeeper 

created misc entry to account for this amount.

No information available. Previous bookkeeper 

created misc entry to account for this amount.

No information available. Previous bookkeeper 

created misc entry to account for this amount.

No information available. Previous bookkeeper 
created misc entry to account for this amount.
No information available. Previous bookkeeper 

created misc entry to account for this amount.

No information available. Previous bookkeeper 

created misc entry to account for this amount.

No information available. Previous bookkeeper 

created misc entry to account for this amount.
No information available. Previous bookkeeper 

created misc entry to account for this amount.



Appendix "B"

Receipts

Cash in Bank - Centre City 137,805.34$          

Cash in Bank - It'll Be Good 89,460.84              

Receiver's Borrowings 50,000.00              

Revenue from Operations 277,090.19            

Deposit - Inland Industries 50,400.00              

Sale of Assets 7,039.20                

Total Receipts 611,795.57            

Disbursements

Filing Fees 71.54$                   

Ascend License Fee 275.00                   

Operating Expense 88,038.48              

Utilities 9,686.95                

Occupation Rent 76,190.48              

Pre-receivership Payroll 1,422.78                

Payroll 87,140.35              

Payroll Remittance 31,711.10              

Contract Labour 950.00                   

Licences and permits - Board Fees 2,521.76                

Advertising 229.40                   

Auctioneer expense 5,268.48                

Auctioneer commission 703.92                   

Telephone 6,038.37                

GST Paid 15,843.10              

PST Paid 19.25                     

GST Remittance 1,683.11                

Insurance 9,219.00                

BC Children's Hospital Foundation 3,760.00                

Receiver's Fees 163,609.00            

Legal Fees 51,154.81              

Total Disbursements 555,536.88            

Balance on Hand 56,258.69$            

Centre City Real Estate Inc. and It'll Be Good Hold Co Inc.

In Receivership

Interim Statement of Receipts and Disbursements

As at March 31, 2021



 

Fees Disbursements Taxes Total

($) ($) ($) ($)

76,329.30      -                 3,816.47      80,145.77            

29,018.50      -                 1,450.93      30,469.43            

32,646.40      -                 1,632.32      34,278.72            

25,614.80      -                 1,280.74      26,895.54            

-                       
15,919.40      -                 795.97         16,715.37            

TOTAL 179,528.40$  -$               8,976.43$    188,504.83$        

16,000.00      750.00           837.50         17,587.50            

GRAND TOTAL 195,528.40$  750.00$         9,813.93$    206,092.33$        

 

April 1, 2021 to present including 

estimate for Receiver's time to complete 

duties

December 1, 2020 to December 31, 2020

March 1, 2021 to March 31, 2021

Summary of Fees and Disbursements - Receiver

APPENDIX "C"

Period

Covered

October 30, 2020 to November 30, 2020

January 1, 2021 to January 31, 2021

February 1, 2021 to February 28, 2021























Date Description Units Amount Notes

03-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 Receive an email from J. Kennedy. Create two invoice accruals in the estate; email to J. Kennedy and H. Ursaki. 

07-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 Email from/to J.Kennedy,  check online banking, download transaction report.

08-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 Review disbursements, prepare two cheque requests to pay OR fee and Ascend License Fee, scan them to J. Kennedy for 

approval.

09-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 Receive two signed cheque requests, process cheques for OR fee and Ascend license fee.

09-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .60 176.40 Receive six cheque requests, issue cheques.

11-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .10 29.40 Email to H. Uursaki re two invoices in Ascend.

11-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .30 88.20 Emails from/to J. Kennedy, review two attachments, create two invoices in Ascend. Create one invoice in MPM.

14-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .10 29.40 Email from/to H. Ursaki, process 2nd payment to pending in Ascend. 

14-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 Review notes from W. Peng w chq#10 as orignal cheque was cancelled as wrong address, review disbursement, prepare 

journal voucher request to record void chq#8

16-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .20 42.80 Address e-remittance.

16-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .70 205.80 Receive and process multiple cheque requests.

16-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .10 29.40 Email from/to Versabank, check disbursement.

16-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 Email from Versabnk re print wire confirmation report. Post it in Ascend. Email to J. Kennedy about wire and coding

17-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .70 205.80 Banking.

18-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .60 128.40 Receive and process cheque requests and cheques.

18-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .70 205.80 Process cheques, Pull out photocoied the two missing cheque requests from J. Kennedy, call w J. Kennedy.

18-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 Receive more cheque requests, issue cheques.

23-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .10 21.40 Mailing cheque out with invoice

23-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .30 88.20 Receive invoice from Patty, review it and check GL, Prepare a cheque request. Receive a signed cheque request, issue a cheque

23-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .10 29.40 Email from/to Versabank, check disbursement.

31-Dec-2020 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 Email from/to Versabank re: review three attachments, check disbursement.

Elizabeth Chen Total 6.20 1,750.80

03-Dec-2020 Greg Ibbott 1.30 526.50 Prepare for and participate in call with BC Real Estate Counsel, disc with legal on same, review options for stable ongoing 

operations.

04-Dec-2020 Greg Ibbott 1.70 688.50 Review corresp from legal on status, disc with legal, disc with Managing Broker on various realtor issues and interferrence by 

principal.

07-Dec-2020 Greg Ibbott .60 243.00 Review corresp from legal, review letter to parties interferring with receivership process, disc with J. Kennedy on same.

08-Dec-2020 Greg Ibbott 1.90 769.50 Update on status of realtor agreements, review and update cash flow variance, reconciliation of same.

09-Dec-2020 Greg Ibbott 1.20 486.00 Review corresp, prep for and participate in update call with Bank, ongoing corresp on realtor issues.

10-Dec-2020 Greg Ibbott .70 283.50 Review of status of sales process, disc incentives for realtors to remain through close of sale.

11-Dec-2020 Greg Ibbott .60 243.00 Corresp on data room information, review corresp on various sales process issues.

18-Dec-2020 Greg Ibbott .40 162.00 Review status of sales process.

Greg Ibbott Total 8.40 3,402.00

01-Dec-2020 Heather Ursaki .40 55.60 Call to Service Canada re ROE forms.

03-Dec-2020 Heather Ursaki .40 55.60 Prepared billing; printed chqs.

08-Dec-2020 Heather Ursaki .10 13.90 Discussion w/J. Kennedy re RP filings.

14-Dec-2020 Heather Ursaki .10 13.90 Printed chq.

Heather Ursaki Total 1.00 139.00



01-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 2.00 810.00 Emails from/to H. Chalmers re: various queries; emails to/from J. Moliere re: deposit book charges; review completions and 

cheques drawn on trust account; emails from/to S. Crawford re: office supplies billings; email from S. Lynch re: update and 

various queries; 

02-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 2.50 1,012.50 Review completions and cheques drawn on trust account; prepare cheque requests; c/c w/ K. Goss and S. Lynch re: RAPP; 

emails to/from D. Mandato re: meeting with S. Lynch; email to prospective purchaser re: access to data room; email from/to L. 

Hiebert re: RECBC.

03-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 2.70 1,093.50 Emails from/to H. Chalmers re: various queries and details re Lone Wolf reports; review completions and cheques drawn on 

trust account; emails from/to I. Singla re: LinkedIn post re sale; emails to/from E. Sirrs and K. Aylward re: LinkedIn; general 

administration.

04-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 5.00 2,025.00 T/c w/ C. Spratt re: insurance settlement conference; t/c w/ S. Lynch re: discussion w/ Z. Mills and transfering licenses; t/c w/ 

and emails to L. Hiebert, R. Laity and G. Ibbott re: same and next steps; draft letter to Re/Max brokerage; summarize realtors' 

ICAs; general file administration.

05-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy .80 324.00 Prepare payroll remittance schedule; prepare cheque requests; review cash flow.

07-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 5.50 2,227.50 Emails from/to R. Laity re: letter to Z. Mills; email to and v/m for R. Yenkana re: sales process; email to R. Laity and L. Hiebert 

re: settlement hearing rescheduled; t/c w/ G. Langer re: status of ICAs and realtors; t/c w/ O. Tumanova re: website; emails 

from/to H. Chalmers re: search account; update cash flow; t/c w/ G. Ibbott re: smae; t/c w/ and email from S. Lynch re: 

landlord listing building; review completions and cheques drawn on trust account; email from prospective purchaser re: NDA; 

t/c w/ J. Reeves re: expenses; t/c w/ S. Lynch re: realtor licenses; emails from/to I. Singla re: LinkedIn ad; general 

administration.

08-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 5.00 2,025.00 Emails from/to H. Chalmers re: various queries and realtor info; review completions and cheques drawn on trust account; 

email from R. Laity re: Z. Mills; review NDA received from prospective purchasers; emails to/from R. Laity re: electronic 

signature; provide access to data room; email from G. Ibbott re: cashflow; email from E. Chen re: cheque requests; print and 

sign same; emails to/from L. Drewcock re: time entry; prepare draft email update to TD; discussion w/ and email to G. Ibbott 

re: same; general file administration.

09-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 4.50 1,822.50 T/c w/ G. Ibbott re: next steps; c/c w/ J. Seidel, J. Moliere and T. Byers re: update; emails from/to prospective purchaser re: 

NDA and data room; t/c w/ D. Mandato re: rent cheque, listing building etc.; review and sign cheques; review completions and 

cheques drawn on trust account; email from Fortis re: account update; email from/to E. Ash re: correspondence with realtors; 

email to and discussion w/ G. Ibbott re: same; email from S. Lynch re: competing brokerages; receive NDA; provide access to 

data room.

10-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 4.50 1,822.50 Emails from/to H. Chalmers re: various queries; review completions and cheques drawn on trust account; emails to/from W. 

Paderson re: Re/Max Western cheque; t/c's w/ S. Lynch re: realtor resignation, incentive plan, etc; prepare and send letters to 

Century 21, Exp Realty and Powerhouse re: sales process; general file admininstration.

11-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 4.50 1,822.50 Emails to/from H. Chalmers re: realtor info; review completions and cheques drawn on trust account; email to J. Moliere re: 

sweep account; review ROE; reformat realtor info; emails to/from G. Ibbott re: same; update dataroom re: realtor info; email 

from/to K. Goss re: various queries re: sales process.

14-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 3.00 1,215.00 Emails from H. Chalmers re: various invoices; review completions and cheques drawn on trust account; emails from/to T. Bolin 

re: sales process.

15-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 4.00 1,620.00 Emails from/to H. Chalmers re: parking and invoices; review completions and cheques drawn on trust account; emails to/from 

J. Moliere re: status of wire transfer; prepare ROE's; email same to employees; prepare cheque requests; t/c w/H. Chalmers re: 

miscellaneous invoices; email to additional brokerages re: sales package; general administration.

16-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 2.50 1,012.50 Emails from/to H. Chalmers; review completions and cheques drawn on trust account; email from prospective purchasers re: 

NDAs and access to data room; prepare cheque requests; follow up with various prospective purchasers; 

17-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 1.50 607.50 Emails from/to H. Chalmers re: various queries; review completions and cheques drawn on trust account; t/c w/ prospective 

purchaser re: assets;; t/c w/ M. Fraser re: termination notice; 

18-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy 4.30 1,741.50 Emails from/to H. Chalmers re: various queries, Lone Wolf invoice and cash flow; review and update cashflow; emails from/to 

S. Lynch re: update and realtor incentive; t/c w/ G. Ibbott re: realtor incentive; prepare summary of prospective purchasers; 

email to prospective purchaser re: income statement; emails to D. Mandato re: rent cheque; file November 2020 GST return; 

email from Errors and Omissions Insurance re: rescheduled settlement conference.

21-Dec-2020 Julie Kennedy .30 121.50 Email from D. Mandato re: rent cheque; emails to/from S. Boyle re: same; 

Julie Kennedy Total 52.60 21,303.00

03-Dec-2020 Patty Wood .10 55.00 Disc with J Kennedy.

04-Dec-2020 Patty Wood .20 110.00 Disc with J Kennedy re issue of realtors and proposed transfer of licenses to other brokerage.

07-Dec-2020 Patty Wood .10 55.00 Disc with J Kennedy re matters re sales process.

10-Dec-2020 Patty Wood .40 220.00 Update re status of sales process; review/sign various trust cheques for wages, op costs etc., receive/review legal account and 

fwd to J Kennedy for payment.

16-Dec-2020 Patty Wood .10 55.00 Disc with J Kennedy re statutory remittances/payroll matters.



18-Dec-2020 Patty Wood .30 165.00 Review and sign various trust cheques re payroll, operating costs etc, and disc with J Kennedy re status of operations/sales 

process.

22-Dec-2020 Patty Wood .20 110.00 Review various correspondence provided by Worksafe BC re cancellation of Debtor's account and opening account for 

Receiver.

23-Dec-2020 Patty Wood .10 55.00 Instructions to E Chen re utilities invoice; review/sign payment request and trust cheque.

Patty Wood Total 1.50 825.00

03-Dec-2020 Seamus Boyle .75 220.50 Prepare WEPPA Employee info forms, update email and sending documents to employees.

04-Dec-2020 Seamus Boyle 1.00 294.00 Review proofs of claims, correspondence with employees updating weppa profiles.

16-Dec-2020 Seamus Boyle .20 58.80 Updat weppa spread sheet and confirming all claims were filed.

18-Dec-2020 Seamus Boyle 1.30 382.20 Review completions, saving documentation and approving payments.

21-Dec-2020 Seamus Boyle 1.20 352.80 Trust account transactions review and approval.

22-Dec-2020 Seamus Boyle .50 147.00 Coordinat courier of cheque for rent payment, reviewing and approving payments from trust account.

23-Dec-2020 Seamus Boyle .30 88.20 Review and approving cheques from trust account.

Seamus Boyle Total 5.25 1,543.50

10-Dec-2020 Stephanie P Williams .10 10.50 Set up courier

Stephanie Williams Total .10 10.50

07-Dec-2020 Winnie Peng .30 44.70 Issue chqs

Winnie Peng Total .30 44.70

Hours Total 75.35

Professional Fees Subtotal 29,018.50$  

 































Date Description Units Amount Notes

01-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .10 29.40 Issue cheque.

01-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 Email from Versabank re: wire transfer; post same; email to J. Kennedy re: same.

01-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .50 147.00 Receive five cheque requests, issue cheques. 

02-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 Email from/ro Versabank re: disbursements.

03-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .10 21.40 Issue cheque.

03-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .10 29.40 Issue a cheque

10-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen 1.20 256.80 Receive 15 cheque requests, issue cheques.

10-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 T/c w/ J. Kennedy re: journal voucher request, void cheque, and reissue cheque.

15-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .10 21.40 Email from/to Versabank re: disbursements.

15-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .20 42.80 Prepare deposit.

15-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .40 85.60 Receive 4 cheque requests from J.Kennedy, issue cheques.

16-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .10 29.40 Email from/to Versabank re: disbursements.

16-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 Email from Versabank re: wire transfer; post same; email to J. Kennedy re: same.

17-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .20 42.80 Receive two cheque requests from J.Kennedy, issue cheques.

18-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .10 29.40 Email from J. Kennedy re a cheque in the safe.

22-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 Prepare deposit.

23-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .10 29.40 Email from S. Boyle re: cheque.

24-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .20 58.80 Prepare deposit.

29-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .20 42.80 Receive two cheque request, issue cheuqes.

31-Mar-2021 Elizabeth Chen .30 64.20 Receive three cheque requests from J. Kennedy, and issue cheques

Elizabeth Chen Total 4.90 1,224.60

05-Mar-2021 Greg Ibbott .30 121.50 Review of reporting to TD.



Date Description Units Amount Notes

Greg Ibbott Total .30 121.50

03-Mar-2021 Heather Ursaki .30 49.50 Prepared billing.

Heather Ursaki Total .30 49.50

01-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 1.80 729.00 Emails from/to H. Chalmers re: various queries; emails from/to Central Interior Bailiffs re: move; t/c w/ S. Lynch re: next steps; 

email to and t/c w/ Telus re: cancel accounts; prepare cheque requests; review and approve January 2021 bank reconciliation; 

general file administraion.

02-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 1.40 567.00 Email from H. Chalmers re: bank recs; emails from/to Meridian re: cheque; email from R. Newman re: cancellation forms re: 

insurance; review insurance; update cashflow; email to H. Chalmers re: cash actuals; email to H. Ursaki re: WIP.

03-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 1.60 648.00 T/c w/ R. Newman re: insurance policies; t/c w/ H. Chalmers re: refund of insurance premiums; t/c w/S. Lynch re: general 

update; update cashflow; prepare cheque request.

04-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 1.00 405.00 Email from/to H. Chalmers re: GST refund; emails to/from R. Newman re: same; t/c's w/ S. Lynch re: janitors; t/c w/ Central 

Interior Bailiffs re: janitorial supplies;

05-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 2.00 810.00 Finalize bill; review and consider cashflow; t/c w/ S. Lynch re: wind up report, AR; emails to/from Central Interior Bailify re: net 

sale proceeds; update to TD; discussion w/ G. Ibbott re: same. 

08-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 3.10 1,255.50 Emails from/to Central Interior Bailiffs re: sale proceeds; prepare termination letters re: H. Chalmers and S. Lynch; prepare 

ROE's; prepare T4s; t/c w/ S. Lynch re: update. 

09-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 1.60 648.00 Emails from/to H. Chalmers re: cash actuals and hourly rate; emails from/to S. Lynch re: adverse claims, settlement hearing 

and hourly wage; email to employees re: ROE and T4; prepare cheque requests.

10-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 3.50 1,417.50 Review adverse claim summary; emails to/from and t/c w/ S. Lynch re: same; review contracts; review Real Estate Services Act; 

t/c w/ H. Chalmers re: invoices; prepare cheque request re: insurance, utilities and payroll; email to R. Laity re: adverse claims; 

emails from/to realtor re: insurance premium refund; general administration.

11-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 1.30 526.50 Emails from/to and t/c w/ R. Laity re: adverse claims; corresp w/ S. Lynch re: unclaimed items, adverse claims and cheques; 

emails from/to H. Ursaki re: shutting down data room.

12-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 1.00 405.00 Emails from/to H. Chalmers re: various; email from S. Lynch re: adverse claims and unclaimed funds; review same; review Real 

Estate Services Act.

15-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 2.40 972.00 Update cashflow; email to J. Moliere re: sweep operating account; email to S. Boyle re: close Worksafe account; prepare 

cheque requests; finalize ROE's and T4s for S. Lynch and H. Chalmers; review schedule of unclaimed and adverse funds; t/c w/ 

S. Lynch re: same; email to R. Laity re: affidavit for unclaimed/adverse funds; t/c w/ S. Lynch re: winding up report and bill 

received by realtor; sign cheques.



Date Description Units Amount Notes

16-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy .80 324.00 Email from/to S. Lynch re: update; corresp. w/ D. Hyndman at Kornfeld re BDC loan; review Firmex and pull reports; t/c w/ H. 

Ursaki re: same. 

17-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 1.20 486.00 Email from/to J. Moliere re: estimated cost; review cashflow; email from H. Chalmers re: invoices for payment; prepare cheque 

requests; sign cheques; t/c w/ City of Prince George re: utility bill. 

18-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy .40 162.00 Emails to H. Chalmers and S. Lynch re: ROE and T4; code cheque for deposit; email to E. Chen re: same.

22-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy .50 202.50 Emails from/to H. Chalmers and S. Lynch re: various reporting; review AR ledger. 

23-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 1.30 526.50 T/c w/ and emails to/from S. Lynch re: AR; email to R. Laity re: demand letters; prepare collection letter re: S. McLaughlin; 

general file administration.

24-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy .50 202.50 Emails from/to S. Mclaughlin re: amount owing; emails to/from S. Lynch re: same;

25-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy 2.50 1,012.50 Emails from/to R. Laity re: demand letters; review same; email to L. Thomson re: Shred-It invoice; review and update cash 

flow; consider update to TD; continue draft court report.

26-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy .20 81.00 Emails from/to R. Laity re: AR collection.

27-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy .20 81.00 Email from R. Laity re: response from C.Radzanowski re: AR; consider next steps.

29-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy .80 324.00 Prepare cheque requests and sign cheques; continue draft court report.

30-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy .50 202.50 Emails from H. Chalmers and t/c w/ S. Lynch re: trust account and final items.'

31-Mar-2021 Julie Kennedy .40 162.00 Prepare cheque requests; review emails.

Julie Kennedy Total 30.00 12,150.00

01-Mar-2021 Patty Wood .10 55.00 Review and sign various final operating costs.

10-Mar-2021 Patty Wood .30 165.00 Disc with J Kennedy re status of deposits held by Debtor re incomplete sale transactions and steps and information to deal 

with same.

11-Mar-2021 Patty Wood .10 55.00 Review and sign various trust cheques re final operating costs.

Patty Wood Total .50 275.00

01-Mar-2021 Seamus Boyle .60 190.80 Reveiw and approv trust account activity 

02-Mar-2021 Seamus Boyle .60 190.80 Review and approv trust activity 



Date Description Units Amount Notes

04-Mar-2021 Seamus Boyle .40 127.20 Review and approv trust activity 

06-Mar-2021 Seamus Boyle .30 95.40 Review and approv trust acount transactions - transfers to Core Realty

08-Mar-2021 Seamus Boyle 1.10 349.80 Review and approv trust account activity and prepared February GST Return 

09-Mar-2021 Seamus Boyle .20 63.60 Review and approv trust accout acitivity, requested clarification on cheque numbers

10-Mar-2021 Seamus Boyle .40 127.20 Review and approv trust account activity, reuested additional information for missing cheques 

11-Mar-2021 Seamus Boyle .60 190.80 Review and approv trust accoutn activity 

12-Mar-2021 Seamus Boyle .40 127.20 Reveiw and approv trust account activity activity

15-Mar-2021 Seamus Boyle .70 222.60 Approve funds transfer to Core, called Worksafe BC to cancel account and submit 2021 payroll information, reviewed 

December 2020 and Janaury 2021 notices of assessments regarding RT0002 HST returns 

23-Mar-2021 Seamus Boyle .25 79.50 Review and save February notice of assessment RT0002, and requested cheque be deposited 

29-Mar-2021 Seamus Boyle .30 95.40 Review and save WEPP statement of account, reviewed and approved trust account activity 

31-Mar-2021 Seamus Boyle .75 238.50 Review GST information from Centre City, updated GST summary and filed March RT0002 return

Seamus Boyle Total 6.60 2,098.80

Hours Total 42.60

Professional Fees Subtotal 15,919.40$  

 



Professional Position Average Rate No. of Hours Time Value

/ Hour ($) ($)

Patty Wood Trustee 550 9.10 5,005.00           

Julie Kennedy Trustee 404 316.50 127,882.50       

Greg Ibbott Trustee 405 58.40 23,652.00         

Elizabeth Chen Accountant 280 23.10 6,463.40           

Seamus Boyle Manager 302 47.20 14,265.60         

Heather Ursaki Admin. Assistant 140 8.50 1,189.30           

Various Support Staff 238 4.50 1,070.60           

     

Total 467.30 179,528.40$     

Summary of Time

(in relation to Receiver's accounts referenced in Appendix "C")

APPENDIX "D"

CONSOLIDATED TIME BY PROFESSIONAL



 

Fees Disbursements Taxes Total

($) ($) ($) ($)

27,411.50      161.90           3,297.49      30,870.89            

6,150.00        -                 738.00         6,888.00              

9,923.50        9.00               1,191.28      11,123.78            

4,163.50        -                 499.63         4,663.13              

March 1, 2021 to April 30, 2021 9,304.50        -                 1,116.55      10,421.05            

TOTAL 56,953.00$    170.90$         6,842.95$    63,966.85$          

5,000.00        -                 600.00         5,600.00              

GRAND TOTAL 61,953.00$    170.90$         7,442.95$    69,566.85$          

 

APPENDIX "E"

Period

Covered

October 29, 2020 to November 30, 2020

January 1, 2021 to January 31, 2021

February 1, 2021 to February 28, 2021

March 1, 2021 to present including 

estimate for BLG's time to complete 

duties

December 1, 2020 to December 31, 2020

Summary of Fees and Disbursements - BLG



Professional Position Average Rate No. of Hours Time Value

/ Hour ($) ($)

R. Barenboim Research Librarian 157 3.00 471.34             

P.K. Byrne Associate 335 1.60 536.00             

L. Hiebert Partner 518 29.40 15,219.88        

R.M. Laity Partner 477 70.70 33,715.23        

S. Lakatos Partner 590 1.60 944.00             

B.D. Portas Partner 580 4.20 2,436.00          

A. Singh Paralegal 255 0.20 51.00               

M. Tolan Associate 405 0.60 243.00             

S. Garcha Articling Student 224 1.60 358.19             

M. Gruchey Articling Student 208 5.60 1,164.86          

E.C. Little Partner 530 0.70 371.00             

J. Pepper Articling Student 59 5.70 336.00             

M.G. Johnstone Associate 370 2.20 814.00             

H. Wong Paralegal 225 1.30 292.50             

     

Total 128.40 56,953.00$      

Summary of Time

(in relation to BLG's accounts referenced in Appendix "E")

APPENDIX "F"

CONSOLIDATED TIME BY PROFESSIONAL




