

C40076

CENTRE OF

Apr 03, 2023

B201 719774 COURT FILE NO. 25-2719774

COURT OF KING'S BENCH OF ALBERTA

JUDICIAL CENTRE CALGARY COM
March 29, 2023

IN THE MATTER OF THE NOTICE OF INTENTION TO MAKE A PROPOSAL

OF GS E&R CANADA INC.

DOCUMENT **EIGHTH REPORT OF MNP LTD.**, **TRUSTEE UNDER THE DIVISION I**

PROPOSAL OF GS E&R CANADA INC.

DATED March 20, 2023

ADDRESS FOR <u>COUNSEL</u>

SERVICE AND LAWSON LUNDELL LLP
CONTACT 1100, 225 – 6 AVENUE SW
INFORMATION OF CALGARY, AB T2P 1N2

PARTY FILING

THIS DOCUMENT ATTN: ALEXIS TEASDALE

TEL: 403.218.7564 FAX: 403.269.9494

EMAIL: ateasdale@lawsonlundell.com

PROPOSAL TRUSTEE

MNP LTD.

1500, 640 – 5 AVENUE SW CALGARY, AB T2P 3G4

ATTN: VICTOR P. KROEGER

TEL: 403.298.8479

EMAIL: victor.kroeger@mnp.ca



APPENDICES

APPENDIX A	Certificate of Full Performance dated August 8, 2022
APPENDIX B	Statement of Receipts and Disbursements for the period of September 17, 2021 to February 28, 2023
APPENDIX C	Summary of Trustee Fees and Disbursements and Affidavit of Richard Anderson dated March 20, 2023;
APPENDIX D	Summary of Trustee Legal Fees and Disbursements
APPENDIX E	GS E&R Canada Inc. December 31, 2021 and December 31, 2022 Fiscal Year End Balance Sheet
APPENDIX F	Draft Escrow Agreement



INTRODUCTION

- 1. On March 11, 2021 (the "Filing Date"), GS E&R Canada Inc. (the "Company" or "E&R Canada") filed a Notice of Intention to Make a Proposal ("NOI") pursuant to Part III, Division I of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act (the "BIA"). MNP Ltd. ("MNP") consented to act as the Trustee under the NOI (the "Trustee").
- 2. The original documentation was erroneously filed under the name E&R Canada Ltd. The Trustee provided the Office of the Superintendent of Bankruptcy (the "**OSB**") with updated filing documentation on March 16, 2021. On March 18th, 2021 the OSB issued a new certificate of filing reflecting the Company's correct name.
- 3. On August 16, 2021, the Court of Queen's Bench of Alberta, now known as the Court of King's Bench of Alberta (the "Court") granted a Sale Approval and Vesting Order and Enhanced Trustee's Powers order (the "Enhanced Powers Order"). The Enhanced Powers Order provides, among other things, that, "upon the resignation of the directors of the Company, the Trustee's powers as Proposal Trustee (in such capacity, the "Trustee") would be enhanced to include, among other things, taking possession and exercising control over all of the assets, undertakings and property (the "Property") of E&R Canada.
- 4. On August 17, 2021, the Company filed a Proposal to its Creditors (the "Proposal"). At the meeting of the Company's creditors held on September 7th, 2021 (the "Creditors' Meeting"), the Proposal was approved by the creditors. The Proposal was subsequently approved by this Honourable Court on September 17, 2021. At the Creditors' Meeting no Inspectors were appointed.
- 5. The remaining director of E&R Canada resigned on September 17, 2021.
- 6. This is the Trustee's eighth report to the Court (the "**Eighth Report**"). Defined terms used in the Eighth Report will have the same meaning as all prior reports.
- 7. All references to currency are in Canadian dollars unless otherwise stated.
- 8. All relevant documents in the Company's restructuring proceedings are available on the Trustee's website at: https://mnpdebt.ca/en/corporate/corporate-engagements/gs-eandr-canada.

REPORT LIMITATIONS

9. In preparing the Eighth Report and making comments herein, the Trustee has relied upon, certain unaudited, draft or internal financial information, including the Company's books and records, and information from other third-party sources (collectively, the "Information"). The Trustee has not audited, reviewed or otherwise attempted to verify the accuracy or completeness of the Information in a manner that would wholly or partially comply with generally accepted assurance standards or other standards established by the Chartered Professional Accountants of Canada (the "Standards"). Additionally, none of the Trustee's procedures were intended to disclose defalcations or other irregularities. If the Trustee were to perform additional procedures or to undertake an audit examination of the Information in accordance with the Standards, additional matters may have come to the Trustee's attention. Accordingly, the Trustee does not express an opinion, nor does it provide any other form of assurance on the financial or other information presented herein. The Trustee may refine or alter its observations as further information is obtained or brought to its attention after the date of the Eighth Report.



10. The Trustee assumes no responsibility or liability for any loss or damage occasioned by any party as a result of the circulation, publication, reproduction, or use of the Eighth Report. Any use, any party makes of the Eighth Report, or any reliance or decision to be made based on the Eighth Report by any party, is the sole responsibility of such party.

PURPOSE OF THE EIGHTH REPORT

- 11. The purpose of the Eighth Report is to provide this Honourable Court with an update in respect of the activities of the Trustee pursuant to the Proposal and the Enhanced Powers Order since the Trustee's seventh report to the Court dated January 12, 2022 (the "Seventh Report") and to provide information in respect of two applications, one on behalf of the sole shareholder of E&R Canada, GS E&R Corp. ("E&R Parent"), and one by the Trustee, both returnable on March 29, 2023 (the "March 29 Applications"). E&R Parent's application seeks an order for the following relief:
 - a. Approving and ratifying the draft escrow agreement ("Escrow Agreement"), a copy of which is attached hereto as Appendix "F", and authorizing the Trustee, Stikeman Elliott LLP ("Stikeman"), and E&R Parent to enter into the Escrow Agreement;
 - b. Authorizing the Trustee to distribute the remaining funds held in the Company's estate, as shown on the SRD, net of the Professional Fees (as subsequently defined), plus interest earned and GST refunds received, to Stikeman, in its capacity as legal counsel for E&R Parent, to be held in escrow for E&R Parent pursuant to the Escrow Agreement, subject to payment of any liabilities owing by E&R Canada to the Canada Revenue Agency ("CRA") in respect of any liability arising from the Final Audits and Final Tax Returns (as defined herein) of E&R Canada;
 - c. Authorizing Stikeman to distribute to E&R Parent the funds held by it in escrow upon the earlier of six months after the date on which MNP receives the last Notice of Assessment from CRA in respect of each of the Final Tax Returns (subject to payment of the liabilities, if any, referenced in the previous subparagraph), or the date on which MNP receives a clearance certificate from CRA;
- 12. The Trustee's application seeks an order for the following relief:
 - a. Approving the reported activities of the Trustee since the Seventh Report, in administering these proceedings in accordance with the Enhanced Powers Order;
 - Approving the statement of receipts and disbursements (the "SRD") for the period September 17, 2021 to February 28, 2023;
 - Approving the professional fees incurred by the Trustee and its legal counsel, Lawson Lundell LLP ("Lawson Lundell") for the period ended February 28, 2023 (the "Professional Fees"); and
 - d. Approving the Trustee's discharge upon completion of the Remaining Activities (as subsequently defined).



TRUSTEE'S REPORTED ACTIVITIES

- 13. Since the date of the Seventh Report, the Trustee has undertaken the following activities, pursuant to and in accordance with the Enhanced Powers Order and the Proposal, as applicable:
 - a. Distributed to all unsecured creditors with proven claims, and deemed trust claims, a final dividend in accordance with the distribution process as set out in the Seventh Report and approved by the Order (Interim Distribution and Approval of Activities Order) pronounced January 18, 2022 (the "Distribution Order");
 - Worked with the purchaser of the assets, Bench Creek Resources Ltd. ("Bench Creek")
 and third parties in accordance with the Enhanced Powers Order to ensure all assets to
 be conveyed to Bench Creek were properly conveyed;
 - c. Completed the 2021 and 2022 fiscal year end financial statements and tax returns;
 - d. Contacted and continued to follow up with the Canada Revenue Agency ("CRA") to initiate a GST audit;
 - e. Prepared and submitted GST returns to date;
 - f. Held discussions and corresponded with Lawson Lundell, as required to administer the estate:
 - g. Paid post filing obligations pursuant to paragraph 15(e) of the Enhanced Powers Order and in accordance with Section 2.7 of the Proposal;
 - h. Provided reporting packages to E&R Parent at their request; and
 - i. Considered and discussed with the E&R Parent and E&R Parent's legal counsel the process and options in relation to the winding-up and dissolution of the Company.

REMAINING ACTIVITIES OF THE TRUSTEE

- 14. Attached as Appendix "A" is the Certificate of Full Performance dated August 8, 2022, confirming the Proposal has been fully performed.
- 15. As discussed in the Seventh Report, CRA had completed its review of the employee source deduction account and submitted a proof of claim for pre-NOI filing source deductions, comprised of a \$100 unsecured claim (the "CRA Unsecured Claim") and a \$25,165.44 deemed trust claim (the "CRA Deemed Trust Claim").
- 16. CRA further advised there was a \$13,736.34 (including interest) post-filing amount owing as a result of a payroll audit (the "CRA Post Filing Claim").
- 17. The CRA Unsecured Claim, the CRA Deemed Trust Claim and the CRA Post Filing Claim have been paid in full.
- 18. The Trustee has on multiple occasions requested that CRA complete an audit of the GST account, to establish any pre-filing GST liability in an attempt to obtain a clearance certificate. CRA has verbally



- advised that, as there was no GST amount owing as of the date of filing the NOI, and no audit would be undertaken.
- 19. The Trustee has prepared and submitted all GST returns to January 31, 2023 and has received the GST refunds related to these returns.
- 20. In order for the CRA to issue a clearance certificate ("Clearance Certificate") the final tax return will need to be filed which can only occur after the distribution of escrow funds (as defined below) to Stikeman in accordance with the Escrow Agreement. As the Proposal has been fully performed, the only remaining duties of the Trustee under the Expanded Powers Order, are to file the final tax returns, including returns in relation to the Company's GST account and Corporate Tax account (the "Final Tax Returns").
- 21. There are remaining funds in the estate of E&R Canada, which are subject to the payment of any outstanding professional fees due to the Trustee and its counsel up to and including February 28, 2023 and the addition of any interest earned on the funds until payout and any GST refunds received by MNP on behalf of E&R Canada (the net amount being the "Escrow Funds"), which the Trustee is recommending be held in escrow by Stikeman, pursuant to the Escrow Agreement.
- 22. Upon filing of the Final Tax Returns, the CRA will have the opportunity to complete the Final Audits required to provide the Clearance Certificate, or at the very least provide the Trustee with the notices of assessment (the "NOAs") regarding each of the Final Tax Returns.
- 23. The Escrow Agreement provides that Stikeman is authorized to release the Escrow Funds to E&R Parent, subject to Stikeman confirming it has paid from the Escrow Funds any obligations, if any, due and owing to CRA pursuant to the NOAs, on the earlier of (a) six months after MNP receives the last of the NOAs arising from the Final Tax Returns and (b) the date on which MNP receives a Clearance Certificate from CRA in respect of the Company.
- 24. Upon completion of the Remaining Activities, the Trustee will file the Trustee's discharge certificate (the "Trustee's Discharge Certificate") confirming all matters have been addressed and funds have been distributed in accordance with the orders sought at the March 29 Application (if approved, the "March 29 Orders").

STATEMENT OF RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

- 25. Attached as Appendix "B" hereto is the Trustee's SRD for the period September 17, 2021 to February 28, 2023.
- 26. The SRD indicates total receipts of \$2,309,231 and total disbursements of \$800,316. Accordingly, the Trustee continues to hold \$1,508,915 in its trust account.

APPROVAL OF ACCOUNTS

- 27. As of February 28, 2023, the Trustee has incurred fees and disbursements in the amount of \$462,107.21, excluding GST. Details of the Trustee's fees and disbursements are described in the Affidavit of Richard Anderson, attached as Appendix "C".
- 28. As of February 28, 2023, Lawson Lundell's fees and disbursements, excluding GST, total \$128,803.55. Attached as Appendix "**D**" is a summary of the legal fees and disbursements. Redacted copies of the invoices, with privileged information removed therefrom, will be provided as Exhibits to a



- secretarial Affidavit, to be sworn and filed concurrently with this Report. The Trustee has reviewed the fees of its legal counsel and is of the view that the fees are reasonable and appropriate in the circumstances.
- 29. Any further trustee fees or legal fees to complete will be paid from the retainer funds previously provided to the Trustee by E&R Parent. As we cannot estimate the time that will be required to respond to any CRA audit questions, we cannot provide an estimate of costs to complete.

REMAINING ASSETS

- 30. All creditors of the Company who filed proofs of claim in the Proposal were fully repaid in accordance with the Distribution Order on or around January 26, 2022 pursuant to Section 6.5 of the Proposal and Section 122(2) of the BIA. They were paid the total amount of their Proven Claim, net of any applicable levy payable to the Office of the Superintendent of Bankruptcy, plus 5% interest per annum. The Trustee is not aware of any further known liabilities of the Company.
- 31. The Company is not carrying on business or incurring any further liabilities (other than for professional fees to its own advisors, the Trustee and the Trustee's legal counsel). As such, the Trustee is of the view that no party will be prejudiced by the granting of the March 29 Order or by the distribution of remaining funds to the Company's sole shareholder.
- 32. Attached as Appendix "E" are the Company's balance sheets for the years ending 2021 and 2022. According to the Company's balance sheet as of December 31, 2022, the common shares are recorded at \$237,253.488, E&R Parent is the sole shareholder of the Company.
- 33. The Trustee understands the common share amount represents the paid-up capital (the "**PUC**") of the sole shareholder, E&R Parent. All of E&R Parent's \$237,253,488 investment in common shares was made prior to the filing of the NOI and has not been repaid.
- 34. Subject to any claims that CRA may have, the Trustee is of the opinion that the balance of the Escrow Funds, after payment by Stikeman of any obligations due to CRA, if any, following the six month time lapse of issuance of the last NOA and/or issuance of a CRA Clearance Certificate, should be returned to E&R Parent as a return of the PUC of the Company.

DISTRIBUTION OF FUNDS

- 35. As shown in the SRD, there remains \$1,508,915 in cash as an asset in the estate, less payment of all outstanding Professional Fees of MNP and its legal counsel up to and including February 28, 2023, together with any interest earned on the funds until payout and any GST refunds received by MNP on behalf of E&R Canada, which will comprise the Escrow Funds. Any further trustee fees or legal costs to complete will be paid from the retainer funds previously provided to the Trustee by E&R Parent.
- 36. Pursuant to section 144 of the BIA, the Debtor is entitled to any surplus remaining after the payment of the claims of all creditors, with interest, and costs of the proceedings. As the Company was dissolved effective January 2, 2023 for failure to file its annual returns, subject to the Trustee paying the Escrow Funds to Stikeman, the Trustee will be in a position to complete and file the Final Tax Returns.
- 37. The Trustee has agreed, subject to approval of this Honourable Court, to enter into the Escrow Agreement with Stikeman, in the form attached to this Report as Appendix "F", that outlines the conditions under which the Escrow Funds will be paid to and held and released by Stikeman. In



summary, the funds will be held with Stikeman until such time as the Trustee has completed all Final Tax Returns, CRA has completed the Final Audits, and Stikeman has paid all liabilities, if any, arising from the Final Tax Returns and the Final Audits, at which time Stikeman will be entitled to release the Escrow Funds to E&R Parent.

DISCHARGE OF TRUSTEE

- 38. The remaining activities of the Trustee includes distributing the Escrow Funds to Stikeman, completion of E&R Canada's final financials statements and tax returns and dealing with CRA regarding any audits ((collectively, the "Remaining Activities").
- 39. Upon completion of the Remaining Activities, the Trustee will file the Trustee's Discharge Certificate confirming all matters have been addressed and funds have been distributed in accordance with the March 29 Orders.

CONCLUSION

- 40. The Proposal Trustee submits the Eighth Report in support of the March 29 Applications for Orders:
 - a. Approving and ratifying the Escrow Agreement (defined herein) and authorizing the Trustee, Stikeman and E&R Parent to enter into the Escrow Agreement;
 - b. Authorizing the Trustee to distribute the Escrow Funds to Stikeman, in its capacity as legal counsel for E&R Parent, to be held in escrow for E&R Parent pursuant to the Escrow Agreement, subject to payment of any liabilities owing by E&R Canada to the CRA in respect of any liability arising from the Final Audits and Final Tax Returns (as defined herein) of E&R Canada;
 - c. Authorizing Stikeman to distribute to E&R Parent the funds held by it in escrow upon receipt of an Escrow Release Notice from the Trustee;
 - d. Approval of the activities of the Trustee since the Seventh Report, in administering these proceedings in accordance with the Enhanced Powers Order;
 - e. Approving the SRD dated February 28, 2023;
 - f. Approving the Professional Fees incurred by the Trustee in the amount of \$462,107.21and its legal counsel, Lawson Lundell to date, in the amount of \$128,803.55; and
 - g. Approving the Trustee's discharge, upon completion of the Remaining Activities.



All of which is respectfully submitted this 20th day of March, 2023.

MNP Ltd. in its capacity as Proposal Trustee in the Division I Proposal of GS E&R Canada Inc. and not in its personal or corporate capacity

Per:

Victor P. Kroeger CPA, CA, LIT, CIRP, CFE

Senior Vice President

Appendix A

District of:

Alberta

Division No.

02 - Calgary

Court No. Estate No.

25-2719774 25-2719774

FORM 46

Certificate of Full Performance of Proposal (Section 65.3 and 66.38 of the Act)

In the matter of the of
GS E&R Canada Inc.
of the city of Calgary, in the Province of Alberta

We	MNP	l td

the administrator acting in the consumer proposal of GS E&R Canada Inc., a consumer debtor, certifies that the consumer proposal,

as filed with the official receiver on the 17th day of August 2021 has been fully performed as of the 8th day of August 2022.

Dated at the city of Calgary in the Province of Alberta, this 8th day of August 2022.

MNP Ltd. - Licensed Insolvency Trustee

Per:

Victor Kroegen - Licensed Insolvency Trustee

1500, 640 - 5 Avenue SW Calgary AB T2P 3G4

Phone: (403) 538-3187 Fax: (403) 537-8437

Appendix B

In the matter of the Proposal of GS E&R Canada Inc.

Statement of Receipts and Disbursements For the Period September 17, 2021 to February 28, 2023

		TS

RECEIPTS		
Cash on hand - September 17, 2021	\$	1,757,285
August 2021 Revenue		444,294
Sale of asset - Kia Sportage		19,000
GST Net	-	946
Collection of prepaid expenses		37,930
Insurance refund		5,070
Miscellaneous refunds		3,702
Interest earned		42,896
TOTAL RECEIPTS	\$	2,309,231
DISBURSEMENTS		
Dividend payments		207,662
Trustee fees/disbursements		277,892
Operating Expense		51,626
Deemed trust claim		25,165
Legal fees/disbursements		188,064
Other refunds - Crescent Point Energy		13,766
Post NOI Filing Source Deduction		13,845
Levy paid on dividend distribution		10,930
Rental expense		3,700
Accounting services		6,878
Auctioneer commission		395
Fees paid to official receiver		153
Payroll services re T4's		85
Repairs & maintenance		40
Bank charges		114
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS		800,317
Net Cash Receipts over Cash Disbursements		
represented by Cash in Bank	_	1,508,915

Appendix C

In the matter of the Division I Proposal of GS E&R Canada Inc. Summary of Professional Fees and Disbursements for the period January 6, 2021 to February 28, 2023

MNP Ltd. - Trustee

					Total before			
Invoice Number	Description	Fe	es	Disbursements	GST	GST	Inv	oice Total
9729422	Fees to April 7, 2021	\$	45,114.75	-	45,114.75	2,255.74	\$	47,370.49
9824218	Fees to April 30, 2021		13,300.00	13.09	13,313.09	665.65		13,978.74
9892295	Fees to June 8, 2021		28,020.75	11.86	28,032.61	1,401.63		29,434.24
9924448	Fees to June 30, 2021		18,040.50	-	18,040.50	902.02		18,942.52
9958015	Fees to July 31, 2021		19,135.25	-	19,135.25	956.76		20,092.01
9992202	Fees to August 31, 2021		31,639.50	1,828.18	33,467.68	1,673.38		35,141.06
Trustee fees and o	lisbursements paid directly by							
GS E&R Canada L	td.		155,250.75	1,853.13	157,103.88	7,855.19		164,959.07
10064903	Fees to October 31, 2021		88,049.20	-	88,049.20	4,402.46		92,451.66
10159137	Fees to January 15, 2022		80,464.80	288.63	80,753.43	4,037.67		84,791.10
10250974	Fees to March 16, 2022		23,533.00	-	23,533.00	1,176.65		24,709.65
10403320	Fees to April 30, 2022		11,889.00	-	11,889.00	594.45		12,483.45
10469614	Fees to May 31, 2022		8,625.20	-	8,625.20	431.26		9,056.46
10503220	Fees to June 30, 2022		11,601.00	-	11,601.00	580.05		12,181.05
10539661	Fees to July 31, 2022		2,905.00	-	2,905.00	145.25		3,050.25
10628241	Fees to August 31, 2022		19,071.50		19,071.50	953.58		20,025.08
10628254	Fees to September 30, 2022		5,228.00		5,228.00	261.40		5,489.40
10751409	Fees to December 31, 2022		26,237.00		26,237.00	1,311.85		27,548.85
Trustee fees and o	lisbursements paid by Trustee							
with enhanced po	wers		277,603.70	288.63	277,892.33	13,894.62		291,786.95
10829803 Trustee fees and c	Fees to February 28, 2023 disbursements paid by Trustee		27,097.00	14.00	27,111.00	1,355.55		28,466.55
	wers subsequent to February 28, 2023	\$	27,097.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 27,111.00	\$ 1,355.55	\$	28,466.55
Total Trustee fees	and disbursements	\$	459,951.45	\$ 2,155.76	\$ 462,107.21	\$ 23,105.36	\$	485,212.57

COURT FILE NUMBER

25-2719774

COURT

COURT OF KING'S BENCH OF

ALBERTA

JUDICIAL CENTRE

CALGARY

IN THE MATTER OF THE NOTICE

OF INTENTION TO MAKE A

PROPOSAL OF GS E&R CANADA

INC.

APPLICANT

MNP LTD., IN ITS CAPACITY AS

TRUSTEE UNDER THE NOTICE OF

INTENTION TO MAKE A

PROPOSAL OF GS E&R CANADA INC. AND NOT IN ITS PERSONAL

CAPACITY

DOCUMENT

AFFIDAVIT OF RICHARD

ANDERSON

DATED

March 20, 2023

ADDRESS FOR SERVICE AND CONTACT INFORMATION OF PARTY FILING THIS DOCUMENT

AFFIDAVIT OF RICHARD ANDERSON

Sworn on March 20, 2023

I, Richard Anderson, of the City of Calgary, in the Province of Alberta, Insolvency Practitioner, MAKE OATH AND SAY THAT:

- 1) I am a vice-president of MNP Ltd. and a Licensed Insolvency Trustee and have been informed about the day-to-day administrative work in relation to the Notice of Intention to Make a Proposal of GS E&R Canada Inc.,(the "Company") and, as such, have personal knowledge of the matters herein deposed to except where stated to be based on information and belief in which case I do verily believe same to be true.
- 2) The Trustee's detailed billings for the Company, for the period January 6, 2021 to February 28, 2023 (the "Invoices") are attached as Exhibit "A" to this Affidavit. The Trustee notes as follows with respect to the Invoices:
 - a) In relation to fees, the rates and charges applied are the normal rates and charges of personnel employed by MNP Ltd. The rates and ranges for the period of engagement are as follows:

	HOURLY RATE
CLASSIFICATION	(\$)
Administration	230 - 260
Analysts and Consultants	215 - 370
Managers	385 - 480
Partners	660 - 760

- b) The total amount due pursuant to the Invoices is \$485,212.57, which can be broken down as professional fees of \$459,951.45, actual out of pocket disbursements of \$2,155.76 and GST of \$23,105.36.
- 3) I make this Affidavit in support of the Trustee's application for approval of its fees.

SWORN BEFORE ME at the City of)
Calgary, in the Province of Alberta)
This 20th day of March, 2023)

A Commissioner of Oaths in and for The Province of Alberta

Richard Anderson

Exhibit A

THIS IS EXHIBIT ""
referred to in the Affidavit of
Richard Anderson
Sworn before me this March 20,700
day of A.D. 20.25
aay of
A Commissioner for Oaths
in and for the Province of Alberta

GURSIMREN DHILLON

A Commissioner for Oaths In and for the Province of Alberta My Commission Expires January 17, 20



Invoice Number:

9729422

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

Apr 7 2021

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS ER for the period January 6 - April 7, 2021

45,114.75

Goods & Services Tax:

2,255.74

Total (CAD):

47,370.49

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

GS ER - Division I Proposal For the Period January 6 - April 7, 2021

Date	Hours	Rate //	Amount	Description
18-Mar-2021 Gord Neudorf	08. 80.	660.00	528.00 528.00	
16-Feb-2021 Terra Klassen 01-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen	1.00		385.00 288.75	Meeting with company, Karen and Vic for direction on filing Meeting with team regarding NOI filing scheduled for March 8th, 2021, REview documents that were emailed in for insurance to check for adequate coverage, email Vic to advise what coverage they currently have
02-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen	3.00		1,155.00	
10-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen	1.50		577.50	make sense Input all of the creditors into Ascend, saving documents on N drive and separating the pdf's as per Vic. Emailed with Vic to confirm we have everything to file NOI tomorrow after going through file on N drive and verifying Ascend. Advised we are missing PPSA, pulled PPSA and found 3 secured creditors. Vic emailed Jungho to show them what the search found.
11-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen	4.00		1,540.00	Get Consent to act signed by Vic, Review cashflow statement and send email for confirmation of 7 items, Speak with Vic to confirm there was nothing else we needed confirmation on for the cashflow, Prepare the Ascend file for filing the NOI. Ran into items floor eached out to OCB to not finised out.
12-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen	3.00		1,155.00	
12-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen	1.00		385.00	
15-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen	2.00		770.00	
16-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen	6.50		2,502.50	
17-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen	3.50		1,347.50) Set meeting with Vic to go over report, revise report based off Rick's comments, revise report after Vic's comments, reformat report for Vic, meet with Vic to go through report and work on cashflow comments within report with Vic. Read all emails that were received today and update report based off legal counsel's changes
18-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen	4.00		1,540.00	Finish off cash flow summary, send email to Jungho to sign cash flow, work with Vic to finish First report and develop cashflow summary, email Gord the report for review, call Louise at the OR to get update on ther OR Certificate. Spoke with OR, received new filing certificate, emailed to Jungho, send cashflow, notes and form 30 for Jungho to sign, sent form 29 for Vic to sign. Finished Supplemental report and sent everything off to Wendy to prepare for court filing. Waiting on cashflow and notes to be resigned by Jungho. received signed cashflow and notes all executed and e-filed along with form 29 and form 30
18-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen 19-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen 22-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen	1.00 .50 .2.00		385.00 192.50 770.00	

24-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen 4.00 25-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen .50 29-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen 1.50 30-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen .30 31-Mar-2021 Terra Klassen .30 43.55 385.00 06-Jan-2021 Victor Kroeger .50 14-Feb-2021 Victor Kroeger 1.00 22-Feb-2021 Victor Kroeger 1.50 24-Feb-2021 Victor Kroeger 1.50 10-Mar-2021 Victor Kroeger 2.00 10-Mar-2021 Victor Kroeger 2.00 12-Mar-2021 Victor Kroeger 2.00 12-Mar-2021 Victor Kroeger 3.00	1,540.00 192.50 577.50 577.50 115.50 16,766.75 330.00 1,650.00 660.00 990.00 1,320.00 1,320.00	Back to back meetings with company as well as lawyers and BCOGC, work on preparing the bank reconciliations for the company to make this easier for them to follow and complete weekely. Bank balances not matching the original cashflow balance due to incorrect breakout. Correcting bank rec's to ensure the right amount are included in cashflow and variances explained due to incorrect breakout. Correcting bank rec's to ensure the right amount are included in cashflow and variances explained Go through emails, respond to Jungho in regards to timing of the cash flow reports Go through emails for GS E&R, review invoices over \$\$k, send email with view on invoices with no issues as well as invoice for invoices for Vic to review and email tolungho to request a missing invoice for review Verify that the cash flow is correct and balances to the projections and bank, ensure the variances are explained, email Jungho regarding proty taxes, Enquire from Vic if they should pay Property taxes Read and Respond to emails Correspondence with company question, review draft cash flow statement, attend call with company and \$tikemans Providing responses to company questions Providing responses to company questions Call with company; review information provided by company Preliminary work on filing Preliminary work on filing
1.50 1.50 1.50 30 43.55 43.55 1.00 1.00 1.50 1.50 1.50 1.50	192.50 577.50 577.50 115.50 16,766.75 330.00 1,650.00 660.00 660.00 660.00 990.00 1,320.00 1,320.00	
1.50 1.50 3.0 43.55 43.55 43.55 43.55 43.55 43.55 43.50 43.50	577.50 577.50 115.50 16,766.75 330.00 1,650.00 660.00 660.00 660.00 990.00 1,3320.00 1,3320.00	
1.50 30 43.55 43.55 1.00 1.50 1.50 1.50 1.50 1.50	115.50 16,766.75 330.00 1,550.00 660.00 660.00 990.00 1,320.00 1,320.00	
30 43.55 43.55 43.50 44 1.00 47 1.50 48 2.00 48 3.00	115.50 16,766.75 330.00 1,650.00 660.00 660.00 990.00 1,320.00 1,380.00	
43.55 .50 .50 .1.00 .1.00 .1.50 .2.00 3.00	330.00 1,650.00 660.00 990.00 990.00 1,320.00	
	1,320.00	
	1.980.00	
	1,320.00	
17-Mar-2021 Victor Kroeger 4.50	2,970.00	
18-Mar-2021 Victor Kroeger 3.50	2,310.00	
	00.099	
24-Mar-2021 Victor Kroeger 3.50	2,310.00	J/Cs T Klassen re weekly accounting, t/c company re critical suppliers. t/c BCOGC re update, t/c A Teasdale re critical suppliers. attend Court application
25-Mar-2021 Victor Kroeger 1.50	990.00	
	1,320.00	
29-Mar-2021 Victor Kroeger 1.00	00.099	
	00.099	
	00.099	Reply to numerous emails from Company; t/c with creditor
	1,320.00	Review and edit draft SISP; t/c T Pavic - Sayer; correspondence with Company
41.50 660.00	27,390.00	
		430.00 Preparing and mailing out Notice of Intention, drafting Affidavit of mailing
2.00 215.00	430.00	,

45,114.75

87.85

TOTAL



Invoice Number:

9824218

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

May 4 2021

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS ER for the period April 8 - April 30, 2021

13,300.00

Disbursements

13.09

Sub Total:

13,313.09

Goods & Services Tax :

665.65

Total (CAD):

13,978.74

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

GS ER - Division I Proposal	osal	3			
For the Period April 8 - April 30, 2021	April 30, 20	Houre	Date	Amount	Poveriesta
	2	cinon		AIIIOUIIL	Describrion
15-Apr-2021 Daniela Leon	uc	.80		172.00	172.00 SAGE GL code creation. Posting wire transfer Dec. 16 and March 10. Emails to Vic. Email to BMO to get March bank statement. Review to previous Ricks email.
15-Apr-2021 Daniela Leon	uc	.30		64.50	64.50 Cheque preparation. Posting transaction in SAGE.
	1	1.10	215.00	236.50	
08-Apr-2021 Reina Ainsworth	vorth	.40		86.00	86.00 Post documents to website.
09-Apr-2021 Reina Ainsworth	worth	.50		107.50	107.50 Post documents on website.
		.90	215.00	193.50	

2.00 1.00 1.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 1.00 1.50 1.50
8-Apr-2021 Victor Kroeger 12-Apr-2021 Victor Kroeger 13-Apr-2021 Victor Kroeger 13-Apr-2021 Victor Kroeger 14-Apr-2021 Victor Kroeger 15-Apr-2021 Victor Kroeger 19-Apr-2021 Victor Kroeger 19-Apr-2021 Victor Kroeger 26-Apr-2021 Victor Kroeger 26-Apr-2021 Victor Kroeger 26-Apr-2021 Victor Kroeger 26-Apr-2021 Victor Kroeger 30-Apr-2021 Victor Kroeger

21.50

Total

GS ER - Division I ProposalFor the Period April 8 - April 30, 2021DateNameAmount09-Apr-2021 Misc. Disbursements3.00 Paid to the Govern	Description Description Description 1597837 10.09 West Direct Courier Invoice 21637577 (Mar 25) - Transaction 1597837 3.00 Paid to the Government of Alberta Invoice 50098078 Mar 31/21 re: PPR -Transaction 16
--	---

3.00 Paid to the Government of Alberta Invoice 50098078 Mar 31/21 re: PPR -Transaction 1600074

Total

13.09



Invoice Number:

9892295

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

Jun 10 2021

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS ER for the period May 1 - June 8, 2021

28,020.75

Disbursements

11.86

Sub Total:

28,032.61

Goods & Services Tax:

1,401.63

Total (CAD):

29,434.24

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

GS FB - Division I Proposal			
For the Period May 1 - June 8, 2021			
Date Name	Units Rate	Amount	
11-May-2021 Rick Anderson	.60		291.00 Reports for extension application.
	.60 48	485.00	291.00
04-Jun-2021 Seamus Boyle	.75		288.75 Review file documents and trustee's reports and Ministry of finance proof of claim
		385.00	288.75
14-Mav-2021 Vanessa Allen	9.		396.00 Review and comment on Trustee's Second Report.
		660.00	936.00
03-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.00		1,320.00 Review weekly results, review correspondence re sales process, correspondence with A Teasdale re required Court report
05-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	3.00		1,980.00 Bi weekly update call with BCOGC, work on Court report
07-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	.50		
10-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.50		
11-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.50		1,650,00 Work on 2nd report, review Stikeman's draft application materials
13-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	4.00		
14-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	4.00		
1/-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		
18-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.00		
19-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.00		Listuing call with bedue, fortespondence with sayer;
21-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	7.00		
25-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	04. 0		33.U.U. Correspond with company to payment of the second of the company of the co
26-IVIAY-2021 VICTOR Kroeger	2.00		L., ZOLOO REVIEW WEEKS! IEDU III) alla Loi IESPOII a Will Collipaily. Neview alla collespoil a will Collipaily ie payables.
27-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	0ç.		Sabutu Correspondence with company;
28-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	T.00		
31-May-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.00		1,220,000 Prepare for an attend call with company, sayer and counse fe offers; review correspondence with Company, Deal with Officell Receiver re-Orders
OT-JUN-ZOZT VICTOR Kroeger	2.00		1,220.00 Neview Wenyl Februaris
02-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.50		Lybour Vergible for an attend and attend and with Bucket and lawyers te directly the Lybour Ferlives and A Teakare te Ories, yie b devisor te ories, and with the Control of Con
03-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		
04-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	T.00		1 370 AD DOES WILL TO THE CONTROL OF
07-Jun-2021 Victor Nroeger	7.00		Lyberton never when the month of the month o
US-JUN-ZUZT VICTOR NTGEBER		00 000	SCHOOL OPER WILL SAFEL BILD OFFICE STANDARD STAN
			00:004/07
04-May-2021 Wendy Locke	.50		107.50 File administration
11-May-2021 Wendy Locke	.40		86.00 Editing documents
14-May-2021 Wendy Locke	.40		86.00 Editing Second Report to the Court
18-May-2021 Wendy Locke	.50		107.50 Posting documents to website
20-May-2021 Wendy Locke	.40		86.00 Posting documents to website
27-May-2021 Wendy Locke	.40		86.00 Posting documents to website
31-May-2021 Wendy Locke	.40		86.00 Posting documents to website
	3.00 21	215.00	645.00
Total	44.95		28,020,75

GS ER - Division I Proposal For the Period May 1 - June 8, 2021

Description
Amount
Name
Date

07-May-2021 Misc. Disbursements

11.86 West Direct courier invoice 21649226 - Transaction 1602215

Total

11.86



Invoice Number:

9924448

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date :

Jul 5 2021

Invoice Terms: Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS ER for the period June 9 - June 30, 2021

18,040.50

Sub Total:

18,040.50

Goods & Services Tax:

902.02

Total (CAD):

18,942.52

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

For the Period June 9 - June 30, 2021	30, 2021		
Date Name	Units	Rate	Amount Description
14-Jun-2021 Daniela Leon	.10		21.50 Email to Vic.
15-Jun-2021 Daniela Leon	.20		43.00 Email to BMO follow up wire transfer, email to Vic and Tom.
16-Jun-2021 Daniela Leon	.40		86.00 Posting in SAGE wire transfer, email sent to Victor K.
16-Jun-2021 Daniela Leon	.20		43.00 Email sent to BMO as per Vic's information sent.
	.90	215.00	193.50
14-Jun-2021 Seamus Boyle	.20		80.00 Review and save proof of claim from Work safe BC
	.20	400.00	80.00
09-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.50		1,035.00 Call with Company and lawyers re offers; correspondence with Sayer
10-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		690.00 Correspondence with Sayer and company, review draft Stikeman email to BCOGC
15-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.00		1,380.00 eview BCOGC response, call with company and legal counsel, review & respond to company requests for payments
17-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.00		1,380.00 Review weekly reporting; review and provide comments to Stikemans re letter to BCOGC
18-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	3.00		2,070.00 Call with BCOGC, call with Stikemans & Lawson Lundell; call with Stikemans and company, call with Stikemans and Sayer; review information
21-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		690.00 Review corresponence with company, correspond with Stikemans
23-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.50		1,725.00 Review BCOGC proposal, t/c Stikemans, Sayer & Lawson Lundell re BCOGC and Bench Creek, review ench Creek financial information
24-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.00		1,380.00 Review weekly results and variance analysis
25-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	5.50		3,795.00 Draft 3rd report
28-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.50		1,035.00 Finalize report, t/c BCOGC and counsel
29-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.00		1,380.00 Review weekly reporting, review payment requests
30-Jun-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.50		1,035.00 Call with BCOGC re sale to Bench Creek, t/c K Fellowes & A Teasdale re potential sale, call with T Pavic re BCOGC conditions
	25.50	690.00	17,595.00
29-Jun-2021 Wendy Locke	.80		172.00 Posting documents to website
•	80	215.00	172.00

27.40

Total



Invoice Number:

9958015

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date :

Aug 4 2021

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS ER for the period July 1-31, 2021

19,135.25

Sub Total:

19,135.25

Goods & Services Tax:

956.76

Total (CAD):

20,092.01

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

GS ER - Division I Proposal For the Period July 1 - July 31, 2021

mount Description	53.75 Posting Journal deposit in SAGE 50 as per Rick's email, saving back up docs and filing in BMO folder.	64.50 SAGE General ledger report generated for Victor K.	118.25
Rate An			215.00
Hours R	.25	.30	55
Description	Janiela Leon	Janiela Leon	ı
Date	27-Jul-2021 Daniel	28-Jul-2021 Daniela Leon	

02-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		690.00 Attend extension Court application
05-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.50		1,725.00 Weekly financial review.
08-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		690.00 Call with K Fellowes & A Teasdale re proposal, review correspondence.
09-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		690.00 Review correspondence between Lawson Lundell & Stikemans
12-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.00		1,380,00 Review weekly reporting
13-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		690.00 Call with K Fellowes & A Teasdale re proposal, review proposed payments
14-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.50		1,725.00 Call with BCOGC, Potential purchaser, GS E&R and counsel, review corresponedence, communication with K Fellowes & A Teasdale
15-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		690.00 Review correspondence and deal with post filing of proposal plan
16-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		690.00 Review correspondence re BCOGC & Bench Creek;
19-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		690.00 Review invoice payment requests, review BCOGC/Bench Creek correspondence
21-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.50		1,035.00 Review draft escrow agreement and discuss changes with A Teasdale
22-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	3.50		2,415.00 Review amended draft Escrow agreement & T/c A Teasdale, review weekly variance reporting
23-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	2.00		1,380.00 Call with Stikemans & Lawson Lundell re agreement, correspondence with A Teasdale, review and comment on most recent draft of Escrow agreement
26-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	.50		345.00 Review payment requests
27-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	3.00		2,070.00 Work on 4th Court report
28-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		690.00 Deal with escrow agreements, review draft APA
29-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		690.00 Review draft escrow agreement re purchase deposit, review draft SAVO material and draft comments to A Teasdale
30-Jul-2021 Victor Kroeger	.50		345.00 Review sale documents and sign P&S Escrow agreement.
	27.00	690.00	18.630.00

172.00 File administration	Posting documents to website	107.50 Preparing bank deposit slip and bringing cheque to the bank		
172.00	107.50	107.50	387.00	
			215.00	
.80	.50	.50	1.80	
05-Jul-2021 Wendy Locke	06-Jul-2021 Wendy Locke	27-Jul-2021 Wendy Locke		

19,135.25

29.35

Total



Invoice Number:

9992202

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

Sep 1 2021

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS ER for the period August 1- 31, 2021

31,639.50

Disbursements

1,828.18

Sub Total:

33,467.68

Goods & Services Tax :

1,673.38

Total (CAD):

35,141.06

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

GS ER - Division I Proposal For the Period August 1 - August 31, 2021

Date Name Hours On Any Mane And Any	Hours	Rate	Amount Description Description STS For Enrostrad 4th range with amondicide and evilibits
US-Aug-2021 Alyssa Wells	30	225.00	67.50 To infacted and princed that is post to write apparature as and exhibits
13-Aug-2021 Daniela Leon 30-Aug-2021 Daniela Leon 30-Aug-2021 Daniela Leon	.10 .20 .20	225.00	22.50 SAGE report BMO General Trust account ledger for Rick A. 112.50 Posting wire transfer in SAGE, printing back up documents and filing them in Gen trust BMO, saving them in N drive. Email to Rick. 45.00 BMO General Trust July bank reconcialition, reports generation. 180.00
27-Aug-2021 Rick Anderson	.40	505.00	202.00 Draft wire for return of Agency funds.
30-Aug-2021 Sarah Forest	.20 .20	225.00	45.00 Teams meeting w/ Rick, Wendy & Daniela re new file set up in estates for retainer & general trust banking 45.00
13-Aug-2021 Seamus Boyle 16-Aug-2021 Seamus Boyle 17-Aug-2021 Seamus Boyle 18-Aug-2021 Seamus Boyle 19-Aug-2021 Seamus Boyle 23-Aug-2021 Seamus Boyle	.60 4.00 3.20 .40 .30 .25 8.75	400.00	240.00 Review statement of affairs figures and request import of figures into ascend 1,500.00 Review Trustee reports, correspondence with V Kroeger and W. Locke, review statement of affairs, prepare trustee's report on proposal 1,280.00 Prepare for e-filing, review of proposal and trustees report, prepare creditors package 1,200.00 Post amended creditors package to engagement website 1,200.00 Update to engagement webpage 3,500.00 3,500.00
03-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 04-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 05-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 06-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 09-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger	4.00 1.50 3.50 2.00 2.50		
10-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 11-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 12-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 16-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 17-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger	3.50 1.50 1.00 2.50 4.00		
18-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 19-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 21-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 24-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 25-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 27-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger 30-Aug-2021 Victor Kroeger	3.50 .50 1.00 1.00 3.00 1.50 2.00 2.00	8089	2,43.500 Newlew weekly reporting, answer questions re closing, review correspondence 355.00 Correspondence with Company re BCOGC payment 595.00 Correspondence with Company re BCOGC payment 690.00 Review and comment on closing documents as 690.00 Review and comment on closing documents of 2,070.00 Weekly review of results and correspondence with Company re various matters including forecasrt and municipal tax payment 1,285.00 Deal with sale closing matters, deal with payments 1,280.00 Weekly review of results
03-Aug-2021 Wendy Locke 10-Aug-2021 Wendy Locke 13-Aug-2021 Wendy Locke 16-Aug-2021 Wendy Locke 17-Aug-2021 Wendy Locke 18-Aug-2021 Wendy Locke	.50 .80 .50 .50 .50 .50 .50	225.00	112.50 Preparing WIP and draft invoice 180.00 Posting documents to website 112.50 Posting documents to website 112.50 Entering Assets and Liabilities into Ascend 490.00 E-filling documents with the OSB, mailing out creditors package 112.50 Posting documents to website 1.080.00

31,639.50

53.75

Total

GS ER - Division I Proposal For the Period August 1 - August 31, 2021

Description
Amount
Name
Date

19-Aug-2021 Misc. Disbursements

1,828.18 Photocopy Charge and Postage for mailout- Transaction 40362117

Total

1,828.18



Invoice Number:

10064903

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

Nov 4 2021

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS ER for the period September 1 - October 31, 2021

88,049.20

Sub Total:

88,049.20

Goods & Services Tax:

4,402.46

Total (CAD):

92,451.66

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

GS ER - Division I Proposal

75-101-101-101-101-101-101-101-101-101-10	1.00 352.00 1.00 225.00 1.00 352.00 1.00 352.00 2.0 352.00	Amount	Description
02-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 03-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 07-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 08-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	2.20 3.50 8.00 5.00	880.00 Discus 1,400.00 Prepar 3,200.00 Final d 2,000.00 Review form 4	88.00 Discussion with V.Kroeger regarding FMOC; review file to get up to date for the same 4,00.00 Discussion with V.Kroeger regarding FMOC; review file to get up to date for the same 4,00.00 Discussion with V.Kroeger representation from a package for many and ongoing voting letters to V.Kroeger for review plor to FMOC; review and 0.4.0.1.3 intendence list, minutes of the FMOC 5,20.00 Final drafts of communicate to date with legal course, invested with minutes claims before FMOC and enter into Accerd; antered and secretary FMOC, draft form 40, 40.1.3 intendence list, minutes of the FMOC 5,20.00 Final drafts of communicate to date with legal course, invested by a proof of claims as requested by Trustes courses 6,00.00 Review and final edits to be only part of the meeting of reading
09-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shelon 13-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shelon 13-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shelon 14-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shelon 15-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shelon 15-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shelon 17-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shelon 20-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shelon	.25 .50 .20 .20 .1.50 1.50 2.50 3.00		2000. Review claim received; update the same in Accord 2000. Review annealmented POC; update Accord 2000. Review on policy or the cord of the control of the
21-Sep-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 22-Sep-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 22-Sep-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 25-Sep-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 27-Sep-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 27-Sep-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	3.50 1.00 1.50 1.50 1.50	1,400,00 Contin (egard 400,00 Call W) (500,00 Call W) 100,00 Receiv (500,00 Reviev adjust	Confinete warms of suggeste the Islands with palmages to the payoff in control of part of the Islands and Permitina at BMO; review communication regarding behavior stated by the Islands adjustments; PC with BP and Permitina regarding the same; review POC's Call with BP end Creek re Aug revenues; review communication received from Jungho regarding the closing adjustment; pC with Vikroeger and A.T. To satis in eagranding the same; review POC's Call with BP end premiums; review communication received from Jungho regarding the closing adjustment; pC with Vikroeger and earliers to be a same the funds to us; review and earliers to the mail re-directs set up bank accounts in ascend Receive we additional POC's; same as server Receive we additional POC's; same saverer Receive we additional POC's; same saverer Receive we additional POC's; same saverer Adjustments to ensure funds for Vikroeger Adjustments from the Reseive we man adjustment to pay for ROE/T/15 from paywork; review enail regarding closing adjustments, remarked finding for Vikroeger Communication with Jungho regarding tenancy at the effect; communication with TO regarding account balance, review account transactions; PC with AT ossable regarding the Bench Creek adjustment; enament man and adjustment; enament with a properties of the effect; communication with Payworks regarding the wire
29-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 50-5ep-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 64-0ct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 65-0ct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 66-0ct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 67-0ct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	2.50 1.50 3.00 1.00 1.00	1,000.00 Contin Whe to to 600.00 Discus 1,200.00 Draft 400.00 Finalt 400.00 Readit 400.00 Readit 616cus 500.00 Compi	Transfer, discherior regaling with Vertication with Hyboron regarding outstanding service providers Continue to work with Psywork's regarding the Wire transfer to clear account bilance; pull bank statement from BMO re the same; P/C to Bench Creek, Pembina and BP regarding Aug, revenue as GS has still not received; call with creditor regarding POC filled; confirm wire transfer information for receiving funds from TD; discussions with CRA auditor. Discussions with Pregarding aben for each Aug revenue adjustment; review and approved; discussions regarding so GN and Court fee Finalize monthly report for monthly monitoring; circulate to GS ERR contacts, answer questions regarding payroll audit; communication with payworks and direct payment of the same Finalize monthly proport for monthly monitoring; circulate to GS ERR contacts, answer questions regarding payroll audit; communication with bench Creek regarding the Pembina August revenue; Receip for milities involved presyment; begin standing the remaining prepaid sustanding. Compile list of bill payment requisitions for once the funds are received from TD; communication with TD account regarding with TD account regarding with TD account regarding with TO account requisitions for nonce the funds are received from TD.

300.00 Confirm funds have been wired from TO to truste account; review and direct coding for deposit;
200.00 Review bank account to confirm receipt of funds; direct Witoke to pay the same; conversation with Bench Creek regarding outstanding BC levy payments; review rental payment for October; submit for payment of the same
400.00 Review bank account to confirm receipt of funds; direct Witoke to pay the same; conversation with Accounts to Calculate the Bull payment of the same; drafting mid month report to HQ; review outstanding pre4,000.00 Discussion with A.Tassdale regarding collection refract; compile necessary information to support the demand letters; sond to A.Tassdale regarding the same; drafting mid month report to HQ; review outstanding payment AR for status, discuss move forward plan re the same; conversation with L.Avery regarding Pliney Bowes collection notice, which relates to invoices post cancellation, direction of the same; conversation with L.Avery regarding Pliney Bowes collection notice, which relates to invoices post cancellation, direction of the same; drawned conversation with L.Avery regarding Pliney Bowes collection notice, which relates to invoices post cancellation, direction of the same; conversation with L.Avery regarding Pliney Bowes collection notice, which relates to invoices post cancellation, direction of the same; conversation with L.Avery regarding Pliney Bowes collection notice, which relates to invoices post cancellation, direction of the same; conversation with L.Avery and J.Park to organize pick up of remaining

.75 .50 1.00 2.50

08-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 12-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 13-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 14-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon

3.50 1.50 7.50

15-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 18-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 250 .50 2.00

19-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 20-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 21-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 22-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 25-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 26-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 27-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 28-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 29-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon 29-Oct-2021 Jacqueline Shellon

documentation

1,400.00 Tavel in siste, escordilation to Accend accounts and TD; email communication to A.Teasdale regarding updates for the report, organize records take over and location clean out for next week; review invoices received from creditor regarding conference or confirm these accounts were cancelled; communication with provider to cancel accounts and notify bench Creek of the same 600.00 P/C with A.Teasdale regarding mid month report, circulate; review poc from previous employee and 600.00 P/C with A.Teasdale regarding mid month update to HCI. Review closing adjustment storedscheet for Wide Sky Disposal Invoce from March; email with BP regarding Sept revenues; final review of mid month report, circulate; review poc from previous employee and fenced must be a seption of the transmit micromorphic provide back printed manufaction regarding Sept revenues; final reviews et of fire Gastield and Energet pre paid demand; provide backup information regarding Gastields calm; askeever of records; inventory of records; arrange pick up with courier and shred company; email communication with Wide Sky Disposal regarding organizes at Fort Neison; email communication with Wide Sky Disposal regarding organizes at Fort Neison; email communication with Wide Sky Disposal regarding organizes.

100.00 Review incoming invoices from Pitney Bowes; direction of payment of the same; email to Gasfield regarding dartification of the right to set off and information request for POC and prepayment funds
1,000.00 Review without strom Hot Mids Comber reporting; recording that same, updating payes to Bench Crock
2,000.00 Review defined by Sposal) regarding the same, updating payes to Bench Crock
2,000.00 Review defanal to Bench Crock to Aug revenues; provide comment on the same
8,000.00 Review defanal to Bench Crock to Aug revenues; provide comment on the same
8,000.00 Review defanal to Bench Crock to Aug revenue; and it to 1,2 Park regarding Aug revenue adjustment relating to Pembina; revisions to the Demand to Bench Crock; follow up email to Gasfield re repayment AR; circulate final demand letter to A.Teasdale, PC with Gasfield regarding Quiting POC.

800.00 Final draft of Demand to Beach Creek for PEnblan funds, diroulate the same; email communication with J.Pak regarding employee claim for severance; review records of the company pertaining to the same; discussion with V.Kroger re disallowance; dark followance regarding the same and some severance; and the same services of the same severance; review the same and update sacend consistence of the same services of the same

1.75 50 1.00 76.65

111.00 Call with Jackle and emails to/from Jackle re: possession on Monday	. 1,350.00 Posterion, to and from a tiet, moving inventory. Figuring out how to and requesting and gaining access to Pandell 7,40.00 Mail redirect school and first are posts fiftee.		370.00 Further drafting and send of TD letter. Reading through correspondance	1,036.00 Getting bank letter signed and sending to Wendy, Pulling Pandell reports, figuring out pandel software, typing out pandell access instructions, responding to lack letter signed and sending to Wendy, Pulling Pandell reports, figuring out pandel software	740.00 Pulling Pandell reports, figuring out pandell software, typing out pandell access instructions, responding to Jackle, looking up pre-paid returns and looking into effect versus the software	83.2.5 Looking into employee/contractor claims, researching the proposal amounts owed for recalculation, discussion with Jackle and others about the way to freat this, input ing the information, rollowing up with prepaids discussion with Jackle	259.00 Reaching out to non-replies about pre-paid refunds	666.00 Updaing claims tracker and sscend and writing back to creditors with updates to their claims. Initial look into Wiee Sky and calling fornouses.	185.00 Reaching out to Hyewoon for records pickup, Updating Jackie on pre-paid relimbursement companies and responses and relimburing up furtner, cooking into Pol-s received	370.00 Looking through Pandei for vendor information for reedie for Wendy to Send	5,188.00 Reguland's PCOS visit what its missing, cal with Lindsey, Frankin Lindson, Heiner, Lindson, Bonding Control and State Control and	25500 Longing Blue December 15 to 15		629.00 Goordinating for Items needed for tomorrow's possession, call with Jackle, disc. w/ creditor Frazer		740.00 Preparing documents for shredit and tippett frichardson, looking at some claims as they come in, call with contractor creditor, finalizing GS E&R records and inputting into server, all with Jackle	1,480.00 To-five shreders and street new Discussion with Lungho, looking through one basts of off lits, returning files to MAP office. Related deskwork once back. Emailing a vendor for account cancellation and pursuant main about payments prior to a cancellation. Both rough severe and one soon for the payments prior to a cancellation between the payments prior to a cancellation between and one soon for the payments prior to	185 On Residing themse Seamed findings on taling review. clic.w/Jackie, Looking into and emailing Jackie about 8C ministry question	185. On Die w. I achde en mit reeding mit op en mit	מבטוב ובי לתו מבתום	MICES .	151.50 Planning for possession of blooks and records.	202.00 open trust accounts.	333.50	62.00 cet un & transfered fealmer file to estates. Inked to corporate general trust account	20 Assume and II I seldence continued to the continued to	Jacob calculation, tears that will attack re disbursements and which form to use for DN I SRDs	310,00	AS AS A LACE A SECURITY OF A S	Zduou Opdate to engagement webpage, save and revew on cannot be used to the cannot be us	150,00 Emil 10 J. Shellon Re: He was a minerant of proposal	200 O DESIGNATOR POR INTERIOR RECEIVED SECURITY LIBRERS SECURITY LIBRERS SECURITY LIBRERS SECURITY LIBRERS SECURITY LIBRERS SECURITY CONTRACTOR POR SECURITY AND ADMINISTRATION OF THE PROPERTY OF THE PROPERT	2000. Delater Hosters in acceptance of the second of the s	Jobbs of the Common Legislane Common		80.00 Review payrol examination statement of account and provide instruction	280.00 Correspondence with BC ministry of finance and prepare application for PST account	400.00 Claims review and provide comments to team	2,550,00
	5.00	2.00			2.00	2.25	.70	1.80	.50	1.00			57.7	1.70			4.00	9	i r	370.00	2/0.0/6	.30	.40	.70 505.00	20	9 6	os:	1.00 310.00		.60	.40	1.00	oc.	200	1.50	.20	.70	1.00	6.45 400.00
16-Sep-2021 Lucas Avery 17-Sep-2021 Lucas Avery	20-Sep-2021 Lucas Avery	27-Sep-2021 Lucas Avery	28-Sep-2021 Lucas Avery	29-Sep-2021 Lucas Avery	30-Sep-2021 Lucas Avery	06-Oct-2021 Lucas Avery	07-Oct-2021 Lucas Avery	08-Oct-2021 Lucas Avery	12-Oct-2021 Lucas Avery	13-Oct-2021 Lucas Avery	14-Oct-2021 Lucas Avery	15-Oct-2021 Lucas Avery	18-Oct-2021 Lucas Avery	19-Oct-2021 Lucas Avery	20-Oct-2021 Lucas Avery	21-Oct-2021 Lucas Avery	22-Oct-2021 Lucas Avery	Secure Assess Assess	23-Oct 2021 Lucas Avery	7/-Oct-2021 Lucas Avery		16-Sep-2021 Rick Anderson	21-Sep-2021 Rick Anderson		01-Sen-2021 Sarah Forest	מייייייייייייייייייייייייייייייייייייי	25-Sep-2021 Sarah Forest			01-Sep-2021 Seamus Boyle	03-Sep-2021 Seamus Boyle	07-Sep-2021 Seamus Boyle	U8-Sep-ZOZI Seamus Boyle	05-Oct-2021 Seamus Boyle	18-Oct-2021 Seamus Boyle	21-Oct-2021 Seamus Boyle	22-Oct-2021 Seamus Boyle	25-Oct-2021 Seamus Boyle	

09-Sep-2021 Valentina Naranjo Garcia	.10		22.50 Pul	Pulled CBB on 2017 Kla Sportage as per Vic and replied to his emall
	10	225 00	22 50	
	21:	22.00	2	
1				

	690,00 Get ready for creditors' meeting, collect PolGs	2,070.00 Prepare for creditor's moeting	4,140,00 Prepare for and Chair creditor's meeting; correspond with Company; correspond with A Teasdale	2,760,00 Finalize all documents for Court Sanction application	1,035.00 Review company's sanction application filing material, correspond with Company re vehicle	690.00 Deal with vehicle, review filed Court documents	1,380.00 Weekly reporting review	690,00 Draft letter to Company	1,380.00 Call with Company re handover, deal with handover Issues	1,725.00 Attend Court, attend to final takeover tasks	2,415.00 Review weekly results, deal with taking over management of the Company	1,380,00 Deal with payroll company, set up banking, review correspondence rfrom Enbrigdge re Aug usuage, review correspondence re directors and change of registered office, deal with Sportage sale, discussions with J Shellon re collecting Aug revenues	1,380.00 Deal with post sanction order issues like change of registered office, change in directors, bank accounts, Aug revenue, call with A Tossdale & Jackle Shelion no Aug revenue issue	690.00 Deal with payrol I vendor, review correspondence	690.00 Deal with payroll information, deal with creditors	690,00 Review reporting request, ‡/c.J shelion re outline of report, review corresponce with A Teasdale	690,00 Work with J Shelon on monthly reporting to parent company.	690,00 Flanlize monthly update, review correspondence from A Teasdale	345.00 Correspondence re post filing creditors	690,00 Deal with post filing creditor claims, review correspondence from J Park	690.00 Deal with post filing payments	690,00 Sign cheques	345.00 Correspondence with J Shellon re AR
2.50	1.00	3.00	6.00	4.00	1.50	1.00	2.00	1.00	2.00	2.50	3.50	2.00	2.00	1.00	1.00	1.00	1.00	1.00	.50	1.00	1.00	1.00	.50
01-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	02-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	03-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	07-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	08-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	09-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	10-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	13-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	15-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	16-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	17-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	20-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	21-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	22-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	24-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	27-Sep-2021 Victor Kroeger	01-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger	04-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger	05-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger	06-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger	08-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger	12-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger	13-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger	14-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger

345.00 Finalize report to HQ	Re collecton of prepayments, deal with old file records	Calls with J Shellon, review payment requests	Review response to HQ queries, deal with post filing creditor claims.	Deal with receivables	345.00 Correspond with J Shellon re proofs of claim	690.00 Deal with PoCs		112.50 Sending creditors meeting invite out	Posting documents to website	File maintenance	File maintenance, posting documents to website	Revising documents	Posting documents on website	Preparing bank deposit slip and bringing cheque to bank for deposit	Preparing wire transfer request, sending for approval and faxing to BMO for payment	File maintenance	Preparing wire transfer request, sending for approval and faxing to BMO for payment	Preparing deposit slip for cheque, bringing to bank	Preparing cheques to pay involces and sending for approval	Preparing deposit silp for cheque, bringing to bank	File maintenance	Preparing deposit silp for cheque, bringing to bank	180.00 File maintenance	180.00 File maintenance			
345.00 F	690.00 F	00.069	690.00 F	345.00	345.00	690.00	33,465.00	112.50 §	112.50 F	180.00	180.00 F	180.00 F	180.00 F	180.00	180.00	112.50 F	180.00	180.00	180.00	180.00	180.00	180.00	180.00	180.00	2,857.50	88,049.20	
							690.00																		225.00	ı	
.50	1.00	1.00	1.00	.50	.50	1.00	48.50	.50	.50	.80	.80	.80	.80	.80	.80	.50	.80	.80	.80	.80	.80	.80	.80	.80	12.70	195.30	
18-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger	20-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger	21-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger	22-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger	26-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger	27-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger	28-Oct-2021 Victor Kroeger		07-Sep-2021 Wendy Locke	09-Sep-2021 Wendy Locke	10-Sep-2021 Wendy Locke	16-Sep-2021 Wendy Locke	20-Sep-2021 Wendy Locke	22-Sep-2021 Wendy Locke	24-Sep-2021 Wendy Locke	27-Sep-2021 Wendy Locke	29-Sep-2021 Wendy Locke	05-Oct-2021 Wendy Locke	08-Oct-2021 Wendy Locke	13-Oct-2021 Wendy Locke	14-Oct-2021 Wendy Locke	15-Oct-2021 Wendy Locke	19-Oct-2021 Wendy Locke	20-Oct-2021 Wendy Locke	27-Oct-2021 Wendy Locke		Total	



Invoice Number:

10159137

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

Jan 28 2022

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS ER for the period of November 1, 2021 to January 15, 2022.

80,464.80

Disbursements

288.63

Sub Total:

80,753.43

Goods & Services Tax:

4,037.67

Total (CAD):

84,791.10

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

GS E&R Canada Inc. - Division I Proposal For the Period November 1, 2021 to January 15, 2022

Date	House	Date	Amount	Document
7 7	2 2	nate.	4 077 TO	
UI-NOV-ZUZI VICTOR Kroeger	05.1		06.760,1	Keview creditor POC listing, review draft month end report
02-Nov-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		705.00	Deal with correspondence with Company
03-Nov-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		705.00	Deal with HQ's queries, correspond with J Shellon re various file matters
04-Nov-2021 Victor Kroeger	0.50		352.50	Re accounting issues
09-Nov-2021 Victor Kroeger	0.50		352.50	Discussion with J Shellon re claims
10-Nov-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.50		1,057.50	Review draft Court Report, correspondence with creditors
11-Nov-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.50		1,057.50	Review of next draft of Court reports, review mid month report to HQ.
22-Nov-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		705.00	Review and finalize Court reports
23-Nov-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		705.00	Deal with creditor claims
30-Nov-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		705.00	Review draft HQ reporting letter and provide comments
14-Dec-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		705.00	Review draft report to HQ; discuss options with J Shellon
17-Dec-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.00		705.00	Review HQ requests and draft response
21-Dec-2021 Victor Kroeger	0.50		352.50	Review ability to repay shareholder
22-Dec-2021 Victor Kroeger	1.50		1,057.50	Correspondence with Company counsel, deal with claims
03-Jan-2022 Victor Kroeger	1.00		705.00	Work on end of month report to HQ
04-Jan-2022 Victor Kroeger	2.00		1,410.00	Call with A Teasdale & J Shellon re Court application, review information re Court application
05-Jan-2022 Victor Kroeger	2.50		1,762.50	Call with Stikeman's and Lawson Lundell re Court application, work on Court report
06-Jan-2022 Victor Kroeger	1.50		1,057.50	Work on next draft of Court report, correspondence with Lawson Lundell re application and distribution
07-Jan-2022 Victor Kroeger	2.00		1,410.00	Work on drafts of Court report, review draft application material, review Stikeman email.
10-Jan-2022 Victor Kroeger	1.50		1,057.50	Work on report with J Shellon and A Teasdale, review and comment on draft report
11-Jan-2022 Victor Kroeger	1.00		705.00	Finalize report
15-Jan-2022 Victor Kroeger	0.50		352.50	Review and provide comments on the Jan 15 report to HQ
	26.50	705.00	18,682.50	
				Discussion w/ Jacqueline & Rick re: repayment/dividend implications, suggest discussing with Affan
15-Dec-2021 Jeff Trost	0.20		88.00	Khalid re: payment of dividend to non-resident
10-Jan-2022 Jeff Trost	0:30		132.00	Emails with Joseph re EL, review letter
	0.50	440.00	220.00	
02-Nov-2021 Seamus Boyle	0.20		103.00	Respond to question re: PST returns
05-Nov-2021 Seamus Boyle	0.20		103.00	Review claims review documentation and respond to question from J. Shellon
02-Dec-2021 Seamus Boyle	0.20		103.00	Discussion with J. Shellon re: PST reporting requirements
04-Jan-2022 Seamus Boyle	0.20		103.00	Discussion with J. Shellon re: PST on Oil and gas operations
	0.80	515.00	412.00	

01-Nov-2021 Ligas Avery	0.20	00 99	emails received and looking for bank statement
02-Nov-2021 Lucas Avery	1.50	495.00	
03-Nov-2021 Lucas Avery	1.00	330.00	
16-Nov-2021 Lucas Avery	2.75	907.50	Looking through Pandell and cross-referencing to BC OGC invoices and POC received, emailing BC Carbon Tax. undating Jackie
17-Nov-2021 Lucas Avery	1.00	330.00	
23-Nov-2021 Lucas Avery	09.0	198.00	Initial look into of new Pandell access (reading/understanding emails), answering Jackie's questions on BC Finance account
24-Nov-2021 Lucas Avery	0.70	231.00	Following instructions and Attempts to sign into Pandell on new users, issues and email to customer service
25-Nov-2021 Lucas Avery	1.10	363.00	Calls with Rick Bechthold re: GST audit, call with Albert LaRocque per Rick's advice and asked about GST audit. Call with BC PST ministry and relaying information to Jackie. Emails with BC Min of Finance
26-Nov-2021 Lucas Avery	0.75	247.50	
29-Nov-2021 Lucas Avery	0.70	231.00	Calling creditor back and discussion around it. Getting into Pandell after receiving new password. BC Fin emails
30-Nov-2021 Lucas Avery	0.30	00.66	Calling back creditor inquiring about dividend, emails with Pandell
16-Dec-2021 Lucas Avery	3.50	1,155.00	Looking into POC's for final review, correspondence with Jackie
17-Dec-2021 Lucas Avery	0.20	00.99	Discussion re: potential GST audit
21-Dec-2021 Lucas Avery	0.50	165.00	Filing/addressing mail
21-Dec-2021 Lucas Avery	0.50	165.00	Pull share capital ledger from Pandell
			Discussion with Jackie, subsequent checks and filing. Disc. re BC invoices. Calling bc forest and email to
22-Dec-2021 Lucas Avery	2.80	924.00	Jackie. Updating POC status for creditor. Visa credit disc.bank rec disc. Attempt to return modem. Call
			with Shaw to cancel, on hold. Call with Jackie. Letter to Shaw draft, review, compiling, and fax
23-Dec-2021 Lucas Avery	1.60	528.00	Call with Pitney Bowes to get return charge dropped, returning Shaw modem with many roadblocks along the way. Looking through Pandell for better SC report and discussing with Jackie
30-Dec-2021 Lucas Avery	1.50	495.00	Bank Recs for accounts for 2 months, figuring it out for a new one, secured pdfs. Pulling reports from Pandell for tax return
04-Jan-2022 Lucas Avery	2.00	00.099	Looking through Pandell for reports related to invoices to Pembina, BP. Looking for cash proof of SC injections
10-Jan-2022 Lucas Avery	0.50	165.00	looking into POC for Jackie, discussion with Jackie and email to BC Finance
11-Jan-2022 Lucas Avery	09.0	198.00	-
	1	1	
12-Jan-2022 Lucas Avery	3./5	1,237.50	proof of sale for BC Carbon. Calling CRA for waiver of GSI audit, calling Pitney Bowes re: credit position result - no refund available. Upload of court documents to website
13-Jan-2022 Lucas Avery	0.70	231.00	_
	28.75 33	330.00 9,487.50	
20-Nov-2021 Vanessa Allen	0.70	493.50) Second partner review of report.

nolled anilement 1505-40-85	0.50	205.00 DC with A/Teasdale re employee claim and necessary information to accept or disallow
01-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	4.00	1,640.00 employee termination; pull ROE from Payworks regarding the same; email to WCB regarding past due notice
02-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	0.50	205.00 Final review of monthly report and circulation Continued conversations with J. Park and S.Sandau re employee claim; continue to work with Payworks
03-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	3.00	1,230.00 regarding ROE and determination of the employee/contractor rights; review paystubs in determination of the same; respond to inquiries by HQ regarding month end reporting; discussions with L.Avery re Pitney
04-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	0.50	bowes machine taken by Bench Creek; Communication regarding cancellation of Shaw service at the office; arrange for courier to pick up the same; call to CRA to follow up on GST audit
05-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	2.50	the same; follow up with A.Teasdale regarding Bench Creek demand letter and non receipt of funds; 1,025.00 review and summarize findings from Trust audit for V.Kroger review; review Proposal for treatment of
		Crown claims; book court date for application against Bench Creek for Aug revenues; begin drafting the
08-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	0.25	report on the same, 102.50 Email to J. Park re CRA audit; emails to V.Kroger regarding employee claim;
10-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	2.75	1,127.50 Draft 6th report to the court, email with H.Lee regarding termination payment DC with 4 Tassdala regarding 6th report, complete revisions of the same draft the Confidential
12-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	5.00	Supplement to the 6th report; compile all exhibits to the reports and circulate the reports to V.Kroger for review; draft mid month reporting for HO, circulate to V.Kroger for review; finalize 6th report and
15-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	0.50	Confidential Supplement to 6th report; circulate to A.Teasdale for review; 205.00 First draft of mid month report; circulate to legal counsel for review and comment
16-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	3.50	finalize and circulate final mid month report, Draft Affidavit for operations manager, send to A.Teasdale for review and comment, draft disallowance for creditors claim, send to V.Kroger for review; email to J. 1,435.00 Park regarding outstanding CRA matters; email communication with land consultant for Bench Creek
17-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	0.50	regarding outstanding information email to Pandell regarding current account 205.00 Email to Bench Creek re BC Ministry of Finance Carbon Registered Consumer account;
18-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	1.25	512.50 Respond to queries from HQ; emails with A.Teasdale re creditor disallowance and Affidavit;
19-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	2.25	PC with Land Consultant re Yes energy document; email to L.Avery regarding outstanding CRA issues and direction to address the same; emails with legal counsel and operations manager re disallowance and affidavit,PC with WCB re closing file; pull final payroll from payroll software; send information
20-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	0.50	requested to WCB re Proposal and final payroll 205.00 Final review from legal of application material; submit 6th report for second partner review;
22-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	1.75	

0.70 705.00 493.50

		PC with BC O&G commission regarding outstanding accounts and payments made; review file and GL for
23-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	0.75	307.50 the same; discussion with V.Kroger re the same; provide direction to BC O&G commission re the same; email communication with Pandell regarding cost savings for account;
25-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	0.75	S07.50 Final review of Affidavit of Sheldon Sandau; final adjustments to a claim Disallowance; direction of mailing registered mail of the same;
26-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	0.25	Email to BC O&G commission re payments of outstanding production revenue; email to TD to confirm status of accounts; submit legal invoice for payment;
29-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	1.75	Draft month end reporting, circulate for review; conversation with A.Teasdale re funds from Bench Creek re Pembina; follow up email with J. Park regarding direction to YES energy;
30-Nov-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	3.75	1,537.50 Finalize monthly reporting; compile month end statement of receipts and disbursement; submit for final review to V.Kroger; updates to SRD; PC with Gov of BC re PST account set up;
01-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	2.75	Reconciliation of GS1 and PS1 relating to Aug revenues; adjustment to month end reporting; PC with GOV of BC re PST; circulate month end reporting; review email from H.Lee regarding outstanding request 1,127.50 from BCOGC; follow up email to BCOGC regarding the same; circulate email communication from BCOGC
		to Bench Creek; follow up email to Stikeman regarding assets in sale and conveyancing documents; request documents to be posted to the website;
02-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	1.25	respond to month end reporting inquiries; LM with YES energy; email communication with Jarak and 512.50 Stikeman re conveyancing documents; Discussion with L.Avery re outstanding GST matter and move
		forward; review incoming request from PC with YES re outstanding documentation from APA; review APA re the same; email to V.Kroger and
		A. Teasdale re the same; confirmation to YES to proceed; email communication with Bench Creek to
03-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	2.25	922.50 produce documentation instead, direction regarding Trustee naming convention; email communication with TD re incoming wire; check BMO acct for the same; LM with Crescent Point re invoice; PC with
		Crescent Point re refund amount, Review incoming details and description of the same to reconcile to GS Check account for incoming wire from TD: reconcile incoming wire transfer; enter deposit into Ascend:
06-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	2.25	922.50 reconcile PST and GST for returns; draft letter to CRA to follow up on GST account; attempt to access Rep
07-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	0.20	a Client; 82.00 Compile final package to CRA re GST; submit for faxing and upload online;
		Review incoming information from crescent point re request for refund; confirm against bank account;
09-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	0.75	307.50 email to Crescent Point for additional clarification;PC with BC Ministry of Finance re pre and post PST
10-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	1.25	account and initig, 512.50 Begin drafting mid month reporting package; submit Crescent Point refund for approval
13-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	4.25	1,742.50 Mid month reporting; update POC in ascend; begin final claims status review; Complete draft of report and SRD; circulate for review; continue claims review, contacting creditors for
14-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	2.25	922.50 additional information and reviewing claims; review employee claim amount and communication with
15-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	2.75	employee and legal counsel re the same; Discussion with tax group re distribution; discussion with V.Kroger re the same; review of final mid month 1,127.50 report; review incoming information from claims review; PC with multiple creditors re the same, update tracker and ascend re the same; review invoices and POC from BC ministry of finance; LM re the same;

			to legal counsel re the same; finalize mid month reporting, circulate for review; research Alberta labour
16-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	4.25	1,742.50	laws for termination pay and severance pay; detailed review and summary of employment claims; email
			communication with Jarak and legal counsel regarding the same; add supporting information to POC's;
			email communication with BC O&G re POC; PC with BC Ministry of finance re GST account set up
2010-12 Cholles	2.25	02250	Review mid month queries; PC with legal re the same; email reply regarding the same; locate prior year
17-Dec-2021 Jacqueille Stellott	67:7	344.30	reporting for tax filing; scan the same to tax group;
21-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	2.00	820.00	PC with CRA regarding POC for payroll audit and GS; PC with international tax; email to V.Kroger and A.Teasdale re the same;
			receive and review CRA Deemed Trust claim; update into Ascend; PC to CRA regarding the amount; PC
22-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	3.75	1,537.50	with CRA regarding pre and post amounts; PC with Stikeman re shareholder register, email
			structure; email communication with Bench Creek re missing information in documentation
			PC with BC O&G re POC and detailed discussion of the POC and pre and post amounts; email
23-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon	1.75	717.50	communication with Pandell and L.Avery re report for SHE; review and update documentation from
			Bench Creek re divestment to Bench Creek; PC with A.Teasdale re employee claim;
2000	7	00 110	Email communication to HQ re disallowance and expiry of the same; email to Mr.Myram re the same;
zy-Dec-zoz i Jacqueiine Sneilon	06:1	013.00	email to BMO to request stmts to complete reconciliation; draft month end report to HQ;
			Amendments to mid month reporting; circulate the same to V.Kroger for review; draft SRD for mid
	4.7E	1 742 50	month reporting; update claims register for mid month reporting; continue drafting 7th report for
us-Jan-Zuzz Jacqueline Snellon	67.4	1,744.30	application; review incoming POC from CRA; final review and revisions to divestment documents with
			Bench Creek; circulate to Bench Creek for final review;
			Finalize month end reporting package; circulate the same; PC with A.Teasdale to prepare for application;
			PC with V.Kroger re the same; PC with PST to gain access to online etax; review the same; email to
	J. C.	1 222 E0	collections agent re outstanding taxes (PST and Carbon Tax); review prior period taxes re PST filing;
04-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Snellon	2.62	05.266,1	review excerpt from Pandell re PUC amount; direct confirmation against bank statements; PC with CRA
			agent re POC for RP account, circulate an update of the same; finalize divestment to bench creek
			documents and circulate the same for review and execution;
			PC with Stikeman re return of capital and dissolution requirements; follow up with affidavit of mailing for
			s.149 notice; follow up with divestment to bench creek documents; circulate the final to Bench Creek;
			summary of PST requirements; email communication regarding the same to HQ, re update to reporting
201043 Cailoumnol CCOC 201 30	5 25	2 152 50	package; email communication re retainer amount; review requirement of HQ for financial statements,
03-Jail-2022 Jacqueiille Jileiloil	0.5.0	6,175.00	discussions re the same and SRD's; compile and send documentation to file tax returns; clarification
			email to Ministry of Finance re POC and amount OS; review banking records of the company to confirm
			payment of property taxes; email to A.Teasdale re updates on PST, property taxes; post obligations;
			finalize draft of the seventh report and circulate for partner review;

PC with creditors re claim; review contractor claim for termination and severance, email communication

Amendments to the 7th report, PC with A.Teasdale re application material; email with Ministry of Finance re POC clarification; reconciliation of SRD and amendments to the same; file outstanding PST returns; close PST account; PC with CRA; review dissolution and return of capital requirements per the ABCA; email communication with A.Teasdale re employee payments, s.136 priority; deemed trust payment; accrue and request deemed trust payment; confirmation received from Ministry of Finance re POC amount and post; request of source documentation from HQ to confirm their PUC amount; circulate CRA contact for service list;		Pull updated creditor listing to add to service list; compile SOA claims amount not filed yet for report; Review updated draft of application material; PC with A.Teasdale and V.Kroger; re the same; multiple amendments re the same; review email from Stikeman re HQ's position on interim return of capital; update the report re the same; PC with partner re application; final revisions to report; send to V.Kroger				Review comments from legal and revisions to mid month reporting; submit to V.Kroger for review; email HQ re timing of report	 Final revisions and updates to mid month reporting package; reformatting; Finalize mid month reporting; put on letterhead; circulate for final review and execution; direction re billing invoice: cheque disbursement for operating costs 	1 1
1,742.50	1,127.50	1,537.50	2,562.50	2,152.50	1,025.00	410.00	307.50	82.00 615.00 410.00 46,699.00
4.25	2.75	3.75	6.25	5.25	2.50	1.00	0.75	0.20 1.50 113.90 41
06-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	07-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	10-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	11-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	12-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	14-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	15-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	16-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon 17-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	18-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon 20-Dec-2021 Jacqueline Shellon

05-Nov-2021 Alyssa Wells Zorgdrager	0.10		23.00 Arranged courier as per Jackie
06-Jan-2022 Alyssa Wells Zorgdrager	0.10		23.00 Prepared affidavit of mailing for 30day notice
	0.20 230.00	230.00	46.00
02-Nov-2021 Wendy Locke	0.80		184.00 Preparing deposit slip for cheque, brining to bank
04-Nov-2021 Wendy Locke	08.0		184.00 Preparing WIP and draft invoice, emailing to V. Kroeger for approval
05-Nov-2021 Wendy Locke	0.50		115.00 Preparing cheque to pay invoice, having signed and sending out cheque

115.00 Preparing cheque to pay invoice, having signed and mailing out same 115.00 File maintenance 184.00 File maintenance 185.00 Preparing cheque to pay invoice, having signed and sending out in the mail 184.00 File maintenance 115.00 File maintenance	0.50 0.80 0.80 0.80 0.80 0.80 0.80 0.80
רסל סו פוומו נים, כיני:	
	2.50
258.30 T2 planning, draft EL, discussion on PUC	0.70
110.70 Planning, T2, draft EL	0.30
	13.30
115.00 File maintenance	0.50
	0.50
	0.50
	0.50
	0.80
115.00 Preparing cheque to pay invoice, having signed and sending out same	0.50
115.00 Preparing cheque to pay invoice, having signed and sending out same	0.50
184.00 File maintenance	0.80
184.00 Printing deposit slip and bringing cheque to bank	0.80
	0.80
184.00 Preparing cheque to pay invoice, having signed and sending out in the mail	0.80
184.00 File maintenance	0.80
	0.80
	0.80
184.00 Editing documents	0.80
	0.50
115.00 Preparing cheque to pay invoice, having signed and mailing out same	0.50

188.35	80,464.80
--------	-----------

GS E&R Canada Inc. - Division I Proposal For the Period November 1, 2021 to January 15, 2022

Date Type	Amount	Amount Description
02-Nov-2021 Travel	2.52 2	2.52 20/10/2021 / Lucas Avery / GS E&R Mileage (Possession)
02-Nov-2021 Travel	2.52 2	2.52 22/10/2021 / Lucas Avery /GS E&R Mileage (Pickup)
02-Nov-2021 Travel	2.52 2	2.52 20/09/2021 / Lucas Avery /GS E&R Mileage
16-Nov-2021 Travel	2.52	2.52 16/11/2021 / Jacqueline Shellon /Milage for GS E&R Records Takeover
02-Nov-2021 Misc. Disbursements	264.75 2	264.75 23/09/2021 / Lucas Avery /GS E&R Mail Redirect
03-Dec-2021 Misc. Disbursements	13.80 V	13.80 West direct courier Invoice 21710901 - Transaction 1634565
Total	288.63	



Invoice Number:

10250974

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

Mar 22 2022

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS E & R for the period of January 16 - March 16, 2022.

23,533.00

Sub Total:

Goods & Services Tax:

23,533.00 1,176.65

Total (CAD):

24,709.65

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

### SATE Card Schillerf** ### SATE Card Schillerff** ### SATE Card Schillerfff** ### SATE Card Schillerfff** ### SATE Card Schillerfff** ### SATE Card Schillerfff** ### SATE Schillerffff** ### SATE Schillerffff** ### SATE Schillerfffff** ### SATE Schillerfffff** ### SATE Schillerffffff** ### SATE Schillerffffff** ### SATE Schillerfffffff** ### SATE Schillerffffffff** ### SATE Schillerfffffffff** ### SATE Schillerffffffffff** ### SATE Schillerfffffffffffffffffffffffffffffffffff	Date Name Un	Units Rate Amount	Description
10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10	39-Feb-2022 Carla Schillreff	.10	_
130 150	11-Feb-2022 Carla Schillreff	.20	
110 2300	6-Feb-2022 Carla Schillreff	.30	
10 250.00 134.0	4-Mar-2022 Carla Schillreff	.10	
20	6-Mar-2022 Carla Schillreff	.10	
20 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 46.00 20 20.00 20.00 20 20.00 20.00 20 20.00 20.00 20 20.00 20.00 20 20.00 20.00 20 20.0		П	184,00
20 280,000 46,000 20 280,000 46,000 30 1,483,0			
20 20000 20 1,48500 25 20000 25 20000 25 20000 25 20000 25 200000 25 200000 25 20000000000	19-Jan-2022 Claire Cameron		
250 250,000 1,435,000 1,43	9-lan-2022 Heather Hreakl	30	
350 1,435.00 5.7 3 1075.00 5.7 3 1075.00 5.7 3 1075.00 5.7 3 1075.00 5.7 3 1075.00 5.7 3 1075.00 5.7 3 1075.00 5.7 3 1075.00 5.7 3 1075.00 5.7 4 1075.00 5.7 5 1		П	1 1
25 90500 275 9005000 275 900500 2	8-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	3.50	
7.5 90.05.05.05.05.05.05.05.05.05.05.05.05.05	9-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	05	
7.5 90.50 2.25 92.50 1.35 19.30 1.35 19.30 1.35 19.30 1.35 19.30 1.35 19.30 1.35 19.30 1.35 19.20 1.35 19.20 1.40 19	0-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	27.	
225 525 525 525 525 525 525 525 525 525	4-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.75	
1.35 1,520.00 1.15 1,520.00 1.15 1,125 1,125.00 1.15 1,125 1,125.00 1.10 1,126 1,126.00 1.10 1,126 1,126.00 1.10 1,126 1,126.00 1.10 1,126.00	5-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	2.25	
1.75 71758 1.75 71758	6-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	3.25	
1.75 17.750 1.75 1	/-Jan-2022 Jacqueline Snellon	05.1	
1,75	1-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.25	
75 30750 125 1250 225 40 156400 16600 167 167 168400 170 170 170 170 170 170 170 170 170 170	2-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.75	717-50. Update creditors review trust accounts for wire transfer fees; follow up with BMO re the same; drift request to open term deposit; follow up with GNA re GST account and request for sudit; direction to LAvery re the same;
125 5125 225 6250 40 16400 140 65500 128 1,14600 130 1,14600 130 1,14600 140 1,150	Leah. 2022 Iscamelles Shellon	7.5	
225 92250 40 15600 40 15600 40 15600 40 15600 40 15600 50	Cob-2022 Inchigate Shellon	135	
225 40 40 1160 6850 40 1160 280 280 280 280 280 280 280 280 280 28	אבת-בחלק זקכלתהוווה סווהווחו	67.4	
235 922-30 40 1822-30 140 1856-00 240 1856-00 240 1856-00 140 1856-00 150 1856-00 250 185			
40 164.00 40 168	-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	2.25	
140 6560 40 16400 220 1,14600 1,10 26100 1,10 26100 20 26100 20 26200 20 266000 20 266000 20 266000 20 266000 20 266000 20 266000 20 266000 20 266000 20 2660000 20 2660000000000	-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.40	
40 164.00 12.80 1,148.00 11.0 628.00 12.80 288.00 13.0 68.00 13.0 246.00 13.0 246.00 13.0 246.00 14.0 246.00 15.0	-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.60	
230 1,146,00 1,10 6,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510 1,10 8,510	-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.40	
110 26500 1160 26500 20 2000 20 2000 20 2000 20 2000 20 2000 20 20 26600 20 266000 20 26600 20 26600 20 26600 20 26600 20 26600 20 26600 20 266000 20 266000 20 266000 20 266000 20 2660000000000	5-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	2.80	
280 080 080 080 080 080 080 080 080 080	5-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.10	
150 85000 20 82000 20 82000 20 13000 20 82000 20	7-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.70	
20 28.00 20 24.00 20	3-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.60	
30 113000 12000 13	-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.20	
2400 2400	-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	30	
20 82000 20 82000 50 24600 50 24600 50 24600 110 89700 110 89700 110 89700 110 89700 110 89700	1-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	10	
90 985000 90 786000 90 786000 100 88700 110 88700 110 88700 110 88700 110 88700 110 88700	Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	 	
60 246000 80 246000 130 12300 130 18200 1,70 18700 1,10 87700 1,30 77500	rep-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	87 S	
50 246.00 30 12300 120 49200 70 897,00 170 697,400 190 779,00	S-Feb-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	3 99	
30 113.00 120 492.00 70 897.00 1,70 697.00 1,40 779.00	-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.60	
120 492.00 .70 287.00 1.70 287.00 1.40 574.00	-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.30	
.70 287.00 1.70 697.00 1.40 574.00 1.90 779.00	-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.20	
1.70 697.00 1.40 574.00 1.90 779.00	7-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.70	
1.40 574.00	9-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.70	
1.90	4-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.40	
	15-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	-	
		40.014	TU, 20,00

2,00 460,00 Call with CRA, being transferred between agents and placed on hold between each one, initial look through Server and Ascend for background question responses. Looking for Canada Post receipt of Shaw Modern sent	00'69	00'69	92.00		115.00	184.00	115.00	115.00	.30 69.00 Volcemail from City of Calgary assessments and looking into what else is needed to receive credit, reading through correspondence with Jon of 8C Finance	322.00	00'69		.40 92.00 Call with BC ministry, TD re: charges/refunds		.40 92.00 Bank Reconciliations	,70 Looking into BC account status, discussion with Jackie, requesting gredit returned from city of Calgary, notitying Jackie and providing her information regarding BC, Min of Environment Saying we had to pay full year instead or provided references and provided with 10 to BC.	1.40 322.00 Calling BC Environment/OGC regarding discharge fee, discussion w/ Jackle re: discharge fee, Email to BC outlining the situation re: Discharge fee	.50 115.00 Fixing up and sending enail to BC Ministry of Environment / OGC	92	3,00 690,00 Looking into interest enries in Ascend. Pulling large reports from Pandell. Drafting Pandel account closure letter. Disc. w/ Lu re: O&G GL's and ensuring we have needed information	.40 92:00 Sending letter to Pandell and updating per their request. Call to Jackle CRA	18.30 230.00 4,209.00	1.00 705.00 Review and finalize January 31 report to HQ	1.00 705.00 Review and finalte mild month report	.50 35.250 Review and of month draft report	.50 3S2.50 Review and edit Mar 15 report to HQ.	3.00 705.00 2,115.00	
25-Jan-2022 Lucas Avery	26-Jan-2022 Lucas Avery	01-Feb-2022 Lucas Avery	02-Feb-2022 Lucas Avery	03-Feb-2022 Lucas Avery	04-Feb-2022 Lucas Avery	07-Feb-2022 Lucas Avery	08-Feb-2022 Lucas Avery	11-Feb-2022 Lucas Avery	14-Feb-2022 Lucas Avery	15-Feb-2022 Lucas Avery	18-Feb-2022 Lucas Avery	23-Feb-2022 Lucas Avery	24-Feb-2022 Lucas Avery	25-Feb-2022 Lucas Avery	02-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	02-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	09-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	10-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	11-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	14-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	15-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery		01-Feb-2022 Victor Kroeger	17-Feb-2022 Victor Kroeger	28-Feb-2022 Victor Kroeger	15-Mar-2022 Victor Kroeger		

19-Jan-2022 Joseph Ju 20-Jan-2022 Joseph Ju



Invoice Number:

10403320

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

May 10 2022

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS E & R for the period of March 16 - April 30, 2022

11,889.00

Sub Total:

11,889.00

Goods & Services Tax:

594.45

Total (CAD):

12,483.45

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

the Period March 16 - April 30, 2022		
Name	Hours Rate Am	ourt Description
17-Mar-2022 Carla Schillreff	20	45 00 file administration.
22-Mar-2022 Carla Schillreff	20	46.00 File administration
31-Mar-2022 Carla Schillreff	20	23.00 File administration.
07-Apr-2022 Carla Schillreff	20	45.00 File administration.
12-Apr-2022 Carla Schillreff	.10	23.00 Fie administration.
13-Apr-2022 Carla Schillreff	20	45.00 File administration.
14-Apr-2022 Carla Schillreff	.10	23.00 Properticines.
19-Apr-2022 Carla Schillreff	20	45.00 Bark dramit.
25-Apr-2022 Carla Schillreff	20	46.00 Bark draznik
	1.50 230.00	345,00
17 May 2022 Avenue - Franchista	20	\$2.00 [mail to CVA], re sold properties.
16-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon 21-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	20	actor consists of the residence and properties. 287.00 F. On this Rudgetion or generations and transfer pricing, provide comment to Viscoger rettle same; circulate mild month reporting emails with tax group re-year end tax return and engagement letter.
	.50	AND TO AND ACCORDING TO Experience and statuted priving provine comments to stateger it to be said, section and more reporting instead with an application of the state of the
22-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.90	2400. Detection for from the communication to Understand way cannot communication with understand in respect to discharging amounts. 34000 Therefore no from the cartiers cannot be the CRN of Financial accounts described accounts. 34000 Therefore no from the cartiers cannot be the CRN of Financial accounts described accounts.
23-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon		
24-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.50 .90	205.00 Ferlies additional conveyanding documentations circulate bit V. Recognifier review. 285.00 Ferlies additional conveyanding documentations circulate bit V. Recognifier review. 285.00 Ferlies additional conveyanding documents serve the same to be chemre and gracified to Enrich Crest, email communication re closure of accounts; email with Payworks re reports for WCB.
25-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon		
28-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	130 20	531.00 Pull reports from Psyworks for WCE; arrange for FMT of EC Min of Fin Invoice; review additional request from Bench Creek re conveyancing doct; review billing from Shaw.
29-Mar-2022 Jacqueline Shellon		E2.00 Additional conveyancing documentation from Bench Greek.
01-Apr-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.10	451.00 Finalize month and reporting circulate to V. Stronger and A.Teasdale for review.
02-Apr-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	20	82.00 Final revisions to month end report; circulate to Vivineger for final review.
04-Apr-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.40	164.00 Finalize and circulate the month and report.
05-Apr-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.40	164.00 Respond to HQ Inquiries.
07-Apr-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	160	656.00 Follow up with outstanding matters-Shaw final bill, CPA GST audit update on tax return.
12-Apr-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.90	360:00 Review APA and recent communication from Secure Energy re transfer of ownership; PC with Bench Creek re trust agreements in Maxhamish; submit final Shaw invoice for payment.
13-Apr-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.70	697.00 Review email correspondence re leste agreement; FC with A Teasdale re the same; email to J Fark re the same; begin GS EBR mid month report strd.
14-Apr-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	60	246.00 Review legal revisions to report, circulate for partner review; submit involves for payment.
25-Apr-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	140	574.00 Email with Bench Creek re additional conveyancing documents; finalize and circulate mid month reporting package; PC with tax group re 2021 YE tax.
29-Apr-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	20	82.00 Review email from J.Park re trademark, send to A.Tessdale for comment.
	13.83 410.00	5,658.00
17-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	120	196.00 Call to J. Shellon rec trust examination. Updating mid-month report and \$50.
18-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	1.00	330.00 Drafting and sending letter to TD for Visa Cancellation and forwarding of funds.
21-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	10	33.00 Correspondence with J.Shellon res mid-month.
23-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	.70	231.00 Call to GRA rectrust examination. Email to 9-aw rec invoicing.
25-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	2.40	272.00 Calling and emailing vendors who set new knokes recently to cared accounts, following up with vendors who sharest responded. Communicating with payroll provider to receive employee payment information for Worlda'd C. C. C. Care, and C.
23-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	40	198.00 PC to GPA Email to Shaw about service charges.
29 War-2022 Lucas Avery	10	33.00 Looking into Shaw as new bill received.
30-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	50	185.00 Call with WorkSafeEC BC ret balance and final report options. Call to Business Impulses to fix RT0002 account.
31-Mar-2022 Lucas Avery	120	336.00 March morth end report and March morth end \$10.
01-Apr-2022 Lucas Avery	.70	231.00 Pull additional Fandell reports to close Fandell, emails to Jackie about WorkSafebC SC invoice.
03-Apr-2022 Lucas Avery	50	165.00 Pulling Pandell reports.
05-Apr-2022 Lucas Avery	50	16500 Email to Shaw, Pulling additional Pandell reports to completion.
OB-Apr-2022 Lucas Avery	40	131200 Call with CPA ret that audit, clear necesser affacts. Disc wif. S about this, Discussing Shaw reply w/ IS.
11-Apr-2022 Lucas Avery	.70	23100 Basis reconcilation for both accounts. Germanochem with Sand CS in statement to Fa difference.
13-Apr-2022 Lucas Avery	60	198.00 Correspondence w/ & re: Worksafe'80 EC payment. Sending Dry of Calgary information for refund.
14-Apr-2022 Lucas Avery	.80	1930 Contrigorome w. 21 feb violation to the property of the agent processing on the Contrigorome violation of the Contrigorome violation violatio
18-Apr-2022 Lucas Avery	110	20400 Francing Dark Per and Call Information Tele South Option Control of the Call Con
13-Apr-2022 Lucas Avery	160	353.00 - Premiurary work for Clusterine . \$33.00 - Action 4GT per limited work for clusterine certificate. Filing and string GST returns.
	100	33000 Filing out TES from for clearance certificate, email to Sidesting all test projected by CRA for clearance certificate.
20-Apr-2022 Lucas Avery	15.70 330.00	3000 rang out 1431 fam for desirate central till, man to 15 desirate central till entre to 15 desirate centr
		Security of the security of th
01-Apr-2022 Victor Kronger	.50	352.50 Review March 31 report to HQ.
18-Apr-2022 Victor Kronger	.50	352.50 Review and approve April 25 report to HQ.
	1.00 705.00	705.00



Invoice Number:

10469614

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

Jun 17 2022

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS E & R for the period of May 1 - May 31, 2022.

8,625.20

Sub Total:

Goods & Services Tax:

8,625.20 431.26

Total (CAD):

9,056.46

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

GS E&R Canada Inc. - Division I Proposal

For the Period	May 1 - 31, 2022				
			5.1		
Date	Name	Hours .20	Rate	Amount 45.00	Description File administration
	2 Carla Schillreff	.20			nie administration
	2 Carla Schillreff 2 Carla Schillreff	.10			rile administration
	2 Carla Schillreff	.20			File administration
	2 Carla Schillreff	.20			Deposits at BMO.
23-11104-202	L cana schinen	.90			
					-
02-May-202	2 Jacqueline Shellon	.80		328.00	Update with L. Avery; month end reporting.
	2 Jacqueline Shellon	.40		164.00	Email to J. Park re annual trademark royalty agreement.
	2 Jacqueline Shellon	.60		246.00	Finalize month end report; circulate for review; send executed NOA to Bench Creek; review billings for April 2022.
	2 Jacqueline Shellon	.70			Discussions with HQ re outstanding tax returns and GST audit; follow up with tax group re 2021 year end; direction re requesting CRA clearance certificate; mid month report.
	2 Jacqueline Shellon	.60			Finalize mid month report; circulate for review and execution; send to HQ
31-May-202	2 Jacqueline Shellon	40			Review outstanding items request; reply.
		3.50	410.00	1,435.00	
17-May-202	2 Joseph Ju	.20		78.20	T2 correspondence.
20-May-202		.40			T2 planning.
20-May-202		.30			72 correspondence.
24-May-202		.30			Phone call with Toki on T2 prep.
25-May-202		.30			Discuss with Toki on GiF1100 assets classification.
26-May-202		.30			Discuss with Toki on T2, various email correspondence.
27-May-202	2 Joseph Ju	1.00		391.00	Various discussion with Toki on various T2 matters, GIFI assets reclassification, email correspondence.
30-May-202		2.50		977.50	Review T2, fix various issues, T106.
31-May-202	2 Joseph Ju	.80		312.80	Various correspondence re wind-up T2, discussion with J.S.
31-May-202	2 Joseph Ju	1.10			_T2 documentation on Sch. 5 and T106, T2 checklist sign off.
		7.20	391.00	2,815.20	
					CET I A Manual CET I
	202000			*****	Disc. and Questions to IS re: updates, tasks to do, GST, clearance. April month end report and SRD and requested revisions. Looking into CRA Notice of assessment and call with IS on this.
	2 Lucas Avery	.70			Discussion on other mail received re: TD request for TIN Number. Bank reconciliations.
	2 Lucas Avery	.40			Bank reconculations.
	2 Lucas Avery	.70			initial prep for report. Mid-month report and SRD Q's for JS regarding this.
	2 Lucas Avery 2 Lucas Avery	.60			Industrial Paper and SNO 23 (2) 23 (2) 24 (2) 25 (2
	2 Lucas Avery 2 Lucas Avery	.60			Answering 15 questions about R+D and report. Call with JS re: clearance certificate documents and tax update.
	2 Lucas Avery	.30			Looking into GST.
Jimay Lot.	z zacasmenj	3.60			
					-
25-May-202	2 Nicholas Patey	.60		105.00	Helping Toki with Gifi and T2 import.
27-May-202	2 Nicholas Patey	.80			_ Helping Toki tie out figures with the client's TB.
		1.40	175.00	245.00	
	2 Toki Adejuwon	.50			Joe call and net income.
	2 Toki Adejuwon	.40			Agreeing prior year accumulated depreciation groupings.
	2 Toki Adejuwon	.20			Grouping Asset Retirement Costs.
	2 Toki Adejuwon	2.30			Balance Sheet Income Statement. Completed BS an IS incorrectly without grouping together based off last year. Questions for Nick about groupings. Nick call and balance sheet.
	2 Toki Adejuwon 2 Toki Adejuwon	.60			nick can and oblance sneet. Joe Call. Request for more TB.
	2 Toki Adejuwon 2 Toki Adejuwon	4.50			Joe Lail. Request for more 16. Matching prior year grouping to current year Groupings, call with Nick, Joe.
27-may-202.	z Toki Maejawan	4.50		787.50	matering professing routing to other threat ordinates, and man man, your spent time grouping to professing the profession of the professio
27-May-202	2 Toki Adejuwon	1.20		210.00	compared to the financial statements.
	2 Toki Adejuwon	1.00			Amortization and completion.
		11.60			
	2 Victor Kroeger	.50			Review and finalize month end report, deal with crew assignment.
17-May-202	2 Victor Kroeger	50			Review and finalize report.
		1.00	705.00	705.00	-
					-
	TOTAL	29.20		\$ 8,625.20	-



Invoice Number:

10503220

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

Jul 12 2022

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS E & R for the period of Period June 1 - 30, 2022.

11,601.00

Sub Total:

11,601.00

Goods & Services Tax:

580.05

Total (CAD):

12,181.05

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

GS E&R Canada Inc. - Division I Proposal For the Period June 1 - 30, 2022

For the Per	iod June 1 - 30, 2022				
Date	Name	Hours	Rate	Amount	Description
06-Jun-202	22 Carla Schillreff	.10			File administration.
16-Jun-202	22 Carla Schillreff	.20		48.00	File administration.
17-Jun-202	22 Carla Schillreff	.20			File administration.
		50	240.00	120.00	
03-Jun-202	22 Jacqueline Shellon	1.00		430.00	PC to plan next steps on winding up.
	22 Jacqueline Shellon	.70			Revisions to month end report; finalize and circulate for review; follow up with tax group re 2021 tax return.
	22 Jacqueline Shellon	.20			Circulate final month end report.
	22 Jacqueline Shellon	.30			Email with HQ re move forward.
	22 Jacqueline Shellon	1.80		774.00	Review 2021 tax return; provide update and documents to tax for amendments; email with Jarak re move forward; PC with tax re assets in the tax return.
	22 Jacqueline Shellon	.20			Review requests from tax group, reply regarding the same.
17-Jun-202	22 Jacqueline Shellon	.60			Mid month report.
20-Jun-202	22 Jacqueline Shellon	.70			Review questions fromHQ regarding tax return and email to MNP tax group re the same; finalize mid month report; circulate for final review.
22-Jun-202	22 Jacqueline Shellon	1.70			Review amended FY2021 tax return; circulate to J. Park for review and comment; discussions with L.L. re move forward.
24-Jun-202	22 Jacqueline Shellon	.20			Confirmation of F2021 tax filing; direct tax department re the same.
	22 Jacqueline Shellon	.70			Prepare for and attend call with Company legal counsel re next steps on file.
30-Jun-202	22 Jacqueline Shellon	40			Email communication re timeline of completion; discussions with tax group re the same.
		8.50	430.00	3,655.00	•
02-Jun-202	22 John Nygren	.50		372.50	Review 2021 T2; queries to J.Ju
06-Jun-202	22 John Nygren	.40		298.00	Clear queries with JJu; sign-offs.
15-Jun-202	22 John Nygren	1.00			Discuss sale with J.Ju; review PSA.
20-Jun-202	22 John Nygren	.30		223.50	Review revised return and provide comment to J.Ju
21-Jun-202	22 John Nygren	20			Discuss successor pools with J.Ju
		2.40	745.00	1,788.00	
02-Jun-202	22 Joseph Ju	.60		258.00	Clear T2 review comments, various documentation on T2 and T106.
	22 Joseph Ju	2.20		946.00	T2, clear review comments, various documentation on T2 and T106.
	22 Joseph Ju	.50		215.00	Discussion with J.N on o/s comments and clear up.
	22 Joseph Ju	.40		172.00	Correspondence with Toki on T2 wind up.
14-Jun-202	22 Joseph Ju	.70			Discussion on sale of assets and update on T2.
	22 Joseph Ju	1.40			Discussion with JN on disposition of oil and gas assets, update and send draft T2.
	22 Joseph Ju	.70			Discussion related to T2 comments, addressing comments, update T2.
	22 Joseph Ju	.70			Oil Gas deduction, various discussion on resources deduction on Sch. 12, update T2, re-print T2 and signature pack.
	22 Joseph Ju	.20			Correspondence on T2 arrange for efiling.
24-Jun-202	22 Joseph Ju	20			Arrange for effling.
		7.60	430.00	3,268.00	·
03-Jun-202	22 Lucas Avery	.80			Updating SRD for month end report and month end report. GST return.
	22 Lucas Avery	.40			Looking into GST and providing Carla a NOA.
	22 Lucas Avery	.40			Bank reconciliations.
	22 Lucas Avery	.20			Scanning and sending mail re: CRA RP. Discussion w/ JS re: CRA and report.
	22 Lucas Avery	.80			GS E&R mid-month report.
	22 Lucas Avery	.40			Disc. w/ JS and CS re: refund received to GS E&R and other items for the Mid-month report.
	22 Lucas Avery	.30			Review TD refund; discussion w/ CS and JS .
	22 Lucas Avery	.10			Call with JS re: file updates, monthly report. Updating SRD and report for month end report. GST Return.
30-Jun-202	22 Lucas Avery	4.10		200.000	opading and and report for month and report, Gar neturn.
		4.10	400.00	1,040.00	•
07-Jun-202	22 Toki Adejuwon	2.20	0	385.00	Creating new caseware file, T2 completion and sign off. Submit quiries
		2.20	175.00	385.00	
15-Jun-202	22 Victor Kroeger	.50	į.	372.50	Correspond with A Teasdale re approach to finalizing engagement.
	22 Victor Kroeger	.50			Review and finalize mid month reporting.
	70	1.00			
	TOTAL	26.		\$ 11,601.00	•
	IUIAL	26.	3	\$ 11,601.00	-



Invoice Number:

10539661

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

Aug 10 2022

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS E & R for the period of Period July 1 - 31, 2022.

2,905.00

Sub Total:

2,905.00

Goods & Services Tax:

145.25

Total (CAD):

3,050.25

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

GS E&R Canada Inc. - Division I Proposal For the Period July 1 - 31, 2022

Date	Name	Hours	Rate	Amount	Description
06-Jul-202	2 Carla Schillreff	.10		24.00	File administration.
		.10	240.00	24.00	
11-Jul-202	2 Jacqueline Shellon	.60		258.00	Finalize mid month reporting; circulate for review; file administration.
12-Jul-202	2 Jacqueline Shellon	.30		129.00	Finalize report with amended comments; circulate for review.
15-Jul-202	2 Jacqueline Shellon	.20		86.00	
18-Jul-202	2 Jacqueline Shellon	.40		172.00	
19-Jul-202	2 Jacqueline Shellon	.30		129.00	Compile final report; circulate.
22-Jul-202	2 Jacqueline Shellon	.40		172.00	
27-Jul-202	2 Jacqueline Shellon	.40		172.00	
29-Jul-202	2 Jacqueline Shellon	.60		258.00	_Account reconciliation
		3.20	430.00	1,376.00	
10-Jul-202	2 Lucas Avery	.40			
16-Jul-202	2 Lucas Avery	.50		200.00	Preparing mid-month report.
21-Jul-202	2 Lucas Avery	.90		360.00	
					June.
22-Jul-202	2 Lucas Avery	.10		40.00	The second of the second contract of the seco
		1.90	400.00	760.00	
12-Jul-202	2 Victor Kroeger	.50			Review report to HQ.
19-Jul-202	2 Victor Kroeger	.50			Review and finalize July 15 report to HQ.
		1.00	745.00	745.00	_
					_
	TOTAL	6.20		\$ 2,905.00	-



Invoice Number:

10628241

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

Oct 25 2022

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS E & R for the period of Period August 1 - 31, 2022.

19,071.50

Sub Total:

19,071.50

Goods & Services Tax:

953.58

Total (CAD):

20,025.08

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

19.4 19.2 Carl Soliter 10 19.2 1	or the Period August 1 - 31, 2022	Hours	Rate Amou	nt	Description
1.4 Aug. 2022 Carle Schilfred			Rate Amou		
1.4 Aug. 2012 Carls Schilfred 30					
13.44g-2022 Crist Schillard 1.39					
14.00 2012 (cris Solited 10 20.00 20					
130 124 125 124 125 124 125					
13-Jug-2022 Intervalina Shirfen 1-70	31-Aug-2022 Cana Schillreit		240.00		
1.0					•
Securities Securitie	12-Aug-2022 Greg lbbott				
1-1-1-1-1-1-1-1-1-1-1-1-1-1-1-1-1-1-1-		.60	745.00	447.00	•
2-Aug-2022 Jacqueline Shelton 1.70 731.00 Formation 1.591.00 Formation 1.59					
1.548.00 1.548.00	04-Aug-2022 Jacqueline Shellon				
10 Aug-2022 Jacqueline Shelton 3.60 1,541.00 Review certificate of compliance documentation; provide revisions and comment to L. Avery, discussions with V. Kroeger re application on the 24th; amendments to the elight the aims. 1.4 Aug-2022 Jacqueline Shelton 3.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00					
the same. 1,434.00 2122 Jacqueline Shellon 1,70 731.00 732.00 732.00 733.00 733.00 733.00 733.00 733.00 733.00 734	09-Aug-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	3.70		1,591.00	Discussions with Tax group re move forward; discussions with legal counsel re application; updates to application material, submit to V. Kroeger for review.
13.4ug-2022 Jacquelline Shelton 170 174.ug-2022 Jacquelline Shelton 170 174.ug-2022 Jacquelline Shelton 170 175.ug-2022 Jacquelline Shelton 170 170 170 170 170 170 170 170 170 170	10-Aug-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	3.60		1,548.00	
Follow up with Lt. re application material; review and execute a mended CRA clarance certificate request; amendments to application material; discussion with Lt. re expagam 1.6 Aug. 2022. Incquellers Shelton 2.10 Serview and prepare material for communication to HQ re distribution process and income tax liability, conference call with Silkeman & Lt. re application; PC with Lt. to discuss special for communication to HQ re distribution process and income tax liability, conference call with Silkeman & Lt. re application; PC with Lt. to discuss special for communication to HQ re distribution; preview tax withholding obligations and legal opinion re the same. 8.1 Aug. 2022 Incqueities Shelton 2.2	11-Aug-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	3.80		1,634.00	Finalize eighth report of the trustee and circulate for review; summarize and review Bell cheques; conversations with J. Park re the same; request refund to Bench Creek; review and
Follow up with Lt. a application material; review and execute amended CNA classrance certificate request; amendments to application material; discussions with Lt. or expagant 16-Aug-2022 Jacqueline Shelton 2.10 Shelton Ministry (althor or ministry) 30-10 per part and schedules 30-Aug-2022 Jacqueline Shelton 3	12.Aug.2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.70		731.00	
15.Aug-2021 Incquelline Shelfon 2.10 50.50 Roubling eighth report and schedules. Solicity Solici	TE LINE TAKE 1804 AND THE POLI	2.75		,52.00	Follow up with LL re application material; review and execute amended CRA clearance certificate request; amendments to application material; discussions with LL re engagements
16. Aug-2022 Jacquelline Shelton 2.10 993.00 Review and prepare material for communication to HQT editaribution process and income tax fability; conference call with Stikeman & LL re application; PC with LL to discuss application 172.00 172.	15-Aug-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	2.20		946.00	
26-Aug-2022 Jacquelles Shellon 40 817.00					Review and prepare material for communication to HQ re distribution process and income tax liability; conference call with Stikeman & LL re application; PC with LL to discuss
30-Aug-2022 Jacquelline Shelson	25 Aug 2022 Jacqueline Shellon	40		172.00	
31-Aug-2022 Jacqueline Shelton 23.20 430.00 9.976.00 9.976.00					
19.4ug 2012 Lohn Niygren					
02-Aug-2022 Junn Nygren 20	31-Aug-2022 Jacqueillie Sileikon		430.00		
149.00 1					-
1-4-bay-2022 Loras Avery 1-70 28.00	08-Aug-2022 John Nygren	.40		298.00	Call with J. Shellon to discuss wind-up.
02-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery	09-Aug-2022 John Nygren	.20		149.00	Response re: S.159.
10-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery .50	100 - 100 -	.60	745.00	447.00	
10-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery 50 20.000 Correcting report, drafting letter and semal to Bell re: refunds.					<i>f</i>
10-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery	02-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery	.70			
10-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery 1.0 1500.0 Compiling updated Interim SDD for eighth report; compiling professional fee summary, Creating GST Summary.	03-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery	.50			
10-Aug-2022 Ucas Avery	04-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery	.40			
10-Aug-2022 Ucas Avery	09-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery	1.40			
11-Jug-2022 Ucas Avery 1.40 560.00 Looking into Bell refunds for 7.0 280.00 Fining perait rolling overview email. Updates to SRO. Filing GST return and saving to server. Call with J. Shellon.	10-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery	.40			
12-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery .70 280.00 Final preparation of and submitting package for request for Clearance Certificates. Following up with Bench Creek.	10-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery	.60			
23-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery 30 120.00 Sending reminder and update letter to CRA re: clearance certificate.	11-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery	1.40		560.00	Looking into Bell refunds for J. Shellon and drafting overview email. Updates to SRD. Filing GST return and saving to server. Call with J. Shellon.
20 109.00 2,640.	12-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery	.70			
29-Aug-7022 Rick Anderson 2.0 109.00 June 2022 bank reconciliations.	25-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery	.30		120.00	Sending reminder and update letter to CRA re: clearance certificate.
29-Aug-2022 Rick Anderson 20 109.00 June 2022 bank reconciliations.	31-Aug-2022 Lucas Avery	.20		80.00	Looking into GST refund cheque to confirm balance.
10-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger		6.60	400.00	2,640.00	
1.0	29-Aug-2022 Birk Anderson	20		109.00	June 2022 bank reconciliations.
11-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 7.0 521.50 Next review of draft report, review issue re Bell payments, discussion with J. Shellon re reply to Stikeman's. 12-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 7.0 521.50 Review Lavron Lundell's comments on draft Court report. 1.0 745.00 Finalize report, call with Stikeman's, review draft application material. 25-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 5.0 372.50 Deal with new directive from HQ re. 26-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 5.0 372.50 Deal with new directive from HQ re. 29-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 5.0 372.50 Review correspondence re taxes. 30-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 5.0 5,140.50 Sills with W. Roberts, Call with Stikeman's, memo to Stikeman's.	25-Aug-2022 Nick Anderson		545.00		
11-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 70 \$21.50 Next review of draft report, review issue re Bell payments, discussion with J. Shellon re reply to Stikeman's. 12-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 1.0 745.00 Finalitie report, call with Stikeman's, review draft application material. 25-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 50 372.50 Deal with new directive from HQ re. 26-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 50 372.50 Discussion with J. Shellon re tax issues. 29-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 50 372.50 Deal with new directive from HQ re. 30-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 50 372.50 Review correspondence re taxes. 30-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 1.50 1,117.50 Call swith W. Roberts, Call with Stikeman's, memo to Stikeman's.					
12-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger					
16-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 1.00 745.00 Finalize report, call with Stikeman's, review draft application material. 25-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 5.0 372.50 Deal with new directive from HQ re. 29-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 5.0 372.50 Discussion with 1.5 Helion re tax issues. 29-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 5.0 372.50 Review correspondence re taxes. 30-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 1.50 1.117.50 Calls with W. Roberts, Call with Stikeman's, memo to Stikeman's.					
25-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 50 372.50 Deal with new directive from HQ re. 26-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 50 372.50 Discussion with J. Shellon re tax issues. 29-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 50 372.50 Review correspondence re taxes. 30-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 1.50 1,117.50 Calls with VI. Roberts, Call with Stikeman's, memo to Stikeman's,					
26-Jug-2022 Victor Kroeger S.0 372.50 Discussion with J. Shellon re tax issues. 29-Jug-2022 Victor Kroeger S.0 372.50 Review correspondence re taxes. 30-Jug-2022 Victor Kroeger S.0 745.00 S,140.50 Size with W. Roberts, Call with Stikeman's, memo to Stikeman's.					
29-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 5.0 372.50 Review correspondence re taxes. 30-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 1.50 1,117.50 Calls with W. Roberts, Call with Stikeman's, memo to Stikeman's. 6.90 745.00 5,140.50					
30-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger 1.50 1,117.50 Calls with VJ. Roberts, Call with Stikeman's, memo to Stikeman's. 6.90 745.00 5,140.50					
6.90 745.00 5,140.50				372.50	Review correspondence re taxes.
	30-Aug-2022 Victor Kroeger		745.00		
1940 \$ 1907150		6.90	745.00	5,140.50	-
	TOTAL	39.40	\$	19 071 50	=



Invoice Number:

10628254

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

Oct 25 2022

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS E & R for the period of September 1 - 30, 2022.

5,228.00

Sub Total:

5,228.00

Goods & Services Tax:

261.40

Total (CAD):

5,489.40

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

GS E&R Canada Inc. - Division I Proposal For the Period September 1 - 30, 2022

	eptember 1 - 30, 2				
	Name	Hours	Rate	Amount	Description
09-Sep-2022	Carla Schillreff	.30			File administration.
16-Sep-2022	Carla Schillreff	.10			File administration.
21-Sep-2022	Carla Schillreff	.20			File administration.
		.60	240.00	144.00	
01 500 2022	Jacqueline Shellon	1.50		645.00	Emails to settle outstanding assets matter; month end reporting and circulate for review.
	Jacqueline Shellon	.50			Final amendments to month end report; circulate for review.
	Jacqueline Shellon	.40			Review trust accounts; follow up with interest earning.
	Jacqueline Shellon	.30			File administration.
	Jacqueline Shellon	.60			Review requests for clarification on month end report; provide summary of the same.
	Jacqueline Shellon	1.50		645.00	
	Jacqueline Shellon	.60		258.00	
	Jacqueline Shellon	.70		301.00	
	Jacqueline Shellon	.10			Circulate mid month report.
	Jacqueline Shellon	.70			Circulate Intol Intol (1997). Email to /from HQ and Stikeman's re CRA's process for winding up.
29-26b-2022	Jacqueline Shellon	6.90	430.00	2,967.00	CHIER TO/HOR TICK BIO STACHBUST C COSTS PROCESS TO STANDING UP.
			430.00	2,507.00	•
				477.00	2000 to 1,000 to 1,00
	Lorry Fritsche	.40			Prepare July 2022 bank reconciliations.
	Lorry Fritsche	.40			Prepare August 2022 bank reconciliations.
30-Sep-2022	Lorry Fritsche	10			Review correspondence received from CRA re: GST notice of assessments.
		.90	430.00	387.00	-
21-Sep-2022	Lucas Avery	.30			Responding to CRA request re: T4 information.
22-Sep-2022	Lucas Avery	.30		120.00	Checking status with CS and requesting mail of cheque to Bench Creek. Notifying Bench Creek of mail.
New Ford Stories		2.40	400.00	240.00	
01 San 2022	Victor Kroeger	1.50		1 117 50	Review information re potential payment to parent, correspondence with Stikeman's & Lawson Lundell, month end report review.
	Victor Kroeger	.50			Review and finalize mid month report to HQ.
23-Sep-2022	victor kroeger	2.00	745.00	1,490.00	TEALER BUR Illinite two mount report of the
		2.00	/43.00	1,430.00	-
					-
	TOTAL	12.80		\$ 5,228.00	_



Invoice Number:

10751409

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

Jan 26 2023

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS E & R for the period of October 1 - December 31, 2022.

26,237.00

Sub Total:

26,237.00

Goods & Services Tax:

1,311.85

Total (CAD):

27,548.85

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

GS E&R Canada Inc. - Division 1 Proposal

Date Name	Hours		mount	Description
25-Oct-2022 Carla Schillreff	.20			File administration.
23-Nov-2022 Carla Schillreff	.10			File administration.
24-Nov-2022 Carla Schillreff	.20			File administration.
02-Dec-2022 Carla Schillreff	.10			File administration.
15-Dec-2022 Carla Schillreff	.30			File administration.
16-Dec-2022 Carla Schillreff	.10			File administration.
22-Dec-2022 Carla Schillreff	10	11 10 11 11 11 11 11		_File administration.
	1.10	260.00	286.00	-
06-Oct-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	4.30		2.064.00	Review receipts for GST collected; provide summary of the same.
13-Oct-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.70			Review HQ requests for information; provided additional documentation; prepare for and attend board meeting with HQ.
17-Oct-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.40			September & October reports.
20-Oct-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.20			Review and comment on move forward timeline; provide legal invoices.
21-Oct-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	3.30			Begin drafting 8th report.
22-Oct-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.80		864.00	Continue drafting 8th report; circulate for review.
24-Oct-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	2.70			Discussions with Lawson Lundell re application material; review and comment on that same.
25-Oct-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.50		720.00	File administration.
26-Oct-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.40		672.00	Review of final drafts of report and application material; updates and circulate to V. Kroeger for review.
27-Oct-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.70		336.00	Finalize last report.
28-Oct-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.40		192.00	Final prep of 8th report.
21-Nov-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	2.50			October month end report and November 15 mid month report.
22-Nov-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.70)	816.00	Finalize month end and mid month reporting; circulate for review; updates and amendments to material for upcoming
				discharge application.
23-Nov-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.50			Continue to compile schedules and prepare for application.
13-Dec-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	.40			November month end review.
20-Dec-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	3.70)	1,776.00	O Conversations with tax and legal professionals re estimated costs to complete; compile estimated costs to complete; submit
				legal invoices for payment; prepare for and attend meeting with HQ.
24 0 - 2022 1 " " " "	4.00		F76.60	Complete cummary of actimated sacts to complete for the trust funds and retainers sand to V. Vroeger for review
21-Dec-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.20			Complete summary of estimated costs to complete for the trust funds and retainer; send to V. Kroeger for review. Summarize remaining activities and estimated distributions.
22-Dec-2022 Jacqueline Shellon	1.70	1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	15,408.00	The state of the s
	32.10	460.00	10,604,61	
20-Dec-2022 Joseph Ju	.20		96.00	Email correspondence with Jackie on T2 2022 and 2023.
	.20		96.00	
	1			
06-Oct-2022 Lorry Fritsche	1.20	0	576.00	D Prepare and submit Aug and Sep 2022 GST; email to J. Shellon re; same; review correspondence received from CRA re: notice of
	Day-17		1910	assessments; email to L. Avery re: GST.
17-Oct-2022 Lorry Fritsche	.20			Prepare Sep 2022 bank reconciliation.
19-Oct-2022 Lorry Fritsche	.20			Prepare Sep 2022 bank reconciliation.
03-Nov-2022 Lorry Fritsche	.20			Prepare and submit Oct 2022 GST.
21-Nov-2022 Lorry Fritsche	.20			Prepare Oct 2022 bank reconciliation. Prepare Oct 2022 bank reconciliation.
30-Nov-2022 Lorry Fritsche 15-Dec-2022 Lorry Fritsche	.20 .10			Email to C. Schillreff re: GST refunds.
21-Dec-2022 Lorry Fritsche	.20			Prepare and submit Nov 2022 GST.
22-Dec-2022 Lorry Fritsche	.40			Prepare Nov 2022 bank reconciliations.
LE DEC ZOZZ LONY INGCHE	2.90		1,392.00	
				- · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
05-Oct-2022 Lucas Avery	.40			Looking into Bell Cheque and correspondence with Bench Creek.
06-Oct-2022 Lucas Avery	.40			Looking into GST and apprising L. Fritsche of file status with CRA. Correspondence with Bench Creek re: Bell cheques.
27-Oct-2022 Lucas Avery	2.00			Call with J. Shellon and looking through, pulling schedules for report.
28-Oct-2022 Lucas Avery	1.00			Looking into report and updates via email.
03-Nov-2022 Lucas Avery	50			Reading emails and reports and responding to HQ email.
	4.30	400.00	1,720.00	
11 Oct 2022 Birly Andorror	90		440.00	Bank reconciliations for July and August 2022.
11-Oct-2022 Rick Anderson 09-Dec-2022 Rick Anderson	.80			October bank reconciliation.
03-Dec-2022 RICK ANGERSON	.90		495.00	
		330.00	455.00	
13-Oct-2022 Victor Kroeger	1.50		1,140.00	Review information, attend call with HQ and legal counsel re approach to finalize engagement.
17-Oct-2022 Victor Kroeger	.50			Review and sign reports to HQ.
24-Oct-2022 Victor Kroeger	1.00		760.00	Review correspondence re Court application.
15-Nov-2022 Victor Kroeger	1.00			Review draft Court application material and draft Court orders and respond to Lawson Lundell.
16-Nov-2022 Victor Kroeger	.50		380.00	Correspond with Lawson Lundell re reports.
21-Nov-2022 Victor Kroeger	.50			Discussion with J. Shellon re HQ reporting.
25-Nov-2022 Victor Kroeger	2.00			Review Court report, attend call with Stikemans and Lawson Lundell.
20-Dec-2022 Victor Kroeger	1.50			Review estimated costs, call with HQ.
22-Dec-2022 Victor Kroeger	50		380.00	Review and edit draft email to HQ.
	9.00	760.00	6,840.00	
			A 2000	-
TOTAL	50.50	U	\$ 26,237.00	=



Invoice Number:

10829803

Client Number: 0855308

Invoice Date:

Mar 8 2023

Invoice Terms : Due Upon Receipt

Mr. J. Park GS E&R 301 - 121 15th Avenue SE Calgary, AB T2G 1G1

For Professional Services Rendered:

For professional fees in the Division I Proposal of GS E & R for the period of January 1 - February 28, 2023.

27,097.00

Disbursements

14.00

Sub Total:

27,111.00

Goods & Services Tax:

1,355.55

Total (CAD):

28,466.55

GST Registration Number: 103697215 RT 0001

GS E&R Canada Inc. - Division 1 Proposal

OJ LUIT CUITAGO	mici - Division x 1 toposai	
For the period of	f January 1 - February 28	2023

For the period of J	od of January 1 - February 28, 2023					
Date	Name	Hours	Rate	Amount	Description	
	Carla Schillreff	.10	Tune		File administration.	
	Carla Schillreff	.40		104.00	File administration.	
20-Jan-2023	Carla Schillreff	.10		26.00	File administration.	
	Carla Schillreff	.10			File administration.	
	Carla Schillreff	.20			File administration.	
	Carla Schillreff Carla Schillreff	.30		10101	File administration. File administration.	
		.10			File administration.	
	Carla Schillreff Carla Schillreff	.20			File administration.	
26-760-2023	Caria Schillen	1.60	260.00	416.00	FILE OUTHINIDATE ATOMIC	
			200,00	120100	•	
	Jacqueline Shellon	3.50		1,680.00	November, December month end reporting and email to HQ re the process; circulate the same; review incoming cheques for GST refunds.	
	Jacqueline Shellon	2.50			Conversations with tax group re compliance certificate; final returns; draft letter for parent company re current retainer.	
	Jacqueline Shellon	1.50			Prepare memo re tax; PC with A.Teasdale re retainer. Final review and circulation of cover letter and support for increased retainer.	
	Jacqueline Shellon Jacqueline Shellon	.70			Compile summary letter re retainer; circulate.	
10-7411-2023	Jacqueille Sileiloii	8.60	480.00	4,128.00		
					•	
11-Jan-2023 .		.20			Ernail correspondence re T2 compliance 2022 and final dissolution.	
16-Jan-2023 .		1.20			Discussion with Ryan on T2 2022 and 2023 dissolution, various correspondence.	
17-Jan-2023 .		.30 1.50			Discuss T2 2022. Review T2 2022.	
19-Jan-2023 . 01-Feb-2023 .		.50			Discussion with Ryan on GIFI and T2 year end.	
02-Feb-2023		.40			Various discussion with Ryan on T2 prep and transactions / adjustments on GIFI.	
23-Feb-2023 .		.20			Email correspondence re T2.	
			480.00	2,064.00		
44.7	Laure Pales - La			40.00	Paviant correspondence received from CDA re- GCT	
11-Jan-2023 13-Jan-2023		.10 .30			Review correspondence received from CRA re: GST. Prepare and submit Dec 2022 GST; update GST tracking.	
13-Jan-2023		.40			Prepare Dec 2022 bank reconciliations.	
24-Jan-2023		.30			Assisting T. Muraina with interim statement of receipts and disbursements.	
30-Jan-2023		.20		96.00	Correspond with working group re: GST; review GST accounts.	
06-Feb-2023		.40		192.00	Review interim statement of receipts and disbursements; recode GST deposit in Ascend.	
09-Feb-2023	Lorry Fritsche	.10			Email to V. Kroeger re: draft ISRD/report.	
10-Feb-2023		.20			Prepare and submit Jan 2023 GST.	
16-Feb-2023		.20			Prepare Jan 2023 bank reconciliation.	
22-Feb-2023		.20 .20			Prepare Jan 2023 bank reconciliation. Review books and records for financial information; email to tax group re: same.	
23-Feb-2023 24-Feb-2023		.10			Correspond with working group and tax re: financial statements.	
28-Feb-2023		.10		48.00	Review correspondence received from BMO and forward copy to tax.	
		2.80	480.00	1,344.00		
20.1 2022	Rick Anderson	20		110.00	December 2022 bank reconciliations.	
30-Jan-2023	RICK Anderson	.20	550.00	110.00		
					•	
16-Jan-2023		2.00			Preparing T2s for year Dec 31, 2022 and stub year end Jan 2, 2023.	
19-Jan-2023		1.00			Discussion with Joseph.	
24-Jan-2023 25-Jan-2023		1.00 4.00			Create new 2022 caseware file, populate with prelim information for 2022 and 2023. Organize GL; work on populating T2 to get to balance for cash changes.	
01-Feb-2023		3.50		1.015.00	Reviewing the provided transaction summary; working on groupings to work on balancing Gifi entry for tax return.	
02-Feb-2023		2.00			Setup caseware, update T2, discuss with Joseph.	
	*	13.50	290.00	3,915.00		
10 1 2022	T	2.00		1 200 00	Summary of corporation taxes, review with J. Shellon.	
	Temitope Muraina Temitope Muraina	3.00			Summary of corporation tax, review with J. Shellon.	
	Temitope Muraina	4.00			Memo, statement of R&D.	
	Temitope Muraina	3.00			Statement of R&D.	
	Temitope Muraina	3.00		1,200.00	Statement of R&D.	
	Temitope Muraina	1.00			Statement of R&D.	
	Temitope Muraina	1.50			Statement of R&D.	
	Temitope Muraina	1.50			Statement of R&D. Correspondence with working team and finalising statement of R&D.	
	Temitope Muraina Temitope Muraina	2.00			Correspondence with working team and finalising statement of R&D. Monthly reporting.	
	Temitope Muraina	3.00			Writing January report, circulating for review and amending as necessary.	
	Temitope Muraina	1.00		400.00	Review emails; monthly reporting.	
	Temitope Muraina	.20		80.00	Call with L. Fritsche about financial statements.	
23-Feb-2023	Temitope Muraina	.20			Correspondence with working team about financial statements.	
24-Feb-2023	Temitope Muraina	20			Correspondence with working team on financial statements.	
		27.35	400.00	10,940.00	-	
03-Jan-2073	Victor Kroeger	1.00		760.00	Review draft monthly reports and draft response to HQ.	
	Victor Kroeger	.50			Review memo re income taxes.	
23-Jan-2023	Victor Kroeger	1.00			Deal with tax and future release of return of capital.	
	Victor Kroeger	.50			Review and edit draft email to Stikeman prepared by Lawson Lundell re release of Escrow funds.	
	Victor Kroeger	.50			Correspond with Lawson Lundell re Escrow agreement.	
09-Feb-2023	Victor Kroeger	2.00	760.00		Work on monthly reporting.	
		5.50	760.00	4,180.00	•	
	TOTAL	63.85		\$ 27,097.00		

GS E&R Canada Inc. - Division 1 Proposal For the period of January 1 - February 28, 2023

Date Type Amount		Amount	Description			
	Туре					
16-Feb-2023	Client Disbursements	14.00	Paid to the Government of Alberta Invoice 1800028934 - Corporate Registry - Transaction 1709822			
	TOTAL	\$ 14.00	-			

Appendix D

In the matter of the Division I Proposal of GS E&R Canada Inc. Summary of Professional Fees and Disbursements for the period January 6, 2021 to February 28, 2023

Lawson Lundell LLP - Legal Counsel for Trustee

					Т	otal before				
Invoice Number	Description	Fees	•	Disbursements		GST		GST	Inv	oice Total
1119821	Fees up to February 28, 2021	\$	2,875.00	\$ 1.80	\$	2,876.80	\$	143.84	\$	3,020.64
1120186	Fees up to March 31, 2021		10,880.00	1,075.65		11,955.65		597.78		12,553.43
1121056	Fees up to June 4, 2021		5,220.00	311.92		5,531.92		268.20		5,800.12
1121459	Fees up to July 12, 2021		3,960.00	19.10		3,979.10		198.86		4,177.96
1121579	Fees up to July 31, 2021		5,617.00	184.28		5,801.28		289.26		6,090.54
1121816	Fees up to August 17, 2021		8,400.00	143.02		8,543.02		427.15		8,970.17
1121863	Fees up to August 31, 2021		1,260.00	49.03		1,309.03		65.45		1,374.48
Legal fees and dis	bursements paid directly by									
GS E&R Canada L	td.		38,212.00	1,784.80		39,996.80		1,990.54		41,987.34
1122187	Fees to September 30, 2021		8,739.50	661.20		9,400.70		469.69		9,870.39
1122796	Fees to October 31, 2021		4,005.00	47.90		4,052.90		200.90		4,253.80
1123232	Fees to November 30, 2021		7,876.00	251.91		8,127.91		406.05		8,533.96
1123695	Fees to December 31, 2021		7,790.00	640.15		8,430.15		414.51		8,844.66
1123980	Fees to January 31, 2022		22,948.00	512.60		23,460.60		1,173.03		24,633.63
1124214	Fees to February 28, 2022		317.50	243.85		561.35		20.07		581.42
1124516	Fees to March 31, 2022		1,423.00	25.94		1,448.94		72.45		1,521.39
1124923	Fees to April 30, 2022		1,893.50	1.20		1,894.70		94.74		1,989.44
1126075	Fees to June 30, 2022		3,728.50	1.20		3,729.70		186.49		3,916.19
1126756	Fees to August 31, 2022		10,672.00	-		10,672.00		533.60		11,205.60
1200792	Fees to September 30, 2022		1,275.00	3.00		1,278.00		63.90		1,341.90
Legal fees and disbursements paid by Trustee										
with enhanced po	wers		70,668.00	2,388.95		73,056.95		3,635.43		76,692.38
1220768	Fees to February 28, 2023		15,740.50	9.30		15,749.80		787.49		16,537.29
Legal fees and disbursements paid by Trustee with enhanced powers subsequent to February 28, 2023			15,740.50	9.30		15,749.80		787.49		16,537.29
Total Legal Fees and Disbursements			124,620.50	\$ 4,183.05	\$	128,803.55	\$	6,413.46	\$	135,217.01

Appendix E

Balance Sheet Information

- Use this schedule to report the corporation's balance sheet information.
- For more information, see Guide RC4088, General Index of Financial Information (GIFI) and T4012, T2 Corporation Income Tax Guide.

GS E&R Canada Inc.

Balance Sheet

As of December 31, 2021

Assets	GIFI item	Current fiscal year	Previous fiscal year
Current assets			
Cash and deposits	1000	2,083,788	2,561,781
Accounts receivable	1060		401,569
Other current assets	1480		3,976,832
Total current assets	1599	2,083,788	6,940,182
Fixed assets			
Machinery, equipment, furniture, and fixtures	1740		47,865,401
Accumulated amortization of machinery, equipment, furniture, and fixtures	1741		(46,565,099)
			1,300,302
Other assets			444.005.074
Intangible assets	2010		144,665,671
Accumulated amortization of intangible assets	2011		(142,087,683)
			2,577,988
Total assets	2599	2,083,788	10,818,472
Liabilities Current Liabilities			
Amounts payable and accrued liabilities	2620	209,357	358,937
Total current liabilities	3139	209,357	358,937
Long-term Liabilities Provision for site restoration	3323		15,549,263
			15,549,263
Total liabilities	3499	209,357	15,908,200
Shareholder equity Contributed capital			
Common shares	3500	237,253,488	236,253,488
Retained earnings (deficit)	3600	(235,379,057)	(241,343,216)
Total shareholder equity	3620	1,874,431	(5,089,728)
Total liabilities and shareholder equity	3640	2,083,788	10,818,472
Retained earnings (deficit)			
Opening balance	3660	(241,343,216)	(240,036,681)
Net income (loss)	3680	5,964,159	(1,306,535)
Closing balance	3849	(235,379,057)	(241,343,216)

This statement has been compiled from information provided by the taxpayer, solely for income tax purposes and may not be appropriate for other purposes. We have not audited, reviewed or otherwise attempted to verify its accuracy or completeness.

T2 SCH 100 E (20) TC17 Version 2022.1.0.0 Canada

GS E&R Canada Inc.

Balance sheet

As at December 31, 2022

	2022	2021
Assets		
Cash and deposits	1,529,228	2,083,788
Liabilities		
Accounts payable and accrued liabilities	-	209,357
Shareholder's equity		
Share capital	237,253,488	237,253,488
Deficit	(235,724,260)	(235,379,057)
	1,529,228	1,874,431
Total liabilities and shareholder's equity	1,529,228	2,083,788

Appendix F

ESCROW AGREEMENT

Escrow Agreement dated ● between GS E&R Corporation ("E&R PARENT"), MNP Ltd. in its capacity as trustee under the Division I Proposal of GS E&R Canada Inc. ("E&R CANADA") and not in its personal capacity ("MNP") and Stikeman Elliott LLP (the "Escrow Agent").

RECITALS:

- (a) On March 11, 2021, E&R CANADA filed a Notice of Intention to Make a Proposal ("**NOI**") pursuant to subsection 50.4(1) of the *Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act*, RSC 1985, c. B-3 (the "*BIA*") and MNP was appointed as Proposal Trustee;
- (b) On August 17, 2021, E&R Canada made a proposal to its creditors under Part III, Division I of the BIA (the "Proposal"). At a creditors' meeting on September 7, 2021, E&R CANADA's creditors unanimously approved the Proposal, which was subsequently sanctioned by the Honourable Justice Jones on September 17, 2021 (the "Approval Order");
- (c) MNP carried out its duties as Proposal Trustee in accordance with the terms of the Proposal and the Approval Order and made all distributions to E&R CANADA's creditors contemplated in the Proposal;
- (d) Following completion of the distributions to creditors contemplated in the Proposal, MNP holds \$1,508,914.72 of cash in hand, which, (i) less payment of all outstanding professional fees of MNP and its legal counsel up to and including February 28, 2023, and (ii) together with any interest earned on the funds until payout and any GST refunds received by MNP on behalf of E&R CANADA (the "Escrowed Property"), is distributable under the BIA to E&R PARENT as E&R CANADA's sole shareholder;
- (e) In accordance with the terms of an Order granted by the Honourable Justice Little on March 29, 2023, MNP and E&R PARENT have agreed that MNP will transfer the Escrowed Property to the Escrow Agent to be held pursuant to the terms of this Agreement (the "Order");
- (f) The Escrow Agent is willing to act as escrow agent for the sole purpose of accepting, holding and releasing the Escrowed Property in accordance with this Agreement.

In consideration of the above and for other good and valuable consideration, the parties agree as follows:

Section 1 Defined Terms

Capitalized terms used in this Agreement and not otherwise defined have the meanings specified in the Order. As used in this Agreement, "Business Day" means any day of the year, other than a Saturday, Sunday, or any day on which Canadian chartered banks are closed for business in Calgary, Alberta.

Section 2 Appointment of Escrow Agent

E&R PARENT and MNP hereby appoint the Escrow Agent to act as escrow agent in accordance with this Agreement and the Escrow Agent accepts such appointment.

Section 3 Delivery of Escrowed Property and Receipt

Upon delivery of the Escrowed Property by MNP to the Escrow Agent, the Escrow Agent shall acknowledge receipt of the Escrowed Property to E&R PARENT and MNP. The Escrow Agent shall hold and deal with the Escrowed Property in accordance with this Agreement.

Section 4 Investment of Escrowed Property

- (1) The Escrow Agent shall deposit the Escrowed Property in its trust account and, until the Escrowed Property is delivered or deposited in accordance with Section 6, the Escrow Agent shall invest and reinvest the Escrowed Property in Guaranteed Investment Certificates issued by the Canadian Imperial Bank of Commerce with an initial term of [] [days]/[months] [payable to the Escrow Agent "in trust".
- (2) Interest earned and paid on such investments will be added to and form part of the Escrowed Property and the Escrow Agent shall invest and reinvest such interest in accordance with this section. Interest earned on the Escrowed Property will be for the benefit of the party to whom such Escrowed Property, or a portion thereof, is released and the Escrow Agent may provide such information (including the identity of the party receiving the Escrowed Property) to CIBC as may be required for tax reporting and other purposes.

Section 5 Holding of Escrowed Property

The Escrow Agent shall retain the Escrowed Property and the certificates (including any replacement securities or certificates) representing the Escrowed Property and shall not do or cause anything to be done to release the Escrowed Property from escrow or transfer, hypothecate or alienate the Escrowed Property, except as expressly provided for in this Agreement.

Section 6 Release of Escrowed Property

- (1) In this Agreement,
 - (a) "Audit" means the CRA audit of the Final Tax Returns and/or review of pre-filing GST deemed trust claims:
 - (b) "Clearance Certificate" means the certificate from the CRA confirming that E&R CANADA has paid all amounts of income tax and GST, interest, and penalties owed by it, if any;
 - (c) "CRA" means the Canada Revenue Agency;
 - (d) "Final Tax Returns" means, collectively, the 2021 corporate fiscal year-end tax return, the 2022 corporate fiscal year-end tax return, and the 2023 final tax return for E&R CANADA; and
 - (e) "Notice of Assessment" means the CRA's evaluation of the Final Tax Returns.
- Subject to Section 11, Escrow Agent will hold the Escrowed Property in trust for the benefit of E&R PARENT until the earlier of the following occurrences:
 - six months elapse from the date on which MNP has received the last Notice of Assessment from CRA in respect of each of E&R CANADA's Final Tax Returns, provided that Escrow Agent has first confirmed to MNP that any balance owing, if any, under any Notice of Assessment received by MNP in respect of E&R CANADA's Final Tax Returns has been transferred to CRA from the Escrowed Property to satisfy the outstanding obligation to the CRA on behalf of E&R CANADA; or
 - (b) MNP receives a Clearance Certificate in respect of the Audit of E&R CANADA.
- (3) In the case of the occurrence contemplated in either Section 6(2)(a) or Section 6(2)(b), as the case may be, MNP shall provide to the Escrow Agent a notice, substantially in the form attached as Schedule A to this Agreement (the "Escrow Release Notice"), that it is released of its trust

conditions contemplated in this Agreement and the Escrow Agent shall be authorized to release the Escrowed Property to E&R PARENT.

Section 7 No Requirement for Determination or Decision

The Escrow Agent is not required to make any determination or decision with respect to the validity of any claim made by any party, or of any denial thereof (including, without limitation, the validity of any Escrow Release Notice), but may rely conclusively on the terms of this Agreement, the Order and the documents delivered to it in connection with this Agreement and Order.

Section 8 Duties and Liabilities of the Escrow Agent

- (1) The Escrow Agent has no duties or responsibilities other than those expressly set forth in this Agreement and the Order, which the parties agree are purely administrative in nature, and no implied duties or obligations may be read into this Agreement against the Escrow Agent. For greater certainty, the Escrow Agent is not bound by any agreement, arrangement or understanding relating to or arising out of the matters provided for in this Agreement, except as expressly set forth in this Agreement.
- (2) The Escrow Agent is not liable for any action it takes or omits to take in good faith and in the exercise of its own judgment, for any error in judgment made in good faith or for any mistake of fact or law, except for its own bad faith or fraud.
- (3) The Escrow Agent may rely on, and is protected in acting upon, any judgment, order, notice, demand, direction, certificate or other instrument, paper or document which it may receive (including by e-mail) in connection with its duties under this Agreement and may accept them as sufficient evidence of the facts stated in them. The Escrow Agent is in no way bound to enquire as to the veracity, accuracy or adequacy thereof or call for further evidence (whether as to due execution, validity or effectiveness, or the jurisdiction of any court, or as to the truth of any fact), and is not responsible for any actions, proceedings, losses, liabilities, costs, claims, damages, expenses (including legal fees and expenses) and demands that may be occasioned by its failing to do so.
- (4) If the Escrow Agent becomes involved in any arbitration or litigation relating to this Agreement and/or the Order, the Escrow Agent may comply with any decision reached through such arbitration or litigation.
- (5) In the following circumstances, the Escrow Agent may (A) refrain from taking any action under this Agreement and/or the Order until it is authorized or directed otherwise in writing by both E&R PARENT and MNP, or by an order of a court of competent jurisdiction from which no further appeal may be taken or (B) deposit the Escrowed Property with a court of competent jurisdiction in Calgary, in the Province of Alberta:
 - (b) The Escrow Agent is uncertain as to its duties or rights under this Agreement and/or Order,
 - (c) The Escrow Agent receives instructions, claims or demands from any party to this Agreement, the Order or from a third Person with respect to any matter under this Agreement which, in its opinion, are in conflict with this Agreement and/or the Order,
 - (d) There is a disagreement between any of the parties to this Agreement and/or the Order which, in the reasonable opinion of the Escrow Agent, may result in adverse claims or demands with respect to the Escrowed Property, or
 - (e) Any of the parties to this Agreement, including the Escrow Agent, disagree about the interpretation of this Agreement, the Order or about the rights and obligations of the Escrow

Agent or the propriety of an action contemplated by the Escrow Agent under this Agreement and/or the Order.

(6) Upon the Escrow Agent depositing the Escrowed Property with a court in accordance with Section 8(5), the Escrow Agent will be released from its duties and obligations under this Agreement and the Order.

Section 9 Escrow Agent's Fees, Costs and Expenses

There will be no additional fees or expenses associated with Escrow Agent's performance of its obligations under this Agreement and Order to E&R PARENT.

Section 10 Indemnification of Escrow Agent

E&R PARENT shall indemnify and save harmless the Escrow Agent and each of its shareholders, partners, directors, officers, employees, agents, representatives and their respective affiliates, of and from, and shall pay for, all actions, proceedings, losses, liabilities, costs, claims, damages, expenses (including legal fees and expenses on a full indemnity basis without reduction for tariff rates or similar reductions) and demands that may be made or brought against it or any of them or which it or any of them may suffer or incur as a result of, in respect of, or arising out of or in connection with this Agreement and/or the Order, the performance or non-performance by the Escrow Agent under this Agreement and/or the Order or any transactions contemplated by this Agreement and/or the Order, except such as shall result solely and directly from its own bad faith or fraud.

Section 11 Resignation, Removal of Escrow Agent

- (1) The Escrow Agent may resign and be discharged from all further duties and liabilities under this Agreement and Order at any time on 30 calendar days written notice to E&R PARENT and MNP or such shorter notice as E&R PARENT and MNP may accept as sufficient. E&R PARENT and MNP may jointly remove the Escrow Agent from its office at any time on 30 calendar days written notice to the Escrow Agent.
- (2) If the Escrow Agent resigns or is removed, E&R PARENT has 20 calendar days to jointly appoint a successor and the Escrow Agent shall deliver the Escrowed Property and all interest accrued thereon as E&R PARENT directs.
- (3) If a successor is not appointed in accordance with Section 11(2), then the Escrow Agent shall cease its function at the expiration of the notice period and deposit the Escrowed Property with a court of competent jurisdiction in Calgary, in the Province of Alberta.
- (4) This Agreement terminates and ceases to be of any further force and effect with respect to the Escrow Agent on the date on which the Escrow Agent delivers the Escrowed Property to a successor or deposits it with a court in accordance with this Section 11, except that Section 10 and all other provisions of this Agreement relating to the protection of the Escrow Agent survive the resignation or removal of the Escrow Agent.
- (5) Upon the appointment of any successor escrow agent, the successor escrow agent will be vested with the same powers, rights, duties and responsibilities as if the successor escrow agent had been originally named as Escrow Agent under this Agreement and will be subject to removal under this Section 11. E&R PARENT, MNP and the successor escrow agent shall execute and deliver all documents and take all such actions as may, in the reasonable opinion of the Escrow Agent, be necessary or desirable for the purpose of effectively transferring the Escrowed Property to the successor escrow agent upon and subject to the terms of this Agreement.

Section 12 Termination of Agreement

In addition to terminating in accordance with Section 11, this Agreement terminates and ceases to be of any further force and effect on the date on which the Escrow Agent delivers the Escrowed Property in accordance with Section 6 or deposits it with a court in accordance with Section 8, except that Section 10 and all other provisions of this Agreement relating to the protection of the Escrow Agent survive the termination of this Agreement.

Section 13 Right to Continue to Act

Each of E&R PARENT and MNP acknowledge that the Escrow Agent has acted and will continue to act as legal counsel to E&R PARENT with respect to various matters, including the Order. Each of E&R PARENT and MNP agrees that, as the Escrow Agent is not acting as legal counsel to MNP, the Escrow Agent will not, by virtue of acting as Escrow Agent, be disqualified from continuing to act for and represent E&R PARENT in connection with the Order and otherwise, including in matters adverse to MNP and its interests.

Section 14 Notices

Any notice, direction or other communication given regarding the matters contemplated by this Agreement (each, a "**Notice**") must be in writing, sent by hand delivery, courier, facsimile or e-mail and addressed:

(a) If to E&R PARENT, to:

Stikeman Elliott LLP 4300, 888 3 Street Southwest Calgary, Alberta T2P 5C5

Attention: Karen Fellowes, K.C. Telephone: (403) 831-9488 Facsimile: (403) 266-9034

E-mail: kfellowes@stikeman.com

(b) If to the Escrow Agent, to:

Stikeman Elliott LLP 4300, 888 3 Street Southwest Calgary, Alberta T2P 5C5

Attention: Keith R. Chatwin Telephone: (403) 266-9088 Facsimile: (403) 266-9034

E-mail: kchatwin@stikeman.com

(c) If to MNP, to:

Lawson Lundell LLP 1100, 225 6 Avenue Southwest Calgary, Alberta T2P 1N2

Attention: Alexis E. Teasdale Telephone: (403) 218-7564 Facsimile: (403) 269-9494

E-mail: ateasdale@lawsonlundell.com

A Notice is deemed to be given and received (i) if sent by hand, courier or facsimile (with facsimile machine confirmation of transmission), on the date of delivery or transmission if it is a Business Day and the delivery or transmission was made prior to 4:00 p.m. (local time in the place of receipt), and otherwise on the next Business Day; and (ii) if sent by e-mail, when the sender receives an e-mail from the recipient acknowledging receipt, provided that an automatic "read receipt" does not constitute acknowledgement of an e-mail for purposes of this Section. A party may change its address for service from time to time by providing a Notice in accordance with the foregoing. Any subsequent Notice must be sent to the party at its changed address. Any element of a party's address that is not specifically changed in a Notice will be assumed not to be changed.

Section 15 Amendments

This Agreement may only be amended, supplemented or otherwise modified by written agreement signed by all of the parties.

Section 16 Entire Agreement

Subject to the provisions of the Order, Agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the parties with respect to the transactions contemplated in this Agreement and supersedes all prior agreements, understandings, negotiations and discussions, whether oral or written, of the parties with respect to such transactions. There are no representations, warranties, covenants, conditions or other agreements, express or implied, collateral, statutory or otherwise, between the parties in connection with the subject matter of this Agreement, except as specifically set forth in this Agreement and the Order, parties have not relied and are not relying on any other information, discussion or understanding in entering into and completing the transactions contemplated by this Agreement. If there is any conflict or inconsistency between the provisions of this Agreement and the provisions of the Order, which cannot be resolved by both provisions being complied with, the provisions of this Agreement will prevail to the extent of such conflict.

Section 17 Enurement and Assignment

This Agreement becomes effective when executed by all of the parties. After that time, it will be binding upon and enure to the benefit of the parties and their respective successors, legal representatives and permitted assigns. Neither this Agreement nor any of the rights or obligations under this Agreement, including any right to payment, may be assigned or transferred, in whole or in part, by any party without the prior written consent of the other parties.

Section 18 Severability

If any provision of this Agreement is determined to be illegal, invalid or unenforceable by an arbitrator or any court of competent jurisdiction from which no appeal exists or is taken, that provision will be severed from this Agreement and the remaining provisions will remain in full force and effect.

Section 19 Waiver

No waiver of any of the provisions of this Agreement will constitute a waiver of any other provision (whether or not similar). No waiver will be binding unless executed in writing by the party to be bound by the waiver. A party's failure or delay in exercising any right under this Agreement will not operate as a waiver of that right. A single or partial exercise of any right will not preclude a party from any other or further exercise of that right or the exercise of any other right it may have.

Section 20 Further Assurances

On or after the date of this Agreement, E&R PARENT and MNP shall execute and deliver such documents and take all such action as the other or the Escrow Agent may request from time to time in order to carry

out the intent and purpose of this Agreement and to establish and protect the rights, interests and remedies intended to be created in favour of the Escrow Agent.

Section 21 Expenses

E&R PARENT and MNP will each pay for its own expenses incurred in connection with this Agreement and the transactions contemplated by it.

Section 22 Time

Time is of the essence in this Agreement.

Section 23 Governing Law

This Agreement is governed by, and will be interpreted and construed in accordance with, the laws of the Province of Alberta and the federal laws of Canada applicable therein. Each party irrevocably attorns and submits to the exclusive jurisdiction of the courts situated in the City of Calgary, and waives objection to the venue of any proceeding in such court or that such court provides an inconvenient forum.

Section 24 Counterparts

This Agreement may be executed in any number of counterparts, each of which is deemed to be an original, and such counterparts together constitute one and the same instrument. Transmission of an executed signature page by facsimile, e-mail or other electronic means is as effective as a manually executed counterpart of this Agreement.

Section 25 English Language

The parties to this Agreement have agreed that this Agreement as well as any document or instrument relating to it be drawn up in English only but without prejudice to any such document or instrument which may from time to time be drawn up in French only or in both French and English. Les parties aux présentes ont convenu que la présente Convention ainsi que tous autres actes ou documents s'y rattachant soient rédigés en anglais seulement mais sans préjudice à tous tels actes ou documents qui pourraient à l'occasion être rédigés en français seulement ou à la fois en anglais et en français.

[Rest of page intentionally left blank. Signature page follows.]

The parties have executed this Agreement.

GS E&R Corporation

Ву:	
	Name:
	Title:
MNP	Ltd.
Ву:	
	Name:
	Title:
Stike	man Elliott LLP
Ву:	
	Name: Keith Chatwin
	Title: Partner
	Without individual or personal liability

SCHEDULE A

ESCROW RELEASE NOTICE

TO:	STIKEMAN ELLIOTT LLP, Attention: Keith R. Chatwin, Partner, email: kchatwin@stikeman.com					
CC:	STIKEMAN ELLIOTT LLP, Attention: Karen Fellowes, K.C., Senior Counsel, email: kfellowes@stikeman.com					
DATE:	[Month], [Date], [Year]					
RE:	Escrow Agreement made on [Date] among GS E&R Corporation and MNP Ltd. (the "Instructing Parties"), and Stikeman Elliott LLP as Escrow Agent (the "Escrow Agreement")					
Unless otherwise defined herein, all capitalized terms used in this Escrow Release Notice shall have the meaning ascribed to them in the Escrow Agreement. The Instructing Parties hereby irrevocably instruct the Escrow Agent, forthwith upon receipt of this Escrow Release Notice, to release [Remaining Property] to GS E&R Corporation in accordance with the wire instructions attached hereto as Appendix "A". This Escrow Release Notice shall be the Escrow Agent's good, sufficient and irrevocable authority for so doing.						
	GS E&R CORPORATION					
	By: Name: Title:					
	MNP LTD.					
	By: Name: Title:					

APPENDIX A

WIRE INSTRUCTIONS

Name	Primary Contact	Receiving Banking Details